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where two people con­
stantly try to change each 
other’s habits.
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Rev. David Wernecke Installed 

At Salem and St. John’s UCC

First Elementary Early 
Release Day Oct. 29th

Salem United Church of 
Christ of Wayne and St. John’s 
United Church of Christ of 
Kohlsville celebrated a spe­
cial day on Sunday, October 
12th at Salem UCC of Wayne 
as the two congregations in­
stalled their Pastor and 
Teacher, the Rev. David D. 
Wernecke.

Those who helped install 
Rev. Wernecke were the Rev. 
Thomas Bentz, Southeast 
Wisconsin Association Minis­
ter, Carol Marchant-Ferber, 
United Christian Church, 
Campbellsport; Rev. George 
Jorenby, West Bend; Rev. Rus­
sell Knoth, St. Paul’s UCC,
Menomonee Falls, Matt Lei- 
thold, St. John’s UCC, 
Kohlsville and Jim Maul, 
Salem UCC of Wayne repre­
sented the Search Committee 
that worked to call Rev. Wer­
necke.

In addition to installing 
Rev. Wernecke, messages 
were shared to instruct the 
newly formed yoke of Salem 
UCC and St. John’s UCC. The 
messages were based on 1 
Corinthians 12:1-11, read by 
Denise Goetsch, Member 
Salem UCC of Wayne. In their 
messages based on the text, 
the Reverend Dr. Steve Peder­
sen, Senior Pastor, Zion UCC, 
Sheboygan, and the Rev. 
William Kesting, pastor of two 
churches (St. Mark’s UCC, 
Cleveland, and St. James 
UCC, Newton) urged the con­
gregations to work coopera­
tively ,not competitively, be­
cause we are called as Chris­
tians to work to enhance the 
ministry of the church. And in 
a yoke situation, the same is 
true of two churches. Both

churches are called to work 
together in shared ministry. 
Rev. Therese Leonhard, pas­
tor of Friedens UCC, Fort 
Atkinson, gave a charge to 
Rev. Wernecke.

Providing a warm welcome 
to start the afternoon were 
Jim Gutjahr, Salem UCC of 
Wayne and Matt Teetzeen, St. 
John’s UCC, Kohlsville. Litur- 
gists for the occasion were

Tommy Cannestra Wins 
Mr. October Contest

Tommy Cannestra

Rev. Stevens Hilyard, Pastor, 
United Christian Church 
Campbellsport and Rev. Eric 
Kirkegaard, Pastor Peace 
UCC, Kewaskum. Special mu­
sic was provided by the Salem 
UCC Sanctuary Choir, under 
the direction of Roger Mertz 
and the St. John’s UCC Youth 
Bell Choir, under the direc­
tion of Anna Asch. Sherri 
Scheurman was organist for 
the service. Greeters an ush­
ers for the occasion were Jeff 
and Matt Steger and John 
Gudex of Salem UCC of 
Wayne. After the service, a 
family style meal was served 
by people from both church­
es.

Both churches invite you 
to join them for Sunday 
morning worship. The people 
of Salem UCC of Wayne, 8925 
Highways W. worships at 9:30. 
The people of St. John’s UCC 
of Kohlsville, located on the 
corner of Highway WW and 
Beaver Dam Road, worship at 
10:30. Both churches have 
Christian Education for chil­
dren and youth as young peo­
ple leave worship after a time 
for children. The churches al­
so provide adult educational 
opportunities.

By Nicole Kuehl 
Statesman Staff Writer 
nkuehl@kewaskuinstatesmaacom

The Kewaskum Board of 
Education approved three 
new courses for the high 
school and four early release 
dates for the elementary 
schools at Monday night’s 
board of education meeting.

The first date for an early 
release day for the KSD ele­
mentary students will be 
Wednesday, October 29th. 
Additional days includ No­
vember 26th, February 20th 
and March 13th, however, the 
March 13th date should have 
been the 25th of March in­
stead, and will have to come 
before the board again to 
have the correct date ap­
proved.

Keith Kriewaldt, director of 
elementary education stated 
that the staff enjoyed having 
these days to work together 
on things they don’t normally 
get the time for. Kriewaldt al­
so stated that the teachers are 
required to be in the building 
during the in-service hours.

The board also approved 
three new classes for the high 
school. Christine Horbas,

In a last minute voting 
frenzy, courtesy of Campbell­
sport Building Supply, a lot of 
personal fans and fellow can­
didate Larry Martin, Tommy 
Cannestra gained a landslide 
victory and was crowned Ke­
waskum’s Mr. October.

A check in Tommy’s name 
will be given to the Juvenile 
Diabetes Fund in the amount 
of $560. The contest raised 
$1,119.

Tommy led the group with 
378 votes. Gil "Baby Huey” 
DeLaurier came in second 
place with 165 votes. Round­
ing the bend at third was Lar­
ry Martin with 163 votes. 
Thrilled with his fourth place 
status was Father Mark Jones 
who gamed 162 votes. Bob 
Buddenhagen received fifth 
with 88 votes and last but cer­
tainly not least Mike “Dough­
boy” Nitschke received 86 
votes.

Thanks to everyone who 
participated.

KHS principal, presented sev­
en new courses. After much 
discussion, four of the cours­
es were put on hold until the 
next meeting because the 
board felt that one of the 
courses needed to be 
changed and the others the 
board wanted costs for. The 
courses approved were Ad­
vance Physical Fitness, Web 
Page Design and Principles of 
Food Science.

Mr. Dave Bertelson was on 
hand to ask the board for ap­
proval for a band / choir trip 
to Orlando in March. The 
board approved the trip wish­
ing them well. The group will 
leave on March 24th and re­
turn and be in school on 
March 30.

News 
Briefs

• KEWASKUM 
WOMEN’S CLUB- will 
meet at 7 p.m. on Thurs­
day, October 23, at the 
Kewaskum Community 
Annex.

JoAnn Hall of Make-It 
and Take-It Crafts will be 
at the meeting. There will 
be an opportunity for 
everyone to make a small 
item for a minimal fee if 
they so desire.

Please join in and expe­
rience the camaraderie of 
this women’s group. If you 
have any questions, 
please contact Jeanne 
Goeden at 626-2777.

• TRICK OR TREAT- 
will be held in Kewaskum 
on October, 26 from 5-7 
p.m.
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On The Record
LUNCH MENUS EMS CALLS

KEWASKUM SCHOOL 
DISTRICT

Monday, Oct. 20 -- Zesty 
Italian spaghetti & meatballs, 
tossed salad, garlic bread, 
pineapple & a chewy choco­
late cookie. *State Fair corn 
dog. (2) Melted cheese sand­
wich.
Tuesday, Oct. 21 -- Bacon 

cheeseburger/bun, potato 
wedges, buttery peas, fruit 
cocktail & sugar meltaway 
cookie. ’Chicken cordon 
bleu/bun. (2) Melted cheese 
sandwich.

’Wednesday, Oct. 22 -- 
Chicken patty/bun, onion 
rings, mandarin oranges, ap­
plesauce & chocolate or 
vanilla pudding. ’Salad bar.
(2) Melted cheese sandwich.
Thursday, Oct. 23 — Chalu- 

pa & toppings, white rice, 
pears, fresh apples, bread & 
pumpkin pie. ’Italian toasted 
cheese sandwich. (2) Melted 
cheese sandwich.

Friday, Oct. 24 -- Shrimp 
poppers, mashed potatoes & 
gravy, coleslaw, fresh red 
grapes & a chocolate chip 
cookie. ’Hot dog/bun. (2) 
Melted cheese sandwich.

HOLY TRINITY SCHOOL
Monday, Oct. 20 -- Mini 

corn dogs, BBQ pork sand­
wich, green beans, pineap­
ple, oatmeal bar, milk.
Tuesday, Oct. 21 -- Strom­

boli, peanut butter/ jelly, 
peaches, fruit cup, cookie 
dough, milk.
Wednesday, Oct. 22 — Ham­

burger on a bun, 
broccoli/cauliflower, pears, 
donut, milk.
Thursday, Oct. 23 — Bread­

ed chicken, whipped pota­
toes w/gravy, golden corn, 
mandarin oranges, dinner 
roll, pudding cup, milk.

Friday, Oct. 24 -- Cheese 
pizza, lettuce salad, mixed 
fruit, cookie, milk.

ST. LUCAS SCHOOL
Monday, Oct. 20 -- Chicken 

patty/bun, carrot coins, 
mandarin oranges, heath bar 
cake.

Tuesday, Oct. 21 — Spaghet­
ti, bread stick, peas, fresh 
fruit, pudding cup.

Wednesday, Oct. 22 -- Cold 
sandwich, chili, pineapple, 
pickle spears, sugar cookie.
Thursday, Oct. 23 -- BBQ 

pork sandwiches, spudsters, 
applesauce, peanut butter 
bar.
Friday, Oct. 24 -- Pizza­

cheese, sausage, pepperoni, 
peaches, fresh veggies/dill 
dip, ice cream.

ST. MATTHEW S SCHOOL
Monday, Oct. 20 -- Strom­

boli, French fries, baked 
beans, pickles, pears, bar, 
milk.

Tuesday, Oct. 21 - October 
Birthday Party: Sausage piz­
za, corn, garden salad, 
peaches & kiwi, birthday 
cake, milk.
Wednesday, Oct. 22 -- 

Baked ham, parsley potato, 
green beans, sweet potato, 
applesauce, dinner roll, milk.

Thursday, Oct. 23 -- Meat­
sauce & spaghetti, wax beans, 
tossed salad, orange wedge, 
garlic wedge, milk.

Friday, Oct. 24 - Egg pattie, 
cheese slice, star potatoes, 
broccoli & cauliflower, carrot 
sticks, mixed fruit, dinner 
roll, milk.

WASHINGTON COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM

For the Elderly Menu 
Meadowcreek Complex

Monday, Oct. 20 -- Steak 
fingers, pasta salad, Wiscon­
sin blend vegetables, banana, 
kaiser roll, chocolate chip 
cookie.

Tuesday, Oct. 21 -- Chilled 
pineapple, juice, baked ham, 
sweet potatoes, asparagus 
tips, cornbread muffin, 
pumpkin pie.

Wednesday, Oct. 22 -- BBQ 
riblet, augratin potatoes, 
green beans, greek seeded 
bread, apple streusel cake.

Thursday, Oct. 23 -- Chick­
en italiano, baked potato 
with sour cream, Italian 
blend vegetables, sourdough 
bread, chocolate ice cream.

Bingo 2nd and 4th Monday 
of the month, 10 - 11:30 a.m. 
Bring 50C prize to participate.

The grand essentials of hap­
piness are: something to do, 
something to love, something 
to hope for.

On October 7, Kewaskum 
Rescue was dispatched in the 
Village of Kewaskum for a 
person who passed out. A 
transport was made.

On October 8, Kewaskum 
Rescue was dispatched in the 
Village of Kewaskum for a 
person who had pain to the 
back of her head. A transport 
was made.

On October 9, Kewaskum 
Rescue was dispatched to the 
Town of Kewaskum for a per­
son who was involved in a 
rollover accident. A transport 
was made.

Also on October 9, Ke­
waskum Rescue was dis­
patched to the Village of Ke­
waskum for a person who 
had chest pain. A transport 
was made.

On October 10, Ke­
waskum Rescue and 
Boltonville First Responders 
were dispatched to the town 
of Farmington for a person

with severe bleeding to the 
leg. A transport was made.

On October 12, Ke­
waskum Rescue was dis­
patched to the town of 
Auburn for a person who had 
injuries from falling off a bi­
cycle. A transport was made.

Also on October 12, Ke­
waskum Rescue was dis­
patched to the town of Ke­
waskum for a person who 
fell. A transport was made.

Again on October 12, Ke­
waskum Rescue was dis­
patched to the town of 
Auburn for a person who had 
ankle pain. A transport was 
made.

MARRIAGE 
LICENSES

^New Births^
HE1PP — A daughter, Sierra 

Lynn, to Jody and Cory of 
Campbellsport, on Oct. 2.

Challenge yourself all the 
days of your life.

Andrew J. Maas, Ke­
waskum, and Rachel L. Brun­
ner, Kewaskum. Wedding 
Oct. 4.

Rodney A. Klebsch, Ke­
waskum, and Rebecca J. 
Rechek, Kewaskum. Wed­
ding Oct. 17.

Jeremy James Ruplinger 
and Katie Lynn Wettstein, 
both Village of Eden.

Steven Edward Kopischke 
and Michelle Renee Kohls, 
both Town of Eden.

Michael J. Dorn, Ke­
waskum, and Kate R. Barker, 
Kewaskum. Wedding Oct. 11.

Mathew J. Kedinger, town 
of Wayne, and Rachel A. 
Baier, town of Wayne. Wed­
ding Oct. 18.

Brian M. Wildt, town of 
Kewaskum, and Jacqueline J. 
Hass, town of Kewaskum. 
Wedding Oct. 25.

Kevin D. Nelson, Ke­
waskum, and Ruth A. Flasch, 
Kewaskum. Wedding Oct. 24.

XYZ CARD RESULTS
The winners at cards 

played at the Municipal 
Building Annex on Wednes­
day, Oct. 8th were: SKAT: 
Francis Gilboy, 17-2--15 net; 
Allen Reindl, 18-4--14 net; 
Francis Gilboy, Grand Ou- 
vert with 4.

Sheepshead: Laura 
Hammes, Harold Backhaus, 
Betty Jacak, Reiny Follmann 
and Athleen Butzke.

Mike’s Country 
Meats llc ^

Hot Ham L 
Homemade 
Rofc Every

WEEKLY SPECIALS
WEI)., OCT. 15 THRU TLES., OCT. 21

ANNIVERSARY SPECIALS

VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM

CURB SIDE LEAF PICKUP
Tuesday, October 21st 

and
Tuesday, November 4th, 2003

PLEASE PLACE BAGGED LEAVES IN CLEAR 
PLASTIC BAGS AT THE CURB FOR COLLECTION, 

(pumpkin bags ok)

Please make sure no debris, paper or litter is included. 
Clean leaves can be recycled in gardens and other uses.

Department of Public Works 
Jerry Gilles, Director

Anyone interested in receiving a truck load of bagged, or bulk leaves 
for mulching/recycling may call the Village Hall at 626-8484 for in­
formation.
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Beef and Pork Combo Roast 
Boneless Top Sirloin Steaks 

Minute Steaks ....................
-1/4 lb. Pork Loins.................
^Country Ribs.........................

8 pc. Cut up Chicken..........
Pork and Beef Bundles Now Available 

HOT SOUP Every Wednesday and Thursdays

$2.19 lb.
$5.99 lb.
$2.39 lb.
$1.99 lb. 
$1.59 lb. 
$ .99 lb.

Cokes many 
Flavors

Pumpkins, Indian 
| Corn, Corn 

Stalks and 
Gourds

NEW Taking Orders for Christmas Cut Out Cookies 
Many Shapes Just Frost and Eat

Celebrate our 1* Year the whole month of October 
For every $20.00 you spend receive $1.00 Coupon OFF 

your next purchase and A Thank You Sift.

NOW TAKING VISA AND MASTERCARD

We

Home Loan Division 
262/335-6262

Savings Bank 
..to Help.

OPEN. Tuesday-Friday 8 am-6 pm; Saturdays 8 am-4 pm: Sundays 8 am-1 pm

204 MAIN STREET, KEWASKUM 262-626-4741

http://www.kewiiskumstiitesman.com
mailto:ckuehl@kewaskumstatesman.com
mailto:nkuehl@kewaskumstatesman.com
kewaskumstatesman.com
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Community News

Broad Community Support For KEYS Run/Walk

Shown above are six of the poster contest winners poster’s. They 
are by, top lejt: Valerie Paulus, grade 5, FES; and top, right 
Georgianna Alfall, grade 5, WES. Middle, left, Block, grade 3, 
FES; right, Ayla Kunes, grade 3, KES. Bottom, left, Joe Ebert, 
grade 5, KES and right, Melanie Juech, 1st grade, WES

More award winning posters by, top right, Andrea Wiedmeyer, 
grade 2, WES and top left, Kelsey Heberer, KES, grade 3. Bottom 
row, left, Ashley Stahl, KES, grade 3 and right, Hunter Demmon, 
KES.

once again. KEYS also thanks 
all sponsors for their help in 
making this scholarship fund 
raiser so successful.

A glorious blue sky, cool 
temperatures and brilliant 
fall colors greeted the run­
ners and walkers of the 10th 
annual KEYS scholarship 
run/walk on Sunday, October 
12.

There were 846 registra­
tions for the event which 
raises money each year for

tered runners and walkers. 
On race day many more high 
school students assisted with 
the race by manning water 
stops, giving directions at 
corners and keeping bib tags 
in order at the finish line.

Elementary students cre­
ated colorful posters for the 
KEYS run/walk as a new

also formed teams and dis­
tributed race day materials to 
their members.

On race day many other 
volunteers assisted by setting 
up the race course, donating 
and setting up refreshments 
for runners and walkers, col­
lecting race day registration 
and pledges, helping hand

THANK YOU

I wish to thank everyone 
for their prayers, gifts to 
Immanuel Lutheran Church 
and coming to my open 
house in honor of my 90th 
birthday.

Malinda Garbisch

K-TOWN SKAT WINNERS
Skat winners on Monday, 

Oct. 6th were: Tom Radtke, 
22-8--14 net; George Minz, 
432 points; Butch Schmitt, 50 
high play.

The next skat will be 
Monday, Oct. 20, at 7:00 p.m. 
sharp. Angie D’s K-Town 
Saloon.

Kewaskum high school stu­
dents. Matt Thull was the 
winning male runner and 
Dot McMahon placed first for 
the females.

Dozens of high school 
students assisted with the 
race, both prior to and on 
race day itself. Students from 
Tim Rohlinger’s class did 
computer data entry for all 
the registrations received 
prior to Sunday morning.

Other students folded 
some 1,200 t-shirts and 
helped fill bags for pre-regis-

activity this year. First place 
winners were displayed at te 
registration headquarters for 
all to admire.

Staff members at all 
Kewaskum public and pri­
vate schools publicized the 
rce, created motivating activ­
ities to increase registration, 
collected and organized all 
registrations at their build­
ings, and packaged boxes of 
t-shirts and race numbers for 
their teams to be distributed 
at each of the schools. 
Businesses had captains who

our race numbers and shirts, 
and assisting with timing the 
race and recording results.

The management of a 
race with over 800 partici­
pants is a monumental task 
and could not be handled 
without the assistance of so 
many willing and helpful vol­
unteers from our wider com­
munity.

KEYS officials are proud 
of the broad community sup­
port this each year and are 
grateful to all runners and 
walkers for participating

®®®fe L) u i 
©W HMcsBart

GRADE A BONELESS
SKINLESS

CHICKEN
BREASTS...............................
USDA CHOICE 

SIRLOIN 
TIP ROAST .........................’2.99.

Specials good OcL 14* through OcL IS* unless noted.

ARTHRITIS AND ALL PAIN SUFFERERS

Take Control Of Your Pain
NATURALLY

NA TURE BLESSED MONTMORENCY

Tart Cherry Juice Concentrate..........
"Quality i\ our Chief Ingredient"

’20.99 «

Kewaskum 
Frozen Foods

118 Forest Ave., Mon. Thurs. 8 5:30; Frl 8 6; Sat 8-4
262 626-2181 • 1 800 660 2710

Sausage Plus 2$t
1421 W. Washington St, West Bend 262 334 4355
Monday Friday 9 to 6 • Saturday 9 to 5 • Closed Sundays 1®^

Visit us online @ www.kewaskumfrozenfoods.com

http://www.kewaskumfrozenfoods.com
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Community News
Kettle Kountry 

Twirlers Baton Corp.

The Kettle Kountry Twirlers. Front row, left to right: 
Leah Brown, Krystal Scannell, Rhianna Byrnes. 
Back row: Brenda Jaycox, and Nicole Meyer. Missing 
from picture: Crystal Marquardt, Brittany Zorn, Ash­
ley Zorn, Ashley Jones and Becky Steinert.

C-Sport Village Clerk/ 
Treasurer Honored

Kewaskum’s own Kettle 
Kountry Twirlers Baton Corp, 
are marching into their 
eighth season. They are a 
smaller group, but a very tal­
ented group. It seems Baton 
Twirling has gotten to be a 
lost “sport,” but the girls are 
trying to bring the excite­
ment back to this almost for­
gotten activity. Baton twirling 
takes a lot of patience, skill, 
grace and agility.

The first half of their ses­
sion, they learn new twirls 
and routines for their Febru­
ary program. They also do 
about 12 parades a year, in­
cluding Homecoming (in 
which they marched in the 
rain), and three Christmas 
parades, and many more 
during the summer. They 
participate in parades from 
as far away as Germantwon 
and as close as Boltonville.

They meet twice a week, 
Tuesdays and Thursdays,

with each class consisting of 
twirling, dance, flag and pom 
poms. Captain and head 
teacher, Crystal Marquardt, 
choregraphs all the routines 
and teaches the twirlers new 
twirls. They promote parent 
involvement to try to keep 
twirling fun.

For more information, 
call Cindy at 262-626-2037.

American adventurer Jim 
Bowie, who fell at the Alamo 
In 1836, actually adopted 
Mexican citizenship in 1830, 
two years after moving to 
what we now know as Texas.

Diane Lemke, CMC, Vil­
lage Clerk/Treasurer of the 
Village of Campbellsport, has 
been awarded the prestigious 
designation of “Certified Mu­
nicipal Clerk” (CMC) from 
the International Institute of 
Municipal Clerks (IIMC) for 
achieving its high education­
al, experience and service re­
quirements.

Ms. Lemke has been em­
ployed with the Village of 
Campbellsport since Septem­
ber 1990, where she serves in 
the position of Village 
Clerk/Treasurer.

She attained her designa­
tion as Certified Municipal 
Clerk through completion of 
the IIMC - approved Munici­
pal Clerks Institute Program 
conducted by the Govern­
mental Affairs Outreach, Of­
fice of Outreach and Exten­
sion, University of Wisconsin, 
Green Bay.

This program provides 
over 100 student/instructor 
contact hours of in-depth 
courses in managerial and 
leadership skills, social and 
interpersonalconcerns, and 
technical training needed to 
deal with changes taking 
place in government today.

She holds an Associate in 
Applied Science Degree in 
Accounting from Fond du 
Lac Technical Institute in 
Fond du Lac. She has attend­
ed courses and seminars 
sponsored by the Wisconsin 
Municipal Clerks Associa­
tion.

Active in professional affil­
iations she is a member of 
the International Institute of 
Municipal Clerks and Wis­
consin Municipal Clerks As­
sociation.

Ms. Lemke has been a

ing job performance and rec­
ognizes the professionaliza­
tion of the Municipal Clerk’s 
office.

Completion of a recog­
nized career development in­
stitute or a baccalaureate de­
gree in public administration 
or related field, responsible 
experience in local govern­
ment, and participation in 
conferences, meetings, and 
educational seminars are re­
quired to earn this presti­
gious Certified Municipal 
Clerk designation. Qualifica­
tions of applicants are re­

viewed and approved by the 
IIMC Program and Review 
Committee.

Heup cl^an^e a u^e/ 
Find out how your donated car, truck, 
boat, camper, or real estate can help 
change the lives of young men. 
Donors may receive a full tax benefit. 
Please call or visit our web site today.

1-800-RAWHIDE
www.rawhide.or*

Now thru 11/30

6 SESSIONS 
1 0 SESSIONS 
16 SESSIONS 
25 SESSIONS

? Full Shelf A 

Food Pantry 
. Barrel of 

Washington 
Co.

‘20.00
‘30.00
‘45.00
‘65.00

(*3.33 tan)
(’3.00 tan)
(*2.81 tan)

*35.00
‘25.00

2nd annual food drive
TANS for CANS

Bring in o non-perishable food and receive $5.00 off your purchase ^ 
of $ 15.00 or more prices w/non-perishable food.

1 month unlimited 
Student unlimited

(‘2.60 tan)

SUN SEEKERS TANNING SALON
1040 Fond du Lac Ave., (Hwy. 45) Kewaskum

262-626-4880
Tw Hok Mius. 4 n-5 pm; Fn. 6 m-? pm 

Sil la-) pm; Sa 10 «tl pm

Habitat for Humanity to 
Dedicate Third Home

Habitat for Humanity of 
Washington County is 
pleased to announce the 
dedication of their third new 
home on Sunday, October 26 
at 1 p.m. The home is located 
at 303 Salisbury Road in Bar­
ton and the proud new 
oweners are Laurie Hardy 
and her daughters.

Habitat for Humanity 
would like to thank all of the 
many volunteers who donat­
ed their time and talents to 
the construction of this new 
home. An heartfelt thanks go 
out to West Bend Mutual In­
surance Company who 
played in integral part in the 
construction of this home

and will play an active role in 
the dedication ceremony.

The dedication ceremony 
will take place at the site (303 
Salisbury Road) and anyone 
who has an interest is cor­
dially invited to attend.

member of the International 
Institute of Municipal Clerks 
since September 2001. She 
joins 227 active Municipal 
Clerks from the State of Wis­
consin who currently hold 
the designation of “Certified 
Municipal Clerk.”

The unique Certification 
Program of the IIMC was 
launched in 1970, climaxing a 
decade of planning. The pro­
gram aids municipal clerks 
and deputy clerks in improv-

ATTENTION PARENTS OF 
SCHOOL CHILDREN

• Wednesday, October 22 2pm-7:30pm
at Oakbrook Health Center, 1201 Oak St., West Bend

• Thursday, October 23 9am-4pm
at Oakbrook Health Center, 1201 Oak St., West Bend

• Saturday, October 25 9am-1 pm
at West Bend Clinic, 1700 W. Paradise Dr.

• Wednesday, November 5 9am-4pm
West Bend Clinic at Cedar Community, 559S Cty. Rd. Z

• Thursday, November 6 9am-4pm
at Oakbrook Health Center, 1201 Oak St., West Bend

• Saturday, November 8 9am-1 pm
at West Bend Clinic, 1700 W. Paradise Dr.

• Wednesday, November 12 9am-4pm
at Jackson Clinic, W22S N16711 Cedar Park Ct

• Thursday, November 13 9am-4pm
at Oakbrook Health Center, 1201 Oak St, West Bend

• Wednesday, November 19 9am-4pm
at Kewaskum Clinic, 1701 Fond du Lac Ave. (Hwy 4S)

Call 
The Kewaskum 

Statesman 
for your all ad­
vertising needs 
(2 62) 62 6-2 62 6

Everyone is urged to caution their children about 
crossing the street safely during school hours. With 
vision limited due to excess snow and buses not 
being able to stop quickly, children must use cau­
tion when crossing near buses or heavy traffic. 
Please help stop an accident BEFORE it happens!

The flu shot costs $20. No appointment is necessary.
Please check with your insurance in advance regarding coverage. 

For more information, please call 

262-334-1641, ext. 2121.

West Bend Clinic
a member of c t t 1 1---------------dj/^r^/Health

www.synergyhealth.org 792M(

http://www.synergyhealth.org
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Community News

Tennies Ace Hardware Nears 
Completion in Kewaskum

All bodies of water are subject to the tide-producing 
forces of the sun and moon, but only where oceans and 
continents meet are tides great enough to be noticed.

Breast Cancer Awareness Month. 
Time to take a closer look at your health.

The newly constructed Tennies Ace Hardware store on Fond du Lac Avenue on the 
South side of the village is nearing completion. David Tennies tells the Statesman that 
they hope to be moved into the building and operating by December 1, 2003. The 
Tennies family owns and operates two Ace Hardware stores in West Bend. Please con­
tinue to watch this newspaper for updates and an exact opening date.

tatesman Photo: Andrew Kuehl

Curves 30-minutc fitness, commonsrnsc weight loss program 
i ah also help diminish the risk of breast cancer. If you join 
the week of October 20 thru 26 and bring proof of your 
current mammogram, we ll waive the service fee 

www.curvetinternational.con>

Cioves
flic power to amaze yourself.”

Kewaskum Kiwanis Selling 
Entertainment Coupon Books

The Kewaskum Kiwanis 
Club is again selling the 
popular Entertainment 
coupon books for $35 each. 
This year Fond du Lac- 
Green Bay books are also 
available for $27.

The club would like to 
thank all those who pur­
chased books last year and 
made the sale a success. 
Monies raised from the sale 
were used to fund programs 
like the Jake’s Free Fishing 
Day, Public Library Summer 
Reading program and high 
school scholarships.

The books can be pur­
chased at any Kewaskum or 
West Bend Dairy Queen, The 
Kewaskum Statesman or 
The Kewaskum-Allenton 
Veterinary Clinic.

Coupons in the book can 
be redeemed at some of the 
following local businesses: 
Dairy Queen- SIX buy one 
get one FREE coupons’, 
Charcoal Grill, West 
Bend- buy one lunch or din­
ner entree, get the second at 
no charge! (an $9 value), 
Northwinds Supper Club, 
Eden- buy one dinner 
entree, get the second at no 
charge! (an $18 value), 
Susie’s Home Cooking, 
Lomira- buy one meal get 
the second at no charge! (an 
$6 value). Just after eating 
at these four fabulous 
restaurants your book is 
paid for!

Others include, El Rey 
Mexican Restaurant in West 
Bend, The Fireside in 
Allenton and many others! 
In addition to the above 
restaurants all TGI Friday’s, 
Pizza Huts, KFC, Pick N 
Saves offer coupons. Also 
offering various coupons are 
the following attractions: 
Milwaukee Admirals, 
Brewers, County Zoo, 
Mustangs and Wave. 
National chains offering 
coupons are: Target.com,

Continental Airlines, Hertz 
Auto Rentals, Ryder and 
Amtrak to name a few. One 
stay at the hundreds of 
hotels offering discounts can 
pay for the whole book itself, 
that’s right, ONE NIGHT’S 
STAY!

The books make the per­
fect anniversary, Christmas 
or birthday present and can

be purchased for areas other 
then Metro Milwaukee. The 
book can be used from now 
until November of 2004.

All funds raised from this 
sale will be used to refurbish 
buildings in Riverhill Park 
in Kewaskum, please show 
your pride and support for 
you community by purchas­
ing a book TODAY!

262-626-65(1(1 
1511 Fond du Lac Ave. 
Kewaskum, WI 53040

$0 
SI RVK Illi

Bring proot ol vmh# * 
current mammogram.

()i*r 6,000 Io, fttiohs to sen* you.

'♦Ta baaed on fiw wait enrollment, minimum I? mo c4 program, new members only Wild only at paffiupnrinf konont
Nor valid with any other offer

The
Kewaskum Veterinary Clinic 

is pleased to welcome

It’s Cut-Up and 
Clean-Up Time!
Chainsaws

Starting at

$179"

Chainsaws 
$269"

MS 170

w/14"bar

Farm Boss 
$309"

MS 290

KTT/U/ s

w/16"bar

Blowers
Starting at

We Sell
og Splitte

M $159"
bgss

fcrefflwesw rT^I AWRlDWA’lR'E"
112 South 5th Ave , West Bend • 338-2316 1625 South Main St. West Bend • 334-5891

COMING SOON TO KEWASKUM!

Dr. Jacqueline Borlen
to our staff.

Dr. Jacqueline is native of the Hartford 

area where she was raised on a dairy farm 

and has been active in the Washington 

County 4-H and FFA.
She recently graduated from School 

of Veterinary Medicine, University of 

Wisconsin-Madison.

The Kewaskum Veterinary Clinic is a full 

service veterinary hospital and a luxury 

boarding facility serving the needs of 

Kewaskum and the surrounding area 

for almost 50 years.

1040 Fond du Lac Ave. ^| 
Kewaskum, WI 53040

262-626-2380

http://www.curvetinternational.con
Target.com
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Local Events

Kettle Kountry Kolors 
Winners Announced

The Friends of Kewaskum 
featured three main raffles at 
the Kettle Kountry Kolors 
Festival held this past week­
end.

The winner of the auto­
graphed Brett Favre print was 
Ann Enright of Kewaskum.

Stacy Muckerheide of 
Kewaskum was the winner of 
the special Ducks Unlimited 
print that was donated by Joe 
Berres Insurance of 
Campbellsport. The framing 
of the print was courtesty of 
Artcentral of Kewaskum.

The third prize, A Night on 
the Town, was won by Willard 
Prost of Kewaskum. The prize 
included a $50 gift certificate 
courtesy of the Ildewile Inn in 
St. Cloud and four hours of 
limousine service by Phase I 
Limo of West Bend.

The Friends would like to 
sincerely thank all those who 
purchaed raffle tickets.

In addition to the raffles, 
Dodie Sargent of Little Folks 
Schoolhouse and Jeff Jaeger 
of Modern Woodmen, provid­
ed some prizes in the chil­
dren’s tent.

Winners of the Little Folks 
Schoolhouse coloring contest 
were: Ages 3-5 - Maddy 
Lehmann, Candyland game; 
6-8 - April Stern, Sponge Bob 
art desk and 9-12 - Alyssa 
Gruenwald, family game set.

Other drawings included a 
Mancala game, won by Kyle

Phillips; a Jumbling tower 
won by Timothy lenders; a 
paddleball set won by Jarret 
Sargent and a coloring 
bonanca won by Kaila Nigh.

Thanks to all sponsors and 
to all of those who participat­
ed in the coloring contest.

Volunteer
‘Holiday Coordinator - 

Assist "Mrs. Claus" in com­
municating with families 
wishing to give gifts to local 
families. Spend time on the 
phone and writing letters to 
match the families. Must 
have good verbal and written 
communication skills. 
Volunteer starting now 
through the holidays, several 
daytime hours per week.

‘Office Support Volunteer 
- Give a few hours a week in 
the office at an agency work­
ing with developmentally dis­
abled people. You will be 
working with client files, 
stuffing envelopes, filing, typ­
ing, copying, and shredding 
of documents. Must be able 
to type efficiently on a com­
puter, alphabetize, and be

organized!
‘ Ice Skating Enthusiast - 

Looking for a volunteer 
instructor to teach children 
ages 6-12 the basics of ice- 
skating! It will be a 3-week 
program in January or 
February, just an hour a week 
in Hartford. If you like work­
ing with youth and love ice- 
skating, this is perfect for you!

‘ Database Consultant - 
Help set up an Access data­
base to manage volunteers 
for an agency that works with 
the environment. Provide 
set-up advise and train key 
volunteers to use the Access 
database.

‘Youth Make a Difference 
Day - Friday, October 31st. 
The kids don't have school on 
Halloween, so why not do 
some community service! 
Participate in projects like 
pumpkin carving, office 
assistance, nature trail 
upkeep, garden clean up and 
a children's Halloween party. 
Call to register your kids ages 
12 and up!

Contact the Volunteer 
Center in West Bend at 262- 
338-8256 to get more infor­
mation on these and other 
opportunities to serve!

The $100,000 bill, with 
Woodrow Wilson’s portrait 
on the front, was printed only 
for use in transactions bet­
ween the Federal Reserve 
System and the Treasury 
Department.

COMMUNITY CALENDAR
OCTOBER

WEDNESDAYS - HIGHWAY 45 PROJECT INFORMATIONAL MEETINGS are held 
every Wednesday morning at 10:00 a.m. in the Community Room at Village Hall. 8-210 

THURSDAYS - KEWASKUM'S FARMERS MARKET - Every Thursday at Legion 
Clubhouse grounds, Fond du Lac Avenue. Call 626-4244 for information. mm

There is a $3.00 charge for publishing your event up to three times in the Community Calendar 
in advance. Calendar events are also listed on our website www.kewaskumstatesman.com

Santa ‘Paws’ Coming 
To the Humane Society

Santa will be flying in to 
the Washington County 
Humane Society courtesy of 
Portrait’s Today on Saturday, 
November 1st from 8:30 a.m. 
to 4 p.m. Pets (and their fami­
lies too if they’d like!) can get 
their picture taken with the 
man in red, and all proceeds 
go to benefit the homeless 
and unwanted animals at the 
Shelter.

Walk-ins are welcome, 
but preferene will be given to 
those who have an appoint­
ment. The cost is $20 and

includes four or five 4x6 pic­
tures. The finished photos 
will be available the following 
Saturday, November 8th at 
the Humane Society, and 
reprints will be available at 
Portraits Today in West Bend.

All dogs must be leashed 
an all other animals must be 
in a suitable carrier. The shel­
ter is located at 3650 Hwy. 60 
(halfway between Jackson 
and Slinger). For more infor­
mation or to make an 
appointment, call 262-677- 
4388.

Kettle Moraine Symphony
Opening Concert on Oct. 19

/ Faxing Service
/ Typesetting
/ Web Design
/ High Volume Copies
/ Media Placement
/ Wedding Invitations
/ Logo Design

250 Main Street Kewaskum
262-626-3312 Phone 262-626-1382 Fax

Camp Matawa 
Offering 
Halloween Camp 
New this fall, YMCA Camp 
Matawa is celebrating 
Halloween Camp! Halloween 
Camp, for kids ages 8-15, will 
correspond with the 
Wisconsin Teachers
Convention school break. 
The overnight adventure 
begins the evening of 
Wednesday, October 29th and 
concludes on Friday evening, 
October 31st. Summer camp 
counselors will lead campers 
through a variety of autumn 
activities; the haunted forest, 
hayrides, stories around the 
campfire and a pumpkin 
carving contest. Traditional 
camp activities such as 
archery, rock climbing, sports, 
and arts & crafts will also be 
offered. Sip hot cider and 
munch on roasted pumpkin 
seeds while spending 
Halloween in a setting like no 
other. Camp Matawa offers 
heated dorm style cabins with 
indoor bathroom and shower 
facilities in the beautiful 
Kettle Moraine State Forest. 
YMCA Camp Matawa is a year 
round, residential camp facil­
ity located at N885 Youth 
Camp Road, Campbellport. 
Both YMCA members and 
non-members are welcome to 
attend. For additional infor­
mation or to register call 
YMCA Camp Matawa at 
262/626-2149.

The Kettle Moraine 
Symphony opens the 2003- 
2004 performance season in 
grand style at the Schauer 
Arts & Activities Center in 
Hartford on Sunday, Oct. 19 
at 7:30 p.m.

The program features the 
work of Nikolai Rimsky- 
Korsakoff in his “Schehe­
razade.” This symphonic 
composition is inspired by 
the “Tales of the Arabian 
Nights,” evoking all the exotic 
charm and mystery of fabled 
Baghdad.

In the second half of the 
program, the orchestra is

joined for the first time by the 
60 voices of the Hartford 
Community Chorus, under 
the direction of Ruth Knoll. 
The two groups will join 
forces in a selection of sacred 
and secular works, climaxing 
in Peter Wilhousky’s stirring 
arrangement of “The Battle 
Hymn of the Republic.”

Tickets of the Opening 
Concert are priced at only $14 
(A Section) and $11 (B 
Section) and can be pur­
chased by calling the Schauer 
Center box office at 262-670- 
0560 Monday to Friday, 11:30 
a.m. to 5:30 p.m.

town

• Monday - Baked Ham
• Tuesday - Pot Roast
• Wednesday - Pork Steak
• Thursday - Cabbage Rolls
• Fri. - All-U-Can-Eat Fish Fry
• Saturday - Daily Specials
• Sunday - Breakfast Specials

10% Senior Citizen Discount Tuesday & Wednesday
Hours: Monday thru Saturday 6 am-8 pm; Sunday 6 am-3 pm

, , 626-2154
Home Cooking at it s Finest

Kewaskum
1041 Fond du Lac Ave.

Specials Monday, Oct. 20 * Sunday, Oct. 26

Annual

CHILI DINNER
’^m^ SUNDAY,

^ OCTOBER 26
'. 11 am to 2 pm

SALEM UNITED
CHURCH OF CHRIST

AT WAYNE
8925 Hwy. W, Campbellsport

All You Care to Eat Chili
Crackers, Homemade Bread, Cheese, Desserts, Coffee 

& Milk, Hot Dogs/Chips available for children

TICKETS $4.00 • children 5 and under FREE

Kewaskum vs Campbellsport

Pre-game

TAILGATE PARTY 
at Kewaskum Fire House 

Friday, Oct. 17 
4 to 7 pm

Chili, Brats, 
Burgers and 

Refreshments

All profits to benefit 
Kewaskum Athletics

Sponsored by Kewaskum Fire Department J io Y-2t

http://www.kewaskumstatesman.com
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People News

Schwartz - (Mueller Campus Notes
Marian College of Fond 

du Lac has awarded scholar­
ships to the following stu­
dents who started attending 
Marian College in the fall of 
2003: Stephanie Grigg-Remil- 
lard Kewaskum and Jackie A. 
HugCampbellsport.

Marian offers more than 
30 majors in business, educa­
tion, nursing, social work, ad­
ministration of justice and 
other areas. For more infor­
mation on Marian College 
programs and scholarships 
available, call 1-800-2-M-A- 
R-I-A-N.

Punt, Pass 
And Kick 
Winners

Community Bulletin Board

Oct. 16: Sherry Sue Becker
Lori J. (Pfister) Schmidt
Mitchell Beine
Amie Stephani

Oct. 17: Cindy Scheid
Oct. 19: Eileen Ramthun

Bernie Bodden
Oct. 20: Kimmy Gizewski

Jeff Taylor
Betsy Jesowshek

Oct. 22: Brent Brennan
Gary Grichtmeier

To have a birthday announced on the Community Bulletin Board
Phone - 262-626-2626 Fax - 262-626-1382 
or E-mail - ckuehl@kewaskumstatesman.com

There is a deadline 3 pm Monday for Thursday publication.

Jim and Phyllis Schwartz 
of West Bend are pleased to 
announce the engagement of 
their daughter, Tina Schwartz 
to Sawa Mueller, son of Tim 
and Gina Mueller of Milwau­
kee.

Tina is a 1992 graduate of 
Kewaskum High School and 
has her Bachelors of Social 
Work degree from UW 
Oshkosh. She is currently

working on her Masters de­
gree in Social Work and will 
graduate in May of 2004.

Sawa is a 1992 graduate 
of Milwaukee Marshall High 
School and has a Mass Com­
munications degree from UW 
LaCrosse. He is employed as a 
Product Manager at Avid 
Technologies in Madison.

A November 1, 2003 wed­
ding is planned.

Faehling to be Inducted Into 
Upper Iowa Athletic Hall of Fame

Robert "Chip" Faehling

Five Upper Iowa Univer­
sity alumni have been select­
ed as the 24th class of in­
ductees into the Athletic Hall 
of Fame during the Home- 
coming celebration Friday, 
October 10. Candidates are 
nominated for the Hall of 
Fame based on outstanding 
athletic, coaching or officiat­
ing careers.

The five-member class of 
2003 includes: Anthony 
“Tony" DiCecco, 1971 (coach­
ing category), Robert "Chip” 
Faehling, 1989 (athletic cate­
gory), Greg Hutchinson, 1974 
(athletic category), Joe Ko- 
vacevich, 1963 (athletic cate­
gory) and Bill Roths, 1973 (of­
ficiating category).

Robert “Chip” Faehling, 
class of 1989, is being induct­
ed into the Upper Iowa Uni­
versity of Fame as an athlete. 
He was a four-year letter win­
ner in tennis - 1986, 1987, 
1988 and 1989. He captured 
the 1988 Iowa Conference 
Tennis Singles Champi­

onship. He was thus honored 
by the ILAC in 1988 as the 
conference Most Valuable 
Player in tennis.

Faehling has been recog­
nized by those on the outside 
as the best tennis player at 
Upper Iowa these past five 
decades, if not all-time, he 
was coached by Dr. Walter 
Griffin, who stated, “I 
coached and observed many 
tennis teams at Upper Iowa 
for nearly 25 years and Chip 
was the most outstanding 
during that entire period.” 
Faehling is Upper Iowa Uni­
versity’s only collegiate sin­
gles champion. In 1987, he 
reigned as UIU Homecoming 
King. He earned a B.A. degree 
in Businesses Management.

Presently, Faehling is a 
Sales Representative with the 
Hewlett-Packard Company, 
where he has been honored 
from 2000 to 2002 in the High 
Achiever Club. A graduate of 
West Bend West High School, 
Chip and his wife Rhonda re­
side in Kewaskum. They have 
two daughters, Sydney and 
Kaya.

The inductions took 
place at the Hall of Fame ban­
quet Friday evening, October 
10. The class of inductees 
were also recognized during 
halftime of the Peacocks’ 
Homecoming football game 
against Central College.

Winners of the Knights of 
Columbus Punt, Pass and 
Kick Program which was held 
on Saturday, Septem-ber 20, 
at the KC Hall, West Bend 
have been announced.

Winners for the girls were 
Ashley Brugger, age 10; Hilla- 
ree Fisher, age 11, and 
Michelle Cahoon, age 12.

Winners for the boys were 
Matthew Rychtik, age 8; Jacob 
Perez, age 9; Tony Cahoon, 
age 10, and Nathan Wendel- 
born, age 12.

The above competed in the 
Diocesan contest held on Sat­
urday, October 11 in 
Oconomowoc. A thank you is 
extended to all the partici­
pants. It was a fun time.

The essence of genius is know­
ing what to overlook

Assisted Living
for the Elderly
Enjoy Living in Kewaskum!

We can provide 24-hour assisted living 
in our Community-Based Residential 
Facility. Independent Apartments with 
services available, such as meals and 
housekeeping are also available.

Now accepting applications for residency.

For more information, call:
Lisa Stockhausen at MapleDale Manor 

(262) 626-1658

Car Wash Specials
Buy Any four Washes and Save s3 (Mix or Match) 

Buy 5 s8 Washes for s35 or 5 7 Washes for s30 
a Savings of s5

Available only at Rain Dance Car Wash.

Buy 8 gallons gasoline or more at Kewaskum Mobil 
and SAVE51 on any wash.

„ L RAIN DANCE
CAR WASH O

Fond du Lac Ave., z | i
KEWASKUM CO X "

mailto:ckuehl@kewaskumstatesman.com


Thursday, October 9, 2003Page 8

School News
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Registration Deadline is
Nov. 7 For Next ACT Test

Kewaskum

CoHege-bound high
school students who want to 
take the ACT test for college 
admissions have two chances 
to register before the 
December 13 national test 
date. The postmark registra­
tion deadline is Friday, 
November 7. There is also a 
late registration postmark 
deadline on November 20 (an 
additional fee is required for 
late registration). Students 
can get information from 
their high school counselor or
register online 
www.act.org.

at

ACT scores are accepted 
by virtually all colleges in the 
nation, including all Ivy 
League schools. The ACT is a 
curriculum-based achieve­
ment test, not an aptitude 
test. There are four sections,

covering English, reading, 
math and science. The test 
cover material that students 
study in high school.

ACT scores are considered 
by colleges for admissions 
and course placement, along 
with several other important 
factors including high school 
GPA, college Prep courses 
taken in high school, 
extracurricular activities, per­
sonal background and other 
information. The test fee is 
$26.

To learn more about the 
ACT Assessmant, including 
registration forms and test 
locations, contact your high 
school counselor or go to the 
ACT website www.act.org, 
which also offers helpful 
information including test- 
prep advice, sample tests and

Hosting 
Jam Nov. 7 
other useful information

4-H News
Submitted by 

Mitch We indo rf 
Club Reporter

Parent Info Night Oct. 27
Kewaskum High School is 

hosting a Parent Information 
Night on October 27th at 7 
p.m. at the Kewaskum High 
School Library.

The program will be about 
what do kids and cops know 
about drugs in our communi­
ties that parents NEED to
know, 
about

Parents will learn 
drug trends in

Washington County, how to 
identify drugs and drug para­
phernalia, where parents can

go for help and information 
and the KSD’s policy for drug 
possession.

It will be presented by 
Lieutenant Robert Konstanz, 
Sheriff’s Dept. Drug Unit; 
Linda Dymond, The Council 
on Alcohol and Other Drug 
Abuse and Christine Horbas, 
Kewaskum High School 
Principal.

Pre-registration is NOT 
required.

S.T.A.N.D. will be hosting 
Jansen Park Jam at the Jansen 
Park Multipurpose Building - 
3745 Schuster Drive, West 
Bend, on Friday, November 
7th from 7 to 11 p.m., with
music by Flatline 
Elements of Style.

and 
All

Washington County High 
School Students are invited to 
attend this event. A high 
school student ID and $4 is 
required to get in the door.

S.T.A.N.D. (Students 
Taking Action Not Drugs) is a 
collaborative effort between 
Kewaskum and West Bend 
High School Students, under 
the direction of The Council 
on AODA of Washington 
County and Kettle Moraine 
YMCA’s Assets For Youth to 
provide fun events for high 
school students without 
using alcohol and other 
drugs. To get more informa­
tion about S.T.A.N.D., please 
call Linda Dymond at The 
Council on AODA at 262-335- 
6888.

The Kewaskum 4-Hers 
meeting on October 2, 2003 
was the Club Open House. 
Everyone brought refresh­
ments. Members brought 
projects and talked about 
them for newcomers. Katrina 
Luther did a demonstration 
on how to groom a dog. The 
next meeting, on November 
6, 2003 we will be installing 
the new officers.

Find out how your donated car, 
truck, boat, camper, or real estate 
can help change the lives of young 
men. Donors may receive a full tax 
benefit. Please call or visit our web 

site today.

^Tn 8MWIIDE
Since 1965

1-SOO-RAWHIDE www.rawnicle.org

KSD News

An investment in knowledge 
always pays the best interest.

-Benjamin Franklin

The Wayne and Farmington Pl Os will be holding Halloween 
Activity nights. WES will hold theirs on October 24th from 6:30 
to 8:30 p.m. FES will hold theirs on October 25th.

On October 28th, KES will have a School-wide Learning Day 
at the Zoo. Students will be traveling to the Milwaukee County 
Zoo and spend an entire school day at the zoo. They will start the 

_ day at 10 a.m. and will continue until 2:15. The day will be run 
like a school day, only in a different location.

KMS is running a “Mr. Rogers’ Memorial Sweater Drive” from 
October 6th through October 24th. They are looking for new or 
freshly cleaned sweaters of all sizes. All sweaters will be used to 
help the less fortunate.

KUS teacher Patrick Moerchen recently announced that he 
received a $1,700 grant from Regal Ware to help with his pro­
grams at the school.

On October 21st students at KHS, who are interested, will be 
taking the PSAT from 7:45 until 11 a.m. All other classes will run 
as scheduled.

When was the last time you ...

■ Were screened for heart disease?

■ Had a prostate exam?

■ Were checked for diabetes?

Live for today ■ Reviewed your diet and nutritional needs?

■ Had a colorectal cancer screening?

Are you a man over 50?
Take a proactive approach 
to your health. A few simple 
screenings could save your life.

■ Had your cholesterol and blood 

pressure checked?Stay healthy 
for tomorrow.

Aurora Health Care
www.AuroraHealthCare.ory

Schedule an Over 50 Wellness Exam 
for men at one of our four convenient 
Washington County locations.

Aurora Health Center Aurora Health Center
1004 E. Sumner St, Hartford 205 Valley Ave., West Bend
(262) 670-7000 (262) 338-1123
Aurora Health Center Aurora Health Center
1061 E. Commerce Blvd. (Hwy. 60), Slinger N168 W20060 Main St., Jackson
(262) 644-2900 (262) 677-3661

The Over 50 Wellness Exam may differ by patient's family history and other personal health factors.

http://www.act.org
http://www.act.org
http://www.rawnicle.org
http://www.AuroraHealthCare.ory
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KHS Booster Club Presents Iowa Not Only About Corn
MVP and Senior Awards

Shown above are the students who received MVP and/or Senior Awards from the 
Kewaskum Booster Club.

It was a privilege to pres­
ent individuals for MVP (Most 
Valuable Person) and Senior 
Awards (Seniors that have let­
tered six or more times during 
their high school career) for 
the 2002-2003 seasons. The 
Booster Club recognizes 
these students for their ex­
ceptional effort, perform­
ance, team and individual 
leadership as recognized by 
their coaches, advisors, and 
teammates.

Awards went to Lorajo 
Christie-Cheerleading; Kyra 
Meyer-Forensics; Jenna 
Roecker-Senior Award; Jenny 
Harter-Student Council; Troy 
Koeferl-Football and Senior 
Award; Jake Wilson-Football; 
Jacqueline Chambers-Senior 
Award; Alison Yanke-Musical
and Swing Choir; Matt Hart- 
mann-Track and Senior 
Award; Michael McKee-Se­
nior Award; Justin Wessing- 
Senior Award, Jessica Gra­
ham-Track and Senior Award; 
Kayla Sauer-Fast Pitch Soft- 
ball; Travis Kempf-Basketball, 
Baseball; Tennis and Senior 
Award; Marty Harris- 
Wrestling; Amy Fehlhaber-

KHS Senior Citizen Bingo Night

B4 you make any other 
plans for Tuesday, October 21, 
join us for food, refreshments 
and some exciting bingo at 
the Kewaskum High School 
Cafeteria! The KHS Student 
Council is sponsoring a bingo 
night for area Senior Citizens 
and students of the High 
School from 6:00 to 8:00 PM.

Individuals may come 
with a student, as a group or 
on their own. This will be a 
great opportunity to meet 
people and if you are lucky, 
win some prizes. Bingo cards 
will cost $0.25 with no limit 
on the number of cards per 
game. Complimentary des­

Vocal Music; Kathryn Klug, 
Lindsay Keller-Basketball; 
Brian Mertz-Vocal Music; 
Corey Darmody-Football; 
Heather Meyer-Volleyball; 
Kurtis Cochran-Soccer and 
Senior Award; Amanda Breit- 
Cheerleading; Beth Boedek- 
er-Basketball; Crystal Dreher- 
Golf; Alexa Nelson-Senior 
Award; Lauri Bausch-Senior 
Award; Becky Herriges-Cross 
Country and Senior Award; 
Amanda Donath - Track; 
Katie Kurer-Tennis; Andy 
Lickel-Senior Award; Dan 
West-Instrumental Music; 
and Josh Meyer-Cross Coun­
try and Track. Jennifer Koth- 
Senior Award; Josh Riebe- 
Golf.

The purpose of the KHS 
Booster Club is to promote
interest and help support co- 
curricular activities of the 
school. All money raised by 
the Booster Club is used for 
the sole benefit of the stu­
dents involved in co-curricu- 
lar activities. Recent purchas­
es include: chess clocks, 
wrestling mat resurfaced, 
soccer goals, goal posts, soc­
cer bags & balls, VCR for

serts and refreshments will be 
provided.

Student Council is also 
offering free leaf raking on 
Saturday, October 25 from 
10:00 to 5:00. Senior Citizens 
living in the village can sign 
up to have their yards raked at 
the bingo night or by calling 
Stacy La Ronge at (262) 626- 
8427 ext. 4255.

No one can predict the heights 
you can soar, even you will not 
know until you spread your 
wings.

sports, batting cage net, soft- 
ball pitching machine, high 
jump pit, and a new scoring 
table. If you are interested in 
helping with various events 
or joining the KHS Booster 
Club please come to a meet­
ing. Booster Club meets every 
third Monday of the month in 
the KHS Library at 7:00 p.m. 
Our next meeting is October 
20th, 2003.

Morality is character and con­
duct such as is required by the 
circle or community in which 
the man’s life happens to be 
placed. It shows how much 
good men require of us.

-Henry Ward Beecher

Education: Dr. Meuler earned his Doctor of Optometry degree from Indiana 
University School of Optometry and completed his residency at the VA Hospital in 
Lexington, Kentucky. He was a clinical assistant professor at Indiana University 
School of Optometry until returning to Wisconsin in 1985 to continue practicing 
optometry.

Philosophy of Care: "I interact with patients in a relaxed yet | 
professional manner, where open communication is essential. I 
believe in the philosophy that patients 'don't know how much you A;, 
know until they know how much you care’. I provide a full range 
of optometry services an/enjoy seeing patients of all ages."

Please welcome
Optometrist Mark Meuler, O.D.

EYE DEPARTMENT!

Interests: Dr. Meuler has a special interest in geriatric optometry. Away from work, 
he coaches a variety of youth sports and enjoys traveling with his family.

New Patients Welcome!

To make an appointment 
or schedule a free 10-minute 

"Get Acquainted Visit" 
call 262-338-0068

West Bend Clinic 
a member of c TT LI-------- -qy^r^Health
1700 W. Paradise Dr., West Bend 

800-825-0513
www.synergyhealth.org

Well, here we are again, 
getting ready for, and talking 
about, the musical STATE 
FAIR, which is set in the state 
of Iowa. My impression of 
Iowa has always been about 
corn and pigs, and believe it 
or not, that’s exactly what Os­
car Hammerstein II wrote 
about in his screenplay about 
STATE FAIR.

Once, when he was ac­
cused of being corny, he 
freely admitted to it. "But is­
n’t life sometimes corny?" he 
asked, and of course it is. 
What could be cornier than a 
tentative young couple in the 
moonlight sharing a first kiss? 
Or an animal so beloved he’s 
like a member of the family? 
But such things do happen, 
and they are real, and STATE 
FAIR is played for you like it is 
real.

Of course, the whole story 
could be told to you through 
these newspaper articles, but 
the fun of the story and the 
show must be experienced by 
you in person, so get ready 
(purchase your tickets), get 
set (load up the car), and go 
(to the Kewaskum High 
School performance) of 
STATE FAIR.

Performances are sched­
uled for Friday, November 7, 
and Saturday, November 8,

TUTTLE CREEK LEARNING CENTER, INC.
1623 Fond du Lac Avenue • Kewaskum, Wl 53040 

(262)626-4155

Ages 6 Wks-11 Yrs 
M-F 6:30 AM-6:00 PM
Before & After School Program
At KES Ages 5-11 Yrs 
FAX (262)626-1675

2003. The performances will 
begin at 7:30 PM. Tickets can 
be obtained by personally 
stopping at the high school 
music offices on Monday 
evening, October 20, from 
6:00 PM to 8:00 PM, or any­
time after that, or by calling 
626-8427, extension 4571.

Cost of the tickets are the 
same as the past few years 
and all seats are reserved. You 
will be able to purchase $5.00 
seats, which puts you close to 
the stage, $4.00 seats which 
aren’t as close, but are still on 
the floor, and, of course, the 
$3.00 bleacher seats.

There will be a free per­
formance for sen'< r citizens 
on Thursday, November 6th 
at 4 p.m. in Rose Hall. Due to 
budget restraints, refresh­
ments will not be served at 
this time.

Behold the turtle. He makes 
progress only when he sticks 
his neck out.

Annual Statesman 
Subscriptions Starting 

at Only $25 Call 
(262) 626-2626

Full-Time Positions 
Open in Our Infant Room

Audra E. Beyer
Owner/Administrator
Shelly Marx
Asst. Administrator 
Crystal Branta 
Asst Director

to the West Bend Clinic

http://www.synergyhealth.org


rooms you’ll 
FALL in love with again and again
Fields Homescapes is here to help 
you find your own level of comfort and 
design. With hundreds of furnishings to 
choose from, along with in-store advice 
on color, space and styles -
Fields Homescapes is full of ideas and 
inspirations.

FALL STOREWIDE 

SALE ON NOW.

150 Veterans Avenue • Downtown West Bend 
262-334-4024 • 800-654-3435
Monday, Wednesday, Friday 10:00am - 8:00pm
Tuesday and Thursday 10:00am - 6:00pm
Saturday 10:00am - 5:00pm
Sunday 11:00am - 4:00pm

in Downtown West Bend

FIEID5H0MBCAPB
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Kettle Kountry Kolors A Huge Success

Gary Cross kicked ojf the weekend with the Modern 
Woodmen dance that followed the Woody s Steak­
house Fish Boil. Proceeds from the dance and a dol­
lar of every fish plate served was donated to the 
Washington County Dive team.

Left to right, Jeanne Becker, Barb Liegl and Nicole Kuehl helped many others sell 
RegalWare cookware at the Jestival. Regal Ware donated half oj the proceeds oj 
the sale to the Friends oj Kewaskum for the Kettle Kountry Kolors Jestival.

LEFT: Downtown Harri­
son, sponsored by St. 
Frances Bank, Ke­
waskum, entertained a 
full house Saturday. The 
Friends of Kewaskum 
are hoping to have Harri­
son perform at future 
functions.

RIGHT: Chaz Dreher, the 
little guy in the front, 
holds a tree frog brought 
to the festival by David 
Stokes, shown in back, 
and his animal adven­
tures. Chaz is the son of 
Chuck and Kris Dreher of 
West Bend.

A Commitment to Quality

Certified Collision Repair Specialists
♦♦Complete Body and Frame Repair*♦

* Computerized Estimates
* Hail and Deer Damage

* Truck Accessories
* Written Warranty

♦♦Expert Color Matching and Refinishing**

(920)533=5930
420 S. Fond du Lac Ave., Campbellsport, WI 53010 (next to King Pin Lanes) 

Hours: Mon-Fri 8:00am-5:00pm; Sat. 8:00am-12:00pm 
ointment

THANK YOU
to everyone who attended, volunteered, 

participated or donated to the success of 

the Annual Kettle Kountry Kolors Festi­

val this past weekend at River Hill Park.

Without many hands working together, it 

never would have become a reality. 

Thanks to all of you there will be a 15th 

Annual Kettle Kountry Kolors Festival on 

October 8,9 & 10, 2004.

Friends of Kewaskum 

Proud Sponsors of the

Kettle Kountry Kolors Festival
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Scarecrow Contest Winners Announced

Kewaskum Middle School's first place 
scarecorw ”Yee haa The Teenage Scare­
crow" by Kelsey and Meghan Ballard.

KMS’s second place 
scarecrow "Sagoa The 
Panda" by Allie Groeschel

KMS’s third place scarecrow “Ahlloween 
Witch of the Sea" by Krystal Scannell.

Holy Trinity's first place scarecrow 
“Pirate" by the seventh grade.

St. Lucas's first place scarecrow 
“Shaneque" by Frederick Fellenz, 
Paul Anderson and Sean Her- 
rtges.

and Sophie Dahlen.

Holy Trinity’s second place scarecrow “Ke­
waskum Kettle Kountry Kolors Artist” by the 
sixth grade.

Holy Trinity’s third place scarecrow “Turkey" by 
Parson, Rinzel, Larson, Wellman, Simones, 
Wendt and Tom.

RIGHT: St. Lu­
cas’s third place 
scarecrow “"Too 
Tall Butch" by 
Greg Sarauer, 
Mitch Keller, Jake 
Theusch and Paul 
Hoenecke.

WINTERIZE
YOUR BOAT!

COMPLETE • Oil & Filter Change
I/O PACKAGE - fuo! fiber

* a a a * Stabilize Fuel
t 2 • Drain & Fill Lower Unit

St. Lucas’s second place scarecrow 
“Buck Tooth Bob" by Adam Edel, Rick 
Hansen, Jesse Backhaus and Kyle 
Witte.

TOM'S
MARINE SERVICE

Comer of V & B in Eden

• Winterize Engine 
with Nonloxic Antifreeze

• Grease Fittings
I • Fog Engine

Most Outboards $25

920-477-3500 ^^^^^
FACTORY TRAINED MARINE MECHANIC WITH 22 YEARS EXPERIENCE!
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ft Obituaries
LLOYD H.TEESELINK RALPH O. KURTH

Lloyd H. Teeselink, age 81, 
of Kewaskum, passed away 
on Thursday, October 9, 2003 
at Community Memorial 
Hospital in Menomonee 
Falls.

He was born on Ft 
ruary 22, 1922 in Ar 
mour, South Dako 
ta, the son of the 
late William and 
Nina (Schol- ( 
ten) Teeselink, > 
and when Lloyd 
was 15 years old the family 
moved to Wisconsin. Lloyd 
served his country in the U.S. 
Army during World War II 
from October 1942 until 
March 1946, and on April 17, 
1946, he was united in mar­
riage to Evangeline Schmidt 
in Iowa City, Iowa.

Lloyd was employed by 
Regal Ware, Inc. in Kewaskum 
for 39 years, where he was a 
member of the 25 Year Club. 
He was a member of Peace 
United Church of Christ in 
Kewaskum, where he held 
various offices in the church. 
He was also a member of the 
Robert G. Romaine American 
Legion Post 384 Kewaskum, 
the Kewaskum Lions Club, 
Modern Woodmen, XYZ Se­
nior Citizens Club, Ke­
waskum Historical Society, 
Kewaskum Auxiliary Police 
and he was a Boy Scout vol­
unteer.

He enjoyed spending time 
with his family and friends, 
playing cards, gardening, 
traveling, camping and going 
around town on his scooter. 
He will be deeply missed by 
his wife, family and friends.

Survivors include his lov­
ing wife of 57 years, Evange­
line of Kewaskum; three chil­
dren, David (Sheila) Teeselink 
of Sheboygan, Dean (Joann) 
Teeselink of Davenport, Iowa 
and Renee Schrab of Green­
field; four grandchildren, 
Aaron Schrab, Sara (Matt) 
Gehrke, Lisa Teeselink and 
Matt Teeselink; two step 
grandchildren, Laura (Jere­
my) Weber and Tanya (Mike) 
Schwinn; two great-grand­
children, Micah and Caleb 
Gehrke; a step great-grand­
daughter, Natasha Schwinn; 
two brothers, Harry (Laurel) 
Teeselink of Minocqua and 
Ken (Evonne) Teeselink of 
Tempe, Arizona; two sisters, 
Margaret Erdmann of Eagle 
River and Mabel (Ed) Olivier 
of Menomonee Falls; a sister- 
in-law, Ione Schmidt of Ke­
waskum, nieces, nephews, 
other relatives and many 
friends.

He was preceded in death 
by a brother, two sisters, a 
son-in-law and three broth- 
ers-in-law.

Funeral services were held 
at 4:00 p.m. on Monday, Octo­
ber 13, 2003 at Peace United 
Church of Christ in Ke­
waskum. Rev. Eric Kirkegaard 
officiated and burial with mil­
itary graveside rites followed 
in the church cemetery.

Friends called on Monday 
at the church from 1:00 p.m. 
until the time of services.

Memorials to Peace U.C.C. 
are appreciated.

The Miller Funeral Home, 
Kewaskum served the family.

Ralph O. Kurth, age 70, a 
lifelong resident of the town 
of Farmington, passed away 
at his home on Friday 
evening, October 10, 2003 
surrounded by his fam * 
after a long struggle 
with cancer.

He was born on 
July 30, 1933 in 
the town of 
Farmington, 
the son of the 
late William and Estelle ' 
(Schuster) Kurth. Ralph 
served his country in the U.S. 
Army from 1953-55, serving 
some of his service time in 
Germany. On October 19, 
1963, he was united in mar­
riage to Shirley Stapelkamp at 
First Reformed Church in 
Cedar Grove.

Ralph farmed in the town 
of Farmington all of his life 
and was a milk hauler for 
many years. He was a mem­
ber of Immanuel Lutheran 
Church in the town of Scott, 
and he loved playing cards 
and fishing.

Survivors include his lov­
ing wife, Shirley of the town of 
Farmington; two children, 
Debra (Dennis) Backhaus of 
Kewaskum and David (Debo­
rah) Kurth of Random Lake; 
five grandchildren, Jesse, 
Abrielle and Garrett Back­
haus, Adam and Amy Kurth, 
other relatives and friends.

He was preceded in death 
by a brother, Myron Kurth; 
two sisters, Avilla Kreif and 
Myrtle Lothringer and a 
brother-in-law, Wilmer 
Hoopman.

Funeral services were held 
at 3:00 p.m. on Tuesday, Octo­
ber 14, 2003 at Immanuel 
Lutheran Church in the town 
of Scott. Rev. Kurt Ziemann 
officiated and burial with mil­
itary graveside rites followed 
in the church cemetery.

Friends called on Tuesday 
at the church from noon until 
the time of services.

The Miller Funeral Home 
in Kewaskum served the fam­
ily-

“To Our Loved One"

In tears we saw you sinking, 
we watched you fade away.

You suffered much in silence, 
you fought so hard to stay.

You faced your tasks with

Tim Reis

courage, your spirit did not 
bend.

But still you kept on fighting 
until the end.

God saw you were getting 
tired, when a cure was not 
to be,

So he put His arms around 
you and whispered, “Come 
with me"

p.m. until the time of services.
Memorials to the St. Lucas 

Building Fund are appreciat­
ed.

JOSEPH W. JUDNIC

Your loving wife 
and family

ELDA KUEHL

Elda Kuehl, age 89, of Ke­
waskum, passed away on Fri­
day, October 10, 2003 at 
Mayville Nursing and Reha­
bilitation Center in Mayville.

She was born on August 
30, 1914 in the town of There­
sa, the daughter of the late 
William and Emma (Erd­
mann) Gutzmer, and on July 
15, 1939, she was united in 
marriage to Jacob L. Kuehl at 
St. Paul’s Lutheran Church in 
the town of Lomira. Her hus­
band preceded her in death 
on December 24, 1978.

Elda was a graduate of 
Lomira High School. She was 
employed by Regal Ware, Inc. 
in Kewaskum for over 20 
years and was one of the 
founders of the Kewaskum 
Sno-Chiefs. Elda was a mem­
ber of St. Lucas Evangelical 
Lutheran Church in Ke­
waskum and the Ladies Aid.

Survivors include three 
children, Richard (Sharon) 
Kuehl of Beechwood, Jerome 
“Butch” (Pamela) Kuehl of 
Campbellsport and Beverly 
(Warren) Gagner of Colorado 
Springs, Colorado; three 
grandchildren, Justin Kuehl, 
Nikki and Cody Gagner; a
brother-in-law, John
Kedinger of Oakfield, other 
relatives and friends.

She was preceded in death 
by a brother, Elmer Gutzmer 
and three sisters, Marie 
Kedinger, Elvira Bintzler and 
Lorna Priest.

Funeral services were held 
at 7:00 p.m. on Tuesday, Octo­
ber 14, 2003 at the Miller Fu­
neral Home in Kewaskum. 
Rev. Edwin Fredrich officiated 
and burial was at 10:00 a.m. 
on Wednesday in Lutheran 
Memorial Park in Kewaskum.

Friends called at the funer­
al home on Tuesday from 4:00

Joesph W. Judnic, age 52, 
years of Kewaskum, went to 
his eternal home on Wednes­
day, October 8, 2003 at St. 
Lukes Medical Center, Mil­
waukee.

He was born on February 
17, 1951 in Medoford to 
Joseph H. and Esther (nee Jar­
chow) Judnic. Joe grew up in 
Rib Lake and shortly after his 
graduation from Rib Lake 
High School he came to Ke­
waskum.

He was employed at Sim­
plicity Manufacturing in Port 
Washington for more than 32 
years. Joe was an active golfer, 
deer hunter, bowler, and was 
a W.I.A.A. basketball referee 
for many years. He enjoyed 
dancing, spending time at his 
cabin on Richter Lake near 
Perkinstown, Wl, and his 
most important activity of 
spending quality time with 
his family. He was a member 
of Fr. Casper Rehrl Council 
#1964 of the Knights of 
Columbus and also was a 
member of the Simplicity lo­
cal of the I.A.M.

Survivors include his lov­
ing wife and best friend, Lynn 
(nee Bieniek) whom he mar­
ried on July 7, 1973 at St. 
Mary's Immaculate Concep­
tion Church. He was the best 
dad anyone could have ever 
had of Jason of Sheboygan, 
Nathan (friend Nici Heller) of 
West DesMoines, IA., and 
Erin (friend Aaron Neirode) at 
home. Dearest grandpa of 
Timothy and Caroline, Fur­
ther surving are his father, 
Joseph of Rib Lake; three sis­
ters, Doris Zitzer, Sandra 
(Vernon) Dunkel and Cindy 
(Bruce) Borman all of Rib 
Lake; four brothers, Jerry 
(Ann), Larry (Pat), Ron (Dar­
lene) all of Rib Lake and Rus­
sell (Judy) of Stanley; his par­
ents-in-law, Tony and Evie Bi­
eniek of Kewaskum; five sis­
ters-in-law, Ginger (Vincent) 
Murphy of Lake Church, Shel-

ley (Mark) Benhold of Hart­
ford, Jody (“AJ”) Seele of Rich­
mond, VA, Tracy (Charlie) 
Schlessinger of Random Lake 
and Becky (Chris) Franks of 
Verona, a brother-in-law, Kel­
ly Bieniek of Waubeka; and 
his best “buddy” “Kirby”, 
nieces, nephews, other rela­
tives and friends. He was pre­
deceased by his mother, a sis­
ter, Shirley Judnic and a 
brother-in-law, Corey Bie­
niek.

Funeral services were on 
Saturday, October 11, 2003 at 
10 a.m. at the Schmidt Funer­
al Home with a Mass of Chris­
tian Burial at 10:30 a.m. at St. 
Mary’s Immaculate Concep 
tion Church. Burial followed 
at St. Mary’s (new) Cemetery.

Visitation at the funeral 
home was from 4 p.m.until 
the 8 p.m. vigil service on Fri­
day, and also on Saturday 
from 8:30 a.m. until the time 
of services.

ALVING. AL’LAS KA

Alvin G. "Al" Laska, 41, of 
St. Lawrence, town of Addi­
son, passed away on Monday, 
Oct. 6, 2003.

He was born on Aug. 14, 
1962 in Milwaukee to Norbert 
and Phyllis (Langhoff) Laska 
and was raised in Wauwatosa, 
graduating from Wauwatosa 
East High School in 1980.

After his marriage to 
Danielle M. Kocan on Oct. 9, 
1999 in Slinger, the couple 
lived in Slinger and later 
moved to St. Lawrence.

He was employed at Wis­
consin Lift Truck of Brook­
field for over 17 years, and at 
the time of his death was a 
products support specialist.

He was an avid fisherman 
and hunter and loved the out­
doors.

Al was a member of the 
Suring Antique Tractor Club.

Survivors include his wife; 
two daughters, Evelyn and 
Barbara Laska of Milwaukee; 
three stepdaughters, Lacey of 
Campbellsport and Morgan 
and Taylor of St. Lawrence;

(Continued on next page)

Physicians Mutual 
Insurance Company* 

Medicare Supplement Insurance

Randy Faber
338-8919

1-800-924-6799 PMA • 975

♦ Have you been offered early 
retirement?

♦ Has your job position been eliminat­
ed?
♦ Need to rollover your 40IK or profit 

sharing plan?
For a comprehensive retirement plan analysis 

call the retirement plan specialists at..

Reis Financial Services uc 
338-0018

P.O. Box 1072, West Bend, WI 53095 6-26 tf

BERTW. PREIS
Nov. 29, 1918 ■ Oct 17. 1904

DEAN KLEINKE
May 19, 1972 - Oct. 18, 2001

FREDRIC V. JESKE 
Dec. 11. 1933 Oct. 19, 1981

ARNOLD H. FELLENZ 
Feb. 11, 1909 - Oct. 19. 1998 

BURNS R. NELTHORPE 
July 6, 1931 ■ Oct. 20, 1968 

ALOIS S. STAEHLER 
April 18, 1926 - Oct 21, 1977

Flying Our 
Flag In 

Remembering 

Our Veterans 
CLARENCE W. KOCHER

Nov. 3, 1895 Oct 23, 1981 

ANTHONY M. KUDELKO 
June 14, 1930 - Oct 24, 2001 

GERALD SECOR 
Aug. 11, 1924 - Oct. 25, 2002 

EDWARD SONNENBERG 
June 11, 1892 - Oct. 28, 1979

MERLIN SEEFELDT
June 1, 1934-0ct.28, 1993 

JACK WILSON 
June 28. 1925 - Oct. 30, 1964

Kewaskum

EDWIN W. TESCH
Oct. 30, 1912-Oct. 30, 1991

Specializing in pre-need arrangements; irrevocable trusts

FUNERAL HOME
Phone 626-2185
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Obituaries
his parents, Norbert and 
Phyllis Laska of Suring; his 
parents-in-law, Daniel and 
Donna Kocan of Allenton; 
three brothers, David (Karen) 
Laska of Wauwatosa, Chuck 
Laska of Milwaukee and John 
Laska of Allenton; four sisters, 
Rose and Carol Laska of 
Wauwatosa, Mary (Joe) 
Schreiber of Hatley and Kay 
(Rusty) Cornett of Dallas, 
Texas; two brothers-in-law, 
Daniel (Angela) Thomas of 
Richmond, Va. and Donnie 
(Jodie) Kocan of Mayville; a 
sister-in-law, Dana (Allen) 
Theusch of Kewaskum; 
nieces; nephews; other rela­
tives and friends.

Preceding him in death 
were his grandparents.

Funeral services were held 
on Friday, Oct. 10, at 7:30 p.m. 
at the Phillip Funeral Home, 
West Bend.

Rev. Richard F. Lawrence 
officiated, and cremation will 
take place at Paradise Crema­
tion Services of West Bend.

Visitation at the funeral 
home was Friday from 4 to 
7:30 p.m.

Memorials are appreciat­
ed.

LEONARD ALLEN PICUS

Leonard Allen Picus died 
on Monday, October 6 after a 
short illness.

Len was born on June 8, a 
1923 in Friendship to the J 
late Mary and Morris 
Picus.

He served in the 
Army Air Force 
during World //^f&% 
War II as a I
navigator. /

Len graduated from ' 
the University of Wisconsin- 
Madison in accounting.

In 1949 he married Julie 
Schwager with whom he had 
three children: Steve (Sharon 
Siegel) of Mequon, Laruie (Al­
lan) Weiss of Colorado 
Springs, Colo, and Barbara 
(Ira) Fleischer of Trabuco 
Canyon, Calif.

They lived in Adams where 
Len and his father worked in 
their family business.

The family moved to Mil­
waukee in 1962.

Julie passed away in 1962.
In 1963 Len married Ruth 

(Schnoll) Aronson and wel­
comed Sheldon (Adele 
pstein) of Portland, Ore. and 
Barabara (Todd Mead) of 
Boulder, Colo, into his heart.

Len owned Fields Furni­
ture in West Bend with his 
son, Steve.

He was a member of the 
Masonic Lodge.

Ruth passed away in 1994.
Len married Lenore (Kass) 

in 1995 and again his family 
grew as he invited Jeff (Teri) 
Minkin, Terri (Gary) Mendel- 
blatt and Marc Minkin and 
their families into his life.

Len will be remembered 
for his devotion to his entire 
family, his uplifting attitude 
and his loving spirit. He al­
ways had a twinkle in his eyes 
and a smile on his lips.

He was grately loved and 
will be missed by all who 
knew him.

Survivors include his de­
voted wife, Lenora; eight chil­
dren; 17 grandchildren; and

his brother, Chuck (Judy) Pi­
cus of Rockford, 111.

Services were held on 
Wednesday, October 8 at 1 
p.m. at Congregation Shalom, 
Fox Point.

Donations to the charity of 
the donor’s choice are appre­
ciated.

The Jewish Community 
Funeral Home, Milwaukee, 
assisted the family.

EUNICE I. BEITSCH

Eunice I. Beitsch, 72, of 
Campbellsport, died on Sat­
urday, Oct. 11, 2003 at Colum­
bia-St. Mary’s Hospital in Mil­
waukee.

She was born on March 9, 
1931 in Campbellsport to the 
late Jerome and Ann (Croell) 
Jaeger, and married Eugene 
Beitsch.

He passed away on June 6, 
2001.

She was associated with 
Old Ironside Batteries of 
Campbellsport for many 
years.

Eunice was a member of 
St. Kilian Catholic Church 
and was very active in parish 
activities.

Survivors include three 
children, Steven of St. Kilian, 
Sharon Beitsch of St. Kilian 
and Gary (Ann) of Fayet­
teville, N.C.; a granddaughter, 
Keri Lynn Stevens of Waupun; 
two step-grandchildren, 
Brenda Mauney of Autryville, 
N.C. and Staff Sgt. Mike Mar­
tin of Fort Benning, Ga.; two 
great-grandchildren, Molly 
and Madison; four step-great­
grandchildren, Tia, Brandon, 
Samantha and Tarra; two 
brothers, Eugene (Helen) 
Jaeger of Campbellsport and 
O. James (fiancee Marian) 
Jaeger of North Fond du Lac; 
a sister, Delores (Bud) Miller 
of Waupun; a half-brother, 
John Croell of Shiocton; two 
sisters-in-law, Jeanne Jaeger 
of Campbellsport and Ruth 
Glover of Libertyville, Ill.; a 
brother-in-law, Lee Niemuth 
of Campbellsport; many 
nieces and nephews; other 
relatives and friends.

Preceding her in death 
were two sisters, Geraldine 
Niemuth and Mary Ann 
Durham, and two brothers, 
Jerome Jr. and Daniel.

A mass of Christian Burial 
was held on Monday, Oct. 13 
at 2 p.m. at St. Kilian Catholic 
Church, St. Kilian.

Rev. Neil Zinthefer officiat­
ed, and burial followed in the 
parish cemetery.

Visitation at the church 
was Monday from noon until 
the time of services.

The Twohig Funeral 
Home, Campbellsport, is 
serving the family.

DOROTHY M. COOK

Dorothy M. Cook, nee 
Yoost, 91, of West Bend, 
passed away on Wednesday, 
Oct. 8, 2003 at the Samaritan 
Health Center.

She was born in New Fane 
on July 23, 1912 to the late 
Robert and Louisa (nee Back- 
haus) Yoost.

She celebrated many mile­
stones in her young Christian 
life at St. Lucas Ev. Lutheran 
Church in Kewaskum where

she was baptized, confirmed, 
and on July 13, 1935 was mar­
ried to the late Leslie Cook.

Later she became a mem­
ber of Good Shepherd Ev. 
Lutheran Church in West 
Bend.

During her life she was 
employed at Amity Leather 
Products and The West Bend 
Co., and in her free time she 
enjoyed cooking and knitting.

Her greatest enjoyment 
was spending time with her 
daughter, grandchildren and 
great-grandchildren.

Survivors include a daugh­
ter, Carol and her husband 
Ron Smith of West Bend; 
three grandchildren, Greg 
and Christine Steinmetz, 
Mark Steinmetz and friend 
Tonya Kohn, Scott and Bobbi 
Jo Kuklinski, all of West Bend; 
five great-grandchildren, 
Joshua, Alex, Quinn, Nicole 
and Robbie, all of West Bend; 
and a special niece, Bonnie 
Pixley.

Preceding her in death 
were a son-in-law, Robert 
Steinmetz: a brother, Elmer 
Yoost; and two sisters, Viola 
Yoost and Lorinda Bukatz.

Funeral services were held 
on Sunday, Oct. 12 at 7 p.m. at 
the Myrhum-Patten Funeral 
and Cremation Service of 
West Bend.

Rev. John Paustian officiat­
ed, and burial was in Wash­
ington County Memorial 
Park, West Bend, at 10 a.m. on 
Monday.

Visitation at the funeral 
home was on Sunday from 4 
p.m. until the time of services.

Memorials to the Thresh­
old are appreciated.

NORMAN O. BOEGEL

Norman O. Boegel was a 
barber in Northbrook, Illi­
nois, who worked by appoint­
ment and his customers were

West Bend Clinic
To make an appointment 

or schedule a free 
10-minute non medical 
"Get Acquainted Visit" 

call 262-334-1641 ext. 2469 
or 1-800-825-0513.

a member of o t t 1 1--------- -dj^r^Health
1700 W. Paradise Dr., West Bend 

262-334-3451 or 800-825-0513 

www. synergy he a I th .org

Philosophy of Care: "I try to treat each and every patient as if t 
he or she were a member of my own family. Compassionate care is J
of utmost importance to me.”

I duration: l^ Mum^hi >e. ci. ed hi • Medual Dcgu-e horn
Columbia University College of Physicians and Surgeons, New
York. He completed his residency in General Surgery at Mary Imogene Bassett 
Hospital, New York and his Urology residency at University of Michigan Hospitals. 
Dr. Muncaster brings nearly 20 years of expertise and is board certified in Urology.

Interests: Dr. Muncaster provides a full range of urology services, with special 
interest in urinary incontinence, cancer and other urologic conditions. He practiced 
Manitowoc for four years prior to moving to West Bend. On a personal note, 
Dr. Muncaster enjoys piano and organ playing, downhill skiing and jogging.

Please welcome
Urologist Richard Muncaster, M.D 
to the West Bend Clinic
UROLOGY DEPARTMENT! k ^

in and out in 15 minutes, and 
that was quick enough to grab 
a haircut on their coffee 
break. His specialty was the 
military buzz cut.

Mr. Boegel, 67, of Niles, Illi­
nois, a former Marine, died at 
his home on Tuesday, Sep­
tember 16, of complications 
from esopha-geal cancer.

Norman was born on a 
farm in Wayne, Wisconsin. In 
1954 he graduated from Ke­
waskum High School and en­
listed in the Marines. After 
serving for three years in 
Hawaii, he moved to Chicago 
where he attended barber 
school.

He proposed to a high 
school friend, Kathleen, on 
their way to the Aragon Ball­
room and they married in 
1958. They had four daugh­
ters.

When those daughters be­
gan to date, young men were 
required to come inside and 
meet Dad. “He would greet 
our boyfriends at the door,” 
said his daughter, Debra. “If 
their hair was touching their 
collar, he would tell them 
they needed a haircut.”

Mr. Boegel also appreciat­
ed a hearty handshake. “He 
always gave one,” his daugh­
ter added. “He treated every­
body the way he wanted to be 
treated.”

Mr. Boegel owned Norm’s 
Barber Shop for 30 years. 
Most of his customers origi­
nally came from the insur­
ance offices next door to the 
Touhy Avenue Barber Shop 
where he worked. When the 
insurance company moved, 
he moved to Northbrook and 
opened Norm’s inside a near­
by hotel in 1973. He always 
shaved his customers’ necks 
and ears with a straight edge 
razor, massaged their scalps

and used a hot towel. “He did 
it first class,” said Jack Shine, 
a customer for more than 25 
years.

In addition to his wife and 
daughter, survivors include 
three other daughters, 
Sharon, Sandra and Julie; four 
brothers, Lambert, John, Jim 
and Bill; five sisters, Rita, 
Joan, Margaret, Mary Ann 
and Lucy, and 14 grandchil­
dren.

Family and friends gath­
ered for an 11 a.m. Mass at St. 
Juliana Catholic Church on 
Saturday, September 20, in 
Chicago.

IN MEMORY
In memory of MICHAEL 

STERN, who passed away 
twenty years ago, October 18, 
1983:
For every pain we must bear 
For every burden, every care 
There’s a reason.
For every grief that bows the 

head
For every teardrop that is 

shed
There’s a reason
For every hurt, for every 

plight
For every pain racked night 
There’s a reason.
But if we trust God, as we 

should
It all works for our good.
God knoVs the reason.

Forever loving and missing 
you Mike.

Mom and Tom

Annual Statesman 
Subscriptions Starting 

at Only $25 Call 
(262) 626-2626

NEW PATIENTS WELCOME!
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Opinion - Editorial

That’s What
I Think

By Andrew Kuehl
Statesman Editorial Staff

News From 
The Capitol

By Rep. Glenn Grothman 
58th Assembly District

Why Does Goverment Think They Can Tell 
Us How to Raise Our Children?

Family Planning Waiver

I have been informed by 
area conservatives and 
assembly Republicans that 
Wisconsin Representative of 
the 58th District, Glenn 
Grothman has authored a bill 
(AB 383) that would amend a 
current bill that at-this time 
allows girls starting at age 15 
to receive birth control and 
other family planning aids 
without cost and even worse 
without the consent of their 
parents! Please see 
Grothman’s column to the 
right on this page.

This is just another case of 
bureaucrats taking away 
authority of parents. Why do 
the Democrats think that gov­
ernment should set the stan­
dards for how to raise our 
children?

This past Tuesday, a public 
hearing on AB383 was held in 
Madison.

Dr. Meg Meeker, author of 
the book EPIDEMIC: Teen Sex 
is Killing our Kids spoke on 
behalf of Grothman and-his 
cohorts.

Dr. Meeker, a previous 
supporter of the waiver pro­
gram stated that after more 
research she feels that the 
waiver program is doing 
much more damage to the 
teens than benefiting them.

She eluded to the fact that 
teen girls do not have the 
immune systems that older 
women do and are more 
prone to attracting sexually 
transmitted diseases. She fur­
ther stated that many studies 
have shown that condoms 
have no effectiveness is pro­
viding protection against 
STDs in women and teen 
girls.

Representatives from 
Planned Parenthood, an 
agency that offers abortion 
services and birth control of 
course had a completely dif­
ferent story. They are provid­
ing just general medical pro­
cedures!

Every parent reading this 
should stand up and take 
notice and contact their legis­
lators and make their voices 
heard before it’s too late. Stop 
letting government bureau­
crats tell your children what’s 
right and what’s wrong.

Please contact Rep. Carol 
Owens, Assembly Family 
Committee Chair at 
rep.owens@legis.state, wi.us 
or Sen. Carol Roessler at 
sen.roessler@legis.state.wi.us

As I proudly wore my new 
Bush/Cheney 04 pin this 
weekend I had a family mem­
ber ask me “why are you such 
a strong Republican?”

I told him that I followed 
the beliefs of the party, and 
most importantly because 
the party for the most part is 
somewhat conservative and 
hold themselves to a decent

standard. This whole issue 
re-affirms why I am proud to 
be a Wisconsin Republican! 
God Bless our legislators like 
Glenn Grothman for standing 
up for what is right!

If you would like further 
information on this bill 
please contact me at the 
email address below. A copy 
of this bill will be posted on 
my page of the Statesman 
website under “Thats What I 
Think” at www.kewaskum- 
statesman.com

As I ended my column last 
week I alluded to the fact that 
this paper played a huge role 
in the Kettle Kountry Kolors 
Festival held in Kewaskum 
this past weekend. When the 
editor of this paper, who 
along with myself chaired the 
festival in years’ past, was 
approached by community 
members and even people 
who lived outside of 
Kewaskum to take over the 
festival from the Chamber of 
Commerce, 1 was less than 
amused.

My thought was that once 
again I (along with the paper) 
was getting dragged into a lot 
of hard work that would just 
be taken for granted and 
again I would be taken away 
from doing what I like to do 
best.... managing a newspa­
per.

WOW, was I wrong! I have 
never in my life seen people 
team up together and work as 
a team like these people did 
to put together this festival. It 
wasn’t even the group itself: it 
was every one who worked 
for the benefit of the festival.

I started getting flly hands 
dirty Thursday, when I started 
my work in the park, which 
was getting the grounds ready 
and getting the Kiwanis’ food 
booth ready to go.

To my amazement I was 
greeted by whom I call 
Kewaskum’s finest, the 
Department of public works 
crew.

These guys were just 
incredible. It was like having a 
professional grounds crew. 
They had the whole park 
looking and operating won­
derfully by day’s end.

That was just one aspect 
of how the entire weekend 
went. Everyone was excited 
and eager to help. Kewaskum 
Police Officer Bob 
Buddenhagen was another 
one, a smile on his face all 
weekend, and was there 
whenever someone needed a 
hand.

I guess you could say I am 
still in shock at how this festi­
val went. Like I said, I chaired 
this festival for three years 
previously and every year 
when it was over I promised 
myself it was my last year.

This year’s group of

friends, Lana Kuehl, Joann 
Hall, Patsy Panzer, Gwen 
Dreher, Dodie Sargent, 
Melissa Hall, Barb Liegl, Jeff 
Jaeger, Bev Rohlinger, Jeanne 
Becker and Hank Schmidt 
were the greatest and deserve 
a HUGE pat on the back. 
What they did for this com­
munity was phenomenal.

Now, you’re asking, 
besides giving us a weekend 
of entertainment, what did 
they do?

Think about the money 
that was put into the commu­
nity by the people who came 
to OUR festival. The people 
stopping for food, whether it 
be Dairy Queen or Woody's, 
the vendors renting hotel 
rooms at the Bonne Belle, 
everyone needs gas, people 
who stopped for a cup of cof­
fee at the Coffee Corner, or 
the person who drove past 
Premier Auto Center and 
stopped to take a look at the 
vehicles on the lot, I haven’t 
asked Bob if anyone bought a 
car but the next time they 
need one, they just might 
come back up or down here 
and buy one!

How many times was the 
ATM used at St. Francis Bank? 
I bet it was used plenty or I 
sure hope it was, because St. 
Francis Bank sponsored one 
of the performers in the park 
and it’s because of people 
banking there and shopping 
locally they could do that!

The list of possibilities for 
people spending money here 
could go on and on.

I think the above-men­
tioned Friends need to be 
thanked by their community, 
business and residential!

When I previously chaired 
this festival, I waited anxious­
ly for things to end Sunday! 
Not this year, I was quite sad 
Sunday when the festival 
closed. I look forward to 
being able to work with my 
Friends again and word has it 
they are already working on 
their next endeavor, a Mardi 
Gras Dance. More on that to 
follow I would imagine.

Once again, GREAT JOB 
FRIENDS!

I would appreciate your 
feedback on this column and 
other aspects of the paper. I 
can be emailed at 
akuehl@kewaskumstates- 
man.com.

The Kewaskum Statesman Welcomes 
Letters to The Editor

However, we do reouire that letters be legibly written or prefer­
ably typewritten, are limited to 300 words, that the author sign the 

letter and that a telephone number and address be included 
where the author can be reached. Only letters including the name 

of the writer will be published. Letters that are used as public 
thank yous will not be considered

Letters can be emailed to: akuehl@kewaskumstatesman.com 
Mailed to: PO Box 98, Kewaskum WI 53040 

Faxed to: (262) 626-1382
Thank You

One of the most offensive 
areas of increased govern­
ment intrusion is in the right 
of parents to instill their own 
values in their children. The 
state of Wisconsin began ear­
lier this year to provide free 
birth control, and other fami­
ly planning services to girls as 
young as fifteen without 
parental knowledge. Sadly, 
this was largely caused by 
Tommy Thompson, both in 
his former capacity as
Governor and now, as
Secretary of Health and 
Human Services.

In 1997 a coalition of liber­
al legislative Republicans and 
Democrats inserted a provi­
sion in the budget requiring 
the state to apply for federal 
grants for family planning 
services to women aged 15 to 
44 from families below 185% 
of the Federal Poverty Level. 
This would be about $16,000 
for one person and $28,000 
for a family of three.

The no-longer conserva­
tive Governor Thompson 
refused my request to veto 
the provision. Then, 
Thompson's own administra­
tion ignored legislative intent 
and decided not to count a 
teenager's parents income in 
determining poverty. Since 
almost no high school stu­
dents make over $16,000 a 
year, this clearly was an effort 
to make the pill available to 
every fifteen-year-old girl in 
the state.

The program is funded 
with 90% federal dollars and 
10% state dollars. The federal 
Department of Health and 
Human Services under 
Donna Shalala did not grant 
the request over the final 
three years of the Clinton
Administration.

Unfortunately, 
with former 
Thompson as

in 2002 
Governor 
President

Bush's Cabinet Secretary the 
waiver was approved and the 
program was implemented 
by the Doyle Administration 
earlier this year. Under feder­
al law, agencies receiving 
these funds will not be able to 
require any parental notifica­
tion.

The program is horrible
for two reasons, 
authority figures

First, 
who

approve of contraceptive use 
for teens inevitably encour­
age sexual activity, as they 
break down teen's natural 
reticence regarding sex. This

means more disease, more 
emotional problems and 
more pregnancies.

Some people may doubt 
the last statement, but in 
Britain, a similar program 
was temporarily shut down 
for a year and a half for legal 
reasons. There was no 
increase in pregnancies. The 
idea that a fixed number of 
teens will always engage in 
sexual activity has also been 
proven false over the past few 
years, as the AIDS epidemic 
and abstinence education 
has resulted in decreased 
pregnancy rates and sexual 
activity among teens.

The second concern is as 
to who the providers are. 
Planned Parenthood and 
similar organizations are the 
primary advocates and pre­
sumably financial beneficiar­
ies of this program. A review 
of a Planned Parenthood 
website for teens will quickly 
show they cannot be expect­
ed to encourage any religious 
values when discussing 
appropriate sexual behavior.

Are these groups who you 
would trust to advise your fif­
teen year-old daughter?

I have tried to terminate 
this program and the com­
mittee I am co-chairing has 
introduced a bill restricting 
its use to adults. The Doyle 
Administration advocates for 
the program. In my opinion, 
the current department is 
showing embarrassment over 
the program in that their pri­
mary defense appears to be 
focusing on health care serv­
ices related to health care 
check-ups and sexual dis­
eases, which are incidental to, 
but not the primary intent of 
the program.

Some of our freedoms are 
specifically stated in our 
Constitution. I believe some 
freedoms were so taken for 
granted they weren't listed. A 
right closely related to the 
freedom of religion is the 
right to instill your values in 
your children including your 
religious values. For our state 
and federal governments to 
generously fund and encour­
age organizations whose val­
ues are an anathema to most 
parents is an outrage that 
must be stopped.

Please let me know what 
you think on this issue. 
Contact me here in 
Madison—please call 1-888- 
534-0058.
* Madison Address: P.O. Box 
8952, Madison, W1 53708- 
8952
* Home Number: (262) 338-
8061 
* E M a
Rep.Grothman@legis.state.wi 
.us
* Madison Office Toll-Free: 
888-534-0058
* Madison Fax: 608-282-
3658

mailto:sen.roessler@legis.state.wi.us
http://www.kewaskum-statesman.com
mailto:akuehl@kewaskumstates-man.com
mailto:akuehl@kewaskumstatesman.com
mailto:Rep.Grothman@legis.state.wi
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Up to 20 words only 
$4.50 per week!

Reach thousands of our paid subscribers 
every week by placing your classified ad 
in The Kewaskum Statesman classifieds! 

All ads ate also placed on our website 
that is viewed by hundreds of people 

daily. All this exposure for one low price!

Statesman Classified 
Marketplace
Also on the web at

www.kewaskumstatesman.com

Thursday, October 16, 2003

Deadline:
Monday at 3 PM

ALL classified ads must be paid in 
advance unless you have a 

business account with the Statesman. 
Ads can also be ordered on our website 
and paid through our secure server by 

credit card 24 hours a day 7 days a week!
Ads can also be emailed to: 

ckuehl@kewaskumstatesman.com

Phone: (262) 626-2626 Fax: (262)626-1382

Due to discrimination laws, we are 
obligated to run various forms of 
advertising submitted to us by oul- 
of-the area businesses. Publication 
of these ads does not mean the 
advertisers are endorsed by this 
paper. Our readers are advised to 
use their own discretion when 
responding to any ad. If you have 
any questions concerning the credi­
bility of an advertiser, we suggest 
you contact the Better Business 
Bureau.

COMPLETE QH AND 
PAINT DISPERSAL - Our 
Loss is Your Gain! 25 yrs. of 
select Foundation and World 
Champion Quarter Horse 
lines. Broodmares 
Weanlings. No reasonable 
offer refused. 920-533-5100. 
www.stonesquarterhorses.com 
10-2-4p

Employment
HELP WANTED - Cleaning 
positions, weekdays and or 
weekends available (p.m. 
hours), $8.59 per hour. 
Lomira/Brownsville area. 
Please call 920-296-5133. io-9-3t

ACTIVITY ASSISTANT - St. 
Joseph Convent, a retirement 
community for the School 
Sisters of St. Francis currently 
has an opening for an Activity 
Assistant. This part-time posi­
tion has a base schedule with 
a holiday rotation and avail­
ability to fill in when neces­
sary. This position is benefit 
eligible. Experience working 
with the elderly, individuals 
with dementia and Alzhei­
mer’s is essential. Interested 
applicants apply at: St. Joseph 
Convent, 526 Mill Street, 
Campbellsport, WI 53010. 
(920) 533-8351. EOE. io-9-2t

COOK, WAITRESS and 
KITCHEN HELP, part-time. 
Rustic Inn. 262-626-2055. io-9tf

PUMPKINS, HAYRIDES, 
CARAMEL APPLES and 
more at The Fideler Farm. 
New nighttime hayrides, 
Fri. - Sat., 7-10 pm. One mile 
S. on 45 to Hwy. H, left on H, 2 
miles to Salisbury Rd., right 
on Salisbury 2 miles to Ridge 
Rd, E. Watch for signs. For 
more information call 262- 
338-0494.____________ io-2-4p

APPLES FOR SALE - 
Cortland, Snow and Red 
Delicious, $7.00 bushel. 1 1/4 
mile West of New Prospect. 
920-533-4162. io-i6-3t

FOR SALE - Seasoned hard­
wood. Cut/split $150 per cord. 
18” chunks $110 per cord. 
Smaller amounts; delivery 
available. Phone 262-673- 
6009. ' 9-25-tf

Rentals

FOR SALE
JEEP - 1994 Grand
Cherokee, 6 cyl., automatic, 
4x4, LOADED and in EXCEL­
LENT condition. $6200.00. 
Call (262) 626-1053.io-16-tf

FOR SALE — Two double 
crypts at Wisconsin Memorial, 
Milwaukee, eye level. 262-626- 
8168.________________ io-i6-3p

APPLES FOR SALE - Hwy. 
28 & W, north. Phone 626- 
2486.________________ io-9-2p

2000 FORD RANGER 5-spd , 
4 cyl., new brakes, 2 new tires, 
book value $7500, will sacri­
fice for $5000. Phone 626- 
8305- _ __________ io-9-2p

BUSINESS FOR SALE - 
Vending Route. 25 high traffic 
locations. 18,000.00 yearly in­
come. Hurry, won’t last, cost 
$3500. Phone 1-800-568-1392. 
www.vendingthatworks.com io-2-2t

COOK
NEEDED

3 days per week 

11:30 am - 7:30 pm

Pay commensurate 
with experience

Contact Sharon, Dietary 
Mgr. 262-626-4258 

or 920-994-4717

Beechwood Rest Home 
in the village of Beechwood

2 BDR. DUPLEX SIDE X 
SIDE, located on a quiet no- 
thru street with a nice yard. 
Has a full basement, att. 
garage, range and frig. NO 
PETS. Available Nov. 15th at 
$650/mo. plus security. Call: 
262-707-0886 or 262-626- 
4195.io-16-tf

CAMPBELLSPORT - 2 
bdrm, lower. Available Nov. 1. 
Includes, water softener, 
stove, refrig., basement, wash- 
er/dryer hook-up, attached 
garage w/opener, central air. 
$525 plus security deposit. 
Pets considered. Call 948- 
3084.io-16-tf

SIDE BY SIDE, quiet country 
home. One large bedroom, 1st 
floor washer/dryer hook-up, 
stove & refrig, included, one 
car garage. Close to town. 
$525.00. Security same. No 
Pets. 626-2304. io-16-ip

FOR RENT — 2 bedroom 
apartment. Available Nov. 1st. 
$400 month. Washer/dryer 
hookup. No pets. Security 
deposit required. Call Dan, 
(920)533-4111. ______io-9-4t

KEWASKUM - Two bedroom 
energy efficient apartment 
with all appliances, air, sewer 
& water furnished, garage w/ 
opener. No pets. $550.00 Call 
715-478-2491 or 262-626- 
8760. 9-18-tf

THREE BEDROOM 
UPPER DUPLEX - Air, nat­
ural gas furnace, two car 
garage with opener, appli­
ances, no pets. $625, security 
same. 262-626-8760._ 9-ibtf

KEWASKUM - One bedroom 
upper unit located in 4-family 
bldg, in nice residential area. 
Gas FA heat, air cond., kitchen 
appliances. Walking distance 
to mini mart & park. Available 
Sept. 1st. NO PETS. $435/mo. 
plus sec. Call 262-626-4195 or 
262-707-0886. __ 7-17-tf

OFFICE SPACE Main 
Street, Kewaskum, approx. 
450 sq. ft., $275 month. 335- 
9787.________________ 8-28-tf

KEWASKUM - Three bed­
room, appliances, new carpet 
& flooring. Available now. Call 
626-2445. 8-21-tf

TWO BEDROOM large
apartment overlooking golf 
course, cathedral ceiling, all 
appliant ss included, washer/ 
dryer, air, attached garage 
w/opener, private entrance. 
NO PETS. $600. 262-626-8760 
or 262-335-9787. 6-26-tf

FOR RENT - One and two 
bedroom deluxe apartments. 
Spacious, quiet, clean. 
Appliances, laundry, garage 
w/opener, secured entry. Lots 
of storage. $425-$555. Call 
(262) 626-4820 or (262) 626- 
4321._______________________ i-23-tf

KEWASKUM STORAGE 
CENTER - Units available. 
10' x 10', 10' x 20', 10' x 30' and 
10' x 40'. Ph. 626-2903. 6-13-tf

HWY. G MINI STORAGE - 
Now renting, 10 x 10, 10 x 21, 
10 x 25. Take Hwy. S north of 
Kewaskum, two miles to G. 
626 4937. 8-29-tf

Rummage
RUMMAGE SALE - Fri., 
Nov. 28 and Sat., Nov. 29, 8 
a.m. to 4 p.m. at Rose Hall, 
Kewaskum High School. 
Excepting donations of any 
items in good, clean condition. 
Please contact High School 
office with any questions, 626- 
2166. Drop oft dates: Sat., Nov. 
22, 8:00 a.m. - 12:00 p.m.; 
Mon. - Wed., Nov. 24 to Nov. 
26, 2:45 p.m. - 6:00 p.m. 
Sponsored by Kewaskum High 
School Senior Class. io-i6-2t

No one can predict the heights 
you can soar, even you will not 
know until you spread your 
wings.

• NO MONEY DOWN LOANS • GOVERNMENT LOANS 
• NO MORTGAGE INSURANCE • ALL CREDIT WELCOME

• FREE PRE-APPROVALS

LOWEST RATES GUARANTEED!

(920) 488-5626
LoanStar Mortgage 

Corporation
106 S. Milwaukee St. • Theresa, WI 53091 

www.loanstarwi.com

Services
CIDER PRESSING
Empire Mills, W4478 Street 
Road. Two miles east of Fond 
du Lac on CTH T. Saturdays, 8 
a.m. - noon, thru Sat., Nov. 22. 
(920) 921-9509.__ 8-2i-i4t

CLARK’S STUMP RE­
MOVAL - Free estimates, 
reasonable rates, insured. Call 
262-626-2513.__________5-8-tf

FIND YOUR KINGDOM, 
WE’LL DESIGN YOUR 
CASTLE - Specializing in 
home design and blueprints. 
Campbellsport Building Sup­
ply, 920-533-4412. www.fur- 
nishanddesign.com 9-25-tf

Activity Coordinator
St. Joseph Convent, a retirement 

community for the School Sisters of 
St. Francis currently has an opening 
for an Activity Coordinator. This is 
a part-time benefit eligible position 
that includes a weekend and holi­
day rotation. Essential qualities 
include previous experience work­
ing with the dementia and 
Alzheimer’s population, and a 
compassionate, caring demeanor. 
Certification or licensure in an 
activity related field is preferred. 
Please direct all inquires to:

St. Joseph Convent 
526 Mill Street 

Campbellsport, WI 53010 
Phone 920-533-8351

FAX (920)533-5394 EOE

Mise.
OPEN SHOOTING - Friday 
nights from, 7 to 10 p.m. at 
New Fane Sportsman’s Club, 
5 miles North of Kewaskum on 
Hwy. G. 4-17-tf

WANTED
WANTED TO BUY - Farm 
or large tract of land. Call 920- 
960-1763. io-16-tf

RN
St. Joseph Convent, a retirement 

community for the School Sisters 
of St. Francis currently has Part- 
time Benefit eligible opening on 
the AM shift. Includes every other 
weekend and holiday rotation. 
Supervisory skills along with 
experience in a geriatric setting 
preferred.

St. Joseph Convent 
526 Mill Street 

Campbellsport, WI 53010 
FAX (920)533-5394 EOE

RN & LPN 
NEEDED
24/36 Program 

Every other weekend

Pay commensurate with experience

CNANEEDED
Day Shift 

24-32 Hrs./Wk. 
Occasional PM or NOC

Call Lisa Hill at

920-994-4717 or 
262-626-4258

BEECHWOOD 
REST HOME

Located in the village 
of Beechwood

Price Reduced!

Kewaskum Town of Auburn Town of Hartford Glen Hupfer
810 Bel-Ric Drive N644 Moraine Dr 3BR, 1.5ba brick Your Realtor.
3BR, 1.5ba ranch. 3BR, 2.5ba country Cape Cod on one 
Wood floors in BRs, tri-level. Deck with country acre. NEW 
DR & LR. Jacuzzi hot tub. FR has bar kitchen, bath, paint, 
tub. 1/4 acre has big and brick NFP. Hy 45 floors, water heater, 
fenced backyard. N to Hy V, NW to furnace, A/C and

Your Neighbor. 
Call for a free 
market analysis. 
262.626.1477 
800 965.8988 x102

Hy 45 to Hy H, W to Auburn-Ashford Rd, electric! Two car 
Bel-Ric, S to address. W to Moraine Dr attached garage.
ID. EUW $139,000 ID: DKG $199,900 ID: BBF $179,900

For a showing of these or ANY property, call me today!

ANN ENRIGHT

COLDWeLL
BANKER □

RESIDENTIAL BROKERAGE
(■) Oantd M Operaad By KU WcorpooM

“2002 & 2003 Realtor* of the Year”

R60HBK
United

(262) 335-2200 (262) 692-2607

This spot is reserved for your listing. 
Buy and Sell with the leader, 

CALL ANN
nBPBEtnPW^pectacuiaj and spacious ranch 4 

bedrooms, 3 full baths, master suite has walk-in closet. 
Kitchen has oak cabinets w/snack counter, patio door lead­
ing to big back yards King-sized basement family room 
plus finished, carpeted office/den, workshop. Attached 2 
car garage. Maintenance free extenor. A real value, 1800 
sq ft. for $169,900.Call Ann Enright for a showing

NEW LISTING 1.24 Acres just North of Kewaskum. Level parcel surrounded by farm fields. 
Beautiful views of the countryside. Only $39,900.

http://www.kewaskumstatesman.com
mailto:ckuehl@kewaskumstatesman.com
http://www.stonesquarterhorses.com
http://www.vendingthatworks.com
http://www.loanstarwi.com
http://www.fur-nishanddesign.com
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Business Directory
Spotlight Your Business Here For Only $60 Monthly! Call 626-2626

LITTLE FOLKS SCHOOL HOUSE
Early Learning Center

Part Time & Full Time Available 
Also Before & After School Care 

Ages 6 wks - 12 yrs.
Preschool curriculum and certified teachers

Call for more info 626-4023
Larry Jesowshek
Kewaskum Resident

THINKING OF 
SELLING?

I HAVE AREA BUYERS WAITING

- LIST TODAY •

HAND LETTERING 
K PINSTRIPING 
V GRAPHICS 
V VINYL

Located at intersection of 
Hwy. W & H Wayne/Kewaskum

1
RrstWeber

B It 1 l T V « T

Home: 262 626 1910
Cell: 262 352 0844
Office: 262 335 6280

920-533-8094

Karen Breitzman 
W5885 St. Kilian Dr. 
Campbellsport. WI

Specializing 
in Service

• Plumbing

• Heating & Air 
Conditioning

• Residential

•Commercial

• Industrial

• Remodeling

***Quick Response***

ALBIEROPLUMBINGi7^>
MP223434 ^7,

Come See Our Showroom!
1940 North Main St., West Bend

262-334-5000

Serving Your Area

PROPANE Jk 
GAS M
Service 
for

Home - Farm or Industry 
Cylinder & Bulk Deliveries 

NO TANK CHARGE
Serving Gas Customers 

for Over 50 Years

BOEHLKE BOnLED 
GAS CORP.

Plants located at Jackson 
and Random Lake

PHILGAS

West Bend 338-8011 
Random Lake 944-2229

TOLL FREE 
1-800-448-3388

We’ll Have You Glowing - Guaranteed?

Sun Seekers Tanning Salon 
1040 Fond du Lac Ave., ono non /toon 

(Hwy. 45) Kewaskum ^ 0 ^ °~J°°'L
5 Sessions $1O°° 

New customer introductory package 
May purchase once per calendar year.

Your First Visit is Always FREE

loaning Hours: Mon Huies 6 om 9 pm; Fri. 6 am 7 pm; Sot. 8 om-3 pm; Sun. 10 am I pm

^-KEWASKUM CONCRETE, LLC
All Your Concrete Needs

Experienced - Qualified

★ Driveways * Patios ★ Sidewalks ★ Garage Slabs
★ Basement Walls ★ Demolition and Removal

✓ INSURED 
✓ BONDED
✓ FREE ESTIMATES 

E-Mail

r Auto Service

Dave Martin 
Ron Theusch

(262) 334-7506
(262) 626-2780 

Fax (262) 626-2780
kewcon@charter.net

ROGER & DAN'S 
AUTO SERVICE

'Your Complete Auto, Tire & Towing 
Service Station in This Area" 

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum

(262) 626-2888 KUMBOYALK

24 HOUR TOWING SERVICE

CERTIFIED SOILTESTER/SYSTEM INSTALLATION 
N1356 Hwy. W SOUTH 

CAMPBELLSPORT, WI 53010
PHONE: (920) 533-4132 

FAX; (920) 533-5770

Koth’s Driving School Ina
r » December 1 

January 12 
March 8 

May 3
Classes Meet: 3:45 - 5:45

New Class Dates Pending - 
Call for more details

Classes: Rm 403 at KHS

Kewaskum
262-707-0328

Call now for more 
information

Locally Owned & Operated

♦ Plantings

♦ Renovations
♦ Retaining Walls

♦ Brick Patios- Walkways
♦ Stone Steps & Pathways

Landscape Architecture
Design Services

(262)334-4799 
OR

(920) 533-8300

CELEBRATING OUR 25™ YEAR

HOHLWECK’S SUPPLY
Wisconsin Master Distribution of
Acrylic & Fiberglass - Tubs & Showers

Toilets, Sinks & Whirlpools
Visit our Showroom by Appointment

50 Units on Display

Call Carl at 262-626-8338

Washed Mason Sand and Gravel Filling 

Crushed Road Gravel • Crushed Stone

J&J Baumhardt 
Aggregates Inc.
W3998 Hwy. 45 • Eden, WI 53019

Phone 477-2118 or (Butzke Pit) 533-4912

DUNDEE 
Sand & Gravel, Inc.

Phone (920) 533-4549
LIME CHIPS • STONE • WASHED SAND 
SCREENED SAND • CRUSHED GRAVEL 

GRAVEL and SANDFILL

Klemme Bros. Well Drilling Inc. 
Kewaskum, WI

Emergency Pump Service 
Well Inspection & Code Repair 

Pressue Tank Service
Well Drilling " i"

_____________Well Abandonment_________ * >,>

Carl Klemme state License
(262)626-4592 5935

mailto:kewcon@charter.net
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. Notice
■■■■■■■■■■■■

Village Board 
Meeting Minutes

Village of Kewaskum 
Plan Commission

August 26, 2003 
7:00 p.m.

The Plan Commission of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Washington 
County, Wisconsin met in the 
Council Room of the Municipal 
Building. 204 First Street.

The meeting was opened with a 
Moment of Silence and pledge of 
Allegiance.

Chairman Mathew Heiser called 
the meeting to order. Members pres­
ent were Andy Pesch, Richard 
Schmidt, and Theodore Meilahn. 
Member Andrew Kuehl, Frank 
Beesten and Leeann Butschlick 
asked be excused and were absent. A 
quorum was present. Mr. Rick 
Kania from SEWRPC was in atten­
dance to discuss the proposed Zoning 
Ordinances.

On a motion by Andy Pesch, sec­
onded by Theodore Meilahn and car­
ried by the majority voice vote the 
Plan Commission approved the min­
utes as amended for July 29, 2003.

Review and discussion was held 
on the proposed preliminary Plat for 
Kettle Kountry Estate for the east 
side of the village. The plat needs to 
be revisited due to the Department of 
Transportation wanting the street 
access to STH “28” moved further to 
the east. There were pros and cons 
discussed with the pros outweighing 
the cons. On a motion by Richard 
Schmidt, seconded by Andy Pesch 
and unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the Plan Commission sent the 
proposed preliminary plat to the 
Village Board with a favorable rec­
ommendation.

On a motion by Andy Pesch, sec­
onded by Theodore Meilahn and car­
ried by the majority to adjourn to 
work session. Roll call vote was 4 
“Aye” 0 “Nay” 3 “Absent.” Mr. Rick 
Kania was present from SEWRPC to 
review a variety of points from previ­
ously discussed sections of the pro­
posed Zoning Ordinance. The pri­
mary discussion was on the existing 
and proposed Zoning Map, as well as 
establishing a RBT Residential 
/Business Transition Overlay 
District.

On a motion by Richard Schmidt, 
seconded by Andy Pesch and carried 
by the majority roll call vote, the 
Commission adjourned the meeting. 
Roll call vote was 4 "Aye" 0 "Nay" 3 
"Absent".

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator
Approved 09-23-2003

Published 10-13-2003

Village Board 
Meeting Minutes

Monthly Meeting 
September 15, 2003 

8:00 p.m.

The Village Board of the Village of 
Kewaskum, Washington County, 
Wisconsin, met in Regular Session in 
the Council room of the Municipal 
Building, 204 First Street.

President Mathew A. Heiser 
presided. All Trustee Members were 
present. A quorum was present.

The meeting was opened with a 
Moment of Silence and the Pledge of 
Allegiance.

On a motion by Trustee Robert 
Stoltzmann, seconded by Trustee 
Harry Roeckerand unanimously car­
ried by voice vote, the minutes of the 
September 2, 2003 were approved as 
printed.

A public hearing was held on the 
special assessment for municipal 
improvements under 66.0703 and 
66.0707 Wl Statutes, to levy special 
assessments upon property within the

described and noticed area; that area 
being adjacent to CTH “H” north 
side. The scope of the work is for 
water & sewer mains, laterals 
hydrants and other related improve­
ments etc. Administrator Daniel S. 
Schmidt reviewed the content of 
Resolution No. 2003-23. Three of the 
four parties subject to the special 
assessments were present. The cost 
estimate of the assessment was dis­
cussed as were options. The interest 
rate as noted in the resolution was 
4.5%. On a motion by Trustee Kevin 
Scheunemann, seconded by Trustee 
Robert Stoltzmann and carried by the 
majority roll call vote the Board 
closed the public hearing. Roll call 
vote 7 “Aye” 0 “Nay" 0 “Absent.”

On a motion by Trustee Kevin 
Scheunemann, seconded by Trustee 
Steve Scheunemann and carried by 
majority roll call vote the Board sus­
pended the rules to take up IX New 
Business A, Resolution No. 2003-23. 
Roll call vote was 7 “Aye" 0 "Nay” 0 
“Absent."

Action was taken on Resolution 
No. 2003-23 as attached hereto:

Fire Chief Mark Groeschel pre­
sented the August 2003 monthly 
report:

Fire calls 2 Year to date 28 
Jaws 0 Year to date 7 
Rescue calls 20 Miles 408
1) The Board was informed that 

the Telesquirt has a broken water line 
and will need to go in for repair.

2) The departmental budget will be 
reviewed at a committee meeting 
October 6, 2003.

Police Chief Richard Knoebel pre­
sented the August 2003 monthly 
report:
Criminal arrests 55
Criminal investigations 44
Traffic warnings 47
Traffic citations 46
Adult arrests 42
Juvenile arrests 15
Property stolen $2,253
Property recovered $ -0-
Parking warnings 13
Parking tags 5

Director of Public Works Jerry 
Gilles reviewed the following:

1. The Board was informed the 
waterline within River Hill Park 
failed and has been repaired. It was 
further noted the line is in very poor 
condition and will need to be com­
pletely replaced in a year or two.

2. It was reported that a free demo 
on a vac/sweeper truck was held last 
week on Stark Street catch basins and 
sweeping of Knights Avenue.

3. The road/street rating software 
is in need of an update through the 
state which is slow in being accom­
plished so alternatives are being 
looked at to comply with the 
December 2003 deadline.

On a motion by Trustee Kevin 
Scheunemann, seconded by Trustee 
Thomas Piwoni and carried by the 
majority voice vote, the Board 
approved the issuance of the 
Operator’s Licenses for 2003/2004 
upon proper payment of fees and 
documentation for the following: 
Friess, Julie M. West Bend, Wl 
Rick, Kevin J. West Bend, Wl

The Police Department had no 
objection to the issuance of said 
licenses.

Administrator Daniel S. Schmidt 
reviewed the following with the 
Board:

1) League and Taxpayer bulletins.
2) Review of the budget control 

sheet for the period ending August 
2003.

3) Review of building permit 
report for period ending August 
2003.

4) Reviewed a proposal for 
Washington County Multi- 
Jurisdictional Comprehensive plan­
ning Process, regarding the compli­
ance with the States Smart Growth 
Legislation.

5) Reminder for Agriculture and 
Household Clean Sweep program for 
September 19 & 20, 2003.

6) Review correspondence.

Administrative Committee 
Chairperson, Trustee Robert 
Stoltzmann, announced a meeting 
time change for October 6, 2003, that 
being 6:45 p.m.

Protection and Public Safety 
Committee Chairperson, Trustee 
Thomas Piwoni announced a sched­
uled meeting for October 6, 2003 at 
7:15 p.m.

Public Services Chairperson, 
Trustee Kevin Scheunemann 
informed the Board that a general 
discussion was held regarding the 
proposed budget for 2004. No action 
was taken.

Discussion was held on the recy­
cling grant application for 2004. It 
was noted the Committee sent the 
grant application to the Board with a 
recommendation to sign and submit. 
The Resolution Requesting Financial 
Assistance For Operation Of A 
Recycling Program and Naming the 
Authorized Official was also sent to 
the Board. Chairperson Kevin 
Scheunemann indicated he did not 
agree with the states recycling man­
date and even though the Village is 
compelled to have a program, would 
not support it and would vote against 
it. On a motion by Trustee Andy 
Pesch, seconded by Trustee Robert 
Stoltzmann and carried by the major­
ity by voice vote, the Board author­
ized the submission and signing of 
the recycling grant request for 2004. 
The vote was 5 “Aye” 2 “Nay” 0 
“Absent.” Trustee Kevin 
Scheunemann and Trustee Steve 
Scheunemann voting “Nay.”

Board Representative for the Plan 
Commission, Trustee Andy Pesch, 
announced a scheduled Commission 
meeting for September 23, 2003 at 
7:00 p.m.

Board Representative of the 
Library Board, President Mathew 
Heiser, reported on the meeting held 
Monday, September 8, 2003 at 6:30 
p.m. The circulation of 3,609 for the 
month of August surpassed the 
August’s 2002 circulation of 2,976. 
The Summer Brat Fry that was post­
poned is now scheduled for 
September 20, 2003.

Action was taken on Resolution 
No. 2003-24 A Resolution 
Requesting Financial Assistance For 
The Operation Of A Recycling 
Program And Naming The 
Authorized Official as attached here­
to: Roll call vote was 5 “Aye” 2 
“Nay” 0 “Absent.” Trustee Kevin 
Scheunemann and Trustee Steve 
Scheunemann voting “Nay.”

On a motion by Trustee Thomas 
Piwoni, seconded by Trustee Steve 
Scheunemann and unanimously car­
ried by voice vote the Board estab­
lished the Trick or Treat date and 
time as follows: Sunday, October 26, 
2003 from 5:00 p.m. to 7:00 p.m.

Administrator Daniel Schmidt 
reported to the Board on some gener­
al budget numbers and a suggested 
date for the Budget Public Hearing. 
On a motion by Trustee Harry 
Roecker, seconded by Trustee Kevin 
Scheunemann and unanimously car­
ried by voice vote the 2004 Budget 
Public hearing date was established 
for Monday November 24, 2003 at 
7:00 p.m.

Motion by Trustee Kevin 
Scheunemann, seconded by Trustee 
Thomas Piwoni and carried by the 
majority roll call vote, to adjourn 
closed session under Chapter 19.85 
(l)(c) of the Statutes to discuss 
employee performance data and 
evaluation for employees over which 
the governmental body has jurisdic­
tion. Roll call vote was 7 "Aye" 0 
"Nay" 0 "Absent".

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator
Approved 10-06-2003

Pub. (K.S.) 10-16-2003

Ozaukee County is Wisconsin’s 
smallest county.

RESOLUTION NO. 2003-25

Village of Kewaskum, Washington 
County, Wisconsin

66 - 142
RESOLUTION IN SUPPORT OF 

ASSEMBLY BILL435

REPEAL OF “SMART
GROWTH" COMPREHENSIVE 

PLANNING

WHEREAS, “Smart Growth” 
Legislation contained in Section 
66.100, Wisconsin Statutes, was 
enacted in 1999 WISC., Act 9 and 
was signed into law by Governor 
Tommy Thompson as part of the 
1999-2000 budget, and

WHEREAS, This land use Act was 
never properly addressed by the 
Wisconsin State Legislature, and

WHEREAS, The consequences of 
this Act may result in the loss of 
property rights, increased govern­
ment regulations, substantial finan­
cial burden on local units of govern­
ment resulting in governmental and 
individual property owners having 
economic hardship:

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT 
RESOLVED, that the Village Board 
of the Village of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Wisconsin, 
express our opposition to this 
“Smart Growth" Law and that the 
Wisconsin Legislature be and here­
by urged to repeal it.

Adopted and approved this 6th day 
of October, 2003 by the Kewaskum 
Village Board.

\s\
Robert Stoltzmann
Village President, Pro-Tern 

ATTEST:
\s\
Daniel S. Schmidt
Administrator/Clerk

Motion for adoption by Trustee 
Kevin Scheunemann

Motion for adoption seconded by 
Trustee Tom Piwoni

Roll call vote was 5 "Aye" 1 "Nay" 
1 "Absent"

Trustee Andy Pesch voting Nay 
and President Mathew Heiser 
Absent.

Advertising 
doesn't have 
to be an ugly 

experience.'

Let our 
spell-binding” • 

staff help 

you place an 
ad today!

Kewaskum 
Statesman

250 Main St., Kewaskum
262-626-2626

FINANCE-TRANSPORTATION-BUILDING & GROUNDS 
COMMITTEE MEETING 

MONDAY, OCTOBER 20, 2003 
DISTRICT OFFICE 

6:00 P.M.

AGEKBA
1. Agenda

a. Corrections/Dcletions
b. Approval of agenda

2. Referendum Discussion 
*Textbooks-Curriculum/Technology/Electrical Wiring @HS

3. Scoreboards and Contracts with Pepsi

4. Next meeting date

5. Adjourn

Village Board 
Meeting Monday

Public notice is hereby 
given that the next meeting 
of the Village of Kewaskum, 
Wisconsin Village Board is 
scheduled for Monday, Oct. 
20, 2003, at 8:00 p.m. in the 
Municipal Building, 204 
First Street.

The agendas for the meet­
ing are prepared as of 
Wednesday noon preceding 
the meeting and are avail­
able at the office of the clerk 
at the Municipal building on 
Thursday preceding the 
meeting.

PUBLIC MEETING NOTICES 
TOWN Of KEWASKUM

The Plan Commission and Town 
Board will hold their regular monthly 
meeting on Monday, October 20, 2003 at 
7:30 p.m. at the Town Hall, 9019 Kettle 
Moraine Dr. A complete agenda will be 
posted at the Town Hall, and at posting 
boards at Badger Rd and Prospect Dr, and 
at VanVechtin Highland Dr Cemetery on 
Thursday preceding the meeting

Sandra Stern, Clerk

The grand essentials of happi­
ness are: something to do, some­
thing to love, something to hope 
for.

Wastepaper & Recycling 

Aluminum 
Cans

without ad 330 lb.
35* lb. 

if over 100 lbs. 
Not valid with any other offers

Valid thru Oct. 23, 2003 
$$ Highest Prices Paid $$ 

We honor all local 
competitors' coupons

Mount: 
M-F 7am-5pm, Sat. 7am Noon 

334-9542
121 Auxiliary Ct., West Bend 
7651 Otten Dr., Kewaskum 

Nomi West Bend) 
www.lynnsrecyciing.com

http://www.lynnsrecyciing.com
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Kewaskum Sports

2003 KHS Cross Country Teams

The 2003 KHS Boys Cross Country Team. Front row, left to right: Zackery 
VanWormer, Adam Janz and Justis Clayton. Second row: Adam Wagner, JejJ 
Paulus, Tristtn Wright and Jonathan Hawig. Third row: Coach Dave Drexler, 
Robert Gibson, John Carpenter, Michael Neumann and Josh Meyer.

The 2003 KHS Girls Cross Country Team. Front row, 
left to right: Allison Janz, Crystal Treptow and Rachel 
Shea. Back row: Nicole Stern, Coach Dave Drexler 
and Katie Uehlman.

Fifth Annual
Last Thursday the 

Kewaskum High School boy’s 
and girl’s cross country teams 
competed at home in the 5th 
Annual Indian Invite. 
Running against teams from 
Milwaukee Lutheran, 
Campbellsport, Markesan, 
Laconia, Howards Grove, 
Elkhart Lake, and Ozaukee, 
the boy’s finished in fourth 
and the girl’s finished in sixth. 
Milwaukee Lutheran won 
both ends of the meet.

The Kewaskum harriers 
met the challenge of the meet 
by posting nine personal best 
times for the year. Josh Meyer, 
(medal winner) the number 
one runner for the Indians, 
took a second place overall 
losing by inches to Pat 
Buffington from Howards 
Grove and posting his best 
time ever covering the 5000 
meter course in 17:03. Zack 
Van Wormer and Bobby 
Gibson (both medal winners) 
battled for the next two spots 
with personal best times of 
18:53 and 18:58 respectively.

Rounding out the counters 
were Justis Clayton and Adam 
Wagner also with personal 
best times of 19:33 and 19:36. 
Jon Hawig and Adam Janz fin­
ished up the tough race with 
times of 20:03 and 21:05.

Not to be out done, the JV 
squad also turned in their 
own personal best times. 
Competing for the squad 
were John Carpenter, 20:47, 
Micheal Neumann, 21:13,

Indian Invite
Tristin Wright, 23:34, and 
Jeffery Paulus, 23:34.

The girl’s race was a first 
for all competitors as they 
also ran the 5000 meter 
course, normally their race is 
4000 meters. Times were 
comparable and most of the 
runners said they hardly 
noticed the longer distance. 
Top lady runner for the 
Indians was Nicole Stern, 
(medal winner) covering the 
course in a blistering time of 
22:49 followed by Allison 
Janz, (medal winner) 23:33, 
Rachel Shea, 25:42, Katie 
Uehlman, 26:34, and Crystal 
Treptow, 27:39.

CAMPBELLSPORT 
SPORTSMEN’S CLUB 
FALL TRAP LEAGUE
Rt Speed Shop, 10-4; 

Herriges Oil, 9-4; Mueller 
Welding, 9-5; Moose’s, 9-5; 
Ambush Alley, 8.5-5.5; 
Shlufty’s 1, 7.5-6.5; St. Killian 
Tap, 7-7; Shlufty’s II, 6-7; Bahr 
Time, 5.5-6.5;
Monacellistone, 4-10; Danee 
Hardware, 3.5-10.5; TB 
Construction, 4-10.

49x50: Jerry Lauters, Jon 
Pesch; 25x25: Jerry Lauters, 
Bob Poznanski, Andy 
Schweitzer, Steve Beisbier, 
Charlie Walls; 24x25: Tom 
Bauer, Garett Mielkie, Toby 
Mueller, Jon Pesch, Chad 
Kampen, Tim Boden, Bob 
Poznanski, Mike Kampen, 
Bob Konstanz.

K-TOWN SHEEPSHEAD 
WINNERS

5 handed winners on 
Tuesday, Oct. 7th were: Ralph 
Stern, 38-0-38, 19-0-19; 
Betty Kehler, 49-11-38, 21-8- 
-13; Elton Ludwig, 45-7—38, 
14-5-9; Syl Stern, 50-12-38, 
16-7—9; Judy Lickman, 39-4— 
35, 16-3—13; Crickets
Rohlinger, 13 low points; 
Norman Giese, 20 most loses.

The next 5 handed call-an-

ace will be Tuesday, Oct. 21st 
at 7:30 p.m. sharp. Angie D’s 
K-Town Saloon.

It is not enough to know what 
not to say, it is also necessary 
to know how and when not to 
say it.

We “measure up" above the rest! ^o
Replacing your windows should be a once in lifetime, worry-free home 

improvement, and it can be with help from the professionals at

HEBERER BROS.
HOME IMPROVEMENTS, LLP

9340 Hwy. 45 N, Kewaskum, WI 53040

(262) 626-2384
We provide windows of unsurpassed quality, energy efficiency and 
functional beauty. Ply Gem Premium Windows are engineered and 
manufactured to last a lifetime. With a Low-E glass package, you can 
cut your heating and cooling costs, help make your home more com­
fortable and reduce air pollution - all without sacrificing versatility or 
style. Best of all, these windows are designeo with a "tilt-in" feature for 
easy cleaning. Ply Gem windows....goodfor you, good for your home 
and good for the environment.

That's not all....we do it all! Let us show you why we have been serv­
ing the community for over 32 years. Call us today for a FREE estimate 
on ALL of your home improvement needs.
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ANTIQUE AUCTION
KEWASKUM, Wl

SATURDAY, OCT 18,9:00am 
8:00 am inspection

LOCATION: Hwy 45 or 28 to Kewaskum, east at downtown lights on 
Hwy 28, 3 blocks to Cty "S", then north 1.5 miles to Paul Auction Co. 
Inc. hall.
AUCTIONEER’S NOTE: Lots of oak furniture; Grandfather clock; 47 
pcs. carnival glass; Jewel T clock; 26 string holders; Toys; Rock-Ola 
"Rocket" juke box; NCR registers; 40 milk bottles; Advertising; Caribou 
mount; Good lures; Oil lamps; Many misc. collectibles.

Charbroiled Brats, Hamburgers & Refreshments
TERMS: Cash or good WI checks. Out of state, no checks. ID required 
for bid number. REGISTERED WISCONSIN AUCTIONEER Mike 
Paul No. 28

2 DAV OPEN HOUSE
Sat., Oct. IX • 2:30 - 4:00 pm 

Sun., Oct. 19 • 11:00 am - 1:00 pm 
Dir: Hwy. 45 north, left on Clinton St. to achlrcss

331 Clinton St, Kewaskum 
Spacious ranch on lg. lot on quiet sul-de- 
sac. 3 bdrms, 2 full baths. Huge family 
room, w/cathedral ceilings, nat. fireplace 
& many windows. Beautiful deck with 
pool. Eat-in kitchen, with lots of cup­
boards. Lg. rec room & den. Insulated 
garage and extra wide concrete drive. 
Home Warranty Included. Pin# 11725 
Call today!.........................$ 199,900

PAUL
AUCTIONS

suM4k419M

Paul Auction Co.
Kewaskum, WI 
262-338-3030

Zachary Stoffel
(262) 338-2648 Ext. 123

zstofTel@shorewest.com d

2419 W. Washington St., 
West Bend, WI 53095 

Office: 
(262) 338-0601

mailto:zstofTel@shorewest.com
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Kewaskum Sports

Everything Comes Together 
For KHS Soccer Team

Successful Season 
For KHS Golfers

The 2003 KHS Varsity Soccer team. Front row, left to right: Javob Cochran, John 
Rudzitis, Tyler Hickman, Ryan Nuernberg, Shane Harlacher, Jason Jahnke. Second 
row: John Olla, Adam Hickman, Nate Kenworthy, Aaron Olla and Frank Cole. Third 
row: Dennis Bigley, Austin Flanders, Paul Gaynor, Noah Olla, Todd Warnecke and 
Andrew Olla.

Sometimes life just works 
out for the best. For the KHS 
Boys soccer team, traveling to 
Sheboygan Falls on Thursday, 
October 9 was the soccer 
equivalent of falling into the 
Midas touch, discovering the 
fountain of youth and finding 
the Holy Grail - all rolled into 
one. Seemingly everything 
the Indians did on the soccer 
pitch worked. Playing with 
intensity and urgency, KHS 
executed well at all levels of 
the game from the opening 
kick-off to the final whistle 80 
minutes later as Kewaskum 
earned a well-deserved 5-0 
victory.

As with most efforts of 
this type, the win was a total 
team effort and heroes were 
plentiful across the field. 
These efforts were lead - as 
they have been all season 
long - by Senior Aaron Olla 
who once again excelled on 
the field and proved why he is 
the premier defender in the 
conference. Olla’s exploits on 
the field are done with such 
apparently effortless grace 
that it is easy to overlook how 
remarkable he has performed 
all year long and this game 
was certainly no different. 
Another Senior whose contri­
butions will not show up in 
the box score was Adam 
Hickman who seemed to win 
every contested ball with his 
quick first step. Hickman 
showed Senior leadership as 
he was involved in practically 
every aspect of Kewaskum’s 
success. Sharp passes, 
attacking defense, smart on­
field communication are all 
hallmarks of a mature player 
and they were certainly part 
of Hickman’s arsenal against 
Sheboygan Falls.

If the exemplary play of 
Senior stars is somewhat 
expected on the athletic field, 
the emergence of a young star 
is always a welcome surprise. 
Freshman lacob Cochran 
earned his first start of the 
year on Thursday and quickly

demonstrated why he had 
earned that honor. In the first 
two minutes of the game, 
Cochran crashed the 
Sheboygan Falls’ box running 
onto a beautifully executed 
pass from Junior Noah Olla. 
Cochran struck the ball solid­
ly and planted it deep in the 
back of the net to score the 
first goal for the Indians and 
set an example for the upper- 
classmen to follow.
The Indians had been strug­
gling of late to score, but 
Cochran’s goal and energetic 
play seemed to wake the rest 
of the team who discovered 
that goals could be had if they 
aggressively attacked the 
heart of the Falls’ defense by 
running into and through the 
box.

One Indian who did not 
need to have this lesson 
shown to him was 
Sophomore Jon Olla who had 
recently been moved up to 
Forward from his usual 
defensive position because 
he offered exactly that kind of 
crash-the-box mentality on 
every play. Since he moved 
forward, Olla has consistently 
troubled the opposition goal­
keepers with his aggressive­
ness and relentless play. He 
was rewarded for these efforts 
in the first half as Junior Tyler 
Hickman passed it crisply up 
to Olla in the box where Jon 
nailed the Indians’ second 
goal of the day.

The Indians defense, 
meanwhile, continued to play 
with the teamwork, good 
communication and strong, 
tough play of which they are 
accustomed. Sophomores 
Frank Cole, Paul Gaynor, 
Austin Flanders and 
Goalkeeper Nate Kenworthy 
joined with Aaron Olla to 
keep the Falls' offense from 
scoring throughout the half. 
Of particular note was the 
gritty play of Flanders who 
moved back from his usual 
position of Midfield to play 
outside defender for the first

time this year.
The second half was more 

of the same on both ends of 
the pitch. Tyler Hickman 
started things off with a long 
shot outside the eighteen that 
sailed over the Falls’ Keepers 
head and found the back of 
the net. Unfortunately for 
Sheboygan Falls, it was the 
kind of shot that when exe­
cuted perfectly is practically 
indefensible.

Perhaps realizing this, a 
few short minutes later, light­
ning struck again when Noah 
Olla made almost exactly the 
same shot from the same 
location. Like Hickman’s, 
Olla’s shot was perfectly 
struck and arced beautifully 
into the net.

With a 4-0 lead, Coach 
Dennis Bigley in a matter of 
sportsmanship, cleared his 
bench getting solid minutes 
from Junior Todd Warnecke, 
Freshman Ryan Nuernberg, 
Senior Adam Hildebrand and 
Sophomore Jon Radzitis. 
Each played with a spirit and 
tenacity equal of the starters 
and kept the pressure on 
Sheboygan Falls throughout 
the second half. In one of his 
few extended stints in goal 
this season, Senior Shane 
Harlacher showed solid play 
at Goalkeeper making several 
nice saves on Fall’s shots.

Late in the game, the 
Indians attempted to manu­
facture a goal for starting 
keeper Kenworthy who was 
playing up on top with energy 
- if not exactly finesse. 
Finally, with no good pass 
opportunity available, 
Sophomore Jason Jahnke - 
the Indians high scorer for the 
year - planted a patented left­
footed, far-post rocket shot 
into the goal. This was the 
final goal of the game for 
Kewaskum who hope to build 
on the well-executed 5-0 win 
as they looked forward to the 
final two conference games 
against Campbellsport and 
State Champion Plymouth.

Crystal Dreher, first team all conference, shows her 
strength off the tee.

A bid to the sectional golf 
tournament, a third place fin­
ish in the Wisconsin Little Ten 
conference and four varsity 
golfers making the all-confer­
ence team selections is a 
good measure of the success 
of the KHS girls’ golf team 
this season. The Lady Indians 
wrapped up their season on 
Wednesday at Old Hickory in 
Beaver Dam. The competi­
tion was tough and the 
Kewaskum girls didint have 
their best showing of the year 
but the game of golf can be 
kind one day and very cure! 
the next.

Arrowhead high school 
won the sectional competi­
tion with a team score of 359 
with Jessie Hauser’s 82 lead­
ing the way. Second place 
went to Catholic Memorial 
with a team score of 369. 
Kewaskum finished in eighth

AUTO BODY DYNAMICS
1235 Fond du Lac Avenue, Kewaskum

Mike Vogt (left), Erica Kudek (center), and Tom Kudek, owner.

We would like to introduce ourselves, so we don't have to meet by 

accident. But, if we do, FTs your choice and we hope you choose...

AUTO BODY DYNAMICS
For All Your Auto Body Needs

downtown Kewaskum (262) 626-8780

place with a 441. The best 
round for the Indians was the 
102 shot by senior Crystal 
Dreher with nines of 52 and 
50. Katie Kowalczyk added a 
111, Nicole Remmel a 112 and 
Cassie Remmel a 116. All the 
rounds for the girls were well 
above their season averages. 
Maybe we can blame it on the 
fast greens of Old Hickory and 
the biting Japenese beetles 
for the higher than normal 
scores. The team has every 
reason to be proud of their 
season and to be hopeful for 
next year.

Competition is a painful 
thing, but it produces great 
results.


