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Candidates, Mates Campaign Here in Final Week

Wisconsin Vote Pivotal in Tuesday’s Election
By Noel Stollenwerk

It is becoming more and more 
apparent that the state of Wiscon­
sin will play a key role in determin­
ing the United States' next 
presidential ticket.

President George Bush and 
Arkansas Gov. Bill Clinton are 
both making late-minute cam­
paign stops in the Dairy State, try­
ing to woo voters into their respec­
tive camps. Wisconsin holds 11 
electoral votes, and it has been 
widely believed that the prospec­
tive candidates are targeting the 
state, calling it pivotal.

Bush, the Republican incum­
bent, is expected to make stops 
in the state this weekend, while 
Bush’s running mate, Vice Presi­
dent Dan Quayle, was in western 
Wisconsin earlier in the week.

Clinton, the Democratic 
nominee, is expected to visit one 
more time before Tuesday's 
general election, while his runn­
ing mate, Tennessee Senator Al 
Gore, was in Oshkosh for a rally 
on Tuesday.

Independent candidate H. Ross 
Perot and running mate James 
Stockdale do little public cam­
paigning, and are not expected to 
pledge for votes in Wisconsin.

The three main campaigns will 
not be the only one on Tuesday’s

Public Urged to Vote Against Tax Referendum

Underage Smoking Ordinance Adopted
By Noel Stollenwerk

KEWASKUM — The 
Kewaskum Village Board last 
Monday night adopted an or­
dinance calling for underage per­
sons to be fined for possession 
and/or use of tobacco products.

The ordinance, which has

Holy Trinity 
Auction Nov. 8

Holy Trinity Parish, 331 Main 
St., Kewaskum, will be holding an 
auction on Sunday, Nov. 8 in the 
church basement.

Auctioneers Col. Jimmy Cotter 
and Barney Strobel will be seek­
ing top bidders, beginning at 1, for 
such items as wildlife prints by 
Robert Bateman and Bill Millomg, 
autographed items from pro 
sports and college teams, gift cer­
tificates, household items, and 
much more.

A raffle drawing will be held at 
5 p.m. with a color TV as the 
grand prize. Refreshments will be 
served.

If you have any questions, 
please call Diane Piwoni at 
626-2121 between 8 a m. and 5 
p.m. or 626-4850 after 5 p.m.

presidential ballot, however, as 
Wisconsin will have 14 different 
tickets from which to choose.

The voting public it to be 
reminded, however, that voting a 
straight-line party vote 
(Republican or Democrat) will not 
automatically vote that party for 
president. You must vote the 
presidential ballot separately from 
the straight-party ballot.

Several other key races will be 
decided by voters on Tuesday. In 
the race for a United States 
Senate seat, Democratic con­
tender Russell Feingold appears 
to be leading Republican incum­
bent Robert Kasten in latest polls, 
however, the gap between the 
two has narrowed considerably. 
Also running for that Senate seat 
are Libertarian William Bittner, 
along with Independents Patrick 
Johnson, Robert Kundert, Joseph 
Selliken and Mervin Hanson.

The position of Washington 
County Sheriff is also to be decid 
ed, with incumbent Robert 
Schulteis receiving opposition 
from Libertarian Dave Amennger, 
as well as from write-in candidate 
Jim Grover, whom Schulteis beat 
in a Republican Primary in the 
spring.

Incumbent James Sensenbren­
ner is being challenged for his 
seat in the 9th Congressional

already been in effect in surroun­
ding communities such as West 
Bend and Slinger, is designed to 
curb the use of tobacco product 
by underage persons.

‘‘We’re the only municipality 
not to adopt it so far,” Kewaskum 
police chief Richard Knoebel said 
at the Board meeting. Knoebel 
reported that violators of the or­
dinance will generally be warned 
first, and subsequent offenses will 
result in a fine of $25.00 plus court 
costs, which amounts to an 
overall fine of $55.00.

Also at the meeting, Village Ad­
ministrator Dan Schmidt express­
ed his feeling toward the tax 
referendum that will appear on 
voting ballots on Tuesday. 
Schmidt said that he agrees with 
State Treasurer Cathy Zeuske’s 
finding that the passing of the 
referendum would have bad con­
sequences for taxpayers.

‘‘The taxpayers will be the ones 
hurt by it,” Schmidt said of the 
referendum, which calls for the lif­
ting of the uniformity clause in the 
taxation of property. That would 
mean that two homes of equal 
value could be taxed at very dif­
ferent rates.

The way Wisconsin law stands 
now, all property within each class 
is taxed uniformly. If the referen-

District by Democrat Ingrid Bux­
ton, Libertarian Jeffrey Holt 
Millikin and David Marlow.

The State’s 20th District Senate 
seat is also up for grabs, as 
Donald Stitt (Republican), 
Delmore Beaver (Democrat) and 
Larry Gavel (Libertarian) jockey 
for the position, with Stitt serving 
as the incumbent.

Mary Panzer will try to hold on 
to her seat in the State 
Assembly’s 59th District, as she 
will be challenged by Libertarian 
candidate Kevin Scheunenmann.

Carol Puerling, the incumbent 
Clerk of Circuit Courts, is receiv­
ing opposition from Libertarian 
Steve Chantelois, while Register 
of Deeds voting will be between 
Republican Dorothy Gonnering, 
Libertarian Betty Schuenenmann 
and Independent Kip Nelson

Incumbent County Clerk Arthur 
Degnitz (Republican) is opposed 
by Libertarian Craig Lemonds, 
while County Treasurer Fredric 
Seefeldt will be challenged by 
Libertarian Ann Kutz.

District Attorney J. Dennis 
Thornton (Republican) is running 
unopposed for the District At­
torney spot, while Republican 
Marlene Yoost is running unop­
posed for the County Coroner 
position.

dum is passed, the state could 
pass a law to determine a home’s 
effective tax rate by taking into ac­
count factors such as age, oc­
cupation, and income. Zeuske 
even goes so far as to suggest 
that special interest groups could 
benefit from the passing of an 
amendment.

“If the amendment passes, the 
Wisconsin Legislature would be 
given a magic wand to grant 
political wishes by allowing select 
groups in society to be favored in 
taxation,” Zueske said in oppos­
ing the referendum.

In other action at the meeting, 
Schmidt went over ‘‘very 
preliminary” figures for the 1993 
budget, which is estimated to be 
increasing by 7 percent, with the 
tax rate to increase between 15 
and 2.7 percent. Schmidt went 
over various facets of the budget, 
explaining any significant in­
creases or decreases, and added 
that further review of the item will 
occur at the meeting on Nov. 
30th.

Knoebel, meanwhile, reported 
that the annual Homecoming 
week at the high school general­
ly went well, although a cost of 
$229.35 was incurred in overtime 
and additional support.

Christmas Parade Will
Be Funded by Tree Lights

Are you anticipating a bigger 
and better Christmas Parade this 
year on Sunday, Dec 6? Do you 
remember seeing the look of 
wonder and excitement on the 
faces of all the children as they 
eagerly awaited the arrival of San­
ta Claus and his elves?

If you enjoy all the Christmas 
smiles, now is the time to con­
tribute towards the holiday merri­
ment as preparations for the an­
nual Christmas parade are cur­
rently underway

Last year the Kewaskum Area 
Chamber of Commerce began a 
fund raiser that will run again this 
year to help underwrite some of 
the cost of the parade

A huge wooden Christmas tree 
was built by Jim Schaub and 
erected in front of Valley Bank 
prior to the Ihanksgiving holiday. 
The same will be done this year. 
You can show your support by 
purchasing individual lights from 
the Chamber that will be placed 
on the Christmas tree

As each light is purchased by 
individual donors, they will be lit, 
one by one, on the tree Hopeful­
ly, all the colored lights on the 
brilliant tree will be lit as the 
Christmas parade rolls by on Dec. 
6, heralding the beginning of the 
festivities

Again this year, in addition to 
the Christmas tree, a large star 
will be placed adjacent to the tree 
and white ‘‘memorial'' lights can 
be purchased to surround the star 
in glowing white light A memorial 
board will be placed in front of the 
star with the message "A star 
shines brightly for those who can­
not share Christmas with us this

Trick or Treat 
Saturday

KEWASKUM — The 
Kewaskum Village Board an­
nounced that the Halloween trick- 
or-treat hours this year will be on 
Saturday, October 31st, from 2 00 
p.m. - 4:00 p.m.

As always, parents are en­
couraged to follow along with their 
children as they trick-or-treat If 
that isn't practical, parents should 
at least talk with the potential 
ghosts and goblins, and explain 
the various safety hints

year... IN MEMORY OF. The 
names of deceased family 
members in whose memory the 
lights were purchased, will also be 
placed on the ‘‘Memorial board.”

The cost of the white memorial 
lights will be $10 for each name 
Green lights, which will surround 
the Christmas tree, can be pur­
chased by individuals and/or 
families for $10 each A “thank 
you” board listing the names of 
the green light donors will be plac­
ed next to the tree

In addition to the green and 
white lights, red lights will be 
available to area businesses and 
corporate sponsors at a cost of 
$25 (or more) per light The 
special red lights will be used to 
decorate the inside of the 
Christmas tree A special “thank 
you’’ board listing the names of 
the businesses that donated “red 
lights" will also be placed next to 
the tree

All new special lights have been 
acquired to maximize lighting ef­
ficiency this year Every few days, 
donors names will be added Io the 
“thank you" boards and fresh 
lights will be lit in addition to those 
previously lit

Please show your support ol 
the Christmas Parade by donating 
one (or more) lights on the 
Christmas tree or Memorial Star 
The parade cannot experience 
growth or be a part of your holi­
day celebrations without the 
financial support of the entire 
community Thank you for your 
help

To donate a light, please fill out 
the coupon on page two and mail 
to the Kewaskum Area Chamber 
of Commerce, P O Box 300, 
Kewaskum, WI 53040

Announce Kettle 
Kountry Kolors 
Raffle Winners

Winners of the Kewaskum Area 
Chamber of Commerce Kettle 
Kountry Kolors raffle were drawn 
at their regular monthly meeting 
held on Wednesday, October 21

First prize of $300 was won by 
Steve Van Ess of Kewaskum Se­
cond prize, which was $200, was 
won by Mike Fennies of West 
Bend Third prize of $100 was 
won by Brenda Kober of 
Kewaskum

Fourth, fifth, sixth and seventh 
prizes, which was $50 each, went 
to Matt Reigle of West Bend, An­
drea Vechart of Brillion, Don 
Woolweber of Grafton and Aman­
da Nelson of Beechwood.

The balloon ride raffle will be 
held within the next few weeks.

The Chamber would like to 
thank everyone who purchased 
tickets in support of Kettle Koun­
try Kolors

V
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October Student of the Month

The above bizarre, oldie Halloween photo was submitted by Isabelle Muckerheide.

By Noel Stollenwerk
Kewaskum High School sophomore Guy Liepert has been chosen 

as the Board of Education s Student of the Month for October.
Guy. son of Dale and Sandy Liepert. was chosen because of his 

positive changes during the first two months of the school year. His 
positive attitude continues to show the effect of the POPS (Power 
of Positive Students) program recently begun at the school.

As one of his teachers wrote in Guy’s nomination, ' He has become 
a more responsible student and person this year in class. He works 
much harder than previous years and gets along better with his 
peers Guy has exhibited a very positive change in attitude and 
behavior."

High-Speed Police Chase 
Flees Through Kewaskum

A high speed chase ended in 
Eden last Thursday, Oct 22, 
when a 17 year old Milwaukee 
youth led police through several 
counties before being 
apprehended

According to a Washington 
County Sheriff’s report, the chase 
began around 11 p.m. in 
Milwaukee, after the suspect 
allegedly stole a car and fled north 
on Hwy 45, accompanied by 
three passengers.

Deputies were called out to pur­
sue the vehicle, entering the 
chase at Hwy 60. after a slate 
trooper who had been following 
the car, reported the driver was 
manuevering erratically, forcing 
traffic off the road

The state trooper joined the 
chase in an unmarked vehicle, 
and requested aid when he felt 
that police squads with more 
lights would be beneficial in 
preventing accidents.

The suspect continued to flee

authorities through Fond du Lac 
county, including Kewaskum, and 
ended just south of Eden, where 
he lost control of the vehicle and 
crashed.

A Washington County Sheriff’s 
Department deputy was injured at 
this point when the sheriff's squad 
hit a utility pole. He was treated 
and later released from St 
Joseph’s Community Hospital, 
West Bend.

The three passengers were 
taken into custody, but the driver 
escaped on foot, and was later ar­
rested in Sheboygan County The 
1 7 year old youth faces felony 
charges of endangering safety

Riveredge Hird Club
Well-known throughout the 

state for his photography, local 
photographer Vern Arendt will 
share some secrets of successful 
bird photography.

A video tape of famous wildlife 
photographer Leonard Lee Rue 
will also be presented on Tues­
day, November 3 at 7 p.m.

Call Riveredge at 375-2715 
(Metro) or 675-6888 (local) for 
more information.

Riveredge Nature Center, a 
non-profit, 350 acre natural sanc­
tuary and educational organiza­
tion, providing environmental pro­
grams for all ages, is located .in 
Ozaukee County, on Highway Y, 
one mile north of Newburg, bet­
ween Saukville and West Bend

YES! Please add our name to the 
list of Christmas Parade Supporters

GREEN LIGHT - $10 Donation

Family Name

RED LIGHT - $25 Donation (or more)

Name of Business

WHITE LIGHT • $10 Donation

In Memory of

ALUMINUM 
CANS

On the first, third 
and fifth Saturdays

10 a.m. to 2 p.m.

SENTRY PARKING LOT 
Kewaskum Mall 

Also buying copper, brass, 
batteries and other aluminum

2nd and 4th Tuesday 
10 a.m. to 1 p.m. 

STRAUB'S in Campbellsport

MARCOE’S RECYCLING

Please mail to:
KEWASKUM AREA CHAMBER OF COMMERCE 

P.O. Box 300, Kewaskum, Wl 53040

OPEN 
HOUSE

Saturday, Nov. 7

355 Main Street 
Kewaskum 

626-8131
a j^c^f®^

Beauty 

?Kc Beast

* NOW SHOWING *
°/oBasic Instinct %Cutting Edge 

°/oThe Babe %Sleepwalkers

Campbellsport Author KAREN HARTMAN
Will Sign Copies of Her Book

DREAM CATCHER 10:00 - Noon

KEWASKUM PHARMACY
927 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum 

PHONE 626-4222

°/oBatman 2

KALLOWEENg?
SPECIAL I 
2 Horror Rentals/ 

99c
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Paper Science Scholarship $$

Keith C. Butschlick
Keith C. Butschlick, son of An­

thony and Sue Butschlick of 8615 
Salisbury Road, Kewaskum, is 
among 19 freshmen awarded 
paper science scholarships worth 
$2,000 over four years at the 
University of Wisconsin - Stevens

KFD Fire and
Rescue Squad Calls

Thursday, October 22, 5:56 - 
The Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
was called to Courtney Lane in 
Kewaskum when a female patient 
complained of pain in the upper 
chest area and was having trou­
ble breathing. She was 
transported to St. Joseph's 
Hospital in West Bend.

Thursday, October 22, 7:49 
p.m. - The Kewaskum Rescue 
Squad responded to a call to 
Fond du Lac Avenue in 
Kewaskum when a female patient 
was found unconscious due to an 
insulin reaction. She was 
transported to St. Joseph’s 
Hospital in West Bend.

Friday, October 23, 7:40 a m. - 
The Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
was summoned to the parking lot 
between Kewaskum High School 
and Middle School when a male 
patient had his right foot run over 
by a vehicle. He was transported 
to St. Joseph’s Hospital in West 
Bend.

Saturday, October 24, 7:21 
a m. - The Kewaskum Rescue 
Squad responded to a call to Hwy. 
S, Kewaskum, when a Kewaskum 
firefighter was injured trying to ig­
nite an abandoned building dur­
ing a training exercise. He suf­
fered burns to the face and neck. 
He was transported to St. 
Joseph's Hospital in West Bend.

Saturday, 
a m. - The 
Squad was 
Beechwood

October 24, 8:32 
Kewaskum Rescue 
summoned to the 

Rest Home when a
female patient suffered a possible 
stroke. She was transported to St. 
Joseph’s Hospital in West Bend.

KHS ACTIVITIES 
CORNER

Week of October 30 to 
November 6, 1992 

October 30 - No School - 
Teachers Convention
October 31 - Volleyball Sectionals 

- State Cross Country
November 2 - No School ■ 

Inservice
November 3 - Start of the Second 

Quarter
November 5 - Musical - 4 p.m. 

Senior Citizen Performance
November 6 - Musical - 8 p.m.

- State Volleyball
PLEASE CONTACT KHS AT 

626-2166 FOP ANY
FUPTHEP IN FOP MATION

Point.
The recipients, who graduated 

at the top of their high school 
classes, were among the honored 
guests at an annual recognition 
dinner on campus.

The scholarships, sponsored 
by industry donations to the UW- 
SP Paper Science Foundation, 
are paid in increasing installments 
over a four-year period. To con­
tinue to receive the stipend, each 
student winner must continue to 
maintain an overall grade point 
average of at least 3.25. Industry 
representatives pledged to con­
tribute more than $100,000 dur­
ing the next year to support facul­
ty and student pursuits.

A graduate of Kewaskum High 
School, Butschlick was a member 
of the National Honor Society and 
earned letters in football and 
basketball.

Junior Women’s 
Recipe of the Month

This recipe and many more can 
be found in the Kewaskum Junior 
Woman’s Club cookbook. To buy 
your copy ask any Jr. Woman’s 
Club member or else they can be 
found at Kewaskum Pharmacy, 
Regal Ware Outlet, Kewaskum 
Frozen Foods, or Village Hair 
Stylists.

TUNA MACARONI BAKE
Meri Lou Chambers

1 pkg. macaroni and cheese 
’A c. sliced pimento olives 
1/z c. mayonnaise or sour cream 
2/3 c. coarsely diced celery 
1/z c. water
1 can (61/2 oz.) tuna, drained 
Heat oven at 350 degrees. Cook 
and drain macaroni as directed on 
package; EXCEPT after draining 
add celery and olives in 1V2 quart 
casserole. In small saucepan, mix 
water and cheese sauce. Mix; 
cook over medium heat. Stirring 
until thick and smooth. Stir in 
mayonnaise. Mix sauce with 
macaroni celery mixture. Fold in 
tuna. Cover and bake 20 to 25 
minutes. 4 to 6 servings.

THANK YOU
A heartfelt THANK YOU to all who supported the recent 
KEWASKUM FFA ALUMNI Nut, Bolt and Tool Sale. 
SPECIAL THANKS to Ed Preo, Area Sales Manager of 
FIVE STAR SHOP SERVICE for conducting the sale; Mark 
Ruplinger for supervising the sale and to the following for 
setting up appointments and riding along to sales: Eugene 
Schneider, DuWayne Schulz, Jim and Carol Oelhafen, 
Mark Ruplinger, Roy Esser and FFA member Mike 
Ksioszk.
To our area farmers, businesses and individuals who sup­
ported us, the Kewaskum FFA Alumni wants to give a 
special nod of appreciation:

David Beck Phi! Lamp
Kermit Coulter Mike Lettow
Gary Darmody Jim Maul
Gordon Darmody Bob Melzer
Dave's Radiator Meyer Farms
Dorn Bros. George Muth
Tom Enright Poger Neuman
Ethan Etta Jim Oelhafen
Al Falk Mark Pamper in
Family Acres Mark Proeber
Farmland Welding RaMor Acres
Bob Felten Reys-En-Shine Dairy
Four Way Farms Mark Ruplinger
Charles Garbisch Schladweiler Farms
Gundrum Bros. Farms Schulz Bros. Farms
Karl Haack Schwartz Trucking
John Herriges Stoffel Farms, Inc.
Ed Hetebrueg Dennis Terlinden
Pobert Ihlenfeld Kevin Thull
Floyd Klug TNT Auto Body
Ed & Harvey Klumb Bill Volm
James Ksioszk Steve Volm

NOTICE
Paying 

Immediate 
CASH

$5

TOP DOLLAR for all 
your unwanted GOLD, 
DENTAL, SILVER, 
DIAMONDS & OLD 
WATCHES and most 
OLD COINS

CALLAWAY 
& CO.

409 Main St., Kewaskum
626-4609

KC HALL

Monthly 
Friday Night

SURE
First Friday 

Of Every Month
Serving Starts at 5 p.m.

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC

Hall is also available for 
class reunions, weddings, 
anniversaries and large or 
small part group meetings.

KC HALL
3245 Lighthouse Lane

334-9849

HT Christian Women 
To Hold Reception

Holy Trinity Christian Women 
are celebrating 40 years as 
members of the National Con­
ference of Christian Mothers On 
November 10. Fr Bertin Roll of 
Pittsburgh. PA. National Director, 
will celebrate Mass at 7 p m. for 
members of Holy Trinity as well as 
District 13 Parishes.

After Mass a reception will 
follow in the Church Hall with Fr. 
Roll as guest speaker

The public is invited to attend

Holy Trinity

BINGO
New & More Games

I $10.00 Minimum Prize 
Per Winner

$1,000 Plus
' Per Session
(Depending Upon Attendance)

Sunday, Nov. 1
7 p.m. (Doors open at 6 p.m.)

Holy Trinity Parish Hall 
315 Main St., Kewaskum 

HELD THE FIRST SUNDAY OF THE 
MONTH THROUGHOUT THE YEAR

KEWASKUM 
FROZEN FOODS

118 Forest Ave., Kewaskum
PHONE 626-2710 or 626-2181 

Pobert Beisbier Owner

★ SPECIAL* ★ SPECIAL* * SPECIAL *
Thurs., Fri. & Sat., Oct. 29-30-31

x POT ROAST 
®°" $1.69 ib

Bring your deer or boneless 
meat to Kewaskum Frozen Foods 

for the finest in processing 
and venison sausage

Professional
DEER PROCESSING

& SAUSAGE MAKING
Open Monday-Thursday 8 am to 5 30 p m

Friday 8am to 7 p m Saturday 8am to 4 p m
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MEMORIES
World War II Servicemen

Tiny Terlinden

Paul Kral

Shown above are some of the handmade creations of Barbara Lembach who 
will again be participating in the Kewaskum Junior Woman's Club sponsored 
“A Kettle Country Christmas" art and craft fair being held this year on Satur­
day, Nov. 21 at Kewaskum High School. Barbara specializes in cedar signs, 
various wooden articles and assorted ‘ ‘Kritters ’ ’ who compliment her wooden 
projects.

Open House at
St. Mary's Springs

St. Mary’s Springs High School 
will be hosting their 1992 Open 
House on Sunday, November 1, 
from 11 a.m. until 1 p.m. Enter­
tainment will include the SMS 
Swing Choir performing “A 
Rockin' Revue” from 11 to 11:30 
in the school auditorium.

At 11:30 tours of the school will 
begin throughout both buildings

and will end at 12:30 in Hutter 
Gym where the cheerleaders and 
pep band will show their school 
spirit in a pep rally.

Immediately following the rally, 
refreshments will be served in the 
Trophy Lobby and Commons, 
and visitors will get a chance to 
socialize with the administration, 
faculty, students and parents of 
SMS. The Booster Closet will also 
be open for shopping or browsing. 
Anyone interested or curious 
about St Mary’s Springs is invited 
to attend.

Happy 25th Anniversary 
MOM and DAD!

FIREMEN TO MEET
The regular monthly meeting of 

the Kewaskum Fire Department 
will be held at the fire station on 
Thursday, Nov 5, at 7:30 p.m

Vinnin Kohler

Tiny Terlinden Photos

KEWASKUM STATESMAN
250 Main St., P.O. Box 98 

Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
Phone 414-626-2626 
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Volume 96 Number 46
October 29, 1992 
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Second Class Postage Paid at 
Kewaskum. Wl 53040 
Lana Harbeck Kuehl 

Publisher

Since 1920, the most successful third party 
candidate for U.S. President has been George 
Wallace, running on the American 
Independent Party in 1968, he racked up 
9,906,000 popular votes out of a total of 
73,212,000. Nixon won that year by about 
510,000 votes.

Love... Rick, Joann, Rod, Theresa & Rebecca

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 
$17.00 a year - in-state 

$20.00 a year - out-of-state
Single copy - 35c

Please send change of 
address orders to:

KEWASKUM STATESMAN 
250 Main St., P.O. Box 98 

Kewaskum, Wl 53040

active member 

ir mr i WISCONSIN II V I NEWSPAPER 
2' ASSOCIATION

active member

...^WISCONSIN
IT Ml newspaper

v' ASSOCIATION

★ MATT THULL ★
1992 Flyway Conference 
Cross Country Champion

GOOD LUCK 
AT STATE!

Proud Grandson of 
Marylin Thull and Loretta Strupp
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e 5 Piggy Sends Greetings 

From Town of Wayne
Hy L.l.K.

I received a very special 
message from my pal, Piggy, at 
work this week and could hardly 
wait to share it with all her 
Kewaskum buds. It read:

“Just a note to the people of 
Kewaskum. John is taking very 
good care of me. I sleep in his 
baby bed and he does tuck me in. 
Last Wednesday night, he took 
me for a ride in his big black car. 
We went to Prime Time Pub and 
I saw Rhonda and Mike, Becky 
and her kids, Jackie, Julie and 
Troy. I can’t wait to go Trick or 
Treating with John. I really like it 
on the farm.

** Piggy”
I was so relieved to hear all this 

good news from Piggy. Now 
perhaps I can again get some 
sleep at night. Of course, now I 
feel as if my heart is broken, 
realizing that at this point in 
Piggy’s happy life, she probably 
doesn’t even miss me, much less 
need my guidance. I do hope she 
has fond memories of all the time 
we spent together and all the 
good times we shared. How 
quickly they forget! But let’s keep 
in touch... maybe we can do 
lunch! Have your person call my 
person.

I had a chance to have a nice, 
long, sobering (yeah, right!) chat 
with Doug Gonring at “Jocko’s’’ 
wedding last Saturday evening. 
Doug quietly informed me that he 
is NOT the one who throws the 
New Year’s Eve Party. He has the 
Super Bowl Party. (I knew that 
Doug... I was just trying to railroad 
you into something!)

Okay... so now at least we all 
know where we’re watching the 
Super Bowl. (I guess we all pret­
ty much surmised we wouldn’t be 
watching it in Green Bay this 
year!) However... I just don’t see 
how this will ever work out Doug. 
I KNOW Piggy won’t go for a 
Super Bowl party. After all, would 
YOU go to a party and watch two 
teams of overgrown men pass 
one of your relatives from one end 
of the field to the other? I think 
not. I mean, let's show some com­
passion for piggy’s fallen 
comrades.

I think it’s better if we break this 
whole football thing to her very 
gently and very carefully. (This 
could scar the poor little thing for 
life!) Here's your next bedtime 
story, John...

Once upon a time there was an 
unemployed coach who wan­
dered unto the campus of an 
Arkansas college and found a 
bunch of BIG-BIG boys kicking 
and throwing around a little, bit- 
sy ball. Coach said, “You guys 
look like a bunch of Razorbacks!’’ 
Thus the team was named after 
one of your old ancestors, little 
piggy. Good bedtime story, hey? 
That should at least “prime’’ 
piggy's interest in football 
anyway. Whatever you do though, 
be careful not to mention what the 
football is made of or you'll really 
hear some squealling!

Okay... so now Piggy is primed 
for Doug's party and Doug takes

the easy way out. After all, what 
do you need for a Super Bowl par­
ty? Pretzels, beer and alot of floor. 
Even I could handle that!?!

That leaves us without a host 
for Piggy’s Rockin’ New Year’s 
Eve Party. Now we re right back 
to square one! How about Eckl's 
Main Street Inn? I know... not big 
enough! How about we rent a big­
big tent and put it on the parking 
lot. A few heaters... a few shovels 
in case of snow and we’re all set.

Actually, good ole’ Doug 
though “MOI’’ should throw the 
New Year’s Eve Party. I don’t 
know if that’s such a good idea. 
Of course this party would have 
to be contingent upon the follow­
ing prerequisites:

1. Someone has to bring a tarp 
large enough to completely cover 
my carpeting. I know what hap­
pens when Piggy gets excited 
after swilling champagne all 
evening.

2. Everyone has to do their New 
Year’s Eve shopping at Kuehl’s 
Suds and Spirits so he is sold out 
and has to close by 6 p.m. 7hen 
make sure someone sends him 
home!

3. Someone has to find an ap­

propriate party hat (and favors... 
she likes the twirly kind you throw) 
for Piggy. (John... this means 
you'll have to invest in a party 
dress for her!)

4. The singing duo of “Ellis & 
Eckl" must perform the song, 
“Pinky, Stinky Pig" exactly at 
midnight!

5. Everyone agrees to eat at 
least one bowl of sauerkraut

There, I guess that should pret­
ty much take care of all the rules 
and regulations. Still want to have 
the party at my house?!?!? 
There's still time for someone else 
to volunteer. Sauerkraut and 
cheap champagne... YUM1 YUM1

Doug did mention that he 
received a few ballots published 
in last week's paper, but he forgot 
to tell me (or I forgot to remember) 
if they were Pro Pig Party or Pro 
Hog Heaven. As tar as I know, 
Doug is the only one of the 
finalists who received any ballots 
But would Greg Eckl and Troy 
Ellis honestly admit it if they got 
any? Ask them... I'll bet they did!

dents own stock or 
invest in stock mutual 
funds.

JERRY’S

AND...

TV 
and 

ANTENNA 
SERVICE
NOW FEATURING

Guys & Dolls - A Character Bonanza
The streets of New York. 

Broadway. People from every 
walk of life, working the streets, 
sight-seeing, or just passing the 
time of day. Guys & Dolls, 
presented by Kewaskum High 
School, has it all. In New York, on 
any given day, one might see a 
variety of interesting sights In 
Guys & Dolls, lucky theater-goers 
will see a prizefighter (played by 
the muscular Tony Strancke) 
shadow boxing and skipping 
rope. He is accompanied by his 
manager (the bossy Eric Rahlf) 
who barks out orders as they 
train.

A pickpocket (played by the 
quick-handed Ryan Herman) has 
just relieved his last victim of his 
watch and is being chased by a 
policeman (fleet-footed Karl 
Ankerson). A sidewalk 
photographer (played by the 
photogenic Jenny Goodsell) has 
just snapped the photo of the

pickpockets victim, a Texan (the 
charming Tyler Dieringer) escor­
ting his wife (the lovely Rhonda 
Klesmith) They become aware of 
the missing watch and join the 
pursuit of the pickpocket.

A blind man (played by the 
near-sighted Kevin Klahn), carry­
ing his cane and tin cup. works 
the streets while street people 
(the resourceful Rachael 
Chambers and Suzi Gauvin) look 
on. Two autograph - seeking bob­
by soxers (played by the animated 
Jenny Straub and Jenny Ebert) 
hound a couple of beautiful ac­
tresses (the talented Mandy Pro- 
eber and Nikki Yogerst) for their 
autographs.

The excitement builds as these 
activities provide the background 
for the entertaining and side­
splitting Guys & Dolls. Get your 
tickets for the 8:00 p m., 
November 6 and 7 performances 
by calling 626-2166

AMERAHN
Bar & Hall

Hwy. 45 North of Kewaskum

Friday, Oct. 30 - 8:30 to 12:30

RAY KONKOL ^
^kwQQin Pcnco^Y
Sponsored by St Matthias Mens' (Jut)
* PRIZES FOR BEST COSTUMES *

Saturday, Oct. 31 - 8:30 to 12:30

NASHVILLE SOUNDS 
★ Country Music ★

RC/I 
Panasonic.

QUANTUM 
UHF/VHF/FM 
ANTENNAS

★ TVs ★ VCRs ★ Boom Boxes
★ Tape Recorders ★Camcorders 
★ Radios ★Cordless Phones

136 E. Main St., 
Campbellsport

- NEW WINTER HOURS -
Tues. - Fri. 9 a m. to 5:30 p m 

Saturday 8 a m. to 12 noon 
CLOSED MONDAYS

PHONE 533-4466

Sunday, Nov. 1 - 1:30 to 5:30 

HOWARD SCHNEIDER 
★ Big Band *

Country Western 
DANCE LESSONS

Every Monday 7:30 to 9 p.m. 
EVERYONE WELCOME!

PHONE 626-4031
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Letters to the Editor
Letter to the Editor: 

WOMEN’S ISSUES
October has been designated 

Breast Cancer Detection 
Awareness Month as a way of 
promoting the need for women to 
take a more active role in the care 
of their breasts. The reason is 
simple it will save lives.

Women in the 20th Senate 
District should mark November 
3rd on their calendars. Sure, it is 
election day, but, for us, it is an 
opportunity to dismiss an elected 
official whose positions on 
women's issues have been less 
than satisfactory.

Senator Donald Stitt was one of 
only two senators who voted to 
deny insurance coverage for 
mammograms He opposed at­
tempts to increase aid for needy 
women and children. Adding in­
sult to injury, Senator Stitt oppos­
ed a family leave bill that even 
Governor Thompson supported

During this year of the woman, 
during this year of family values, 
we certainly ought to cast a 
critical eye on each candidate. I 
am afraid that in the 20th Senate 
District, incumbent Senator 
Donald Stitt does not measure up

Sincerely, 
Arlene Beisbier 
West Bend

October 26, 1992 
To the Editor:

Sheriff Schulteis and James 
Grover both ran very costly 
primary campaigns As we all 
know the American Way is that 
after a campaign, the two can­
didates shake hands and hopeful­
ly can work together as 
gentlemen However, this time we 
have not seen Sheriff Schulteis as 
a man that is ready to let bygones 
be bygones So, the citizens of 
Washington County have rallied 
in protest against a Sheriff who is 
unable to let bygones be bygones 
and return his concentration to 
the job he was elected to do, that 
be, serving the people of this 
county instead of concentrating 
on his revenge tactics.

I am proud to be a resident of 
Washington County It has been 
an exciting experience to see how 
each community within the coun­
ty has joined forces to get the 
word out that there is a Write In 
for Grover campaign out there. 
West Bend has over two hundred 
hard working citizens out there 
actively spreading the instructions 
on how to do a write in vote. Hart­
ford has a group of over one hun­
dred, along with groups in 
Jackson, Kewaskum, German­
town. Richfield, Slinger, Allenton, 
and many other of the small com­
munities. I congratulate all of you 
in your effort toward bringing 
everyone together to assure that 
fairness is restored to our 
Sheriff's Department. I am sure 
that the employees of the Sheriff's 
Department are grateful for this 
Write In Grover for Sheriff cam­
paign. The Sheriff Dept has been 
riven with morale problems and 
budget problems for several 
years. It is up to we the people to 
unseat the incumbent when he or 
she is abusing the power of their 
office under the cover of their 
office.

The unity of the people of this 
county in supporting the Grover 
Write In voting campaign has 
been unbelievable. When 
W.I.G.S. was first formed on Sept. 
13, we were told that a Write In 
vote was nearly impossible. 
Anything is possible when the

people rally to fight for fairness 
and justice in local government, 
as well as state and federal 
government. Get out and vote on 
November 3rd, it is your right and 
your duty. Please write in Jim 
Grover for Sheriff, he is the man 
for the job. He and we the people 
need a write in vote from all of 
you.

Diane Michalski 
W.I.G.S. Secretary 
1507 Roosevelt Drive 
West Bend, Wl 53095

October 12, 1992

Dear Editor:
The Opportunity League of 

Washington County, Inc. 
celebrated their ninth anniversary 
on Friday, October 9, 1992, at 
Barth's Linden Inn. The special 
event started out with welcoming 
the guests with a cash bar before 
the buffet dinner With a Moment 
of Silence for Florence H. Mineau 
and a short prayer, we enjoyed a 
lovely delicious meal. Marge 
Behlen was the guest speaker for 
the special event. Marge spoke 
on the work Florence did for the 
organization until her death last 
spring Florence was the founder 
and the executive director of the 
organization Marge also remind­
ed the guests on the goals of the 
League We had a couple of door 
prizes before we closed the pro­
gram for music and dancing with 
the Joey Klass Band.

Among the 99 guests attending 
the event were Mayor Michael 
Miller of West Bend, Mayor 
James Core of Hartford, Tom 
Bergerud, Hope Nelson of West 
Bend, Opportunity League 
members, family and community 
friends of the members.

The centerpieces were donated 
by Pick N' Save South. Pick N' 
Save North, Sentry Foods of West 
Bend, Design Originals, Boergers 
Floral, Bits and Pieces, Black's 
Flower Shop, Kewaskum Floral, 
RLS Floral Studio and Miller- 
Bradford & Risberg, Inc. of 
Milwaukee. The door prizes were 
donated by First National Bank of 
Hartford and Regal Ware, Inc. of 
Kewaskum Other donations were 
made by Hartford Cleaners, The 
Camera Case and individuals.

We would like to thank each 
and every one of you who 
donated toward this special event. 
Please patronize the businesses 
mentioned above. We also would 
like to thank each and every one 
of you who helped in any way 
and/or just attended this special 
event. We hope to see you all at 
the tenth anniversary celebration 
on Friday, October 1, 1993 as be­
ing planned.

Thank you.
Judith A. Hchlen 
Secretary Treasurer 
Opportunity League of 
Washington County , Inc.

• • • •

October 16, 1992 
To the Editor:

At this time, I wish to extend my 
thanks to all who supported my 
recent bid for the 59th State 
Assembly seat.

As Jim Grover pointed out, one 
really doesn’t lose when you have 
done your best. I also feel I did my 
best, in a very short time to cam­
paign and against incredible 
odds, in gathering a 26 percent 
district average, which ranged as 
high as 39 to 43 percent in several 
wards in the northeast part of the 
district. These totals were called

“a respectable showing for a 
political unknown" by some 
media commentators. The results 
are gratifying, especially in light 
of the unusually heavy 
Democratic vote, and lay a foun­
dation for future efforts.

Most important, both can­
didates kept the campaign clean 
and professional, positive and 
issue-oriented. Losing a clean 
fight is no cause for bitterness.

Finally, I wish to note that the 
campaign experience was a hap­
py one, with most voter contacts 
pleasant, courteous and infor­
mative. While time constraints 
allowed me to reach only about 4 
percent of the doors in the district, 
I received a generous helping of 
complimentary and supportive 
remarks, which were a great emo­
tional and spiritual lift. (See Pro­
verbs 12:25, 16:24, 17:22).

With all this in mind, I will likely 
seek office again. Certainly, as I 
reflect on my life as it stood a year 
ago, I have come a long way and 
have much to be grateful for. My 
thanks to all who made that 
assessment possible.

David A. Schwengel 
West Bend

To the Editor:
As the Treasurer of W.I.G.S., I 

urge the citizens of Washington 
County to get out and Write In 
Grover for Sheriff on Nov. 3.

Mr. Schulteis, in his arrogance 
immediately after the primary 
election, did exactly the opposite 
of what he claimed he would do 
before the primary.

Now I am sure he thinks that 
the people of Washington Coun­
ty are not intelligent enough to do 
a write in campaign to defeat him. 
Well, we have got big news for 
him W.I.G.S. has taken the bull 
by the horns. Through the 
generous donations of the several 
hundred members that have join­
ed us, we now have available to 
you the citizens, Grover stickers 
to use on election day. If you are 
interested in the stickers and have 
friends who are also interested, 
please call 338-0871. We will be 
sure you get them.

Jim Grover has done the right 
thing and decided to run for 
Sheriff on this write in voting ef­
fort. He knows that his days are 
numbered under Sheriff Schulteis 
if he fails, so he might as well go 
all out.

It is a shame that the Sheriff 
couldn't have just accepted his 
victory and then moved on, but to 
demote Jim Grover and then ac­
cuse him of being untrustworthy 
is going way over the line.

W.I.G.S. have every intention to 
do everything possible to insure 
that Jim Grover is treated fairly 
and that some responsible leader­
ship will be at the helm of the 
Sheriff’s Department. For lack of 
leadership skills, the Sheriff is us­
ing intimidation. How would you 
feel if your boss treated you this 
way?? Get ready Sheriff, the 
public is about to speak. Write in 
Jim Grover for Sheriff November 
3rd, your vote counts and it is 
crucial. Ask your poll worker how 
to do a WRITE IN VOTE, they are 
there to assist you.

Bob Michalski 
1507 Roosevelt Dr. 
West Bend, Wl 53095 
414 338-0871

To the Editor,

Fool me once, shame on you. 
Fool me twice, shame on me.

This is how I feel about the up­
coming election of the Sheriff of 
Washington County.

Mr. Schulteis won the primary 
election with statements that "Jim 
Grover would have his job after 
the election." I believed that.

He won the election with the

statement, "a Sheriff you can be 
proud of.” I believed that.

He won the election with the 
statement that the budget was in 
good shape, "not to worry." I 
believed that.

To put it in a nutshell, the man 
is only going to fool me once. I 
personally am going to write-in 
Jim Grover in the General Elec­
tion and I would like as many peo­
ple as possible to do the same.

He thinks he has it in the bag... 
let’s send him packing with that 
bag.

Marilyn Multhauf 
Hubertus, Wl

To the Editor:
During the recent primary elec­

tion for sheriff, Jim Grover spent 
more than $40,000 in a futile at­
tempt to win the nomination and 
defeat Sheriff Robert Schulteis. A 
lot of people sneered at such 
spending. Perhaps some of those 
people will stop sneering and will 
now start understanding why he 
did it.

Jim Grover knew what would 
happen if he lost the nomination. 
He said that Sheriff Schulteis 
would force him out of the depart­
ment. The sheriff smoothly 
disagreed, assuring everyone, in-

CELEBRATION CANDLES 
Burning in Honor of

27th - Happy Birthday Willie Goeden from Danielle & Megan

, OCT-
4th - Happy Birthday Sara Ramel from Audrey Jaraczewski
5th • Happy Birthday Judy Christensen from Joyce Halfmann
5th • Happy 97th Birthday Kewaskum Statesman from the Staff
7th - Happy 21st Birthday Yvonne Amerling from Mom & Dad 
8th - Happy Birthday Adeline Halfmann from Joyce Halfmann 

10th - Golden Anniversary Memorial for Al Muckerheide from 
Isabelle Muckerheide

12th - Happy 1st Anniversary Steve & Lisa Gauger
12th - Happy Birthday Roger Breit from Greg, Shawn, Ashley, 

April & Angela
14th - Happy Birthday Amanda Stollenwerk from Grandma & Grandpa 
14th - Happy Birthday Ruthie Butler from Your Secret Pal 
16th - Memorial Birthday for Kermit Miske Jr. from His Family 
18th - Happy 13th Birthday Tammy Backhaus from Mom & Jim 
19th - Happy Birthday Daniel Stollenwerk from Lisa, Mom & Dad 
22nd - Happy Anniversary Gerald & Martha Stollenwerk
25th - Happy 45th Anniversary Roger & Ruth Kuehl from Lana & Dennis 
25th - Happy Birthday Mike Engelman from Ashley
29th - Happy Birthday Marcie Harbeck from #3
29th - Memorial for Earl H. Dreher from David Dreher Family
31st - Happy Birthday Alan "Moochie” Kuehl from the Statesman girls

$5.00 PLEASE LIGHT A CANDLE ON- 

(date)__________
®*OO

IN HONOR OF:.
(name)

on the occasion of 
(check one only)

birthday ___ anniversary 
memorial

other

Given by____________________ ________

PLEASE MAIL TO: Kewaskum Area Chamber of Commerce, 
P.O. Box 300, Kewaskum, Wl 53040

ALL PROCEEDS USED TO FUND KEWASKUM

eluding our local media, that this 
would never happen. The sheriff 
waited less than two weeks after 
the primary to show what he real­
ly had in mind for Jim Grover. He 
started by stripping Sgt. Grover of 
his duties as SWAT team super­
visor. He added some character 
assassination to the formula by 
telling the newspapers that 
Grover could not be trusted. We 
can only guess what will happen 
after the November General Elec­
tion and Schulteis is .elected 
officially.

So Grover spent big, knowing 
that his career was over if he lost. 
Schulteis responded by in­
vestigating Grover’s supporters 
and firing Grover’s campaign 
treasurer. Two people, plain old 
private citizens who don’t even 
work for the department, were 
"invited” in for a little chat with 
the sheriff, because they were 
overheard talking about suppor­
ting Grover. Grover’s first cam­
paign director had to resign that 
position after Schulteis put on 
some heat in his direction. Grover 
himself took an unpaid leave of 
absence to escape the pressure 
exerted by Schulteis, something 
that neither Ted Griepentrog or 
Schulteis himself had to do when 
they ran against Clarence 
Schwartz. So much for

(Continued on Page 10)

(please specify)
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Performing Artist Robb Goldstein

The West Bend Gallery of Fine 
Arts is pleased to present Robb 
Goldstein, at a free concert Sun., 
Oct. 25, at 2 p.m. a diversely 
talented musician, explores the 
relationship between music and 
art.

He has travelled throughout the 
United States presenting 
workshops for museum/gallery 
learning experiences. Having per­
formed and conducted special 
programs for all ages, on such 
topics as Thomas Hart Benton, 
Nantucket Folk Life and American 
Frontier Life, Robb shares his 
love of research and performance 
with a focus on the object, be it 
historical or artistic.

Known as “The Troubadour”, 
Goldstein” ...combines a flair for
entertainment with thorough 
scholarship and documenta­
tion...He challenges as well as 
delights his audiences” — 
paraphrased from William Howze, 
Director of Special Programs,

HALLOWEEN 
COSTUME 

PARTY 
THREE R’s

In Boltonville 

„ . Friday, Oct. 30
Music by 8:30 t0 12:30

BADGER CREW
PRIZES & SURPRISES

® EckLs Main Street Inn
143 Main St., Kewaskum

Anyone in costume 
receives FREE DRINK 

with meal purchase 
(DINING ROOM ONLY)

Dine In... Or Take Out 
626-4328

PANCAKE
St. Martin’s 

U.C.C. 
Fillmore

Saturday, Nov. 7 4to7:30p.m
— FAMILY STYLE —

Potato and Buttermilk Pancakes 
Sausage and Applesauce

DONATION: Child ■ $2.50 — Adult ■ $5.00

BAKE SALE
CARRYOUTS AVAILABLE

Amon Carter Museum Ft. Worth. 
Texas. He has performed at the 
National Gallery of Art. the Saint 
Louis Art Museum, Wadsworth 
Athenium, Hartford. CT., Fort 
Lauderdale Museum of Art, Fort 
Lauderdale, FL, the Pennsylvania 
Academy of Fine Arts, Old Stur­
bridge Village, Old Sturbridge. 
MA and the Buffalo Bill Historical 
Center, Cody, WY.

The West Bend Gallery of Fine 
Arts is located at 300 South 6th 
Avenue in downtown West Bend. 
Normal gallery hours are 
Wednesday through Saturday 
10:00 a m. - 4:30 p.m. and Sun­
day, 1:00 - 4:30 p.m. For more in­
formation call the gallery at 
334-9638.

Election Night Supper 
At Immanuel U.C.C.

The 60th Annual Election Night 
Supper, Craft and Bake Sale will 
be held November 3, at Immanuel 
UCC Church, 5th and Walnut, in 
West Bend.

There will be five seatings of a 
family style supper by reservation. 
The seating times are 4, 4:50. 
5:40. 6:30 and 7:20 p.m. The sup­
per includes roast beef and pork, 
horseradish sauce, home baked 
bread and cakes, applesauce, 
carrots, and sauerkraut.

The price is $6.00 for adults 
and children ages 3 to 11 are 
$3.00. Children under the age of 
3 are free.

Tickets can be purchased at 
the church office at 501 W 
Walnut St., West Bend. Wl 53095. 
The telephone number is 
334-2886, or tickets can be pur­
chased from members, at the 
main offices of the M & I and Bank 
One banks, and at the door the 
night of the supper. Everyone is 
invited and welcome.

Dan Schmidt of Kewaskum, was the lucky winner of the $100 gift 
certificate at the Country Reflections Condominiums Open House 
held recently Ann Enright of Hometown Realty (left) is pictured 
presenting the gift certificate to Dan (right).

Make a 
New 

Best Friend
KEWASKUM STATESMAN CLASSIFIEDS

Pioneers blazed the trail to open up 
this great land of ours. They have 
descendants who burn up the road.

TURNER HALL
Fillmore

Choice dates available
AMPLE PARKING 

692-2597 
If no answer 692-2592

'Catering Available

CORN GAME 
& RAFFLE

Every Third Wednesday
7 p.m.

Once Again Featuring
V-^BOB FUCHS#
J* and the ^r

SINGING MACHINE « 
< Saturday, Nov. 21*^’ 

J 9 p.m. to 1 a.m. 4

PRIME TIME PUSl
Kewaskum f

Bar-N-Ranch, Inc.
Friday October 30th

The Pony Express 
Supper Club and the 

Bar-N-Ranch, Inc. 
team up to give you a 

night to remember.
$15.00 Per person
(S10.00 Children under 12).

includes: 
A dinner of 

Perch, Pike or 
Broasted Chicken 

- to be followed 
by a Horse Drawn 
Haunted Hay Ride 

and LIVE MUSIC 
upon returning.



Kewaskum Statesman, Thursday, Oct. 29, 1992, Page 8

Regal Ware Announces New Members for 25 Year Club
Kewaskum, Wis. — Regal 

Ware, Inc. held its annual 25 Year 
Club banquet to recognize those 
employees with 25 years or more 
of service. The banquet was held 
on the 47th anniversary of the 
founding of Regal Ware, at the 
Knights of Columbus Hall, West 
Bend

The banquet was emceed by 
David Schellhaass, Vice Presi­
dent II of the 25 year Club, with 
a welcome from L N Peterson, 
Founder Chairman of the Board. 
Mr. Peterson read a message 
from Jim Reigle, Chairman of the 
Board, who was unable to attend 
because of his responsibilities 
with Regal Swan of England Ray 
Krueger is the current Club Presi­
dent Employees who had reach­
ed their 25, 30, 35, 40 and 45 year 
service anniversaries were 
honored for their outstanding 
dedication and loyalty

The new members of the 25 
year club are: Leo Emmer, 
Darlene Ernisse, Phyllis Faber, 
Sandra Fritz, John Galligan, 
Henrietta Gremminger, Jerome 
Hau, Geraldine Pesch, Michael

Pfeiffer. Jean Prost, Kathleen 
Roesel, Patricia Rosenthal, 
Gerald Sarauer, Barbara 
Schmidt, Irene Seefeldt, Iris 
Seefeldt, Dolores Straub, and 
Kathleen Yogerst.

The new members of the 30 
Year Club are: Dante Del Ponte, 
Lloyd Gatzke, Mary Ann 
Jurgensmier, Raymond Krueger, 
Ronald Kumrow, Dolores Marian, 
William Rahlf, Ronald Staehler, 
Lloyd Westerman, and Jewell 
Zielieke.

Joan Dirks is a new member of 
the 35 Year Club.

The new members of the 40 
Year Club are: Eugene 
Backhaus, LaVern Geidel, David 
Krueger. Daniel McCarty, Vincent 
Nigh, and Ron Reigle.

Ray Gremminger is a new 
member of the 45 Year Club.

With the addition of the new 
members, Regal Ware has over 
150 active employees with 25 
years or more of service.

Regal Ware, Inc. is a multi-plant 
manufacturer of cookware and 
portable electrics headquartered 
in Kewaskum, Wis.

Regal 35 Year Club new member, Joanne DirksRegal 45 Year Club new member, Ray Gremminger

Regal 25 Year Club new members L to R: Barbara Schmidt, Jerome Hau, Irene Seefeldt. 
John Galligan, Kathleen Roesel. Michael Pfeiffer. Patricia Rosenthal and Darlene 
Ernisse.

Regal 40 Year Club new members L to R: Vince Nigh and Daniel 
McCarty.

Regal 25 Year Club new members L to R: Kathleen Yogerst. Dolores Straub. Henriet­
ta Gremminger. Gerald Sarauer, Geraldine Pesch, Leo Emmer and Jean Prost

Regal 30 Year Club new members: L to R: Jewell Zielieke, Lloyd Westerman, William 
Rahlf. Dolores Marian, Lloyd Gatzke and Raymond Krueger.

DUNDEE 
SAND & GRAVEL 
G. RAMTHUN 533-4549 
* Washed Sand 
* Crushed Gravel 
* Stone and Lime Chips

Also Gravel and Sand Fill 
Topsoil 

GENERAL TRUCKING

TRUCKS - SIGNS - CUSTOM STRIPING
317 N. Railroad St., Campbellsport

533-8094

■ \ To prepare and serve a most
S delicious buffet or family 

j style dinner just for you!

CALL 629-5591
‘ 'Catering for the Finest 
In Food and Service ’ ’

When Making Plans for 
Your Wedding or Party Call

C & R 
Catering 

of Allenton
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Sheriff Reminds Motorists 
To Obey School Bus Laws

Washington County Sheriff 
Robert H. Schulteis reminds 
motorists that school is open and 
great care is needed when driv­
ing near children or school buses. 
The sheriff pointed out these im­
portant safety rules:

- Drivers must stop at least 20 
feet from a school bus which is
stopped and'has its red lights ac­
tivated. Driver may not proceed 
again until the bus resumes mo­
tion or has extinguished the red 
lights.
“Some drivers who have been 

ticketed have protested that the 
bus’s stop arm was not extended 
and, therefore, they didn’t have to 
stop. The stop arm is optional 
equipment which is not address­
ed in the statutes,” the sheriff 
said.

- It is illegal to pass any vehicle 
on the unpaved shoulder of a 
road. Doing so creates the risk of 
striking a pedestrian who may not 
be visible until its too late. It is 
especially dangerous when 
drivers pass a school bus on the 
right, which risks hitting the 
children who are getting on or off 
the bus.

- Drivers must stop 10-30 feet 
from a school crossing when 
directed by a crossing guard or 
officer.

Under Wisconsin law, school

Excerpts from 
As I Remember

by Manin Martin
On the top of the hill, which 

would now lead you to Hon-E-Kor 
was a gate on the east side of the 
road and another gate on the west 
side of the road that went into 
South Side Park. South Side Park 
had a dance hall which had a 
swaying floor, and when people 
danced, it looked like waves on 
the floor. The dance hall had a bar 
and facilities to provide meals.

Coming back from the South 
Side Park, on the west side of 
Riverview Drive, directly across 
from the Odd Fellows Hall, was 
the German Methodist Church.

Going north on Riverview Drive, 
on the east side, the next place 
was the Opera House. This was 
a place that had a hall where we 
had shows, later movies, and was 
the recreational center of 
Kewaskum. We played basketball 
there.

Again, starting out from Main 
Street, going north on Riverview 
Drive, was an ice house and a 
stable for horses. Also, most of 
the taverns or saloons as they 
were called in those days, had a 
place to put up horses while peo­
ple shopped, etc.

Campus News
The Lakeland College Choir 

presented its first concert of the 
1992-93 season on Sunday, Oc­
tober 18, at 3 p.m. in the Bradley 
Fine Arts Building on the 
Lakeland campus in Sheboygan.

According to choir conductor, 
Dr. Lewis Schmidt, the 
27-member choir performed a 
variety of folk and Christian 
songs. Lakeland's Good News 
Singers, conducted by Frank 
Berger, also performed.

The choir concerts are part of 
the Krueger Fine Arts Series. 
Members of the choir include: 
Jennifer Beimborn of Adell, a 
freshman majoring in music and 
elementary education, and 
Jonathan Haldemann of West 
Bend, a sophomore majoring in 
elementary education.

bus drivers and crossing guards 
are authorized to file complaints 
against people who violate these 
laws. If the sheriff's department 
cannot prove who the driver was. 
the statutes place the liability on 
the vehicle owner, and that per­
son will be ticketed.

Kim Petrie, Kewaskum High 
School graduate, daughter of 
Charles and Kay Petrie of 
Kewaskum, has enrolled in 
Lawrence University. Appleton. 
this fall.

.4 man can be driven by his wife just 
so far. Then he should take over the 
wheel himself

NOTICE OF ELECTION
STATE OF WISCONSIN
COUNTY OF WASHINGTON
VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM

Public notice is hereby given to the qualified electors of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Washington County. Wisconsin, that 
an Election will be held in the Village of Kewaskum on the 
3rd day of November, 1992.
Notice is further given that the election will be held at the usual 
polling place in the Municipal Building, 204 First Street, and 
that the polls will open at 7:30 a.m. in the morning and will 
remain open until 8:00 p.m. in the evening.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

William Howard Taft started a presidential cus­
tom when he threw out the first “first ball" at the 
opening of baseball's 1910 major league season in 
a game between Washington and Philadelphia.

Village of Kewaskum 
General 

ELECTION
Tuesday, November 3, 1992

7:30 A.M. to 8:00 P.M.

MUNICIPAL BUILDING
204 First Street

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator/Clerk

Thanks for your business . . .
o

inhn Klotz Joanne SchillVicki VanKooy John Klol Juhe Rolh
Trudi Marquardt

Patti Zielieke

Our first Anniversary
"You'ue done a lot for us in just one year.

We appreciate your business."

Nationalk
Mike Burch
President, National Exchange Bank & Trust

Enchange
Bank BTrust

The Quality Bank
350 Sheboygan Street • P.O. Box 840 • Campbellsport, Wl 53010 0840 • 414/533 5533

MEMBER FDIC



Letters to
The Editor

(Continued from Pane 5)

democratic principles. So much 
for his jaunty assurances in the 
spring that, “I expect people to 
run against me, that’s part of the 
system.”

Well, Sheriff Schulteis has 
strange ideas about ‘‘the 
system.” If these ideas cause you 
some concern (re: ‘‘police state 
tactics”) think about the morale of 
the sheriff’s department 
employees who work in this 
climate of fear every day. We 
have a second chance to elect 
Jim Grover by writing in his name 
on November 3. It's easy to do. 
the instructions are at the polling 
booths.

We cannot afford two more 
years of Robert Schulteis.

Brenda Pawlowski 
West Pend, W!

I o the Cdilor,
The Washington County 

Democratic Party in the primary 
election has little or no say in the 
selections of the people who hold 
office in this county. In the 
primary, I had definite feelings 
that I would like to vote for Jim 
Grover for Sheriff, but being that 
I wanted to vote for Mr Feingold. 
I was unable to make that selec­
tion. I understand that almost 
1500 ballots were thrown out dur­
ing the primary because of the 
crossover vote. The people who 
hold these offices have a definite 
effect on my standard of living in 
the county and I find it a shame 
that I have no say at all as to 
which person I prefer in these 
positions I felt that in the general 
election it was all cut and dried as 
to who would win these seats.

I was not happy when I found 
out that the Sheriff, after making 
a promise to the electorate that 
Jim Grover s job was safe, nine 
days after the election, started his 
process of eliminating Mr Grover 
from the department. This is a 
pattern with this man Steve 
Braun and others have preceded 
Mr Grover in this process. How 
can the Sheriff expect to have the 
rest of his department respect him 
or trust him when the minute 
anyone disagrees with him they 
are the next in the target? If this 
man is willing to do this to his 
employees what is he willing to do 
to get even with the citizens who 
oppose him?

Thanks to W I G S (the Write- 
In Grover for Sheriff), I have a 
chance to WRITE-IN Grover in the 
general election and I urge 
anyone from the Democratic Par­
ty to do the same This is no 
longer a partisan issue, it is an 
issue of what is right!

We need a Sheriff that we can 
trust and at this point I believe Jim 
Grover is that man. Take an ex­
tra minute on Election Day and 
Write-In Grovei.

Thank you.
Bruce J. Miller 
Hubertus, Wl

October 26, 1992
To the Editor:

TO ALL VOTERS: 
PLEASE WAKE UP!

Once again, the Democrats 
have given us a presidential can­
didate who feels he can pick as 
much as he likes out of our 
pockets to spend as he pleases.

Governor Bill Clinton would 
work with the liberal Congress to 
make government more POWER­
FUL, more INTRUSIVE than it

already is... They'll REGULATE 
us right out of our minds.

WAKE UP AMERICA!
Do you really want Governor 

Bill Clinton as YOUR President? 
Don't be fooled by smooth talk, a 
slippery smile, and the biased 
news media Governor Bill Clinton 
WILL certainly raise your taxes 
and increase spending.

Did you notice whenever 
Governor Clinton refers to the 
President of the United States of 
America, he never PROPERLY 
addresses him as President 
Bush; whereas, President Bush 
always correctly refers to him as 
Governor? This should tell you 
something!!

Sincerely,
Esther Doughty Luckhardt 
State Representative 
For 22 Years

Dear Editor,
Underneath Sheriff Schulteis’ 

picture in the August 31st issue 
of the Germantown News was a 
promise from the sheriff It said, 
I promise to be ‘‘a sheriff you can 
be proud of.”

Well I for one, can not be pro­
ud of a man who told voters that 
Sgt. Grover could return to his job 
with no fear of retribution and then 
demoted Sgt. Grover from his se­
cond in command position on the 
S W A.T. Team.

If being demoted is not retribu­
tion, I’m afraid to find out what is! 
Can we trust a man who tells the 
voters one thing and then does 
the opposite? We deserve better! 
Join nie and WRITE-IN JIM 
GROVER FOR SHERIFF'

Kelly Miller
(lenmmtown

Births
SAY — A son to Christine and 

Kevin, 9185 Bolton Drive, 
Kewaskum, on Oct. 19.

ZOMMERS — A daughter to 
Karla and Richard, W1759 State 
67, Campbellsport, on Oct. 7.

Authorized and paid for by Washington County Republican Organization. George Nehrbass-Chairman. 
Dorothy GonneringTreasurer

Rffil ./ATr S£S2 ■hu VOTE ihu 
REPUBLICAN

For Continued Effective Government 
Support These Republican Candidates 

At the Polls Tuesday, November 3!
X] President
.XJvice President
XIU.S. Senator
X]9th District Congressman
Estate Senate District 8 
IS State Senate District 11 
X]State Senate District 20
XIAssembly District 24
XjAssembly 
X] Assembly 
XjAssembly 
^Assembly

District 33
District 58
District 59
District 60

XJCounty Clerk 
XjSheriff
X]Clerk of Courts 
XjDistrict Attorney 
^Register of Deeds 
XjTreasurer 
XjCoroner

George Bush
Daniel Quayle
Robert Kasten
F. James Sensenbrenner
Alberta 
Joanne 
Donald

Darling
B. Huelsman
K. Stitt

Lolita Schneiders 
Daniel P. Vrakas 
Michael A. Lehman 
Mary E. Panzer 
Susan B. Vergeront 
Arthur G. Degnitz 
Robert Schulteis 
Carol Puerling 
J. Dennis Thornton 
Dorothy Gonnering 
Fredric Seefeldt 
Marlene Yoost
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Wisconsin Regional Planning Commission

been reappointed to the 
Southeastern Wisconsin Regional 
Planning Commission. His term 
will expire on September 15, 
1998.

MADISON... Governor Tommy 
G. Thompson has announced two 
appointments to the 
Southwestern and Southeastern 
Wisconsin Regional Planning 
Commissions.

The commissions provide plan­
ning and development services to 
local governments and utilizes 
selected federal and state pro­
grams to enhance the economic 
well-being and environment of the 
counties in their regions.

The following individuals were 
appointed to the commissions:

-Beverly Anderson, Mayor of 
Darlington, has been reappointed 
to the Southwestern Wisconsin 
Regional Planning commission. 
Her term will expire on September 
15, 1998.

-Daniel S. Schmidt. Village Ad­
ministrator for Kewaskum, has

The winners at skat played by 
the ABC Senior Citizens at 
Beechwood Hall on Tuesday. Oct 
20. were: Joe Butschlick. 
28-4—24 net; Elroy Egerer, 
22-3—19 net; Ruth Egerer, 
12-1—11 net; Elroy Egerer. Heart 
Solo vs 4.

Personnel Workshop 
For Small Business 
Owners/Operators

■ One of the largest challenges 
facing business in the next 
decade will be labor manage­
ment,” says Chuck Wise, Area 
Business Agent for UW- 
Extension. It will be critical to find 
good people and hold them in a 
productive capacity.”

The new MEP Workshop in 
Personnel Management will 
assist the owner/operator of small 
businesses to do just that. It will 
be held on four consecutive 
Tuesdays at the UW-Center in 
West Bend, beginning November 
2.

Included in the four weekly 
discussions will be “getting and 
keeping superior employees,” 
“building an effective team.” 
‘‘rewarding employee perfor­
mance” and “state laws and 
statutes” as well as other perti­
nent topics relating to the human 
side of the enterprise.

Moderating the workshop will 
be Paul Christensen, Vice Presi-

NOTICE OF POLLING PLACE 
TOWN OF FARMINGTON

GENERAL ELECTION
Tuesday, Nov. 3, 1992
Polls open at 9 a. m. - Close at 8 p.m.

FARMINGTON TOWN HALL
9422 Hwy. 144 in Boltonville

ACCESSIBLE TO THE DISABLED

Joanne Oneska, Town Clerk

TOWN OF AUBURN
Notice of Location of Polls 

and Hours of Voting
GENERAL ELECTION

Tuesday, Nov. 3, 1992
TOWN HALL

W1695 Town Hall Road
9:00 a.m. to 8:00 p.m.

Accessible to the Handicapped

CAMILLA BUTZKE, CLERK 
Town of Auburn

TOWN OF WAYNE
Notice of Location of Polls 

and Hours of Voting
GENERAL ELECTION

Tuesday, Nov. 3, 1992
WAYNE TOWN HALL

6030 Hwy. H

9:00 a.m. to 8:00 p.m.

ORVILLE KERN. CLERK 
Town of Wayne

NOTICE OF 
GENERAL ELECTION

TOWN OF KEWASKUM
Tuesday, November 3, 1992

-POLLING PLACE-
AMERAHN HALL

9480 Highway 45 North 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin

- EXTENDED POLL HOURS -
7:30 a.m. to 8:00 p.m.
This polling place is fully 

accessible to the handicapped

BARBARA WENZLAFF 
TOWN CLERK

dent for Human Resources and 
Distribution for Amity Leather Pro­
ducts. Paul has spent his entire 
professional career in personnel 
and people-development.

His background includes 
recruiting, hiring and supervision, 
team building and worker produc­
tivity. He has recently taught at 
UWM in an MBA Strategy course.

In addition, he has been involv­
ed in seminars on quality circles, 
environmental law and conces­
sion bargaining. His MBA is from 
the University of 
Wisconsin-Milwaukee.

Small business entrepreneurs 
will enjoy Paul Christensen and 
receive vital information that 
makes their operations even more 
successful. For a free brochure, 
call Chuck Wise at 414-335-5204. 
Registration closes on October 
30, or when the class reaches its 
maximum enrollment. Register 
NOW.

CANDIDATE POSITIONS ON RIGHT TO LIFE ISSUES

Mental illness 
has warning signs, too.

For a free booklet 
about mental illness, call : 

1-800-969-NMHA.
Learn to see the warning signs.

National Mental Health Association ^

WISCONSIN RIGHT TO LIFE • 10625 W. North Ave. • Milwaukee. Wl 53226 • (414) 778-5780 
Paid by Washington Co Chapter Inc

I PRESIDENT
U.S. SENATE

BUSH CLINTON KASTEN FEINGOLD
Position 

on 
Abortion

Opposes Abortion 
Except for Rape, 
Incest, or Danger 
to Mother’s Life

Supports Unlimited 
Abortion Virtually 

Any Time 
During Pregnancy

Opposes Abortion 
Except for Rape, 
Incest, or Danger 
to Mother’s Life

Supports Unlimited 
Abortion Virtually 
Any Time During 

Pregnancy

Freedom of Choice Act — 
Allows Unlimited 

Abortion and Prevents 
States from Enacting 

Restrictions

Opposes
Supports, 

Would Sign 
Into Law

Opposes Supports

Taxpayer Funding 
of Abortions

Opposes Supports Opposes Supports

Parental Consent 
Before A 

Minor’s Abortion
Supports Opposes

Supports
Opposes

Action 
On 

Legislation

100% Pro-Life 
Veto Record

Would Sign 
All .

Pro-Abortion 
Provisions Into Law

97% Pro-Life 
Voting Record

5% Pro-Life 
Voting Record

Appointment of 
Supreme Court 

Justices

Appointed Judicial 
Conservatives

Would Only Appoint 
Supporters of 

Unlimited Abortion 
Virtually Any 

Time During Pregnancy

PEROT 
SUPPORTS UNLIMITED 

TAXPAYER-FUNDED ABORTION
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FACSIMILE BALLOT NOTICE OF 

GENERAL ELECTION 

NOVEMBER 3. 1992

OFFICE OF THE WASHINGTON COUNTY CLERK 

TO THE ELECTORS OF WASHINGTON COUNTY

OFFICIAL BALLOT

Notice is hereby given of a partisan election to be held in the several wards in the County 
of Washington, on the 3rd day of November, 1 992, at which the officers named below shall 
be chosen The names of the candidates for each office to be voted for, whose 
nominations have been certified to or filed in this office, are given under the title of the 
office, each in its proper column, together with the questions submitted to a vote for a 
county referendum, if any. in the sample ballot below

INFORMATION TO ELECTORS

Upon entering the polling place, an elector shall give his or tier name and address before 
being permitted to vote The initials of two inspectors must appear on the ballot card 
Upon being permitted to vote, the elector shall retire alone to a voting booth or machine and 
cast his or her ballot except that an elector who is a parent or guardian may be 
accompanied by the elector's minor child or minor ward An election official may inform 
the elector of the proper manner for casting a vote, but the official may not in any manner 
advise or indicate a particular voting choice

At the November general election, if an elector wishes to cast a straight party vote for all 
candidates nominated by any party, the elector shall make a punch or a hole in the space 
designated for the party of his or her choice or depress the lever or button under the party 
designation printed at the top of the ballot Unless another name has been written in, a 
sticker applied, or a punch or a hole has been made in the space designated for a candidate 
for the same office of another party, the straight party punch is a vote for all the party's 
candidates listed on the ballot A straight party vote cannot be cast for Independent 
candidates If an elector does not wish to vote for all the candidates nominated by one 
party, tfie elector shall make a punch or a hole in the space designated for the candidate's 
name or separately depress the lever or button next to each candidate's name for whom 
he or she intends to vote A STRAIGHT PARTY VOTE CANNOT BE CAST FOR THE OFFICE 
OF PRESIDENT AND VICE HU SIDE NT OF THE UNITED STATES AN-ELECTOR MUST 
CAST A SEPARATE BAI LOT FOR PRESIDENT AND VICE PRESIDENT

To vote for a person whose name does not appear on the ballot, the elector shall write in 
the name and the office of the candidate of his or tier choice on the ballot envelope 
provided, or the elector shall write the name of the candidate of his or her choice in the 
space provided for a write in vote

A separate vote must be cast for President and Vice President jointly on one ticket To vote 
for candidates whose names appear on tfie ballot, make a punch or a hole in the space 
designated or depress tfie lever or button next to the President and Vice President 
candidates of your choice To vote for persons whose names are not printed on the ballot, 
write in the names and designate the office for each on the ballot envelope provided or 
write in the names of individuals of your choice for both offices on the lines provided A 
write in vote only for a vice presidential candidate will invalidate your vote

On referenda questions, the elector shall make a punch or a hole in the space designated 
for "yes" or depress the lever or button next to "yes" if in favor of the question, or the 
elector shall make a punch or a hole in the space designated for "no" or depress the lever 
or button next to "no" if opposed to the question

The vote should not be cast in any other manner If the elector spoils a ballot, he or she 
shall return it to an election official who shall issue another ballot in its place, but not more 
than three ballots shall be issued to any one elector If the ballot has not been initialed by 
two inspectors or is defective in any otfier way. the elector shall return it to the election 
official who shall issue a proper ballot in its place Not more than five minutes’ time shall 
be allowed inside a voting booth Unofficial ballots or a memorandum to assist the elector 
in marking his or her ballot may be taken into the booth and copied The sample ballot shall 
not be shown to anyone so as to reveal how the ballot is marked

After an official ballot card is punched, it shall be inserted in the envelope provided so the 
punches do not show After casting his or her vote, the elector shall leave the booth, 
deposit the envelope containing his or her ballot card in the ballot box or deliver the 
envelope to an inspector for deposit and shall leave the polling place promptly

An elector mav select an indiv.dual to assist in casting his or her vote if the elector declares 
to the presiding official that he or she is unable to read, has difficulty reading, writing, or 
understanding English, or that due to disability is unable to cast his or her ballot The 
selected individual rendering assistance may not be the elector's employer or an agent of 
that employer or an officer or agent of a labor organization which represents the elector

The following is a facsimile of the official ballot

ARTHUR G. DEGNITZ, WASHINGTON COUNTY CLERK

WASHINGTON COUNTY 
WISCONSIN 

November 3, 1992

INSTRUCTIONS TO VOTERS

1. INSERT YOUR BALLOT CARD WITH BOTH HANDS. BE 
SURE THE PINS ARE THROUGH THE TWO HOLES.

2. HOLD THE PUNCHING DEVICE STRAIGHT UP AND 
DOWN. PRESS DOWN FIRMLY OPPOSITE THE 
CANDIDATE AND/OR PROPOSITION SELECTIONS OF 
YOUR CHOICE.

3. IF YOU INCORRECTLY PUNCH, TEAR, OR DEFACE THE 
BALLOT CARD OR BALLOT CARD ENVELOPE, RETURN 
IT TO THE ELECTION OFFICIAL FOR ANOTHER ONE.

WRITE-IN VOTING

TO VOTE FOR A CANDIDATE WHOSE NAME DOES 
NOT APPEAR ON THE PRINTED BALLOT, USE THE 
ENVELOPE TO "WRITE-IN" THE OFFICE AND THE 
CANDIDATE'S NAME.

TO BEGIN VOTING, TURN PAGE

POS E OFFICIAL BALLOT

_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ CONGRESSIONAL
UNITED STATES SENATE VOTE FOR ONE

POS D OFFICIAL BALLOT

For Congressional, State, County Offices

STRAIGHT PARTY

REPUBLICAN ROBERT W. KASTEN, JR. 78 »^

DEMOCRATIC RUSSELL D. FEINGOLD 79 ^

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO NO CANDIDATE

IF YOU DESIRE TO VOTE A STRAIGHT PARTY TICKET FOR 
ALL CONGRESSIONAL, LEGISLATIVE, STATE, AND COUNTY 
OFFICES, PUNCH A HOLE NEXT TO THE NUMBER LISTED TO 
THE RIGHT OF THE NAME OF THE PARTY. A STRAIGHT 
PARTY VOTE CANNOT BE CAST FOR INDEPENDENT 
CANDIDATES. IF YOU DESIRE TO VOTE FOR INDIVIDUAL 
CANDIDATES, TURN THE PAGE AND PUNCH A HOLE NEXT 
TO THE NUMBER LISTED TO THE RIGHT OF THE NAME OF 
THE PERSON. TO VOTE FORA PERSON WHOSE NAME 
DOES NOT APPEAR ON THE BALLOT, WRITE THE OFFICE 
NAME AND THE NAME OF THE CANDIDATE IN THE SPACE 
PROVIDED ON THE BALLOT ENVELOPE.

LIBERTARIAN

INDEPENDENT

INDEPENDENT

INDEPENDENT

INDEPENDENT

WILLIAM BITTNER

PATRICK W. JOHNSON 82 »X 
(Independent "For The Little Guy")

ROBERT L. KUNDERT 
(Grassroots Party)

JOSEPH SELLIKEN 
(Independent Populist)

MERVIN A. HANSON, SR.

REPUBLICAN 67 ■>
REPRESENTATIVE IN CONGRESS, 9TH DISTRICT--------------  

 VOTE FOR ONE

DEMOCRATIC 69 ■>
REPUBLICAN

DEMOCRATIC

F. JAMES SENSENBRENNER, JR. 90 b^>

INGRID K. BUXTON 91 »>

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO NO CANDIDATE

LIBERTARIAN JEFFREY HOLT MILLIKIN 93 »>

LIBERTARIAN 73 *■>
INDEPENDENT DAVID E. MARLOW 95 »>
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POS B OFFICIAL PRESIDENTIAL BALLOT

STRAIGHT PARTY VOTING DOES NOT INCLUDE VOTING FOR 
PRESIDENT AND VICE PRESIDENT. IF YOU DESIRE TO VOTE 
FOR PRESIDENT AND VICE PRESIDENT, YOU MUST COM­
PLETELY PUNCH OUT THE HOLE OPPOSITE THE PRESI­
DENTIAL AND VICE PRESIDENTIAL CANDIDATES OF YOUR 
CHOICE ON THE NUMBERED SIDE OF THE BALLOT.

TO VOTE FOR THE PRESIDENTIAL ELECTORS OF THE CAN­
DIDATES OF YOUR CHOICE, COMPLETELY PUNCH A HOLE 
OPPOSITE THE NAMES OF THE CANDIDATES. TO VOTE FOR 
THE PRESIDENTIAL ELECTORS OF CANDIDATES WHOSE 
NAMES DO NOT APPEAR ON THE BALLOT, WRITE THE CAN­
DIDATES' NAMES AND THE OFFICE FOR EACH ON THE 
BALLOT ENVELOPE PROVIDED. WHEN VOTING FOR PRESI­
DENT AND VICE PRESIDENT, YOU MAY VOTE FOR THE 
CANDIDATES ON ONE TICKET JOINTLY OR WRITE IN THE 
NAME AND OFFICE FOR EACH PERSON. A WRITE-IN VOTE 
FOR VICE PRESIDENT ONLY WILL INVALIDATE YOUR VOTE.

POS C
OFFICIAL PRESIDENTIAL BALLOT (CONTINUED)

4« 20 JOHN HAGELIN 
MIKE TOMPKINS

PRESIDENT
VICE PRESIDENT

Natural Law Party

22 LYNDON H. LaROUCHE, JR. PRESIDENT
JAMES L. BEVEL VICE PRESIDENT

Independents for Economic Recovery

24 JAMES WARREN PRESIDENT
WILLIE MAE REID VICE PRESIDENT

Socialist Workers Party

26 JAMES GRITZ PRESIDENT
CYRIL MINETT VICE PRESIDENT

America First Coalition

<- 28 HOWARD PHILLIPS PRESIDENT
ALBION KNIGHT VICE PRESIDENT

The Wisconsin Taxpayers Party

GEORGE BUSH 
DAN QUAYLE

PRESIDENT
VICE PRESIDENT

Republican Party

29 •> ^* 30 ROSS PEROT PRESIDENT
JAMES STOCKDALE VICE PRESIDENT

Independent

BILL CLINTON 
AL GORE

PRESIDENT 
VICE PRESIDENT 

Democratic Party

31 »> 32 J. QUINN BRISBEN PRESIDENT
BARBARA GARSON VICE PRESIDENT

Socialist Party - USA

RON DANIELS PRESIDENT 33 »k
ASIBA TUPAHACHE VICE PRESIDENT

Labor-Farm/Laborista-Agrario Party

4* 34 JACK HERER 
DERRICK P. GRIMMER

PRESIDENT
VICE PRESIDENT

The Grassroots Party

ANDRE MARROU PRESIDENT 35
NANCY LORD VICE PRESIDENT

Libertarian Party

<T 36 LENORA B. FULANI PRESIDENT
MARIA ELIZABETH MUNOZ VICE PRESIDENT 

The New Alliance Party

EUGENE A. HEM PRESIDENT 37
JOANNE ROLAND VICE PRESIDENT

Third Party

YOU HAVE NOW COMPLETED VOTING FOR PRESIDENT AND 
VICE PRESIDENT. TURN PAGE TO CONTINUE VOTING.

POS F OFFICIAL BALLOT

LEGISLAIIVE

STATE SENATE - 20TH DISTRICT VOTE FOR ONE

REPUBLICAN DONALD K. STITT 99

DEMOCRATIC DELMORE A. BEAVER 100

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO NO CANDIDATE

LIBERTARIAN LARRY R. GAVEL

INDEPENDENT

102 ^

NO CANDIDATE

POS G OFFICIAL BALLOT
WASHINGTON COUNTY 

| DISTRICT ATTORNEY VOTE FOR ONE-|

REPUBLICAN J. DENNIS THORNTON 117 b^

DEMOCRATIC NO CANDIDATE

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO NO CANDIDATE 

LIBERTARIAN NO CANDIDATE

INDEPENDENT NO CANDIDATE

REPRESENTATIVE TO THE STATE ASSEMBLY 
59TH DISTRICT VOTE FOR ONE

REPUBLICAN MARY E. PANZER 106 »^

DEMOCRATIC NO CANDIDATE

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO NO CANDIDATE

LIBERTARIAN KEVIN S. SCHEUNEMANN 109 »^

INDEPENDENT NO CANDIDATE

It was not until 1845 that Election Day was offi­
cially set as the first Tuesday after the first 
Monday in November.

In the elections of 1824, 1876 and 1888, the presidential candidate 
receiving the largest popular vote failed to win a majority of the elec­
toral votes and the other guy (John Quincy Adams, Rutherford B. 
Hayes and Benjamin Harrison, respectively) got the job.
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POS H OFFICIAL BALLOT - WASHINGTON COUNTY
| COUNTY CLERK VOTE FOR ONE

REPUBLICAN ARTHUR G. DEGNITZ 134 ^

DEMOCRATIC NO CANDIDATE

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO NO CANDIDATE

LIBERTARIAN CRAIG LEMONDS 137 —J

INDEPENDENT NO CANDIDATE

| treasure __ ________ VOTE POR ONE | 

REPUBLICAN FREDRIC A. SEEFELDT 140 ^)

DEMOCRATIC NO CANDIDATE

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO NO CANDIDATE

LIBERTARIAN ANN KUTZ 143 H

INDEPENDENT NO CANDIDATE

[SHERIFF VOTE FOR ONE |

REPUBLICAN ROBERT H. SCHULTEIS 146 —}

DEMOCRATIC NO CANDIDATE

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO  NO CANDIDATE

LIBERTARIAN DAVE AMERINGER 149 «^

INDEPENDENT NO CANDIDATE

POS J OFFICIAL BALLOT-WASHINGTON COUNTY (Cont.) 
| CLERK OF CIRCUIT COUHI VOTE FOR QHQ

REPUBLICAN CAROL A. PUERLING 153 ^^

DEMOCRATIC N0 CANDIDATE

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO NO CANDIDATE 

LIBERTARIAN STEVE CHANTELOIS 156 *^

INDEPENDENT N0 CANDIDATE

[register of deeds vote FOR ONE J

REPUBLICAN DOROTHY C. GONNERING 159 »>

DEMOCRATIC NO CANDIDATE

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO NO CANDIDATE

LIBERTARIAN

INDEPENDENT

BETTY SCHEUNEMANN 162 v)

KIP A. NELSON 163 a^

I CORONER VOTE FOR ONE ']
REPUBLICAN MARLENE YOOST 165 ^

DEMOCRATIC NO CANDIDATE

LABOR-FARM/LABORISTA-AGRARIO NO CANDIDATE

LIBERTARIAN NO CANDIDATE

INDEPENDENT NO CANDIDATE

POS K
OFFICIAL REFERENDUM BALLOT

"Residential property tax reduction. Shall section 1 
of article VIII of the constitution be amended so that 
the legislature may reduce property taxes imposed 
upon residential and agricultural real property, as 
defined by law, by authorizing credits against income 
taxes imposed by this state or payments from state 
revenues?"

YES 178 v>

NO

YOU HAVE NOW COMPLETED VOTING. 
TAKE YOUR BALLOT AND PLACE IT IN 
THE ENVELOPE PROVIDED. RETURN IT 
TO THE PROPER ELECTION OFFICIAL.

The word ballot comes from the French word 
ballotte, meaning a little ball. In ancient Athens, 
judges generally gave their verdicts by dropping 
stone or metal balls into boxes.

T/V/C OFFICE PARTY/CANDIDATE POSITION 
NO.

TOWNS OF Germantown, 
Polk (Wards 6 & 7), Richfield 
(Wards 1-4, 6-15) 
VILLAGE OF Germantown 
CITY OF Milwaukee 
(Ward 276)

STATE SENATE 
8TH DISTRICT

REP ALBERTA DARLING
DEM WILLIAM C. WHITTEN
L&F NO CANDIDATE 
LIB NO CANDIDATE 
IND NO CANDIDATE

97
98

TOWNS OF Addison, Barton, 
Farmington, Hartford, 
Jackson, Kewaskum, 
Polk (Wards 1-5,8), 
Trenton, Wayne, West Bend 
VILLAGES OF Jackson, 
Kewaskum, Newburg, Slinger 
CITIES OF Hartford, 
West Bend

STATE SENATE 
20TH DISTRICT

REP DONALD K. STITT 
DEM DELMORE A. BEAVER 
L&F NO CANDIDATE 
LIB LARRY R. GAVEL 
IND NO CANDIDATE

99
100

102

TOWNS OF Germantown, 
Polk (Wards 6 & 7), 
Richfield (Wards 1-4,6-15) 
VILLAGE OF Germantown 
CITY OF Milwaukee (Ward 276)

REPRESENTATIVE
TO THE

STATE ASSEMBLY 
24TH DISTRICT

REP LOLITA SCHNEIDERS 
DEM NO CANDIDATE 
L&F NO CANDIDATE 
LIB NO CANDIDATE 
IND NO CANDIDATE

104

TOWNS OF Erin,
Richfield (Ward 5)

REPRESENTATIVE
TO THE

STATE ASSEMBLY 
33RD DISTRICT

REP DANIEL P. VRAKAS 
DEM NO CANDIDATE 
L&F NO CANDIDATE 
LIB NO CANDIDATE 
IND MICHAEL J. MANGAN 

(Wise Ecology Creates
Economic Vitality)

99

103

TOWNS OF Addison,
Hartford, Jackson,
Polk (Wards 1-5,8), 
Trenton, West Bend 
VILLAGES OF Jackson, Slinger 
CITY OF Hartford

REPRESENTATIVE 
TO THE 

STATE ASSEMBLY 
58TH DISTRICT

REP MICHAEL LEHMAN 
DEM SARA LEE JOHANN 
L&F NO CANDIDATE 
LIB DAVID HOWARD 
IND NO CANDIDATE

105
106

108

TOWNS OF Barton, 
Farmington, Kewaskum, 
Wayne
VILLAGE OF Kewaskum 
CITY OF West Bend

REPRESENTATIVE
TO THE

STATE ASSEMBLY 
59TH DISTRICT

REP MARY E. PANZER
DEM NO CANDIDATE
L&F NO CANDIDATE 
LIB KEVIN S. SCHEUNEMANN 
IND NO CANDIDATE

106

109

VILLAGE OF Newburg REPRESENTATIVE
TO THE

STATE ASSEMBLY 
60TH DISTRICT

REP SUSAN VERGERONT
DEM NO CANDIDATE
L&F NO CANDIDATE
LIB NO CANDIDATE
IND THOMAS B MURRAY

109

113
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1991 Senate Joint Resolution 12

1991 Enrolled Joint Resolution
To amend section 1 of article VIII of the constitution, relating to reducing, 
by income tax credits or by payments from state revenues, property taxes 
on residential and agricultural real property as defined by law (2nd 
consideration).

Whereas, the 1989 legislature in regular session proposed an amendment to the 
constitutionby 1989 Assembly Joint Resolution 81 (1989 Enrolled Joint Resolution 76) and 
agreed to it by a majority of the members elected to each of the 2 houses, which 
amendment reads as follows:

SECTION 1. Section 1 of article VIII of the constitution is amended to read 
(Article VIII) Section 1. The rule of taxation shall be uniform but the except as follows

(1) The legislature may sm^ewar by law authorize cities, villages or towns to collect and 
return taxes on real estate located therein by optional methods.

(2) I8) Taxes shall be levied upon such real property with such classifications as to forests 
and minerals including or separate or severed from the land, as the legislature thaU prescribe 
prescribes by law.

jy Taxation of agricultural land and undeveloped land, both as defined by law, need not 
be uniform with the taxation of each other nor with the taxation of other real property.

£32 Taxation of merchants' stock-in-trade, manufacturers' materials and finished products, 
and livestock need not be uniform with the taxation of real property and other personal 
property, but the taxation of all such merchants' stock-in-trade, manufacturers' materials 
and finished products and livestock shall be uniform, except that the legislature may provide 
by law that the value thereof shall be determined on an average basis Taxes may also be

(4) The legislature may by law impose taxes on incomes, privileges and occupations, 
w*uo*». Such taxes may be graduated and progressive, and reasonable exemptions may be 
provided.

(5) The legislature may reduce property taxes imposed upon residential and agricultural real 
property, as defined by law, by authorizing credits against income taxes imposed by this 
state or payments from state revenues.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the senate, the assembly concurring. That 
the foregoing amendment to the constitution is agreed to by the 1991 legislature; and.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the foregoing amendment be submitted to a vote 
of the people at the election to be held on the Tuesday after the first Monday of November 
1992; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the question concerning ratification of the 
foregoing amendment be stated on the ballot as follows:

QUESTION 1: "Residential property tax reduction. Shall section 1 of article VIII of the 
constitution be amended so that the legislature may reduce property taxes imposed upon 
residential and agricultural real property, as defined by law, by authorizing credits against 
income taxes imposed by this state or payments from state revenues?"

EXPLANATION

Section 1 of article VIII of the Wisconsin Constitution requires that property taxes be 
uniform, subject to certain exceptions. For example, real estate taxes can be paid in 
installments, forest land can be taxed differently from other real estate and minerals can be 
taxes separately. Agricultural and undeveloped lands can be separately classified for 
taxation purposes and the Legislature can make special provisions for the taxation of 
merchants' stock trade, manufacturers' materials, finished products and livestock

A "yes" vote on this amendment would allow the Legislature to use income tax credits or 
direct payments from state revenues to reduce property taxes on residential and agricultural 
real property. The Legislature would define residential and agricultural real property. A 
"yes" vote, therefore, would mean that property taxes on residential and agricultural real 
property, as defined by the Legislature, would no longer be required to be uniform with 
other property taxes, but could be reduced through income tax credits or payments from 
state revenues. A "yes" vote would also reorganize the constitutional provision into 
subsections to facilitate future amendment.

A "no" vote would keep the present language of section 1 of article VIII of the Wisconsin 
Constitution, would continue the requirement that taxes be uniform and continue the 
current exceptions to that rule.

ARTHUR G. DEGNITZ, COUNTY CLERK

NOTICE OF SEPARATE PRESIDENTIAL BALLOT

ELECTORS WHO WISH TO VOTE FOR ALL CANDIDATES OF A RECOGNIZED 
POLITICAL PARTY MUST CAST A SEPARATE BALLOT FOR THE OFFICES OF 
PRESIDENT AND VICE PRESIDENT. YOU MUST VOTE THE PRESIDENTIAL 
BALLOT SEPARATELY FROM THE STRAIGHT PARTY BALLOT. IF YOU MARK 
OR PUNCH YOUR BALLOT IN THE SPACE PROVIDED FOR A STRAIGHT PARTY 
BALLOT, YOU WILL NOT HAVE CAST A VOTE FOR PRESIDENT.

IF YOU WISH TO VOTE FOR PRESIDENT AND VICE PRESIDENT, YOU MUST 
MAKE A MARK OR PUNCH IN THE SPACE OPPOSITE THE NAMES OF THE 
PRESIDENTIAL AND VICE PRESIDENTIAL CANDIDATES OF YOUR CHOICE.

WASHINGTON COUNTY. WISCONSIN

POLLING PLACE AND TIME 
NOVEMBER 3. 1992

TOWNS POLLS OPEN AT
Addison Town Hall, 1 27 First Street
Barton Town Hall, 3482 Town Hall Road
Erin Town Hall. 1846 Hwy 83 S, Hartlord
Farmington Town Hall. 9422 Hwy 144
Germantown Rockfield School, N132 W18473,

Rockfield Road. Richfield
Hartford Town Hall, 3360 Hwy K South
Jackson Town Hall, 3146 Division Road
Kewaskum Amerahn Hall, 9480 Hwy 45 North
Polk Town Hall, 3680 Hwy 60, Richfield
Wds 1, 2, 8 Town Hall, 4128 Hubertus Road
Wds 3, 4, 5 Fire Station #2, 1100 Hwy J
Wds 9, 10, 11, 12 Richfield Fire Hall. 2008 Hwy 175
Wds 6, 7, 13, 14, 15 American Legion Post <522, 3590 Noith Shore Drive

Trenton Town Hall, 1071 Hwy 33 East
Wayne Town Hall, 6030 Hwy H
West Bend Town Hall, 6355 Hwy Z, West Bend

8 AM
9 AM
8 AM
9 AM

9 AM
8 AM
7 AM

7:30 AM
8 AM
7 AM
7 AM
7 AM
7 AM
7 AM
9 AM
7 AM

VILLAGES
Germantown
District 1 
District 2 
District 3

District 4 
Jackson 
Kewaskum 
Newburg 
Slinger

Village Hall, N122 W17177, Fond du Lac
Senior Activity Center, W162 N11960 Park Avenue
St. John's United Ctiurch of Christ, N104 W14181

Donges Bay Road
County Line School, W159 N9939 Butternut Road
Jackson Fire Station, W2O4 N16722, Jackson Drive
Village Hall, 204 First Street
Village Hall, 450 Main Street
Village Halt, 220 Slinger Road

7 AM
7 AM

7 AM
7 AM
8 AM

7 30 AM
9 AM
8 AM

CITIES
Hartford
Aid Dist 1 City Hall Council Chambers, 109 N. Main
Aid Dist 2 City Hall Community Room, 109 N. Main
Aid Dist 3 Library Conference Room, 109 N. Main

West Bend
Aid Dist 1 Wds 1, 2, 17 Meadowbrook Manor, South Ent.

475 Meadowbrook
Aid Dist 2 Wds 3, 5, 22 Public Library, 230 S. 6th Ave
Aid Dist 3, Wds 6, 7 City Hall, 1115 S. Main Street
Aid Dist 4, Wds 8. 9, 10 City Hall, 1115 S. Main Street
Aid Dist 5, Wds 4, 11, 12 Courthouse, 432 E. Washington Street
Aid Dist 6, Wds 13, 14, 15 Courthouse, 432 E. Washington Street
Aid Dist 7, Wds 16, 18 Barton School, 614 School Place
Aid Dist 8, Wds 19, 20, 21 Silvetbrook School. 120 N. Silverbrook

7 AM
7 AM
7 AM

7 AM
7 AM
7 AM
7 AM
7 AM
7 AM
7 AM
7 AM

What’s Going on at the 
Kewaskum Public Library?

National Author’s Day is 
November 1. Founded by Nellie 
Verne Burt McPhearson, this day 
is set aside to show patriotism, 
loyalty and appreciation of the 
men and women who have made 
American literature possible. It is 
also a time to encourage and in­
spire others to give of themselves 
in making a better America. 
Celebrate National Author’s Day 
by visiting your library and check­
ing out some new books!

Sidney Sheldon fans won’t 
want to miss The Stars Shine Down, 
his latest, and perhaps best book 
yet. Lara Cameron is a young and 
beautiful self-made tycoon. She 
has worked relentlessly for suc­
cess, power and control of her life 
and relationships. But an act of 
revenge by a discarded lover 
could cost Lara everything she 
has struggled a lifetime to build.

In her latest novel The Stork Club 
Iris Rainer Dart focuses on the 
trials and triumphs of becoming a 
parent in the nineties. The “Stork 
Club’’ is about a group of 
dissimilar men and women united 
by their desire to have and love 
a child, and to become worthwhile

parents. A touching story about 
raising a child, this book is sure 
to be as big a hit as Dart’s 
bestseller Beaches.

Are you a quiz show fanatic? If 
you are, you will surely want to 
check out The Jeopardy Challenge 
a new collection of the long- 
running TV game show’s most 
challenging contests. It includes 
teen, college and senior tourna­
ment games, as well as tips and 
background information.

See you soon at the library!

Riveredge Haunted 
Halloween Hike Set

Don’t miss the annual Haunted 
Halloween Hike. In the dark of the 
night, the fields and forests of 
Riveredge Nature Center will be 
haunted on Friday and Saturday, 
October 30 and 31.

The hike will begin at 6:30 p.m. 
with groups scheduled every 
eight minutes until 9:00 p.m., with 
each hike lasting approximately 
one hour.

Payments for the hike must be 
received within seven days of 
registration. There MUST be one 
adult that accompanies every five 
children. Preregistration is RE­
QUIRED. Call Riveredge at 
375-2715 (Metro) or 675-6888 
(local) to sign up for your time slot. 
There is a $4.50 fee per person.

Riveredge is a non-profit, 350 
acre natural sanctuary and 
educational organization, pro­
viding environmental programs 
for all ages.

County Separated and 
Divorced Group to Meet

The Washington County 
Separated and Divorced Men and 
Women Support Group meets 
every Friday at Sacred Heart 
Church in Allenton from 7:30 to 
9:30 p.m.

The purpose of the meeting is 
to provide a group to share ideas, 
concerns, support, fellowship and 
love from a Christian perspective. 
There are also guest speakers, 
panel discussions, small group 
sharing and activities.

The group is open to singles, 
widows and widowers. Many of 
the topics pertain to single 
parents and other individuals 
rebuilding their lives and 
relationships.

Upcoming topics are:
October 30 - “The Masks We 

Wear.”
November 6 - “Cure-X/Banned 

Aides’’ presented by Wendy from 
Planned Parenthood.

November 13 & 20 - To Be An­
nounced (attend a meeting for the 
schedule of speakers).

November 27 - Question: 
“What’s Thank-full?” Answer:

Opposite of Thank-Empty,” 
which is a group discussion with 
a video.

ALL POLLS CLOSE AT 8 PM

ARTHUR G. DEGNITZ 
WASHINGTON COUNTY CLERK

Expert on Middle East 
To Present Lecture
“A New Order or Disorder in 

the Middle East,” will be the title 
of Dr. Mohammed Aman’s up­
coming lecture at UW- 
Washington County. Dr. Aman is 
an expert on international infor­
mation policy issues and an avid 
observer of Middle East politics 
and policies.

He has lectured extensively on 
the subject of the Middle East and 
has participated in numerous 
radio and television programs as 
well as talk shows in Milwaukee. 
He saw Kuwait's destruction after 
the Gulf War. He was in Moscow 
during the failed coup against 
Gorbachev. His visits throughout 
the Middle East are too numerous 
to mention.

CARPET & UPHOLSTERY 
CLEANING SERVICE

Reliability in Professional Cleaning
RESIDENTIAL • COMMERCIAL 

FREE ESTIMATES ■ Call Anytime

338-0783
TRUCK MOUNTED MOBILE PLANT 

SYL STERN, Prop
INEW! ACOUSTICAL CEILING ClEANINGl

He is the Dean of the School of 
Library and Information Science, 
as well as a professor at the 
University of Wisconsin- 
Milwaukee He has been the chair 
and a member of UWM's Com­
mittee on the Middle East and 
North African studies. He has 
worked at the Egyptian Ministry of 
Information and Cairo University

Dr. Aman pursued his Master’s 
degree at Columbia University in 
New York. He received his doc­
torate from the University of Pitt­
sburgh. He is the author of 
several books and scores of ar­
ticles and reports on international 
information and policy issues, the 
Middle East and Islam.

This free lecture is open to the 
public. It is scheduled for 
November 5, at 7:30 p.m. in 
Room 259 at UWWC. For further 
information, call 335-5208
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Obituaries
MRS. ESTHER SPRADAU

Mrs. Esther Spradau, age 76, 
of Kewaskum, passed away on 
Wednesday, October 21,1992, at 
St. Joseph’s Community Hosital 
in West Bend.

She was born on July 4, 1916 
in the Town of Ashford, the 
daughter of the late Mike and 
Ellsbeth (Guntly) Krueger. On 
May 1, 1933 she was united in 
marriage to Walter F. Spradau.

Mrs. Spradau was a member of 
St. Lucas Evangelical Lutheran 
Church in Kewaskum. Survivors 
include her husband Walter F.; 
two sons, Walter A. (Sharon) of 
Jackson, and Roger (Roseann)of 
West Bend; two daughters, San­
dra (Herbert) Justman and Mae 
Spradau both of Kewaskum; a 
sister, Louise Flitter of Lomira; six 
grandchildren and four 
great-grandchildren.

In addition to her parents, she 
was preceded in death by a son, 
Kenneth and a brother.

Funeral services were held at 
the Miller Funeral Home, 
Kewaskum, at 7:00 p.m. on Fri­
day, October 23, 1992 with Rev. 
Edwin Fredrich officiating. Burial 
was in the Lutheran Memorial 
Park Cemetery, Kewaskum, at 
10:00 a m. on Saturday.

Friends called from 4:00 p.m. 
until the time of services at the 
funeral home on Friday.

HAROLD T. DEGNER
Harold T. Degner, of West 

Bend, died Friday, Oct. 23, 1992, 
at his residence, at the age of 70.

He was born Dec. 30, 1921, in 
West Bend, to the late Erwin and 
Mathilda (nee Hoppe) Degner.

After his graduation in 1939 
from West Bend High School, he 
was employed with the Chicago 
Northwestern Railroad Co., until 
entering the U.S. Army, serving in 
North Africa and Italy during 
WWII.

After his discharge, he return­
ed to the railroad where he work­
ed as a depot agent in Camp­
bellsport, Kewaskum and West 
Bend. He retired after 44 years of 
employment.

In retirement he became involv­
ed in amateur radio with the call 
letters N9JNZ.

He married Kathryn E Baer at 
Immanuel UCC, West Bend, on 
June 6, 1948

Survivors include his wife; two 
children, Neal (Erika) of German­
town and Corinne (Richard) Hig­
gins of Hutchinson, Minn.; three 
grandchildren, Sigrid Degner and 
John and Anne Higgins; a 
brother, Walter (Mabel) of West 
Bend; two sisters, Bernice (Elroy) 
Remmel of Hartford and Edith 
Degner of West Bend; and other 
relatives and friends.

He was a member, treasurer 
and an usher at Pilgrim Lutheran 
Church, West Bend, and a 
member of Robert G. Romaine 
Post 384 of the American Legion, 
AARP and the Washington Coun­
ty Amateur Radio Club.

Funeral services were held

Monday, Oct. 26, at 8 p.m. at the 
Schmidt Funeral Home, West 
Bend, with Pastors Timm Griffin 
and Bryan O’Connor officiating. 
Burial was at 10 a m. Tuesday in 
Washington County Memorial 
Park, West Bend.

Visitation at the funeral home 
was on Monday from 5 p.m. until 
the time of services.

Memorials to Pilgrim Lutheran 
Church appreciated.

CARD OF THANKS
A warm and sincere thank you 

to all of our friends and relatives, 
Dr. Sison and Dr. Castro, the 
nurses on 2nd floor. Rev. Fredrich 
and Rev. Henning, Miller’s 
Funeral Home and all who paid 
their respect with cards & gifts in 
the loss of our dear husband, 
father grandfather, and great­
grandfather, LEROY A. KELLER, 
Sr. Your prayers, flowers, cards, 
memorials, food and kindness will 
long be remembered.

Martha Keller
LeRoy and Charleen Keller 

Shirley Okrasa

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to thank 

everyone who helped us during 
the recent loss of our wife, 
mother, and grandmother, 
ESTHER SPRADAU

The prayers, cards, food, 
flowers, memorials, visits and 
everything else that helped us 
through this difficult time are 
much appreciated.

Special thanks to Pastor 
Fredrich, St. Lucas Lutheran 
Church, the ICU nurses at St. 
Joseph’s Hospital, Dr. Gibson 
and a special thank you to Millers 
Funeral Home.

All of your help was a great 
comfort.

The family of 
Esther Spradau

State of Wisconsin
Circuit Court
Washington County 
Probate

NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS

File No. 92-PR-373
IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF MARGARET J. 
STAEHLER

An application has been filed 
for Informal Administration of the 
estate of the above named per­
son, Washington County, Wiscon­
sin. whose post ottice addrec^ 
was 617 Main Street, Kewaskum. 
Wl 53040.

IT IS ORDERED THAT. All 
creditors' claims must be filed on 
or before January 11, 1993. or be 
barred.

By the Court: 
Sue Deppiesse, 
Deputy

October 9, 1992
Attorney Roger W. McKenna 
114 Main Street
P.O. Box 550
Kqwaskum, Wl 53040-0550 
#1006965

Publish: Oct. 22, 29, Nov. 5

October is National Physical Therapy Month. The staff at Cedar Haven 
Rehabilitation Agency is dedicated to providing quality care to clients of all 
ages. October is the month to focus attention onto practitioners of Physical 
Therapy and the benefits of being treated by them. Cedar Haven Rehabilita­
tion Agency provides comprehensive Physical Therapy, Occupational Therapy 
and Speech Therapy services to Washington and Dodge County residents. 
For more information call the Cedar Haven Rehabilitation Agency at 334-1486. 
Pictured, left to right: Robin Yourich, Sue Bantz, Lisa Dyson, Wendy Vorpahl. 
Front Row: Joanne Boden, Kim Pfalzgraf, Pat Bannon.

State of Wisconsin
Circuit Court
Washington County 
Probate

NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS

File No. 92-PR-384
IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF ALICE I. WILSON
An application has been filed 

for Informal Administration of the 
estate of the above named per­
son, Washington County, Wiscon­
sin, whose post office address 
was 1256 Meadow Lane, 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040.

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
All creditors’ claims must be fil­

ed on or before January 16, 1993, 
or be barred.

By the Court: 
Kristine Deis 
Probate Registrar

October 16, 1992 
Steffes & Schwefel 
Attorney 
P.O. Box 437 
Beaver Dam, Wl 53916

Publish: Oct. 29, Nov. 5 & 12

BERT W. PREIS
Nov 29. 19180ct 17, 1984THANK YOU

My undying gratitude to all who 
cared.

Harvey Otto

Prairie Seed Collecting
Here’s the chance to help 

yourself and Riveredge Nature 
Center too, by gathering seed 
from the prairie plants at the 
Center. Participants will be able 
to take home a part of the seeds 
they gather for planting in their 
“prairies."

This opportunity will take place 
on Sunday, November 8, from 1 
to 3:30 p.m. Call Riveredge at 
375-2715 (Metro) or 675-6888 
(locel) to make reservations.

Riveredge Nature Center, a 
non-profit 350 acre natural sanc­
tuary and educational organiza­
tion, providing environmental pro­
grams for all ages, is located in 
Ozaukee County, on Highway Y, 
one mile north of Newburg, bet­
ween Saukville and West Bend.

BURNS R. NELTHORPE
July 6. 1931 Oct 20. 1968

CLARENCE W. KOCHER
Nov 3. 189S Oct 23. 1981

JACK WILSON
June 28. 1925-Oct 30. 1964

AS A MEMORIAL 
TO LOVED ONES...

Please send contributions to:

If p^^ KEWASKUM YOUTH I I
SCHOLARSHIPS, INC. LTLl

P.O. BOX 124, KEWASKUM, Wl 53040

Flying Our 
Flag In 

Remembering 
Our Veterans

FREDRIC V. JESKE
Dec 11,-1933-Oct 19. 1981

ALOIS S. STAEHLER
April 16. 1926-Oct 21. 1977

EDWARD SONNENBERG
June 11. 1892-Oct 26. 1979

EDWIN W. TESCH
Oct 30. 1912-Oct 30. 1991

Specializing in pre-need arrangements; irrevocable trusts

We proudly present
THE TRI HUTE PROGRAM

Il can help you remember all the love 
between the laughter and the tears 

Cull its or \top h\ ’or it free booklet

FUNERAL HOME 
Kewaskum Phone 626-2185

Arlene Hankwitz

Announcing...
PHYSICIANS MUTUAL $ INSURANCE COMPANY 
is now serving the Fond du Lac County area with local representatives 
Hospitalization • Cancer • Income Protection • Medicare Supplement

For more information about your current policy or new insurance you may need,

Call: Arlene Hankwitz at 922-6949, 272 N. Main, Fond du Lac
Equal Opponunity Company PM A-261
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More 
Scouts, 
leaders

SCOUTINgfgg Food

Area Food Banks to Benefit 
From Scouts’ November Appeal
than 20,000 Cubs, 
Explorers and their 

will mobilize for two
weekends in November to help 
feed the hungry in Northeastern 
Wisconsin communities. Organiz­
ed by the Bay Lakes Council, Boy 
Scouts of America, the 1992 
“Scouting for Food Good Turn” 
will cover a 22 county area in an 
enormous effort to collect 
1.000,000 cans of food.

The Bay Lakes Council effort, 
now in its’ sixth year, has netted 
over 2,000,000 cans of food col­
lected locally and distributed 
locally through food banks in each 
community. The local “Good 
Turn” effort is credited with stock­
ing dozens of food banks with 
enough food for several months 
last year.

While the Scouts "Good Turn" 
has been extremely successful, 
the root causes of hunger have

not gone away, nor has the food 
pantries need been fully met, so 
the Scouts will undertake their 
sixth Scouting for Food project 
this November.

Directed by Bill Lawson. Presi­
dent of Employers Health In­
surance, Scouts will distribute 
bags to individual homes in 
neighborhoods throughout 280 
communities on Saturday, 
November 7. The following Satur­
day. November 14, the Scouts will 
return to pick up bags filled with 
food. They will gather the food 
and deliver it to the following pan- 
tries: Full Shelf (Allenton, 
Jackson, Kewaskum, West Bend) 
121 Island Ave., West Bend; Hart­
ford Food Pantry (Hartford. 
Rubicon, Saylesville) Hartford 
Recreation Center, 525 Main St.. 
Hartford; Slinger Food Pantry at 
St. Peter Church, 202 E. 
Washington St., Slinger.

District 11 Scouting for Food 
Chairman, Mike Smith, said, 
“Many of our needy are children 
and I feel this program is a good 
opportunity for our kids to help 
other children and learn about 
caring and sharing on a very per­
sonal basis.”

Honorary Chairman Chuck 
Ramsay. WBAY-TV news anchor 
calls this. “One of the most 
remarkable statements of 
Scouting Spirit we can make, and 
one of the most worthwhile efforts 
we can offer our community. 
Hunger is a problem we can ad­
dress, and our neighbors facing 
the pain of hunger are people we 
can help directly.”

Scout Leader Roundtables 
Set tor November 5

Roundtables for all Scout­
masters. Cubmasters. Committee 
Chairmen. Den and Webelos 
Leaders, their assistants, Pack 
and Troop Committee Members 
and Unit Commissioners ot 
Glacier Edge District 11. Bay- 
Lakes Council of the Boy Scouts 
of America, will be held Thursday, 
November 5. from 7:30 - 9:00 
p m., at John Long Middle 
School, corner of Fifth and 
Hickory Streets. Grafton.

Boy Scout personnel will meet 
in the school library where Bill 
Yankus of Hartford, and avid 
stamp collector, will give the 
guidelines for this Merit Badge, 
and an introduction to stamp col­
lecting for a lifelong hobby. 
Special Scout Stamp Series, 
as well as foreign stamps, will be 
exhibited

Dan Flanders, Scoutmaster of 
Troop 795, will present a video of 
the highlights of his troop's excur­
sion through the U.S Grant 
Pilgrimage in Galena, Illinois, 
which includes a tour of Grant's

home, a Civil War Encampment 
and history brought to life.

Cub Scout Leaders will con­
gregate in the All-Purpose Room 
and participate in the December 
theme. “To Help Other People.” 
Linda Spawr and Carole Stuckert 
have a collection of Christmas 
patterns and samples of candles, 
various Christmas trees, an 18” 
reindeers and holiday decora­
tions The Helping Others seg 
ment of "Ethics In Action" will be 
discussed and put to use. 
Webelos Leaders will concentrate 
on the Craftsman and Citizen Ac­
tivity Badges during their session

The District Cub Camping 
Chairman. Dick Lexa, will do a 
promotion on Council Camps and 
explain which programs are 
available to Cub units, the regula­
tions and requirements.

HALLOWEEN

New Phone Books
New telephone books publish­

ed by Ameritech Publishing and 
distributed to Wisconsin Bell 
customers are causing some con­
fusion for some area residents, 
according to Washington County 
Sheriff Robert H. Schulteis.

The inside front cover of the 
books indicate that 911 should be 
used for emergencies, but in­
cludes a section entitled, "Other 
Emergency Numbers.’’ The 
number shown for the Sheriff’s 
Department in that section is on­
ly for use by hearing impaired per­
sons who use a telephone device 
for the deaf, known as TDD. 
Those initials are indicated in that 
section, but many people do not 
know what they mean and use the 
number to call the Sheriff’s 
Department.
“It is impossible to properly 

handle a phone call on the TDD 
line if the caller isn’t using a TDD 
device,” the Sheriff stated. A TDD

allows the caller to communicate 
by typing messages, much like a 
typewriter.

Residents may wish to write in 
alternative numbers on the inside 
front cover to avoid confusion. 
335-4411 can be called to request 
an officer for a non-emergency. 
335-4378 is the number to call to 
request information or obtain 
copies of reports. 911 is to be us­
ed to report emergencies. 
Residents should not hesitate to 
use 911 if they are not sure if it 
is a “real emergency.” “We 
would rather that they use 911 
and let us determine the nature of 
the call” the Sheriff said.

Wisconsin Bell is aware of the 
situation and is assisting the 
Sheriff’s Department in educating 
the public about the TDD phone 
number. The design of the page 
will be modified next year to 
eliminate the problem.

'Auto Service——^——— 

ROGER & DAN’S 
AUTO SERVICE

Your Complete Auto, Tire & Towing 
Service Station in This Area”

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum

626-2888
24 HOUR TOWING SERVICE

UNW3YAL

Auto Craft

Super Fantastic 
Conversion Sale”

Thurs., Nov. 5 thru Mon., Nov. 9
Extended Hours!

All Vans Are 
Fully Equipped

Conversion Van 
Prices As Low As 

$15,995
A&J and Gladiator 
Factory Reps Will 

Be On I land

OnTteSpot 
Rnancinq 
Available!

Special Prices For 
This Sale Only!

Astro Conversion Van

I roe

Full Size Conversion 4x4

GLAVAL

Full Size Conversion Van

Insurance Work Our Specialty 
Complete Auto Body Repair 

Vnibody Repair 
Rental Cars Available 

Fast Service 
Serving the Areaforl6Years

All A&J Full-Size 
Conversion Vans 
sold during this 

special sale include a 
9 inch Magnavox Color 

TV, VCR, Portable 
AC/DC entertainment 

center. An $850 value.
ASI
V AN

Craftsmanship 
and Quality 
Above All

GLADIATOR

Conveniently located between West Bend and Kewaskum

338-0379
FINANCING 
AVAILABLE

NEUVILLE
CHEVROLET-GEO

Hwy. 45, Kewaskum 626-2161
.Houri Mondoy Thundoy 9 8 Frldoy 9 5 S»turi*y 9-3_________
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School^ 
Lunch )
Menus ^

Minutes of Village 
Board Meeting

KEWASKUM COMMUNITY 
SCHOOLS

Monday, Nov. 2 — No School.
Tuesday, Nov. 3 — Tony’s 

cheese & sausage pizza, tossed 
salad w/asst. dressings, pear 
slices, homemade bread, milk & 
a peanut butter choc, chip bar.

Wednesday, Nov. 4 — Chicken 
patty/bun, broccoli w/cheese 
sauce, pineapple chunks, milk 
and a sugar meltaway cookie. 
(Salad Bar - H.S.).

Thursday, Nov. 5 — Crispy
breaded fish square
w/cheese/bun, veggies & dip, 
peach slices, milk & funfetti cake, 
(or pizza patty/bun - H.S. & M.S.).

Friday, Nov. 6 — Golden brown 
chicken, mashed potatoes, & 
gravy, green beans, homemade
bread, milk and a choc, 
cookie.

chip

HOLY TRINITY 
SCHOOL

Monday, Nov. 2 — No School. 
Teacher in-service.

Tuesday, Nov. 3 — Fish/tartar 
sauce, French fries, apple sauce, 
cole slaw, flying saucer, milk.

Wednesday, Nov. 4 — Meat- 
balls/meatloaf/gravy, whipped 
potatoes, golden corn, muffin/but- 
ter, milk.

Thursday, Nov. 5 — Sub­
sandwich, lettuce/mayo, peaches, 
grapes, frosted donut, milk.

Friday, Nov. 6 Turkey
cubes/gravy, fluffy rice, green 
beans, pear slices, dinner roll/but- 
ter, grandparents cookie, milk.

WASHINGTON COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM 

FOR THE ELDERLY MENU 
Meadowcreek Apartment 

Complex
Monday, Nov. 2 Polish

sausage, German potato salad, 
sauerkraut, rye bread, maple 
cake.

Tuesday, Nov. 3 — Mushroom 
barley soup & crackers, boneless 
chicken breasts, lite gravy, rice 
florentine, peas & carrots, whole 
wheat bread, raspberry sherbet

Thursday, Nov. 5 — Boneless 
braised short ribs, whipped 
potatoes, California vegetable 
medley, branatural bread, rice 
pudding.

Ceramics at 10:00 a m. every 
1st and 3rd Tuesday of the month.

Mid-Monthly Meeting 
October 19, 1992 
8:00 p.m.

The Village Board of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Wisconsin, met 
in Mid-Monthly Session in the Coun­
cil Room of the Municipal Building, 
204 First St.

President Mary Krueger presided. 
Trustee Thomas McElhatton asked to 
be excused and was absent. All other 
Trustee Members were present. A 
quorum was present.

The meeting was opened with a Mo­
ment of Silence and Pledge of 
Allegiance.

On a motion by Trustee Robert 
Wagner, seconded by Trustee Robert 
Beisbier and unanimously carried by 
voice vote, the minutes of the October 
5, 1992 meeting were approved as 
printed.

Fire Chief Robert Stoltzmann 
shared the September 1992 monthly 
report with the Board as follows:

Fire calls - 2, Year to date - 24; False 
alarms - 0, Year to date - 1; Jaws of 
life (used) - 0. Year to date - 4, (not us­
ed) - 2, Year to date - 15; Rescue calls 
- 15, Year to date - 152; Burn permits 
- 0, Year to date 25.

Chief of Police Richard L Knoebel 
shared the September 1992 monthly 
report with the Board as follows: 
Traffic citations 38, Traffic warnings 
117, Parking violations 8, Parking war­
nings 6, Property stolen $139, 
Criminal investigations 49, Aoult ar­
rest 34, Criminal arrest 56, Juvenile 
arrest 6, Property recovered $11.

Director of Public Works, Jerry 
Gilles asked the Board for authoriza­
tion to advertise the 1971 boom truck 
for sale On a motion by Trustee 
Robert Beisbier, seconded by Trustee 
David Goeden and unanimously car­
ried by voice vote, the Board authoriz­
ed the sale of the boom truck as 
requested.

On a motion by Trustee Gary Gavin, 
seconded by Trustee Robert Wagner 
and unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the Board approved the applica­
tion for an Operator’s License upon 
proper payment of fees and documen­
tation and authorized the office to 
issue said license as follows:

Manthei, Becky L., Kewaskum. Wl
Administrator Daniel S. Schmidt 

reviewed the following:
1) Budget control sheet for the 

period ending September 30, 1992.
2) Building permit list for the month 

on September, 1992
3) Review of correspondence
Chairman of the Public Works Com­

mittee. Trustee Harry Roecker inform­
ed the Board that a committee 
meeting has been scheduled for 
November 2, 1992 at 7:30 p m. to 
review the proposed 1993 budget.

Chairman of the Park and Recrea­
tion Committee. Gary Gavin informed 
the Board that a meeting was held 
with the Kewaskum Softbdil Associa­
tion and that the 1992 season went 
well Plans to enter into another agree­
ment for 1993 have begun The finan­
cial records have been turned in for 
review

It was also noted that a review of the 
proposed electrical work for River Hill 
Park took place and that plans would 
be drawn up A brief report regarding

the proposed 1993 budget also took 
place.

Board Representative for the Plan 
Commission, Trustee Gary Gavin in­
formed the Board that a Plan Commis­
sion Meeting has been scheduled for 
Tuesday, Octoer 27, 1992 at 8:00 p.m.

Board Representative for the 
County-Wide Library Board, Trustee 
Robert Wagner reviewed briefly the in­
formation discussed at the last 
County-Wide Library Meeting. A 
review of how the system has affected 
the Village will be discussed in the 
Spring of 1993 prior to entering into 
another multi-year agreement.

Board Representative for the Mid­
Moraine Municipal Association, 
Legislative Committee, Trustee David 
Goeden reported that he had attend­
ed a recycling meeting sponsored by 
Senator Donald Stitt, but indicated he 
was the only one in attendance.

Action was taken on Resolution No. 
92-23 a Resolution to Amend the 1992 
Budget to cover the purchase of the 
replacement boom truck as attached 
hereto:

Action was taken on Ordinance No. 
92-9 an Ordinance to Adopt State 
Statutes regarding smoking violations 
as attached hereto:

The Board, by consensus directed 
the Administrator to prepare a resolu­
tion to increase the rent for the two 
apartments at 1102 Fond du Lac 
Avenue by $10.00 per month effective 
January 1, 1993.

A preliminary budget review and 
discussion was held regarding the 
1993 proposed budget. The budget is 
estimated to be increasing by 7 per­
cent while the levy/tax rate is 
estimated to increase 1.5 percent to 
2.7 percent. The explanation sheets 
will be reviewed at the next meeting 
as well as the notice for public hear­
ing which is scheduled for November 
30. 1992.

The topic regarding the Trustee and 
Village Presidents' pay was discuss­
ed and it was suggested that the Ad­
ministrator look for comparisons and 
report back to the Board.

It was noted that the 1992 
Homecoming weekend went very well 
and that the total cost for additional 
support for the week of homecoming 
equalled $229.35.

President Mary Krueger shared with 
the Board two books received at a 
reception for visitors from Germany. 
It was noted that in the future the ' 
Village may be able to establish a 
sister city program with
Langenselbold, Germany. It was I
noted that the books will be placed in I 
the Library. I

On a motion by Trustee Harry I
Roecker, seconded by Trustee Robert 
Wagner and carried by the majority 
roll call vote, to adjourn to closed ses­
sion under Chapter 19 85 (1) (c) of the 
statutes to consider employment, 
compensation and performance of 
public employees over which the 
governmental body has jurisdiction. 
Roll call vote was 6 “Aye," 0 "Nay," 
1 “Absent."

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

RESOLUTION NO. 92-23
A RESOLUTION TO AMEND THE 1992 BUDGET

BE IT RESOLVED, that the balance in 540195 the machinery/equipment outlay 
account be adjusted by transferring funds from the Restricted Fund 
(Account 109120) Machmery/Equipment Account in the amount of Fifteen 
Thousand, One Hundred Thirteen and Thirty Five Cents ($15,113.35).

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the 1992 Budget under the category of 
Machmery/Equipment Outlay Account reflect a total of $88,045.35. Noting 
these additional funds are to cover the purchase of a replacement boom 
truck 1987 Ford for the 1971 Chevrolet.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Revenue side of the Budget for 1992 
account 479200 Pre-budgeted Transfer of Funds reflect an increase equal 
to the expenditure increase of $15,113.35 leaving a total budget amount of 
$49,121.35.

ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 19th day of October, 1992 by the Kewaskum 
Village Board.

Mary L. Krueger 
Village President

ATTEST:
Daniel S. Schmidt
Administrator/Clerk

Introduced by Trustee Gary Gavin
Motion for adoption by Trustee Robert Wagner
Motion for adoption seconded by Trustee Harry Roecker
Roll Call vote was 6 "Aye" 0 "Nay" 1 “Absent

ORDINANCE NO. 92-9
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND PUBLIC PEACE AND GOOD 
ORDER IN THE VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM, WISCONSIN

The Village Board of the Village of Kewaskum. Wisconsin do ordain as follows:

The Village Board of the Village of Kewaskum, Wisconsin wish to amend and 
reference to include 9 947.013 in order to include the public health, safety, 
peace and welfare, the Village Board of the Village of Kewaskum, Washinoton 
County, Wisconsin, do ordain section to the Municipal Code of Kewaskum, 
Wisconsin in regards to Underage Possession and Use of Tobacco products 
and ordain as follows;

9.48.983 POSSESSION AND USE TOBACCO PRODUCTS BY UNDERAGE 
PERSONS PROHIBITED.

NOTE: To be included in the following.

9.29.288 to 9.951.16 OFFENSES AGAINST STATE LAWS SUBJECT TO 
FORFEITURE The following statutes following the prefix "9" defining offenses 
against the peace and good order of the State are adopted by reference to 
define offenses against the peace and good order of the municipality provid­
ed the penalty for commission of such offenses hereunder shall be limited to 
a forfeiture imposed under Section 25.04 of the Municipal Code.

This ordinance shall take effect upon passage and publication as provided by 
law.

PASSED. ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 19th day of October, 1992, by the 
Kewaskum Village Board

ATTEST:
Daniel S. Schmidt
Village Administrator/Clerk

Mary Krueger
Village President

Introduced by Trustee David Goeden
Motion for Adoption by Trustee Gary Gavin
Motion for Adoption Seconded by Trustee Robert Beisbier
Roll Call Vote was 6 “Aye" 0 “Nay" 1 "Absent"

•Commercial
•Residential
•Farm

when quality and price are important call 
HEBERER BROS. CONSTRUCTION

Kc«ivc a frc.c estimate on;
_ Custom Built Replacement Windows 
_ Siding Aluminum, Vinyl or Steel 
_ Aluminum Soffct and Fascia 
_ Cover Window and Door Trim 
_ .032 Seamless Aluminum Gutters 
_ Raynor Overhead Garage Doors 
_ Patio Enclosures • Attic 
_ Custom Built Replacement Doors 
_ Aluminum Awning - Sidewalls 

Patio Covers - Shutters

626-2384
Office: 118 Hwy H, Kewaskum

W 
w

w 
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SHEEPSHEAD WINNERS
5 handed winner's on Thurs­

day, October 22nd were; Judy 
Lickman, 66-9—57, 21-5—16; 
Harry Mickael, 53-4—49, 
21-2—19; Marge Geiger, 
53-4—49, 18-3—15; Vivian 
Bartelt, 52-4—48, 16-4—12; John 
Steger, 58-10—48, 17-7—10; 
Marge Bonlender, 58-11—47, 
17-7—10; Alice Giese, 62-18—44, 
19-10—9; Martha Keller, 
50-9—41, 21-5—16.

The next 5 handed will be 
Thursday, November 5th and ’ 
Wednesday, Nov. 11th at 8:00 
p.m. sharp. Schmitt’s Never Inn.

XYZ CLUB CARD RESULTS
The winners at cards played by 

the XYZ Senior Citizens at the 
Municipal Building on Wednes­
day, Oct. 21, were: SKAT: Harold 
Eggert, 26-2—24; Fritz Klein, 
26-3—23; Elmer Stange, 
18-4—14 net; Willy Blecher, 
13-2—11 net; Elroy Egerer, Heart 
Turn vs 6; Ruth Egerer, Grand 
Schneider 140 points.

SHEEPSHEAD: Florian 
Jakubouski, Les Engelmann, Gert 
Kaschner and Eileen Petri.

Serving Your Area

GAS
PH I IGAS

•Front discharge ready mix trucks
•Delivery available Saturdays
•Radio dispatch

KLOKE 
READY MIX, Inc.
528 Elmore Dr., Campbellsport, Wl 

533-8034

Service WiF
for
Home ■ Farm or Industry
Cylinder & Bulk Deliveries

NO TANK CHARGE
Serving Gas Customers 

for Over 50 Years

BOEHLKE BOnLED 
GAS CORP.

Plants located at Jackson 
and Random Lake

West Bend 
Random Lake

TOLL FREE 
1-800-448-3388

338-8011
994-2229
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Board Meeting

September 14, 1992 
Regular Meeting 

President Weare called the meeting 
to order at 7:00 p.m.

Members present: Ray Engelking, 
Ruth Schmitt, John Schulte, Neal 
Weare, Ron Beimborn, Janet 
Wolfenberg, Jean Goeden.

Members absent: none.
Clerk Schmitt led the Pledge of 

Allegiance.
Schmitt/Wolfenberg motion to ap­

prove the agenda. Motion passed 6-0.
Sophomore Ron Sternig, son of 

Ronald Sternig and Pam Hamilton 
was honored as the September Stu­
dent of the Month.

Audience to visitors; receiving of 
delegations: Ms. Strand announced 
that Connie Schulist was named the 
Outstanding Parent Contributor and 
will be honored at the Gifted and 
Talented Conference to be held in 
Stevens Point on October 2nd and 
3rd.

President Weare informed the 
public of an upcoming board 
workshop concerning early childhood 
care to be held at the administrative 
office on Monday, September 21, 
1992.

Being National Housekeepers 
Week, Dr. Heather recognized the 
janitors and custodians of the district 
and thanked them for their continuing 
efforts in keeping the buildings a-d 
grounds clean.

Dr. Heather advised the board and 
the public of the ACT scores which 
were recently published. Kewaskum's 
composite score was 21.8 Last year 
Kewaskum scored 21.2 and the year 
before the score was 20.5.

Laura Waehler, representing the 
Kewaskum Elementary School PTO, 
reported to the board on the 
P A R E N T S, program.

The following people who attended 
the KMS seminar at Platteville 
reported their experiences to the 
board; Connie Strand, Jan Uhlman, 
Ruth Schmitt, Joanne Tallmann, 
Renee Roels and Diane Stangl.

Dr. Heather reported the current 
district enrollment to be approximately 
the same as the enrollment on the 
1992 January count day although 
enrollment is expected to increase 
during the school year.

Schmitt/Schulte motion to approve 
the minutes of August 17, 1992 with 
a correction. Motion passed 5-0-1 with 
Ray Engelking abstaining.

Wolfenberg/Schulte motion to ap­
prove the minutes of August 24, 1992. 
Motion passed 3-0-3 with Mr. Engelk­
ing. Mrs. Schmitt, and Mrs. Goeden 
abstaining.

Schulte/Goeden motion to approve 
the minutes of August 31, 1992 with 
corrections. Motion passed 5-0-1 with 
Mr. Engelking abstaining.

Schulte/Engelking motion to ap­
prove the minuses of September 9, 
1992 with corrections Motion passed 
6-0.

Schulte/Schmitt motion to approve 
the second reading of the following 
policies. 155-Administration- 
Management Rights Clause; 
122-lnternal Board Policies- 
Organization; 165-Code of Ethics; 
185.1-Standing Committees; 
162-Orienting New Board Members; 
187-Procedures for Meetings and 
Public Participation; 171.1-Public 
Notice; 171.21-Regular Business 
Meeting. Motion passed 6-0.

The Policy-Legislation-Bylaw Com­
mittee will meet again on November 
2, 1992.

Wolfenberg/Goeden motion to ap­
prove the chemical waste disposal bid 
from Chemical Waste Management in 
the amount of $4268.90. Motion pass­
ed 6-0.

Wolfenberg/Schmitt motion to ap­
prove the list of items for the auction 
as presented. Motion passed 6-0. The 
auction will take place on October 17, 
1992 at Riteway Bus Garage in 
Richfield.

The Finance Committee will meet 
again on September 28. 1992.

Schmitt/Beimborn motion to ap­
prove the payroll and accounts 
payable in the amount of 
$1,044,346.36. Motion passed 6-0.

Schmitt/Beimborn - "I make a 
resolution authorizing temporary bor­
rowing in the amount not to exceed 
$1,700,000 pursuant to Section 
67 I2(8)(a) 1, Wisconsin Statutes ’’

Motion passed 7-0
Engelking/Beimborn motion to ap­

prove the administrative and non­
represented personnel salaries and 
contract changes for the 92-93 school 
year as listed on attachment D 3. 
dated 9-14-92 Motion passed 6-0

Schmitt/Engelking motion to ap­
prove the contract for before and after 
school child day care with Kids Port. 
LTD Motion passed 5-1 with John 
Schulte voting no.

Goeden/Engelking motion to ap­
prove raising substitute teacher pay 
to $60 for a full day and $31 for a half 
day. and to pay $65 to substitutes after 
the 11th day of subbing. Motion pass­
ed 5-0-1 with Ruth Schmitt abstaining

Schmitt/Wolfenberg motion to ap­
prove a teaching contract to Julie Ann 
Butcher to teach third grade at KES 
Motion passed 6-0.

Schmitt/Wolfenberg motion to ap­
prove a teaching contract to Lynn 
Heinz to teach fourth grade at KES 
Motion passed 6-0.

Goeden/Schmitt motion to approve 
the resignation of Len Soller as assis­
tant middle school wrestling coach. 
Motion passed 6-0

Schmitt/Wolfenberg motion to ap­
prove Richard Straub as the head 
wrestling coach at KMS. Motion pass­
ed 6-0.

President Weare appointed John 
Schulte as the WASB Delegate for the 
1993 WASB Delegate Assembly, with 
Mrs. Schmitt being the alternate.

Goeden/Schulte motion to approve 
Mr. Furman for a district administrator 
practicum. Motion passed 6-0.

Goeden/Schulte motion to give ap­
proval to Mrs. Alvarado to plan a stu­
dent trip to Mexico in March 1993.

Schmitt/Wolfenberg motion to ad­
journ. Motion passed 6-0. The 
meeting adjourned at 8:15 p.m.

Minutes of School 
Board Meeting

Submitted Oct. 19, 1992

August 17, 1992 
Regular Meeting

The meeting was called to order at 
7:00 p.m. by President Weare

Members present: Mrs Schmitt, Mr 
Schulte, Mrs. Goeden, Mr. Beimborn, 
Mrs Wolfenberg, Mr. Weare

Member Absent: Ray Engelking.
Clerk Schmitt led the Pledge of 

Allegiance.
The agenda was changed as 

follows: The next meeting date for the 
Finance-Transportation-Buildings and 
Grounds meeting is August 31,1992. 
Item D. 2. Approval of parental re­
quest for district to pay tuition was 
moved to C 2 Schmitt/Goeden motion 
to approve the agenda as amended. 
Motion passed 5-0.

Audience to Visitors; receiving of 
delegations: Kathy Miller presented 
the board with a petition asking the 
board to prohibit the sale of alcohol on 
school property.

Mr. Weare announced that a 
Special Meeting will be held on 
August 24 to discuss administrative 
wages. He also announced that the 
Sub-Committee will meet on August 
26.

Schmitt/Goeden motion to approve 
the regular meeting minutes of July 
13, 1992. Motion passed 5-0.

Schmitt/Goeden motion to approve 
the Closed Session minutes of July 
16, 1992. Motion passed 5-0.

The following policies were read for 
the first time: 831.2 - Beer Sales on 
School Property; 155 - Administration- 
Management Rights Clause; 
122-lnternal Board Policies- Organiza­
tion; 162.1-Board Members' Respon­
sibility; 165-Code of Ethics; 
185-Committees; 185.1 - Standing 
Committees; 162-Orienting New 
Board Members; 153-Methods of 
Operation; 187-Procedures for 
Meetings and Public Participation; 
163-School Board Conferences, Con­
ventions and Workshops; 
171.1-Public Notice; 171.21-Regular 
Business Meeting. The following 
policies will be sent back to the com­
mittee for reconsideration; 831 2-Beer 
Sales on School Property; 162.1 - 
Board members’ Responsibility; 185 
-Committees; 153-Methods of Opera­
tion; 163-School Board Conferences, 
Conventions and Workshops.

Schulte/Schmitt motion to approve 
the second reading of the following 
policies: 541 43-Library Aide Job 
Description; 496-Extracurricular Ac­
tivity Programs; 672-Purchasing Pro­

cedures. 411-Equal Educational Op­
portunities; 411 01-Non- 
Discnmination Publication Notice, 
411.2 Student Conduct Non- 
Discrimination Statement; 235.2 - 
LVEC; 840 1 - Non-Discrimination 
Statement; 685 - Returned Checks 
Motion passed 5-0.

The next Policy Meeting will be held 
November 2, 1992.

Wolfenberg/Goeden motion to ap­
prove the purchase of new equipment 
for the food service program ii. the 
amount of $17,367 00 Motion pass­
ed 5-0.

Schulte/Goeden motion to approve 
tuition payment to UWWC for Chad 
Harlow and to grant credit for the 
courses taken. Motion passed 5-0

Schmitt/Goeden motion to approve 
the purchase of computer equipment 
and the IBM Writing to Write Program 
in the amount of $150,838 00, with the 
computer committee being the agent 
that makes the decision of the place­
ment of the equipment and review of 
the software. Motion passed 5-0.

Wolfenberg/Schmitt motion to ap­
prove the proposal of approximately 
$24,562 for the fibre optic connection 
between KES and KHS. Motion pass­
ed 5-0.

Wolfenberg/Schmitt motion to ap­
prove the purchase of computer 
equipment for the EEN program, EEN 
administration, KES administration 
and KES library at a cost of $11,398. 
Motion passed 5-0.

Wolfenberg/Goeden motion to ap­
prove the purchase of three personal 
science lab stations for the physical 
science and physics area at KHS for 
a cost of $6180 Motion passed 5-0.

Wolfenberg/Schmitt motion to ap­
prove the purchase of a Risograph 
5800 from Camadon for $6950 Mo­
tion passed 5-0.

The next Finance Meeting will be 
held August 31, 1992.

Schmitt/Wolfenberg motion to ap­
prove the payroll and accounts 
payable in the amount of $668,068 80 
Motion passed 5-0.

Goeden/Wolfenberg motion to ap­
prove 4-year old screening and 
remediation programs. Motion pass­
ed 5-0.

Schulte/Beimborn motion to call 
back up to six instructional aides if 
they are needed. Motion passed 5-0

Goeden/Schulte motion to approve 
the teacher evaluation instrument as 
proposed Motion passed 5-0.

Schmitt/Wolfenberg motion to ap­
prove after school day care at KES. 
Motion passed 4-0-1 with Mr Schulte 
abstaining.

Mrs. Goeden left the meeting at 
9:02 p.m.

Schmitt/Wolfenberg motion to ap­
prove the authorization of the follow­
ing public depositories: Valley Bank 
- Kewaskum, First Band, NA- 
Milwaukee, Local Government Invest­
ment Pool-Madison, West Bend Sav­
ings and Loan - Kewaskum, and The 
Wisconsin School District Liquid Asset 
Fund. Motion passed 4-0. (Mrs 
Goeden was absent).

Schmitt/Beimborn motion to ap­
prove the food service contracts for 
92-93. Motion passed 4-0. (Mrs. 
Goeden was absent).

Mrs. Goeden returned to the 
meeting at 9:07 p.m.

Beimborn/Goeden motion to ap­
prove the CESA 6 media services con­
tract. Motion passed 5-0.

Schmitt/Goeden motion to approve 
the resignation of Lucy Wagner Mo­
tion passed 5-0.

Schmitt/Goeden motion to approve 
the following instructional contracts: 
Suzanne Wagner, 7th grade; Linda 
Kiser LD; and Robin Jasinski, Home 
Ec. Motion passed 5-0

Goeden/Wolfenberg motion to hire 
two additional teachers because of in­
creased enrollment in the third and 
fourth grades in KES. Motion passed 
5-0.

Dr Heather announced that the first 
day of school for students will be Mon­
day. August 24 The traditional open­
ing day breakfast for all staff will be 
held Thursday, August 20 beginning 
at 7:00 a m and all board members 
are invited to participate.

Schmitt/Goeden motion to the 
following extra-curricular appoint­
ments: Beth Rydzik as choreographer 
for the fall musical, Dale Schatz as 
assistant high school boy’s basketball 
coach, and Carla Pritzlaff as assistant 
girls' tennis coach Motion passed 4-1 
with John Schulte voting no.

Schmitt/Wolfenberg motion to ad­
journ. Motion passed 5-0. The 
meeting adjourned at 9:36 p m.

Minutes of Special 
School Board Meeting

August 24. 1992 
Special Meeting 

Meeting was called to order by 
President Weare at 7:34 p m All 
members were present with the ex­
ception of Mrs Schmitt, Mr Engelk­
ing. and Mrs Goeden 

Wolfenberg/Schulte motion to ap­
prove the resignation of Bob 
Sobolewski as an instructional staff 
member Motion passed 4-0 

Schulte/Beimborn motion to ap­
prove the appointment of Richard 
Straub as an instructional staff 
member for 92-93 Motion passed 4-0 

Beimborn/Wolfenberg motion to ap­
prove a before school day care pro­
gram providing it follows the state 
statute requirements as listed in 
120 125. Motion passed 3-0-1 with Mr 
Schulte abstaining

Wolfenberg/Beimborn motion to in­
crease instructional time for Mrs 
Wright from .5 FTE to .75 FTE if need 
arises due to increase of students 
from 4 year old screening program 
Motion passed 4-0.

Wolfenberg/Schulte motion to ad­
journ. Motion passed 4-0 The 
meeting adjourned at 7:57 p m

The closed session was not held

Village Board 
Meeting Monday

Public notice is hereby given 
that the next meeting of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wiscon 
sin. Village Board is scheduled 
for Monday evening, Nov. 2, 
1992, at X:(X) p.m. in the Coun 
cil Room of the Municipal 
Building, 204 First Street.

The agendas for meeting are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and arc 
available at the office of the clerk 
at the Municipal Building on 
Thursday preceding the meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the 
Kewaskum Post Office and lob 
by of the Valley Bank.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

TOWN OF FARMINGTON 
Monthly Town Meeting
The Town Board of the Town 

of Farmington will hold their 
regular monthly meeting on Tues 
day, Nov. 3. al X p.m. in the 
Town Hall, 9422 Hwy. 144. 
Kewaskum.

Joanne Oneska, Clerk

MEETING NOTICE
There will be a meeting of the Policy Legislation-Bylaw Commit 

tee of the Kewaskum School District on Monday, November 2, 1992 
beginning at 7:00 p m Said meeting to be held in the Administrative 
Offices at 1450 School Street

PROPOSED AGENDA
1 . Call meeting to order - Mr Schulte
2 Roll call of members
3 Extracurricular Activities Policies

a. 377 2 - Academic Eligibility for Interscholastic Competitive 
Activities - review

b 377.3 - Rules for Interscholastic Participation and Cheer­
leaders - review

c. 377 4 - Policy Dissemination - review
4 SEC Policies

a 6180/334 - Evaluation of the Instructional Program - revise 
b. 6180(a)/334 1 - Staff Organization Chart - revise
c 6180(b)/334 2 - Evaluation of Instructional Program Staffing 

for Evaluation Process - revise
d 6180(c)/334 3 • Evaluation of Instructional Program, Content 

of Program Self Studies - revise
e 6180(d)/334 4 - Evaluation of Instructional Program, Imple­

mentation of Findings - revise
5 852 1 - Distribution of Materials by Students - review
6 Adjournment

Lead Screening 
Tests Available

Lead screening tests will be 
available tor children, up to age 
6, at the Washington County 
Community Health Nursing Ser­
vice in the Public Agency Center, 
333 East Washington Street, First 
Floor/Room 1145. (Enter parking 
lot off of Indiana Avenue)

The screening will be held 
Wednesday, November 4, 1992, 
from 9 to 10:30 am. by 
appointment.

Childhood lead poisoning is 
one of the most common pediatric 
health problems in the United 
States and is entirely preventable 
Children at greatest risk of lead 
poisoning are those who live in a 
house or building built before 
1960 or those living in an older 
home that is, or recently has 
been, remodeled. Lead poisoning 
can occur in a young child without 
the parent being aware of the 
problem.

For more information call 
335-4462, 644-5204 or 342-2929; 
ask for extension 4462 A parent 
must bring the child to the clinic.

Two-Day Workshop for 
Kids Who Love to Draw

The West Bend Gallery of Fine 
Arts is pleased to announce the 
following workshop for children: A 
Two Day Workshop for Kids Who Love 
to Draw. The instructor is Sandra 
Butz-Siebers Classes will be held 
on Friday and Saturday, Nov. 13 
& 14 (two sessions), at 9:00 a m. 
- 12:00 noon (ages 6, 7 & 8); 1 00 
- 4:00 p.m. (ages 9, 10, 11 & 12).

The fee is Gallery friends 
$10.00; General public. $15.00

Class size is limited to twelve 
students. In conjunction with the 
exhibition, DRAWN TO ART, this 
workshop will provide students 
with an intense immersion into the 
direct experience of drawing or 
mark-making, the hows, whys and 
wherefores about drawing. There 
will be lots of discussion, a brief 
study of the very early drawings 
of Carl Marr and a chance for 
students to work on their own with 
the instructor in this six-hour 
class. Fee includes supplies.

The West Bend Gallery of Fine 
Arts is located at 300 South 6th 
Avenue in downtown West Bend 
Normal gallery hours are 
Wednesday through Saturday 
10:00 a m. • 4:30 p.m. and Sun­
day, 1:00 - 4:30 p m For more in­
formation call the gallery at 
334-9638
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25 Years Ago
OCTOBER 27, 1967

A class of 40 little children con­
sisting of 18 boys and 22 girls will 
receive their First Holy Commu­
nion during the 8 a.m. Mass at 
Holy Trinity Catholic Church in 
Kewaskum on Sunday morning, 
October 29. The Rev. John T. 
Budde, Pastor, will be celebrant. 
A list of the first communicants of 
Holy Trinity School follows: Kaye 
Bauer, Cheryl Beisbier, Patricia 
Beisbier, Mark Boden, Mary 
Bonlender, Bryant Borland, 
Gerald Bruessel, Jacqueline 
Coulter, Jennifer Coulter, Susan 
Dillinger, Carole Dreher, Kristine 
Dreher, Carole Fell, Ronald 
Felten, Brenda Gruber, Craig 
Gruber, Gary Herman, Allan 
Jaeger, Nancy Kaehne, Richard 
Katzenberger, Victoria Key, Karen 
Konkel, Keith Lawrenz, Christine 
Nigh, Timothy Perkins, Theresa 
Reindl, Jodi Ritger, Jean Scan­
nell, Jennifer Schaub, David 
Schoofs, Anthony Simon, Renee 
Sieger, Jack Staehler, Kevin 
Volm, Larry Westerman, Daniel 
Tyda. Children of the Saturday in­
struction class who will receive 
their First Communion include 
Linda Baier, Kim Krueger, Merlin 
Tackes, Steve Tackes. Serving as 
little flower girls and boys for the 
first communicants will be 
Dorothy Gruber, Barbara Kober, 
Kelly Scannell and Richard 
Schoofs.

The first snow of the fall season 
fell on this area late Tuesday 
night, following a day of heavy 
rains and high winds. The 
temperature dropped from the low 
60 s in the afternoon to the low 
30’s at night, changing the rain to 
snow. The howling wind whipped 
the snow into a small blizzard 
around midnight but it did not last 
long and the snow melted soon 
after hitting the ground. There 
was also a mixture of snow flur­
ries and rain Wednesday 
morning.

A daughter was born to Mr. and 
Mrs. Donald Klein, Route 2, 
Kewaskum on October 23. A son 
was born to Mr. and Mrs. Wilmer 
Klahn, Route 2, Kewaskum, on 
October 24. A son was also born 
to Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence 
Wickert, West Bend on October 
22. Mrs. Wickert is the former 
Nancy Fickler, daughter of Mr 
and Mrs. Edwin Fickler of 
Kewaskum.

Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Krueger, 
West Bend, adopted a daughter, 
Barbara Jean. Mr. Kluever is the 
son of Mrs. Norma Kluever, 
Kewaskum, and Mrs. Kluever is a 
daughter of Mrs. Lorena Peter- 
mann, Route 2, Campbellsport 
Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Markus. 
Route 2. Kewaskum, adopted a 
son, Steven James.

50 Years Ago
OCTOBER 30, 1942

Homecoming festivities at 
Kewaskum High School 
culminated in the all school dance 
in the school gym Friday night A 
grand march led by the 
Homecoming king, Glen Abel, 
and his queen. Ursula Thull. set 
the spirit of the dance. Behind 
them, marched the queen’s court 
of honor and their escorts: Marion 
McElhatton and Arthur Buss: 
Deanne Backus and Leo Thull: 
Mary Bremser and Bob Brauchle; 
LaVerne Siegfried and Ollie 
Staehler; Shirlee Backus and 
Harold Lehnerz and Delores 
Hammen and Dave Bartelt. The 
evening was devoted to dancing 
amid the gay cornstalks and pum­
pkins spread throughout the

room. Earlier in the day, the 
queen and her attendants made 
two public appearances. Resplen­
dent in formals and tiaras, the 
court of honor sat enthroned on 
the main float of the homecoming 
parade, decorated in gleaming, 
wind rippled white crepe paper. 
The parade left school at 1 p.m. 
proceeded west to Fond du Lac 
Avenue, down to the drug store, 
down Main Street to Wietor’s cor­
ner, up Main Street to the depot, 
from the depot to Remmel Mfg. 
and back to school for the game. 
At 2:15 p.m. the queen surround­
ed by her attendants, began the 
game by throwing onto the field 
of play, the football.

On Friday night, Oct. 23, a 
group of relatives and friends 
gathered at the home of John H. 
Faber in this village to celebrate 
his 25th year of faithful service to 
the Amity Leather Products Com­
pany of West Bend.

The second fall festival spon­
sored by Holy Trinity Congrega­
tion will be held in the parish 
school rooms and hall on Sunday, 
Nov. 8. The event will be held in 
the afternoon and evening, star­
ting at 2 p.m. Plans are nearly 
completed to provide a wide varie­
ty of games and amusements, in­
cluding poultry bingo. 
Refreshments and lunch will be 
served.

The people of Washington 
County can expect a third phase 
of total countywide blackout 
within the near future according 
to citizens defense corps officials. 
Application has been made to the 
sixth service command of the 
United States army for the third 
stage test with date and time to 
be unannounced. District control 
centers will be notified through 
the air raid warning system. The 
public will be alerted through the 
medium of sirens, whistles, 
emergency rings on rural 
telephone lines and such addi­
tional means as have been ar­
ranged in the various com­
munities for alerting the public. 
While the first and second stage 
blackout practices were pro­
nounced as successful, it is only 
through the medium of a surprise 
alert that the county can have the 
assurance that it is fully prepared 
for the real emergency.

An 8 pound baby boy was born 
to Mr. and Mrs. Peter Bies of this 
village at St. Joseph's Hospital in 
West Bend on Oct.30. They have 
two other sons and a daughter.

Mr and Mrs Wilbert Schlosser 
of West Bend are the parents of 
a son born Oct 27 at West Bend 
Mrs. Schlosser is the former Ruth 
Runte of this village.

Dr. and Mrs. E. Allen Miller of 
Watertown are the parents of a 
daughter born Oct. 4 at Water­
town. She will be named

★ OPEN HOUSE ★

FOR SALE BY OWNER
Two-story, 2 plus bedroom home with full basement. Gas heat, 
low taxes, includes 28 ft. pool with 15x30 attached deck and 
a 9x12 storage shed. Cozy and efficient $79,900.

1326 Kewaskum Street
PHONE 626-8285

Elizabeth Ann. Dr. Miller is a 
brother of Charles Miller of this 
village and fomerly resided here. 
The Millers also have a son, Ed­
ward Judson.

Mr. and Mrs. John Werner of 
Wayne received word of the ar­
rival of their first grandchild, born 
to their son-in-law and daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Schuppel, Jr. 
at St. Michael’s Hospital in 
Milwaukee on Oct. 24. Mrs. 
Schuppel is the former Shirley 
Werner. Her husband is a son of 
Mr. and Mrs. John Schuppel Sr. 
of Kewaskum.

75 Years Ago
OCTOBER 27, 1917

Official notice received from the 
Post Office Department at the 
local post office states that 
postmasters shall, on and after 
November 2, 1917, see that 
postage is paid at the rate of three 
cents an ounce or fraction thereof 
on letters and other first-class 
matter except drop letters. All 
drop letters, that is, letters mail­
ed for delivery from the office at 
which posted, including those for 
delivery by city, rural or other car­
rier of such office are required to 
have postage paid on them at the 
rate of two cents an ounce or frac­
tion thereof.

Accidently shot in the chest 
Sunday afternoon by his brother, 
Gustave, while hunting on Rush 
Lake, United States Senator Paul 
O. Husting, was fatally wounded. 
He died at 10:35 Sunday night. 
The charge of shot entered tore 
away part of his left lung. He was 
carried in an unconscious condi­
tion to a nearby farmhouse, while 
surgeons from nearby cities were 
rushed to the scene. The scene 
of his death was the home of a 
farmer living near Lake Station on 
the Chicago, Milwaukee and St. 
Paul road. Rush Lake station is 
but a short distance from Pickett, 
which itself lies a few miles north­
west of Ripon.

The sophomore boys of 
Kewaskum High School are trying 
hard to encourage the members 
of the school to raise a fund with 
which to buy them combs. Their 
old combs being worn from the 
constant use of combing their 
pompadours.

A baby girl was born to Mr. and 
Mrs Adolph Heberer of New Fane 
on Wednesday and a baby boy 
was born to Mr. and Mrs. John 
Oppermann, also of New Fane on 
Thursday.

A telegram was received here 
by Jos. Remmel Thursday from 
the American Red Cross at Paris, 
France stating that Adolph 
Meinecke. who was with Pershing 
in France, was one of the seven­
teen soldiers rescued when the 
U.S. troop ship Antello was 
torpedoed on its way home on Oc-

Washington County Free
Distribution of USDA Food

Washington County has receiv­
ed surplus commodity food items 
that will be distributed to eligible 
households on Saturday, October 
31, 1992, from 8:30 to 9:30 a.m. 
(as long as the supply lasts).

Food being distributed includes 
butter, flour, cornmeal, peanut 
butter, canned green beans, 
canned corn and canned 
applesauce.

Locations for the free distribu­
tion are as follows:

West Bend - St. Frances 
Cabrini Church, 615 Hawthorn Dr. 
(lower level parking lot); Hartford 
- St. Kilian School, 245 High 
Street (Johnson Street entrance);

tober 19. There were 70 enlisted 
army men on board and only 17 
of them were saved. The telegram 
states that Mr. Meinecke is at 
Paris and is safe and well.

The following is a list of the 
Kewaskum young men enlisted in 
the service of Uncle Sam: Corp. 
Jack Tessar, Corp. Edwin 
Backus, Sup. Serg. Ralph Petri, 
Private Arnold Hansen, Private 
Carl Schaefer, Private Walter 
Schaefer, Private A.L. 
Rosenheimer, Private Fred A. 
Schaefer, Private Jos. Wester­
man, Bugler J.P. Harter, Private 
M. Rosenheimer, Private Mike 
Darmody, Private Joseph Roden, 
Private Peter Beisbier, Private 
Nicholas Stoffel, Private Daniel 
Schrauth, Private Edwin “Spatz’’ 
Miller, Serg. Ralph E. Olwin, 
Private John Meinecke, Private 
Alfred Meinecke, Private Walter 
Mathieu, Ordinance Serg. John 
C. Dahlke, Lieut. Syl. J. Driessel, 
Private Carl Westerman, Private 
John Coulter, Private Gregory 
Hilmes, Corp. Edwin Miller, A.J. 
Harter U.S. Naval Reserve and 
Private Wm. E. Schneider.

PUBLIC AUCTION 
Kewaskum, Wl 

SUN, NOV. 1st, 9:00 am 
Inspection after 8:00 am

LOCATION: Hwy s 45 or 28 to Kewaskum, east at stop 8 go lights on Hwy 28. 3 blocks to County S 
then north 1% miles to PAUL AUCTION CO hall
AUCTIONEER'S NOTE: Estate of Rose Tesch. Hartford. Wl Large sale1 In addition to a fully furnished 
home in Hartford we have the contents of the Pike Lake residence Nothing removed or added A great sale 
HOUSEHOLD, ETC: GE ref freezer, Hotpoint self clean 30 in elec range. Upright freezer. Older refrig 
GE matching washer 8 elec dryer, near new, Zenith 23 in color console TV. Port B8W TV, Sanyo digital 
microwave; Pots, pans, dishes, glassware, etc.; Small appliances. Singer Athena 2000 8 Slant o Matic 
401 sewing machines; Lots of sewing stuff, material, etc. 2 recliners, Roll top 8 cylinder roll desks, Early 
Am twin beds, dresser 8 chest set, Lamp tables. Lamps. Typewriter 8 stand, Kirby vacuum. File cabinet 
w safe. Seth Thomas elec carriage chime clock. Radios; Lots of bedding, linens, etc.; Fruit jars. Folding 
picnic table Lawn furniture. Porch glider. Case 220 Hydraulic Drive garden tractor w mower deck, Rotary 
mowers, Lots of lawn 8 garden tools; Wheelbarrow, Elec edger, string trimmer, hedge clipper 8 blower. 
Step 8 extension ladders. Trash cans; Toro S 200 snow blower. Machinist's vise. Power saw drills, sander, 
etc; Lots of hand tools; Shop vac; Weber grill and much more usually found at a complete sale 
AUTOMOBILE & BOAT: 1986 Oldmobile Regency 98 4 door, 3 8L EFI V6, full power, air. cruise, tilt, metallic 
maroon w matching velour interior, 70,000 miles, looks 8 drives like new Always garaged 14 ft alum 
fishing boat; Older elec trolling motor

ANTIQUES & THINGS OLD
FURNITURE: Round oak pedestal table, 6 leaves; Square oak table, heavy fluted legs. Oak bachelor s 
chest, complete. Oak library table. Eastlake upholstered settee, ca 1880 Oak platform rocker w matching 
chair, Lincoln rocker. Needlepoint platform rocker 8 side chairs; Oak lamp table, rope turned legs. Parlor 
tables. Impressive 1930 s art deco bedroom set, double bed, vanity w large round mirror, chest of drawers 
8 night stand, beautiful figured wood. Outstanding 1920 s walnut sofa table, (2) walnut 3 drawer chests, 
1 spoon carved, Double brass bed 8 heavy iron bed wbrass finials. Matching 20’s sofa 8 chair, carved 
frame orig uph„ Oak Morris chair, Chrome kitchen set 1930 s kitchen set; 1920's walnut buffet. Oak 
claw foot piano stool. Press back 8 other rockers; Wicker lamp 8 rocker; 2 nice Lane cedar chests; Dun 
can Phyfe drop leaf table, 30 s dresser w'mirror; Iron base bench, Stick hall tree; 30’s magazine stand 
Oak office chair 4 caned ladder back chairs. 6 oak dining chairs. Assorted single chairs 8 other items 

ELECTRIC TRAINS: (The late Walter Tesch was Depot Agent for many years at Hartford 8 Slinger, thus 
his interest in toy trains I Lionel 2353 AA plus B diesel Santa Fe units; Lionel gang car; Older Lionel tin 
plate cars, 3 automatic cars; 275 watt transformer, Lionel accessories 8 1957 catalog; A F 300 engine 
8 tender, Marx Steam eng 8 3 passenger cars plus buildings, scenery, bridges, etc.
COINS & JEWELRY: (2) $10 gold coins, (9) $2% gold coins. Silver dollars, halves 8 quarters, plus misc.: 
Stone Mountain comm.; 50 ct diamond wedding set. 25 ct diamond cocktail ring. Black Hills gold, class 
8 other rings. Gold pocket watch; Wrist watches; Lots of costume jewelry;

THE REST OF THE SALE: Cuckoo clock w carvings; New Haven wall clock, Junghans oak shelf clock, 
Handel reverse painted table lamp, shade cracked; Oil lamps; Table 8 floor lamps; 7 in. adv sponge bowl 
from Ashippon, Roseville 8 Hull vases. Red Wing Bob White pitcher, shakers, plus art pottery, Figural 
cookie cutters; Junior coffee mill; Toy Singer sewing machine, mint. Early iron Betty lamp, Nic? fram 
ed prints, pastel, etc.. Matching twin size patchwork quilts plus an applique; Lots of fancywork, lace, 
doilies, etc, 1930's sewing cabinet. Frankart art deco ash tray. 1930 s Pabst tray, Slinger Foundry bench 
anvil, Majolica jardiniere 8 pedestal Bamboo fly rod; Sm granite pails. Cookbooks. Beaded 8 chain purses 
Articles of old clothing; Bisque 8 porcelain statuary; Glass basket Lots of Fostoria stemware 8 acces 
pc s Service for 12 Noritake Tuscana . 2 service for 12 silver plate sets. Figural salts. Lenox Nipper etc 
Nippon Trunks. Basketware Flexible Ryer sled and many other items Lots of interesting smalls

Charbroiled Brats Hamburgers 8 Refreshments 
Jim and Mike Paul 
Kewaskum. Wl 53040 
HI4) 338-3030

Appraisals - Real Estate 
Indoor or On-Site Auctions

Germantown - Senior Activity 
Center, W162 N11960 Park Ave.; 
Slinger - Village Hall, 220 Slinger 
Road; Allenton - Addison Town 
Hall, Village of Allenton; 
Kewaskum - Kewaskum High 
School, north entrance, and 
Jackson - Jackson Fire Depart­
ment, S. Jackson Dr.

Eligibility is based on the cur­
rent MONTHLY GROSS INCOME. 
(before taxes) of ALL household 
members with the following limits: 
Household size 1, income limit 
$851; 2. $1,149; 3. $1,446; 4. 
$1,744; 5. $2,041; 6. $2,339; 7. 
$2,636; 8. $2,934; 9. $3,231; 10. 
$3,529.

For more information, the 
public may phone 335-4610.

Home delivery is available for 
Elderly and Handicapped if there 
is no one in the household who 
can get to a distribution site. To 
make arrangements, call the 
distribution site in your area. West 
Bend residents please call 
335-4610.

Although no income verification 
information is required, a self 
declaration form must be signed 
by the recipient and is subject to 
state audit. You may also be ask­
ed to provide proof of residency.

This program is being coor­
dinated by the Washington Coun­
ty Department of Social Services, 
and handled locally by various 
volunteer workers in each 
community.

NOTICE: No other qualified 
person shall be excluded from 
participation in this program or be 
denied the benefits of, or other­
wise be subject to discrimination 
in any manner on the basis of 
race, color, national origin, or 
ancestry, religion, sex, disability, 
association with a person with a 
disability or age.



Ke
w

as
ku

m
 St

at
es

m
an

, T
hu

rs
da

y,
 O

ct
. 2

9,
 19

92
, P

ag
e 2

RUMMAGE SALE — Sat., Oct. 
31, 105 S. Fond du Lac Ave., 
Campbellsport. Inside - Lots of
stuff. 10-29-1p

FOR SALE — 1984 full size 
Blazer, black/silver. Great condi­
tion. Call 626-4493 after 5 p.m. or 
leave message. 10-29-tf

FOR SALE — Lowrey organ, 
good condition. Call 626-4850 
after 5:00. 10-22-2p

Put Yourself in the mv AQQiHiHnQ 
Marketplace, in the «“^» *“^

ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE
RATE: $2.00 up to 20 words; over 20 words • add 10c per word

NEW CLASSIFIED AD POLICY
All classified ads must now be paid in advance. Classified ads phoned in or brought 
to our office must be paid by noon on Tuesday of the week you want the ad publish­
ed. The ONLY exception will be for those businesses who have regular running ac­
counts with the Statesman.

FOR SALE — AKC - Dalmation 
puppies, shots and dewormed. 
Bred for beauty and temperment. 
$250 and up. Call or leave 
message (414) 626-2004.

10-22-4p

FOR SALE — 1977 Olds 98 
Regency, new paint job, 403 
engine. Call 626-2798. 10-22-2p

FOR SALE — Nintendo System 
power glove, Nes Max plus 
games. Call 626-2798. 10-22-2p

CIDER PRESSING — Empire 
Mills, W4478 4th St. Rd., two 
miles east of Fond du Lac on 
Hwy. T. Open Saturdays, 8 a m. 
to noon. Open Sat. thru Nov. 28. 
Call (414) 921-9509. 10-22-tf

FOR SALE — Bolens 8 hp. snow 
blower. In good condition. 
626-2776. Call Oct. 30 or 31.

10-29-1p

FOR SALE- Two sets heavy du­
ty counter type steel shelving; 3 
pegboards; some wooden shelv­
ing; 2 oil space heaters; wooden 
drawers & flour bin from old time 
pantry, wooden boxes, etc. Ph. 
626-2841. 10-29-1p

1992 WORLD BOOK 
Encyclopedia now 

on sale for Christmas 
533-4068

10-29-4p

FOR SALE — Great duplex in 
Village of Campbellsport featuring 
a two-bedroom and a large three- 
bedroom two story beautiful Vz 
acre lot maintenance free ex­
terior, 2-car block garage, 
$89,900. Professional Realty Co., 
Joanie Strobel. Call 626-4553.

10-1-tf

FIREWOOD FOR SALE — Finest 
quality seasoned red and white 
oak. Cut, split and delivered. $125 
cord. Immediate or later delivery. 
Inspections welcome. Phone 
922-1575. 9-24-tf

FOR SALE — Small home, 
Village of Eden. Three-plus 
bedrooms, nice lot on deadend 
street. $44,900. Call Joanie 
Strobel, Professional Realty Co. 
626-4553 or 334-0400. 8-13-tf

DOGSITTER NEEDED - Loving 
Lap for little toy poodle a few days 
here and there while her family 
takes a break. Call 626-4022. 

10-15-tf

CHILD CARE — Before and after 
school care available at 
Kewaskum Elementary School. 
Starting Sept. 14 from 7 to 9 a m. 
and 3:30 to 6 p.m. If interested, 
call 284-6595. 9-10-tf

HELP WANTED — General Store 
Antique Mall, Kewaskum. Does 
include weekend hours. Apply 
within. 10-22-2t

FOR RENT — Kewaskum. One 
bedroom first floor apartment. 
Close to post office and churches. 
No pets. $300 per mo., plus 
security deposit. Call 626-4392.

10-29-tf

FOR RENT — Spacious 
2-bedroom apartment in 
Kewaskum. Carpeting, ap­
pliances. No pets. Available Dec.
1. Ph. 334-5910. 10-29-2t

WANTED — 8 volt battery 
charger. Phone 626-2636.

10-29-1p

FOR RENT — Deluxe two 
bedroom apartment in 
Kewaskum, appliances included. 
Call 626-4321 or 626-2653.

10-29-tf

FOR RENT — Eden. Brand new 
deluxe two bedroom apartment. 
Includes garage, all appliances, 
air conditioning, washer and dryer 
in each unit. Cable ready. Call 
477-4561 or 477-4793. 10-22-2t

REDUCE safe and fast with 
GoBese Tablets and E-Vap 
“Water Pills" available at 
Kewaskum Pharmacy. 10-22-4p

HELP WANTED — Daytime 
cook, weekdays and weekends; 
adult waitresses, days and even­
ings. Eckl’s Main Street Inn. Call 
626-4328. 7-23-tf

HELP WANTED — Will do relief 
milking and field work. 
Reasonable prices. 20 years ex­
perience. References. Ph. 
1-885-2298. 10-8-4t

HELP WANTED — RN or LPN, 
casual hours, available on all 
shifts. No weekends. Small 26 
bed skilled facility. Come and join 
our friendly, professional staff. 
Contact Evelyn Schmidt, DON., 
Beechwood Rest Home, N1495 
W. Hwy. A, Kewaskum, Wl 
626-4258 or 994-4717. 7-2-tf

HELP WANTED — Certified 
nurses aides. P.M. shift with oc­
casional rotation to days and 
nights. Sign on bonus - com­
petitive wages. Come join our pro­
fessional, caring staff. Contact 
Evelyn Schmidt, DON, 
Beechwood Rest Home, N1495 
W., Hwy A, Kewaskum. Wl 53040. 
626-4258 or 994-4717. 5-14-tf

HELP WANTED — Nursing 
Assistant part-time, 2nd and 3rd 
shift for new group home in 
Kewaskum. Call Kathy (days at 
626-4990 or evenings at 
533-4037). 10-22-21

HELP WANTED — Nursing 
assistants, 2nd and 3rd shifts, 
part-time. Call St. Joseph’s Con­
vent Campbellsport. 533-8351.

10-29-2t

FREE — Storms and screens. Ph 
626-2045. 10-29-1p

OLD ORIENTAL RUGS
WANTED Any size or condition
1-800-443-7740 10-29-2p

“THEY WILL SPARKLE IN HIS 
LAND LIKE JEWELS IN A 
CROWN.” Precious Stone’s 
Stable. 533-5100. 10-8-tf

WANTED TO BUY — From 
owner nice three bedroom house 
in or around Kewaskum or Camp­
bellsport area, up to $60,000. Call 
533-5375. 10-22-3p

WORK WANTED — Lloyd's 
Home Maintenance. No job too 
small. Repairs, remodeling, 
carpentry, painting, varnishing, 
wallpaper, woodgraining, ceramic 
tile, etc. Lloyd M. Eberl. 533-8013. 

4-30-tf

FOR RENT — One. two and three 
bedroom apartments and 
townhouses. Rustic Timbers 
Apartments. Phone 334-1395.

4-30-tf

RESIDENTIAL — Building lots for 
sale. Approximately four miles 
north of West Bend. Terms: Call 
334-7306 Licensee/Owner.

4-30-tf

HAVE BUYERS — For country or 
village homes within 3 miles of 
Kewaskum. If you are thinking of 
selling, call Ann Enright, 
Hometown Realty of West Bend. 
338-5656 or 692-2607 collect.

5-21-tf

BICYCLES — Sales and Service. 
Wally’s Bike Shop, 208 North 
Ave., Kewaskum. 4-30-tf

SEWING — Will do light mending 
and alterations. Call 626-4495.

4-30-tf

TOM CLARK’S TREE SERVICE 
& STUMP REMOVAL — Reason­
able rates. Free estimates. Call 
626-2513. 4-30-tf

TIRES — There’s always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan’s Service. 
Goodyear and Uniroyal. 
626-2888 4-30-tf

WANTED TO BUY 
★ IMMEDIATE CASH PAID* 

Cash paid for one item or entire 
estate. Always looking for wood 
furniture, old tools, crocks, 
decoys, trunks, fish lures, toys 
and toy tractors, glassware, quilts, 
lamps, cookbooks, etc. Top prices 
paid - before you throw it out or 
sell it, check with me. Jim Walter, 
533-8731. 4-30-tf

CUSTOM 
BUILT 

HOMES
Your Plan or Ours 

Design Service 
Available

Kirst Builders 
411 Main St. 

Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
626-4392

Eden Knights Sat. 
Mixed Couples 

10-17-92
EZ Riders. 14-7; M&M’s. 14-7; 

W&W’s, 12-9; Pinheads, 11-10; 
The Udder Team, 10-11; Busy 
Bodies. 9-12; Strikeless. 7-14. 
The Fuzzy Four, 7-14.

Men's high series: Al Miller. 
584: Elsmer Zimdahl, 554,

HOME FOR SALE

Two story, four bedroom home. Full basement, gas 
heat, oak structure. 100x127 foot lot. 617 Main St., 
Kewaskum. Call 626-2329. $78,000 Must settle estate.

SHomhown
REALTY

OF WEST BEND, INC. 
2375 W. Washington St. 

338-5656 REALTORS’——a_
OPEN SUNDAY 1 to 4 p.m.

Dir: Hwy 45N to Old Fond du Lac Rd , right on Wildlife

Country Reflections Condominiums of Kewaskum
•Luxury 2 bedroom units
• In-Unit laundry
• 2 bathrooms
• Deluxe kitchen with appliances
•Garages and parking
• Beautiful view of Kettle Moraine Hills
•Be among the first for a good selection

Call Collect - Ann Enright, 692 2607

“Hr would like to thank the community for the 
wonderful response to this project. "

Ann Enright
John & Mary Ellen McElhatton

_________ Rob & Geralynn McElhatton

,7

YESTERYEAR LOG HOME 
Country Decorator's Delight

Restored hewn log home with gorgeous maple 
floors, firldstone fireplace, exposed beamed 
ceilings, open stairway, many kitchen c abinets 
One acre witn apple, plum, pear trees Coun 
try location with panoramic, views M0 $98,900 
Call Ann al 692 2607

* REDUCED - LOW TAXES *
4 bedroom Colonial on country acre I arge 
family room with natural fireplace; flanked 
by bookshelves formal dining room, many 
guality caoinets line Itie roomy kitchen 
Beautifully landscaped yard #24 Ask for 
Ann F might, 692 260 7

VACANT LAND
BUILD your new home in this quiet country subdivision 1 0? acres that pee s tor । onven 
tional septic, system $10 900 Call Darlene Kremer 3 34 9562 »200
OVER '/» ACRE parcel in r.ountry subdivi ,ion |ust minutes from West Bear) $9 300 Gall Darlene 
Kremer 334 9562 »202
WINDY ACRES SUBDIVISION I wo 2 acre < or,try loti Beautiful view Only $17 500 Call Ann 
collect 692-260 7 #216
7 $ BEAUTIFUL ACRES with Mini*'.re<>^ . ,ritiieq thru WojpOii / enir view »214 $28 900 
Call Ann Enriqht collect 692 260 7
2 97 ACRE WOODED LOT loped to the iith to'ru ergy eftir tent dwelling If you enjoy privacy 
and nature this lot is for you' *220 $23 900 Call Ann Enright Collect 692 260 7

OPEN SUNDAY ■ 1 to 3 p.m.
Town of Farmington DIRECTIONS: Hwy 4b S to Hwy H. East 

to Orchard Valley

CREAM CITY BRICK & LOG 
25 ACRES AND STREAM

Over ?000 sq fl makes this home a decorator's 
dehqhl Entertain on wood deck and in summer 
kitchen turned guesthouse #25 $149 900 Call 
Ann at 692 ?(>()/

NEW LISTING
Village of Kewaskum Colonial Four 
spacious bedrooms, family room with par 
tial open staircase, beautifully decorated, 
gualify construction Desirable location 
near park nib

George Muckerheide, 535.
Men's high game: Al Miller, 

224; George Muckerheide. 213; 
Elsmer Zimdahl. 203.

Ladies high series: Mary 
Laatsch, 536; Lori Muckerheide. 
491; Deb Wiesner, 461.

Ladies high game: Mary 
Laatsch. 188; Julie Miller. 184: 
Bev Zimdahl, 179

Darlene Kremer........334-9562
Ann Enright..............692-2607
Wendy Coulter..........338-3296
Agnes Jelic.............488-3122
Marilyn Filler.......... 338-0313
Lynn McBride...........334-9622
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Hunters’ Choice Permits In the 
Mail, Bonus Tags Sold by Phone

MADI SON--Wisconsin gun 
deer hunters should receive their 
hunters’ choice permits and 
bonus antlerless deer permits for 
the 1992 November season in the 
mail this week, Tom Hauge, 
Director of the Bureau of Wildlife 
Management, said.

The Department mailed out 
more than 341,000 hunters’ 
choice permits, including 224,000 
to hunters who requested only in­
dividual hunters' choice permits 
and 117,000 to hunters re­
questing both hunters’ choice 
permits and bonus antlerless 
permits.
“Hunters who receive the 

bonus antlerless permit notifica­
tion cards must mail the card 
back to the Department of Natural 
Resources by Saturday, October 
31,’’ Hauge said. Applicants must 
also include a check or money 
order payable to the Department 
of Natural Resources for $12 for 
a resident applicant or $20 for a 
nonresident applicant.

“The sooner it’s mailed back, 
the quicker we will be able to 
determine the actual number of 
permits left over in each deer 
management unit, and the 
quicker we’ll be able to make 
them available to the public,’’ 
Hauge said.

All of the bonus antlerless per­
mits will be processed and 
delivered to the applicants by 
Monday, November 16, 1992.
“Hunters who were not suc­

cessful in obtaining a hunters’

Art Hauser Doubles as Hall of Fame 
Inductee and Speaker at Rock Dinner

If you family name begins with 
a “K” or "H", you had a good 
chance of election this year into 
the Rock River Baseball League’s 
Hall of Fame.

And, if you played for Rubicon 
and were willing to travel a long 
distance to be inducted, you were 
halfway to Cooperstown.

Under these cnditions, Rock 
alumni favored a pair of Rubies in 
a mail election held over the past 
month by members of the 
league’s Oldtimers’ Association: 
Art Hauser, 62, of Cincinnati, 
former (1946-53) slugging first 
baseman, and Bob Kay, 54, an in­
fielder who spent 13 of his 23 
Rock River seasons at Rubicon, 
sandwiched between others at 
Neosho and Hustisford, and who 
now resides in Hudson, Florida.

But their geography does not 
diminish the lustre of four closer- 
to-home alumni who also made 
the elite Hall.

Oldtimer President Carl 
Heimerl, Jackson, announced this 
week that a tie in the balloting 
allows a total of six to be inducted 
on Saturday evening, October 31, 
at Hustisford's Firemen’s Hall.

The other two “K's’’ are prac­
tically neighbors: Beaver Dam’s 
Marv Klawitter, 65, a first 
baseman and outfielder for 
Burnett (1945-58), and speedy 
Bob Kampstra, 53, with 11 
seasons at first base and center- 
field for Randolph.

Tom Hartwig, 66, of Mayville, is 
the other “H’’. He was one of the 
league’s premier shortstops for a 
decade (1947-57), eight years at 
Mayville and two at Horicon.

Filling out 1992's honorees is 
46-year-old Al Alt of Waukesha, 
who had 13 years of his 31 home 
talent baseball seasons at 
Hustisford in the 1970's and '80’s 
as a RH no-hit pitcher, shortstop.

choice permit in one deer 
management unit, but who ap­
plied for bonus antlerless permits 
in another unit and were suc­
cessful, will receive notification of 
their bonus antlerless permit 
separately,’’ Hauge added.

Department staff estimate that 
20,000 to 30,000 bonus antlerless 
permits will be leftover for 1992. 
This total is down dramatically 
from the 90,000 permits remain­
ing in 1991 after the hunters’ 
choice application process.

BONUS PERMITS WILL BE 
PROCESSED BY PHONE

The Department will be selling 
this year’s remaining permits 
through a telephone ordering pro­
cess, rather than through DNR of­
fices... a process which last year 
caused long lines at offices 
statewide. The telephone order 
process will go on line at 8 a.m. 
Wednesday, November 4.

The' number to call is 
1 -800-695-HUNT. This service will 
be available 24 hours a day and 
hunters can charge their bonus 
antlerless permits to their Master­
card or Visa accounts, or they can 
be billed directly by the Depart­
ment. “This year there were 
21,000 bonus antlerless permits 
left over after we processed the 
hunters' choice permit applica­
tions and requests for bonus 
antlerless permit requests,’’ 
Marilyn Davis, DNR License Sec­
tion Chief, stated. “That number 
could increase depending upon

outfield and slugger.
Hauser, also a block of granite 

offensive guard (1954-'61) for the 
Bengals in the NFL and in the old 
American Football League, will be 
the featured speaker at the Hall 
of Fame Dinner.

In abstencia, the late Erv 
Buchert of Watertown, player and 
umpire, is to be enshrined in the 
Rock River’s Posthumous Hall of 
Fame.

Town of Wayne 
Proposed 1993 Budget

Revenues
1992 Budget 1993 Proposed Budget % Change

Taxes
General Property 120,000 140,000 16.7%
Intergovernmental Revenue 110,795 135,638

Licenses & Permits 525 825
Recycling 2,600 3,790
Miscellaneous 2^00

236,^20 283,253 19.8%

Expenditures
General Government 24,200 26,000
Public Safety 18,600 25,550
Public Works 138,2411 107,591
Recycling 3,000 3,000
Recreational 120 120
Debt Service 22,089 20,992
Capitol Outlay 20,000 90,000
Contingency Fund 10.000 10,000

^36,420 283,253 19.8%

The public hearing on the proposed budget will be held at 8:00 P. M. 
'Wednesday, November 18, 1992 at the town hall, 6030 Highway H. The town 
board meeting will follow at which time the budget will be approved.

Orville Kern, Clerk

how many of the 117,000 persons 
who have received bonus 
antlerless permit notification in 
the mail participate in the hunters' 
choice process."

There are currently 23 deer 
management units with left over 
bonus antlerless permits. Those 
units and the estimated number 
of bonus antlerless permits 
available include: Unit 1,870; Unit 
4, 470; Unit 6, 910; Unit 13, 810; 
Unit 14, 900; Unit 18, 920; Unit 
19, 1,970; Unit 20, 2,130; Unit 24, 
1,380; Unit 25, 850; Unit 28, 
1,090; Unit 29A, 830; Unit 29B, 
90; Unit 30, 390; Unit 51 A, 3,000; 
Unit 51B, 180; Unit 59D, 1,410; 
Unit 59M, 150; Unit 70, 780; Unit 
70A, 460; Unit 70E, 480; Unit 
77M, 850; and Unit 78, 300. (The 
number of permits will likely in­
crease depending on the 
responses from hunters who have 
received bonus antlerless permit 
notifications.)

The Department of Natural 
Resources will update hunters on 
the sale of the bonus antlerless 
permits on the television show 
“Deer Hunt ’92” hosted by Out­
door Wisconsin to be aired on all 
public television channels 
statewide at 8 p.m. Thursday, 
November 5, 1992. The program 
will originate live at the 
WMVS/WMVT Channel 10 and 
36 studios at Milwaukee.

West Bend 600 
Club Tourney at 
King Pin Lanes

The West Bend 600 Club 
recently held their 3rd Annual 
9-Pin Tap Tournament at King Pin 
Lanes in Campbellsport.

High single game of the tourna­
ment was a 288 game rolled by 
Cindy Volgmann. High Scratch 
series bowled in singles was a 
727 by Florence Kissinger. The 
High scratch series bowled in 
singles was a 727 by Florence 
Kissinger. The High scratch game 
in doubles was won by Kathy 
Rohlinger with a 743 series.

Prize winners (with handicap­
ped score) included: SINGLES - 
1) Kathy Schlefke, 784, 2) Wen- 
die Winkler, 776, TIE 3) Kathy 
Rohlinger, 761, TIE 3) Rosie 
Sarauer, 761, 5) Gloria Farvour, 
757, 6) Joan Loduha, 750.

DOUBLES -1) Cindy Volgmann 
& Lynn Judnic, 1496, 2) Ramona 
Dins & Helen kertscher, 1471,3) 
Carol Burns & Mary Crass, 1414.

“Stitt Named ‘Friend of Agriculture’ 
By Wisconsin Farm Bureau’’

From left to right: Senator Donald K. Stitt and Washington 
County Farm Bureau President Mark Pamperin.

MADISON....Volunteers for 
Agriculture, the political arm of 
the Wisconsin Farm Bureau 
Federation, recently named State 
Senator Don Stitt (R-Port 
Washington) a “Friend of 
Agriculture” for his outstanding 
commitment to agriculture issues.

Every two years the Volunteers 
for Agriculture committee 
evaluates state legislators on their 
votes and support on issues affec­
ting agriculture.

Legislators with exceptional 
agricultural voting records, such 
as Don Stitt, receive a “Friend of

Kangaroos can travel 40 miles an hour but they can't 
walk.

KLEMME BROSWELL DRILLING INC.
Kewaskum, Wl

Emergency Pump Service 
Well Inspection & Code Repair 

Pressure Tank Service 
Well Drilling 

Well Abandonment

CARL KLEMME 
414-626-4592

Agriculture” designation.
“As the backbone of our state’s 

economy, farmers need to be 
heard when public policy deci­
sions are made," Stitt said.

Legislative roll call votes on im­
portant agricultural issues were 
the primary criteria used to iden­
tify “Friends of Agriculture."

Votes on property tax relief, 
health care, biotechnology and 
property rights were deemed as 
critical to Wisconsin farmers.

The Wisconsin Farm Bureau 
Federation is the largest farm 
organization in the state with a 
membership of over 55,000.

State License 
# 5935
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By Statesman Sports Writer
SHEBOYGAN FALLS — 

Heading into last Saturday's 
WIAA Division II Regional here, 
the Kewaskum volleyball team 
had lost a match to just one op­
ponent, that being Eastern 
Wisconsin Conference champion 
Sheboygan Falls (twice).

So when Waupun eliminated 
the Falcons in a sub-Regional last 
Tuesday, the Indians had to be a 
bit relieved that they wouldn't 
have to face Falls again this 
season.

The problem was that 
Kewaskum would have to face 
Waupun in the Regional finals, 
where the Warriors showed just 
why they were co-champions of 
(he Little Ten Conference.

Waupun manhandled the In­
dians 15-3 and 15-6 in the open­
ing round of the Regional finals, 
on their way to a 6-0 record on the 
day, and earned the right to ad­
vance to Sectional play.

The Indians, meanwhile, 
bounced back from the opening­
round loss, and went on to win the 
rest of their games in the round­
robin tournament, also featuring 
Campbellsport and Mayville. 
Kewaskum finished 4-2, while

Campbellsport was third (2-4) and 
Mayville (0-6) fourth.

We had way too many unforc­
ed errors.’' Indian coach Dave 
Rizzardi said of the two games 
against Waupun. ' We didn’t hit 
the ball well at all.”

The loss was tough to take 
considering that Rizzardi still 
thinks that the Indians have just 
as much talent as Waupun, and 
even Sheboygan Falls for that 
matter.

"We can play with those two 
teams, if we play to our potential.” 
Rizzardi said. Pointing to the fact 
that his squad didn’t even reach 
double figures point-wise in those 
matches, he added “Obviously, 
we didn't do that...not even 
close.”

As disappointing as the loss 
was, Rizzardi was still encourag­
ed, and proud of the team for its 
effort the rest of the afternoon. 
“We really finished up strong.”

That typical strong finish saw 
Kewaskum beat Campbellsport 
15-8 and 15-11, while the Indians 
rolled over Mayville 15-11 and 
15-1.

“That was an outstanding way 
for our seniors to finish,” Rizzar­
di said of the final game against

the Cardinals. “We really had a 
great year, so that was nice to 
see.”

Serving, a strong point for the 
Indians all year, was once again 
a strength on Saturday. Of the 
112 serves on the day, the Indians 
missed just 6, while also chalking 
up 11 aces.

Leading the way was Julie 
Mertz, who finished her senior 
year with a 23x23 effort, including 
six aces, more than half of the 
team's total. Junior Ginger 
Wiesner also added a 24x 24 day, 
while Kim Sabish missed just one 
of her 20 tries, and also led 
Kewaskum with 17 assists in the 
three matches.

Despite having their troubles 
against Waupun, the Indian 
spikers also had a decent day. 
Senior Christa Schmidt led the 
team with 20 spike kills as well as 
three saves, while Robyn Winn- 
inghoff (nine spikes, 13 total 
points) and Beth Kempf (five 
blocks) also fared well.

”We had a remarkable year,” 
Rizzardi concluded. “We only lost 
to two teams all year. It's just 
disappointing that we didn’t play 
to our potential in those mat­
ches.”

Make Sure Halloween is Safe 
As Well as Seary, AAA Says

KHS Rolls Over Port Habitat Healers
By Statesman Sports Writer

KEWASKUM — Things went 
pretty much as expected in the 
WIAA Sub-Regionals held here, 
last Tuesday.

In the opening match, 
Kewaskum rolled to an easy 15-3, 
15-10 victory over Port 
Washington, while Eastern 
Wisconsin Conference champion 
Sheboygan Falls and Little Ten 
Co-Champion Waupun had to go 
to a third game before their match 
was decided.

When it was all said and done, 
the Warriors had ousted the EW 
champs 15-13, 6-15, and 16-14 in 
a wild match that sent Waupun, 
along with the Indians, to the 
WIAA Regional finals on 
Saturday.

Kewaskum had no trouble with 
the Pirates, although the Indians 
did play a bit sluggish in the se­
cond game. Fortunately, Port was

unable to capitalize.
“We sort of coasted through 

the second game,” Indian coach 
Dave Rizzardi said of the win, ad­
ding. "The competition wasn’t as 
tough, so we got away with it. But 
overall, we did about as well as 
we wanted to.”

Senior Kim Sabish did very 
well, as she connected on all 13 
of her attempts. Sabish also chip­
ped in 11 assists.

A trio of seniors did the job at 
the net. Christa Schmidt (seven 
points), Beth Kempf (six), and 
Robyn Winninghoff (five) all con­
tributed in the winning effort.

The second match was the 
highlight of the evening, though. 
Waupun got a dink and a spike to 
close out the third and deciding 
game against Falls, eliminating 
the previously undefeated 
Falcons, the only team to have 
beaten Kewaskum this season.

This informal, but informed 
group meets each Tuesday to 
pursue a variety of activities 
related to managing the habitats 
of Riveredge. Prairie seed collec­
ting, systematic surveys of prairie 
insects, transplanting of 
woodland wildflowers and just 
musing are all within the purview 
of activities of this work-learn 
group.

Anyone who thinks this sounds 
like fun may join in at Riveredge 
Nature Center on Tuesday, 
November 3. from 9 a m. to Noon.

Call Riveredge at 375-2715 
(metro) or 675-6888 (local) for 
more information.

Riveredge is a non-profit, 350 
acre natural sanctuary and 
educational organization, pro­
viding environmental programs 
for all ages. It is located in 
Ozaukee County, on Highway Y, 
one mile north of Newburg, bet­
ween Saukville and West Bend.

On Halloween night, young wit­
ches and ghosts will try to scare 
up some fun on the streets of 
communities across Wisconsin 
The scariest aspect on this night, 
however, will be the increased 
potential for auto accidents involv­
ing these young pedestrians.

"Halloween brings out costum­
ed boys and girls who are often 
too excited to look both ways 
before crossing the street," said 
Joe Laubmeier, spokesman for 
the American Automobile 
Association's Wisconsin Division 
“Dark costumes make trick-or- 
treaters difficult to see Worse yet, 
ill-fitting masks obstruct vision so 
children can’t always oncoming 
cars.”

Laubmeier offers the following 
tips to drivers, children and 
parents to help make this Hallo­
ween a safe one:

Drivers: Halloween is a 
dangerous time because of the in­
creased number of children on 
the street during the dusk and 
evening hours, according to 
Laubmeier.

Be extra alert for children dar­
ting out from between parked 
cars. Turn on headlights at the 
first sign of dusk and take extra 
care when negotiating driveways. 
With so many children on the 
streets, a right turn on red can be 
dangerous, so slow down and 
watch out.

Driving at least 5 mph below 
the posted speed limit in residen­
tial areas gives drivers and 
children a margin of safety.

Children: Trick-or-treat while it s 
still light and wear comfortable 
light-colored costumes that make 
it easy to walk, see and be seen 
Carry a flashlight. Trim your 
costume with special reflective 
tape that shines brightly in 
headlights (your parents can get 
it at most auto supply, hardware 
and sporting-goods stores) Trick- 
or-treat on well-lighted streets. 
Never dart out between parked 
cars in the middle of the block 
Walk on the sidewalk, not in the 
street If there is no sidewalk, walk 
facing traffic and as far out of the 
road as possible.

Parents: Be sure your children 
can see clearly. Enlarge eye holes 
on masks and have children 
remove masks before crossing 
the street. Better yet. encourage 
them to wear makeup instead of 
a mask. Makeup won’t impair vi­
sion, and it’s fun to wear. Accom­
pany your children or send an 
older brother or sister along. If so­
meone older can't go, kids should 
trick-or-treat with a group and tell 
you in advance what streets they 
plan to haunt.

Triple-A Wisconsin is 
distributing approximately 87,000 
free “Tips for a Safe Halloween" 
bookmarks to children statewide 
through the cooperation of local 
police departments. The 
bookmarks — featuring 14 
Halloween-safety suggestions— 
are also available at any of Triple- 
A Wisconsin's 12 offices 
statewide

Hunters Choice in Unit 69A, Not a Good Bet!

THURSDAY NIGHT MIXED 
Lighthouse Lanes 

10-15-92
Schmidt Funeral Home, 37-19; Fast 

Eddies, 33-23; Son s Trucking, 32-24; 
Crickett Communication, 30-26; 
Moose’s Watering Hole, 30-26; 
Walden's, 30-26; Lighthouse Lanes, 
30-26; M & R Bar, 29-27; No No's, 
29-27; Family Farms, 26-30; Tesker 
Mfg., 25-31; West Bend Moose Lodge 
1398, 24-32; Reindl Repair, 23-33; 
Threshold Thrashers, 14-42.

Mike Belongia, 599 (212); George 
Wagner, 598 (197); Jon Stenschke 
585 (233).

Judy Krajna, 599 (212); Eileen 
Mueller, 517 (194); Mary Ann Theisen 
507 (173).

INTER-CITY
Lighthouse Lanes 

10-21-92
Griesser Ins., 169-71; West Bend 

Air, 162-78; Venture Inn, 161’/2-78’/2; 
Park Ave Pub I, 147-93.

Bryan Goehring, 792 (256, 247, 
289); ‘Bonner’ Bonlender, 723 (235, 
219, 269); Tim Stoiber, 706 (221.249, 
236).

’5

DOORBEU, REPAIR

DON’S 
ELECTRIC
Electrical Contractor
•Residential Wiring
•New Construction
•Remodeling
•Rewiring
•Service Changes

FREE ESTIMATES 
Call 334-7565

Once again this year my phone 
has been ringing and people are 
complaining about not getting a 
Hunters Choice Permit in Unit 
69A. There was only one unit, 
state wide, where preference ap­
plicants actually lost, guess what 
unit — Unit 69A Some other units 
had unsuccessful applicants but 
they were all in the nonpreference 
category. Unit 69A had a total of 
1675 permits available and had 
5,600 people apply for the per­
mits, 497 were landowner applica­
tions and 26 were non-resident 
applicants. Unit 69B faired better 
1325 were available and a total of 
1605 people applied for the 
permits.

Hunters who applied for Bonus 
Permits and were successful for 
up to 9 permits in some Units, can 
send $12 for each Bonus Tag 
they want. This must be 
postmarked by Oct. 31, 1992 or 
received by the Departments In­
formation Center in Madison no 
later than 4:30 p.m. on Oct. 30, 
1992.

There will be an estimated

20.000 to 30,000 leftover bonus 
antlerless permits for 1992. This 
total is down from 90,000 permits 
remaining in 1991. The process 
for selling the left over permits this 
year will be handled by telephone 
rather than the long waiting lines 
at DNR Offices statewide. The 
telephone order process will go 
on line at 8 00 a m. on Wednes­
day, Nov. 4th The number to be 
called will be 1-800-695-HUNT 
The service will be available 24 
hours a day and hunterscan 
charge their bonus antlerless per­
mits to their Mastercard or Visa 
accounts, or they can be billed 
directly by the Department.

For more information on deer 
management units which will 
have Antlerless Deer Permits left 
over, contact your local DNR Of­
fice. There are no permits 
available in our area, most are in 
the northern and western part of 
the state.

Doug Bilgo, 
Conservation Warden 
533-5041 or 626-2116

BUNKELMAN 
BUILDERS INC.

BUILDING QUALITY IS OUR SPECIAL TY' 
RESIDENTIAL & COMMERCIAL

Building • Alterations 
Additions 

New Construction 
Remodeling

626-2511
'•PROFESSIONAL EXPERIENCE. QUALITY 

MATERIALS AND ATTENTION TO ALL DETAILS ”

8687 PROSPECT DR KEWASKUM
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Post First Winning Season Since 1983

Big Plays Help Indians Whip Kiel
By Stateman Sports Writer

KIEL — No team or coach likes 
to end their season with a loss, 
but the Kewaskum football team 
and coach Clark Pearson had 
more than that riding on their 
game with Kiel here, last Thurs­
day night.

A win over the Raiders would 
secure the Indians’ first winning 
season since they went to the 
State Title game in 1983, and 
would also be an added bonus for 
Pearson, who taught and coach­
ed at Kiel before coming to 
Kewaskum.

Trying to be spoilers, it was Kiel 
who was left with the bitter taste 
of defeat, as the Indians came up 
with numerous big plays in 
beating up on the Raiders, 22-8 
in the final game of the year for 
both teams.

“It was a great way to end the 
year,” Pearson said of the win, 
which upped Kewaskum’s 1992 
mark to 5-4 overall, including a 
respectable 3-3 in the tough 
Eastern Wisconsin Conference. 
‘‘I was real happy with our effort.”

The effort came against one of 
the EW's better defensive teams, 
although the Raiders had struggl­
ed the previous two weeks. 
Kewaskum added to the host’s 
woes, running up 256 yards of 
offense.

“They do a lot of stunting, so 
it basically becomes a guessing 
game,” the KHS coach said. “‘We

were fairly ready for it.”
“The offensive line again did a 

good job,” Pearson pointed out, 
citing Brian Bruendl, Chris Geidel, 
Justin Hanson, Steve May and 
Mark Morell. “They opened up 
some holes for our runners.”

Dan Schulteis was the main 
beneficiary of those holes, as he 
racked up 120 yards rushing on 
just 15 carries. Schulteis 6-yard 
scoring run in the opening quarter 
gave the Indians an early lead.

The run capped off an 83-yard 
drive that featured a 35-yard 
bomb from Jim Marx to Keith Her­
man on a third-down play. Marx 
hooked up with Todd 
Muckerheide on the conversion 
giving Kewaskum an 8-0 lead.

Kiel struck back quickly, scor­
ing in just three plays on their next 
possession. Raider QB Mike 
Schuler went the final 33 yards, 
scrambling from Indian defenders 
and into the end zone.

’“We had him trapped, but he 
got away,” Pearson said of the 
broken play run. Chad Sabel tack­
ed on the two-point conversion on 
a run, tying the score.

That’s the way it stayed until 
the third quarter, when Schulteis 
once again broke loose, this time 
for a 69-yard scamper on an off- 
tackle play. A change in the block­
ing patterns helped Schulteis 
break free.

‘We made a couple of blocking 
adjustments at halftime,” Pear­

son noted of the run, which was 
just the second play of the third 
period.

The Indians added a little in­
surance in the final stanza, as 
Marx scored on a quarterback 
sneak from a yard out. The score 
was set up by a 35-yard reception 
by Herman, as well as a beautiful 
grab by Aaron Pettier to keep the 
drive going.

“He actually caught it lying on 
his back,” Pearson said of the 
grab by Rettler, who eventually 
was rewarded with a scoring 
catch on the two-point 
conversion.

Defensively, lineman Paul 
Stoltzman and Shawn Larson 
were doing the job keeping the 
Raiders held in check. ‘‘Paul had 
a real good game,” Pearson said, 
adding ‘‘the defense as a whole 
played very well.”

“Marx had a good game throw­
ing the ball,” he went on, noting 
his QB's numbers (7 for 13, 95 
yards, 2 int's). ‘‘We moved the 
ball pretty well.”

The Indians coughed up the 
ball a total of four times, but also 
forced five Raider turnovers, with 
four different players (Beau 
Coulter, Herman, Brad Jackson, 
Tony Rix) hauling in interceptions.

‘They were pretty fired up about 
it,” Pearson said of his players’ 
reaction to the monumental 
season. ‘‘It’s something that they 
can be proud of.”

By Statesman Sports Writer
STEVENS POINT — The WIAA 

State Football Playoff parings 
were announced last week, and 
several area teams are included.

The Eastern Wisconsin Con-

KHS Drops in 
Final VB Poll

By Statesman Sports Writer
KEWASKUM — After hovering 

around the fourth and fifth spots 
all season long, the Kewaskum 
girls volleyball team saw their 
ranking fall in the final Wisconsin 
Coaches Association poll releas­
ed last week.

The poll finally moved Eastern 
Wisconsin Conference champion 
Sheboygan Falls ahead of the In­
dians, ranking the Falcons sixth, 
while Kewaskum dropped to 
number eight, garnering 22 votes.

Waunakee and Westosha Cen­
tral, which had both been ranked 
on top of the poll during the 
season, finishing in a first-place 
tie, each collecting 56 votes, while 
Lakeland was a close third with 50 
votes.

Wisconsin Coaches 
Association

Girls Volleyball Poll 
Division II

1. (tie) Waunakee, Westosha Central, 56 
votes each. 3. Lakeland, 50; 4. (tie) 
Pewaukee, Waupun, 35; 6. Sheboygan 
Fall, 32; 7. Portage, 27; 8. KEWASKUM. 
22; 9. Manitowoc Lutheran, 10; 10. 
Seymour, 8.

Honorable Mention - Barron, Shawano, 
Whitewater, DeForest.

ference will be represented by 
champion Sheboygan Falls (8-1) 
and runner-up Plymouth (3*4). 
Falls will play in Division III, open­
ing at Berlin (8-1) on Tuesday 
night. Plymouth, meanwhile, will 
host Kaukauna (6-3) in a Division 
II contest.

In other opening-round games, 
Little Ten champion Hartford (8-1) 
will host Green Bay East (6-3) in 
a Division I showdown, while LT 
runner-up Oconomowoc (7-2) will 
play at Sun Prairie (9-0).

In Division II, Germantown (7-2) 
will play at Greendale (8-1), while 
in Division IV, undefeated 
Mayville (9-0) will play Reedsville 
(7-2) in a game at Kiel.

A couple of area squads will 
also be in Division III, with Slinger 
(8-1) playing at Elkhorn (7-2) and 
Campbellsport (8-1) taking on 
East Troy (8-1) at Kettle Moraine.

Slinger’s only loss of the year 
was at Kewaskum (22-13), while 
Campbellsport (26-6), Plymouth 
(12-0) and Sheboygan Falls (20-0) 
all beat the Indians in games this 
year.

Freshman Complete Undefeated Football Season
By Statesman Sports Writer

KEWASKUM — What is with 
this Kewaskum High School 
Class of 1996? Haven’t they 
learned yet that winning isn’t 
everything?

Apparently not, as a second 
freshman sports team recently 
completed its season without a 
loss. This time it was the Indian 
freshman football team, which 
posted season-ending wins over 
New Holstein and Kiel to finish the 
year 6-0-1.

“It very-well may be the first 
time ever,” freshman coach Jim 
Westphal said of his team’s ac­
complishment Westphal said that 
he and other coaches can’t 
remember a freshman football 
team finishing the season without 
a loss in at least 25 years. "It’s a 
very good possibility” that it has 
never happened, he added.

And it's a good possibility that 
a KHS team on any level has not 
been as dominant as the young 
Indians were this year. The In­
dians outscored their opponents 
this year 206-32, an average 
margin of victory of almost 34 
points!

“Our defense played extreme­
ly well the entire year,” Westphal 
said, noting that foes scored a 
total of five touchdowns against 
the Indians this year, two of which 
came on kickoff returns late in the 
game. “Teams had a very difficult 
time moving the ball against us.”

The only team to do anything 
offensively against Kewaskum 
was Plymouth, which accounted 
for the lone blemish on their mark, 
a 12-12 tie. Plymouth, too finish­
ed the year undefeated.

Against New Holstein, Aaron 
Kurth scored three touchdowns 
on runs of 10, 43 and 60 yards, 
as the Indians rolled 46-8. “He 
had a big day," Westphal said of 
Kurth, who has shared backfield 
duties with Jesse Koch 
throughout the year.

Koch also contributed against

the Huskies, scoring on a 55-yard 
TD run, while Peter Reis, subbing 
for injured QB Brian Butschlick, 
threw a 25-yard TD pass to Joel 
Rettler, and added a 12-yard TD 
scamper, as Kewaskum rolled to 
a 30-0 halftime lead.

The Indians had a bit tougher 
time against Kiel, as they led just 
14-0 at the half. Kurth scored on 
a touchdown run, while Koch mat­
ched Kurth’s effort against New 
Holstein, running for three scores.

“They've shared the duties 
pretty much the whole season,” 
Westphal said of his 1-2 punch in 
the backfield. “But I think our 
defense was once again the key. 
It gave our offense plenty of op­
portunities.”

The undefeated year follows 
three consecutive 4-2 seasons at 
the freshman level. And while he 
can’t exactly pinpoint the reasons 
for the recent success. Westphal 
is encouraged by the participation 
in the community’s youth flag 
football program.

“I think it definitely helps,” 
Westphal said, although qualify­
ing the response some. “It’s hard 
to say just how much it helps, 
however. There are some major 
differences," such as the block­
ing and tackling aspects, he said. 
But overall. "It sure doesn’t hurt."

TOWN & COUNTRY 
Lighthouse Lanes 

10-20-92
Fromm's, 40-16; Noble Construc­

tion. 40-16; Quality Cabinets, 31-25; 
Carl’s Choice Liquor, 31-25.

Tim Fechter 621 (236).

Let CertainTeed 
Warm You

FREE 
JACKET 
OFFER

Inside and Outside 
Your Home.

CertainTeed El
Fiber Glass Insulation

You can get a FREE JACKET when you 
buy ten or more packages of CertainTeed 
Fiber Glass Building Insulation! Offer 
limited and restrictions apply. See our 
display for complete details.

Campbellsport 
Building 

Supply
227 W. Main St., Campbellsport 

Phone 533-4412


