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Girls Lose to State Champions School Lunch Program Controversy 
Major Topic of Board Meeting

See photos on 
pages 6 and 7

The Kewaskum High School 
girls basketball team, making 
their first appearance since 
its recent inception, lost out 
in the WIAA Girls State Tour 
nament in the fieldhouse at 
Madison Friday but it took 
the best Class B team in the 
slate, the state champion Cu­
ba City girls to do it.

Unbeaten Cuba City, with 
a perfect 23 0 record on the 
season, had Io come from be­
hind in the last quarter to 
beat Kewaskum, 53-45 The 
Cubans went on to defeat 
Omro Saturday afternoon. 
50 41, for the state title

By luck of the draw. Ke­
waskum drew Cuba City in 
the first game. Most writers 
and the two coaches were of 
the opinion that these were 
the two best teams and thh 
was the best game of the tour­
nament, also that Kewaskum 
could have beaten both Omro 
and Mondovi Kewaskum 
gave Cuba City a closer bat 
tie than Omro did in the 
championshin game.

Kewaskum was ahead of 
Cuba City most of three quar­
ters, leading by as much as 
five points late in the third 
quarter. The Cubans didn’t 
take the lead until 6 minutes, 
47 seconds remained in the 
game It took a 22 point last 
quarter to pull out the wm 
The score at the end of game 
was the biggest margin the 
Cubans had all night as the 
Indians tired on the big court 
in the closing minutes, while 
the Cubans became aggres­
sive and pressed, which won 
for them.

The Indians still might 
have won were it not for poor 
free throw shooting in the 
last quarter and the fact that

KEWASKUM CROWD — 
Kewaskum fans supported 
their girls at Madison. Seven 
bus loads, including five for 
students and one each for the 
band and adults, together 
with about 100 more indivi­
duals who drove themselves 
were on hand for the Cuba 
City - Kewaskum game Fri­
day night. About 400 local

they lost their top scorer, all 
conference player Julie Sof 
fel on fouls

Cuba City coach, Syd Sin 
cock, said he believed Ke­
waskum was the second best 
team in the state and that the 
Indians gave them the tough 
est game of the year Ke was 

•kum coach Mike Theiler also 
was of the opinion his team 
was right behind or rated 
pretty even with Cuba City 

.Theiler said his team didn’t 
play too well defensively nor 
execute enough on offense in 
the second half.

Sparked by Stoffel’s 11 
points in the first half. Ke­
waskum led at the quarter by 
3 points, 118. and by 2 at 
halftime, 26-24. Junior Deb 
Trane! led the Cubans by 
scoring 14 of her game high 
16 points in the nip and tuck 
first half. She also fouled out 
in the final quarter b”4 was 
picked up by Mary Leifker 
and reserve Linda Brown, 
who each scored all of their 
10 points in the second half 
Lynn Timmerman of the Cu­
bans set a Class B record 
with her 19 rebounds Ke 
wask urn’s Stoffel was close 
behind with 15 rebounds 
Sonh Yvonne Schacht, a hard 
worker, took second honors 
for the Indians with 12 noints 
although she was hitting the 
hoons better al! year.

Kewaskum shot only 50 per

fans were there In all. Part 
of the Kewaskum crowd, 
which whooped it up for the 
Indians, is shown in the 
photo at the University of 
Wisconsin fieldhouse. The Ke 
waskum girls received much 
publicity and many pictures 
In the Madison. Milwaukee 
and area newspapers.

cent, com oared to the Cubans 
65 per cent from the free 
throw line Coach Theiler said 
the “pathetic shooting” at the 
free throw line was a major 
reason for the defeat.' He al­
so was disappointed with the 
officiating, especially on Cu­
ba City’s traveling violations 
in their final minutes when 
they made their drive. He 
thought Stoffel also had some 
bad fouls called on her.

The Indians finished their 
season with a respectable 15-7 
record

There were some tears shed 
in the locker room but the 
girls have nothing to be ash 
amed of. They made history 
And there’s also next year 
when three of the girls who 
saw much action will be back

(Continued on Page 12)

Candidates Forum 
At High School

Communicate with the can 
didates Tuesday, March 29, 
at the Kewaskum High 
School cafeteria. The candi­
dates for Village Board will 
participate in a forum at 7:00 
p. m. The forum for School 
Board candidates will begin 
at 8:00 p. m.

The Kewaskum Junior Wo­
man’s Club and the League 
of Women Voters of Wash­
ington County are sponsoring 
this informational evening. •

Computers, lunch programs 
and staffing for next year 
were the major topics of the 
Kewaskum School Board 
meeting held Monday even­
ing.

Carl Roerdanz of CESA 16 
was at the meeting to de­
monstrate computer termin­
als, and the uses schools put 
them to. Both the education­
al programs available with 
the CESA computers and the 
budgeting, payroll and ac­
counting systems were dis­
cussed. The board has been 
considering going to the com­
puter system primarily to 
handle the requirements of 
the new state accounting sys­
tem which will be fully in ef­
fect by the 1979 - 80 school 
year, but other benefits wilt 
also be realized.

Added costs for the compu­
ter system is estimated at 
$7,000 a year, which does not 
include the original cost of 
the local terminal Th s cost 
would be a one-time expendi­
ture and would cost between 
$4,000 and $6,600 While the 
system will probably not re­
duce present bookkeeping 
staff requirements it was ex­
plained that it will most 
likely eliminate the need to 
add staff to handle the more 
complicated requirements of 
the new system.

A report on the lunch pro­
gram presented by Mr Bren 
holt was adopted by the 
board The report was in res 
ponse to comments and pro 
posals made at the previous 
meeting by a committee of 
the Farmington PTO The re­
port, as adopted, follows

“At the board meeting of 
February 28, a number of 
comments and suggestions 
were made by a committee 
from the Farmington PTO

High School to 
Present Concert

The Kewaskum High 
School Music Department is 
pleased to announce a dif­
ferent type of concert for 
your listening pleasure. The 
program will be presented on 
Tuesday night, March 22, in 
the h'gh school auditorium.

The Jazz Band w'1l begin 
the program at 7 00 n m 
and will feature Nick Contor- 
no of Kettle Moraine High 
School as guest soloist At 
7 45 n m the musicians of 
Kewaskum will present sever­
al of their solos and ensem­
bles which they are prepar­
ing for the Selo and Ensem­
ble Contest which will be 
held at Grafton on March 26

It is hoped that the public 
will come to hear some of 
the truly outstanding musici­
ans of Kewaskumt

concerning the school lunch 
programs A good deal of 
controversy has resulted

A number of these com­
ments need to be examined. 
Tn some instances the infor­
mation given to the board 
was incorrect or incomplete 
Some comparisons were made 
with the lunch programs at 
Cedarburg and Milwaukee, 
and aspects of these pro­
grams were cited to suggest 
improvements to the Kewas­
kum program.

In general, the lunch pro­
gram at Kewaskum is a good 
one. To say that improve-

(Continued on Page 3)

St. Lucas Church 
Plans Centennial 
Services, Concert

In the year long celebration 
of its 100th year of existence, 
St. Lucas Lutheran Church 
will have three Centennial 
Services this coming Sunday, 
March 20.

In the two morning servi­
ces. a former Pastoral Assis 
tant of the Congregation, the 
Rev James Tiefel, who is 
now Associate Pastor of St 
Paul’s Lutheran Church in 
Saginaw, Michigan, will be 
the guest speaker and will 
speak on the musical heritage 
of the church in his sermon 
entitled "With a Song in 
Your Heart.” These two servi­
ces will begin at 8 00 and 
10 15 a m

Then at 3 30 in the after­
noon, an Organ-Choir Con­
cert will be presented by the 
Rev Tiefel and the Senior 
Choir of St Lucas In this 
concert, the Rev Tiefel, who 
is also an accomplished or­
ganist, will play some of the 
outstanding organ composi­
tions of the church Included 
in his concert will be: “Varia 
tlons of a Mighty Fortress” 
by Walther, Scheidt and Ben 
dor; “Trumpet Tune and 
Ayre” by George Philip Tele 
man; "Two American Com 
positions” by Gilbert Martin; 
"Psalm XIX” by Benedetto 
Marcello; "Variations on 
Praise the Almighty, My Soul 
Adore Him” by Jan Bender; 
"Chorale Variations on A 
bide, O Dearest Jesus” by Jo 
hann Pachelbel; “Three Chor­
ale Preludes on Jesu, Joy of 
Man’s Desiring,” “Wake, A- 
wake” and “If Thou But Suf­
fer God to Guide Thee” by 
Bach. He will conclude bis 
concert with variations of the 
hymn ‘10 God, Our Help in 
Ages Past” by Paul Manz

The Senior Choir of St Lu­
cas will sing 5 special ar­
rangements in this concert 
They are: “He is My Savior”

(Continued on Page 2)
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by Iceland Sateren: “A Chant 
of Praise” by Gordon Young 
“Hallelujah, Amen” by Geor 
ge Frideric Handel: “Praise 
God With a Shout” by Mil­
burn Price, and “Now Sing 
We Joyfully Unto God” by 
Gordon Young Children of 
the congregation will also 
present two vocal selections, 
“God’s Son Has Made Me 
Free” and “Yesterday, Today 
and Tomorrow ”. The Rev 
Paul Hoenecke is the director 
of the Senior Choir and Mrs 
Paul Hoenecke is the accom­
panist Senior Choir mem 
bers are Mrs Robert Stoltz 
man, Mrs Raymond Krueger, 
Miss Connie Ludwig, Mrs 
Richard Kohn. Thomas Mil­
ler. Mrs Alvin Barutha, Mrs 
Paul Hoenecke, Mrs Ronald 
Schmitz., Mrs Orville Breit 
kreutz, Mrs Eugene Muench. 
Miss Carol Muench. Mrs Mel 
vin Furlong. Miss Suzette 
Kleinke. Mrs Wallace Cudno 
hoske, Mrs Roger Groeschel. 
Miss Denise Groeschel. Mrs 
Lloyd KeMer, Mrs Eldon 
Ramthun, Dennis Krueger. 
David Cudnohoske. Dennis 
Reha. Wallace Cudnohoske, 
Howard Laubenstein and 
Mrs Thomas Milter

St Lucas Congregation 
extends a cordial welcome to 
residents of the community to 
attend any of these special 
services.

down by the tail end of a tor 
nado, no-one’s spirits were 
dampened Blisters have ah 
healed, and everyone is proud 
of his Trail Blazers patch

The boys are now working 
to earn their expenses for 
Camn, by holding a Pancake 
Dinner at Wayne School on 
March 18 from 4 30 to 9 n 
m. Tickets are $2 50 for a 
dulls and $1 00 for children, 
age 6 to 11 Little ones will 
eat free of charge Games 
will also be played, with pri 
zes for* everyone We hope 
the entire community will 
back the boys.

Any boy interested in io:n 
Ing the troon is very wel 
come The boys would also 
like to extend a snec'al invi­
tation to any man in the 
community who would like 
to work with boys, to join 
them, whether he has boys or 
not Tf your children are all 
grown, or if you never had 
any. or if they arc all girls 
there’s stil a dace for you

and you’ll enioy helvine these 
boys to grow up to be better 
pecnlo For -my information, 
call Jim BoeJkow a* 629 5154 
or Ed Markielowski at 629 
5830

Mrs. Lorinda
Schaefer Dies

Lorinda E Schaefer, age 
88 years, of Kewaskum, died 
at the Menomonee Falls Hos 
pital on Saturday, March 12, 
where she had been a patient 
for 11 days.

Mi's Schaefer was born 
Nov. 14, 1888, in Kewaskum 
to the late Mr and Mrs 
Louis D. Guth. On Oct 8, 
1911, she was married to 
John F Schaefer in the 
Peace Church, Kewaskum 
He passed away on Feb. 10, 
1939

Mrs Schaefer was a mem 
ber of the Kewaskum Wo­

man’s Club and the XYZ 
Club of Kewaskum

Survivors include two sons. 
John L (Wilma) of Rich­
field, William F (Kathryn) 
of Kewaskum. and one 
daughter. Kathleen (Paul) 
Kra! of Milwaukee: eight 
grandchildren: 18 great 
grandchildren: one sister. 
Mrs. Lydia Holtz of Milwau­
kee: two sisters-in-law. Ade­
laide Schaefer of Milwaukee 
and Lazetta Knickel of Camp­
bellsport: nieces, nephews 
other relatives and friends.

Visitation at M’ller’s Fun­
eral Home, 215 Forest Ave.. 
Kewaskum, was after 4 n m 
Monday and at Peace United 
Church of Christ from 12 
noon until the time of servi 
ces at 2 p. m Tuesday. Pas 
tor Darrell Joiner officiated 
and burial was in the church 
cemetery.

Memorial tributes to the 
Cancer Fund would be appro 
ciated

ANNA K. HATZUNG

Anna K. Hatzung, nee 
Krebs, of 533 Riverview Dr., 
West Bend, passed away at 
the Samaritan Home and 
Hospital on Monday, March 
7, at the age of 89 She was 
the mother of Ruth (Leroy) 
Muckerheide of Kewaskum 
The funeral was held Friday 
at West Bend.

OerVs
BEAUTY SALON

114 Main St. • 
Featuring 

Helene Curtis UNIPERMS 
in Savings A Loan Bldg. 

(Rear Entrance) 
PHONE 626 4455

Town of Wayne 
Boy Scouts Plan 
Pancake Dinner

On Feb. 12, every boy in 
Boy Scout Troop 771, Town 
of Wayne, took part in this 
year’s Klond'ke Derby, in the 
Kettle Moraine State Park, 
bringing home an Award of 
Merit and Honor, one of the 
highest honors awarded

Although the troop has 
been active only about 1*6 
years, they have participated 
in every event scheduled by 
the district, and have also 
held other events of their 
own. Outstanding among 
these was a 17 mile Trail 
Blazer Hike at Wabeno. Wis . 
in which scouts and their fa 
milies participated Everyone 
camped for the weekend at 
Wabeno, and although some 
of our tents were blown

Hunt

Joon of Arc, Light Red 

KIDNEY
BEANS

01 TF 1Bottle J ■

Del Monte, Lite Chunk

Bottle

Mighty Foine Fresh Fruits and Vegetables!

CREAMETTE J
I SHELLS /

California Seedless

NAVEL ORANGES

L Rosenheimer
CONSUMER REPORT:

Tis No Blarney ... We Shillelagh Prices!

KETCHUP TUNA FISH

OREGON 
TRAlL 

PURP^ PLUMS

WESTERN 
RICHELIEU ^<Zd SAUCE 
HUNT TOMATO PASTE 
BALLARD CRESCENT ROLLS

SAVE $1.00
on Any TURKEY 

in Stock
With This Coupon

Good only at L. Rosenheimer 
Cash Value l/20th of 1c

Coupon Expires March 26.

Dad’s
ROOT BEER

8-PACK QQc
16 oz. Bottles ^^ ^^

55

^t 1
53<^ 

35«

Doz.

Idaho Russet 
POTATOES

89
Winesap Apples 3 lb. bag 79c
CARROTS 1 lb. bag 23c

10 lb. bag 
$1.19

Our “Irish Buys"
Golden Valley

Whole or Cream

CORN

Will Make You Smile!
Golden Valley 

Green or Wax

I BEANS

PEAS & CARROTS 
HUNT TOMATOES 
WESSON OIL 
PINK SALMON

FONTANA

GRAPE JELLY

79i

Golden 
Valley
Whole 
Peeled

e
Vegetable

29< 
^' 39< 

£: S1.64 
£ 51.69

Golden Volley 
Yellow Cling

PEACHES
Urregul.r J| M^ _ 
^ 49c

MACARONI

15c OH 

BOUNCE 
Faixic Softener

*1.59
Strawberry Preserves M.29

WildernesscXPie Filling 2^79c
O' t es in this Ad good thru Tues

WORTH 4IK 
HILLS BROS. 

IHSTANT COFFEE 
?: $p8

Of

r
March 22.

WORTH 25c

; LIQUID
: • DETERGENT
! I $922 ^I | Bottle Coupon

I I Offer n l It-, Sit Mar IS 

L Roacabatasat 
। 1 firmly

STOKE HOURS

Mon • Sat.
8 a ni. to 9 p ru

Sunday 
9 a m. - 1 p. m.



Board Meeting
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ments could not be made, of
course, would be wrong 
But this kind of statement 
can be made of virtually any 
thing which people do. While 

, this does not mean changes 
to improve the program 
should not be made, any 
problems there may be with 
our program are not serious, 
and certainly not serious e 
nough to create the kind of 
controversy which has oc­
curred.

Are the Cedarburg and 
Milwaukee systems self sun 
porting, as was stated by the 
committee? They are not 
The dietician in charge of the 
Cedarburg program stated 
that the district will pay most 
of her salary this year, and 
will subsidize the lunch pro­
gram to that extent She did 
say that she hopes this will

food is often served as an a! 
ternate or addition the fol 
lowing day Also, this hap 
pened at the end of fast year 
when foods were being used 
up. While the state superv's
or did not visit 
specifically, the 
port was a good

Farmington 
overall re- 

one. While
it is doubtful that it is ne­
cessary, it certainly would be 
possible to have someone vis
it the Farmington 
specifically, if the 
directs.

Whether it was

nrogram
board so

intended
or not, an impression was left 
at the meeting that the group
was also 
ness of 
kitchens 
cifically,

questioning the 
the cooks and 
at Farmington 

hair nets and
forms were mentioned

neat 
the 

Spe 
uni­

Hair
nets are required, uniforms 
aren't. Regardless of intent, 
because of the impression

not be necessary 
Also, Cedarburg 
a la carte menu 
to pay some of

next year
serves an

which helns 
the costs of

left, 
that
ness 
chen

it’s important to state 
the cleanliness and neat 
of the Farmington kit 
and cooks should not be

The people involved don’t 
lose their right to participate 
in the discussions, but these 
kinds of unnecessary disrup­
tions can be eliminated

2 If a group wants to ini-
tiate discussions with the
board after going through ad 
ministrative procedures, they 
should ask to be on the agen­
da. There was no apparent 
reason, in this instance, why 
the group could not have 
asked to be placed on the 
meeting agenda, and no an 
parent reason why this could 
not have been brought to the 
attention of school personnel 
first.

3 Board policies should be 
reviewed and policies written 
or rewrtten to assure that si­
milar procedural problems 
don’t arise again ”

The board by motion ex­

authorized for the high 
school for the present year.

A proposal for the middle 
school would add one teacher 
This would relieve some class 
sizes which have reached as 
high as 37 students during 
the current school year Six 
teen different class sections

Kewaskum Statesman
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agriculture teaching 
Both are effective at 
of the year.

pressed its thanks

197J

position 
the end

are 30 
eluded 
Middle 
Mty of

or over this year In­
in the proposal on the 
School is the possibi- 
eliminating the class

of science taught to Holy 
Trinity eighth graders

These proposals, along w:th 
others concerning staffing, 
will be taken up again at the

Teacher contracts were ap 
proved for 1977 78 Because 
negotiations are not complet­
ed, contracts will be issued 
on the basis of this year’s a 
greement.

The board expressed Its 
congratulations to the girls’

next board meeting
Resignations were 

ed from Mr Mader, 
at Beechwood, and

accent- 
teacher 
Mr Po

basketball team for 
Participation in the 
tournament. They also 
ed the student fans, 
leaders, band and ail

their 
state 

thank 
cheer- 
others

tratz presently in a nart time
concerned for their participa 
tion, support and good con­
duct at the tournament.

their lunch program.
Mr. Peterburs of the Mil­

waukee business office indi­
cated the USDA recently did 
an audit of their lunch pro 
gram and determined that 
the per meal cost was $1.05 
Obviously, if they are charg 
ing 40c and 35c, the program 
is not self-supporting. The 
DPI determined our meal 
cost to be just over 75c. Mil­
waukee will be considering a 
large increase in their char­
ges to bring the program clo­
ser to paying for itself.

We have always tried to 
charge everything except 
building (heat, lights, etc.) to 
our lunch program costs Be­
cause districts may report 
costs in a variety of ways, 
exact comparisons are diffi 
cult. Our lunch program costs 
appear to be very competi­
tive.

Should we have a dietici-

in question. Everything ap 
pears to be in fine order The 
report from the state also 
mentioned that all areas 
checked were clean and well

Gruhle for her 
vice as head 
district.

Mrs. Barbara 
sently working

years 
cook

to Mrs. 
of ser­

in the

Niehaus, pre- 
as a cook at

SAFE? 

EFFECTIVE?

DRAIN CLEANERS

maintained
The lunch 

not deserve 
has received

program does 
the criticism it 

Because of the

the Cedar Lake Home, was 
hired as the new head cook 
on the recommendation of 
Mr Brenholt. She will begin 
part time work with Mrs 
Gruhle immediately and will

ASK YOUR PLUMBER.

BIO-CLEAN IS!

H. Ram th u n & Son st* <|| ■■&'<£?? 
PI ITMniMn ^^■®*^&F\

manner in which this was 
handled, an atmosphere has 
been created which makes an 
objective discussion of the 
program very difficult. There 
is no apparent reason for the 
board to change the program 
at present. After the new 
cook has been in the position 
for a time, and has had a 
chance to discuss possible 
changes with the superinten­
dent, the board may be asked 
to approve changes which 
would require board action.

Beyond the considerations 
of the lunch program, there 
are some statements that

begin 
soon 
work 
early

on a full time basis as
as possible She
with Mrs 
April.

Gruhle
will 

until

Staffing for 
discussed, with 
this to added

1977 78 was
time limiting 

teacher re-
quests at the high school and 
middle school. Proposals at 
the high school would include 
an additional teacher in agri­
culture ■ industrial arts, one 
in science - mathematics and 
one in English social studies. 
These would replace the two 
intern positions which were

^ Kewaskum Ph. 626 2424
PLUMBING & HEATING

armacy

our
102

All Service Pharmacy 
Main St., Kewaskum 

626-8001
Tom Kennelly 

673 4981 
Emergency Service

John Boray 
673-6386 

Emergency Service

Complete Prescription Service

an ' Few programs presently 
do In talking with state de­
partment personnel, their re 
commendation was for a part 
time rather than a full time 
person. This, then, is some­
thing which can be consider­
ed at a later date if the 
board wishes The district 
would still be in need of a 
head cook Also, it is too late 
at this time to consider a dif­
ferent approach.

Are menus standardized in 
our district? Yes, there may 
be variations at times due to 
differing inventories, but in 
general the menus are stan­
dard.

Some comments were made 
about food quality At this 
point, it would seem the 
comments must be rejected 
At least three board members 
ate at Farmington on two dif­
ferent days and found the 
meals good. Mr Larsen indi-

should be made 
the approach i 
committee.

Most of the

concerning 
used by the

questions
raised by the committee were 
not policy matters, and, under 
any circumstances, should 
have been taken through ad­
ministrative channels If the
committee 
since last 
certainly 
wait until

has been 
April, the 
did not 
now and

working 
question 
have to 
then be

ROGER'S
SERVICE

Mobil

cated the 
do a good 
The State 
food was

Farmington cooks 
Job in preparation 
report said “The 

well prepared and
attractively served.” Certain­
ly some menus are more pop 
ular than others, and when 
serving large numbers it is 
impossible to please every­
one. Comments about prunes 
being served three days in a 
row are a result of picking 
an isolated incident, and they 
are unfair If there is food left 
from a previous day, that

brought directly to the board 
Because of the manner in 
which this was approached, 
the lunch program has receiv­
ed public criticism which it 
does not deserve. A contro­
versy has been stirred and 
hard feelings created which 
could easily have been avoid­
ed.

Three points should be 
made:

1. Community groups which 
have concerns should go 
through administrative chan­
nels. The task of the board 
is basically that of setting 
policy. The board should not 
get involved in questions of 
this type unless the commu­
nity group is not satisfied 
with administrative decisions 
made as a result of their 
bringing an issue to the ad 
ministration. In this case 
there would have been policy 
decisions involved, but if 
this had been handled in the 
proper manner, the policy 
questions could have been 
brought to the board as part 
of an administrative report

Your Automotive 
Needs 

With 
Many Years Experience

Major Tune-ups 
— o — 

Brakes & 
Mufflers

ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS

Carburetor Overhauls 
SHOCKS,0 TIRES 

& BATTERIES
24 Hr. Wrecker 

Service
8745 Hwy. 45 So. 

KEWASKUM
626-2888

Hair Appliances
Baby Needs

Chocolate House Candy

Back Supports and 
Surgical Garments

Everest and Jenning 
Convalescent Aids

American Greeting
Cards and Gift Wrap

Kodak Film and 
Camera Equipment

Photo Processing 

Electric Shavers 
and Repair 

Smokers Supplies 

Timex Watches

Cosmetics

of Kewaskum

Funeral Home
TWO BEAUTIFULLY FURNISHED CHAPELS
215 FOREST AVE. DIAL 628 2185

Fine Home Furnishings 
LARGEST DISPLAY — DECORATOR SERVICE 

STORE PHONE 626-2184

Dependable & Reasonable 
Since 1910
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Bavarian Inn ««i Kaffee Haus

Petries

authentic bavarian atmosphere

OFFERS COMPLETE

CATERING SERVICE
FOR

PARTIES - WEDDINGS - MEETINGS 
ANNIVERSARIES - REUNIONS 

FUNERAL DINNERS
Phone 921-9150 or 921-5440

FIVE GENERATIONS—Five 
generations gathered for this 
photo taken at the baptism 
of Amv Lynn Peterson, who 
Is being held by great great­
grandmother, Mrs. Ida Op

AMVVVWWMMMWVMWtf

WOOD SPLITTER
FOR RENT

By the Hour

Laubenstein

at. 2 Kewaskum 
Phone 626 2553

<<: GAMHH i>

J&J AUTO

day after day after d< 
Stop by and see all the 
beautiful new Bulova 
watches . gift-priced 
from $49 95
Hit: 17 jewels Woodtone dial 
Brown leather strap $49 95 
Hers: Goldtone finish. Cham­
pagne dial 17 jewels $54.95

SERVICE
Complete 

Automotive Service 
Air Conditioning 

Service
Tires 

Batteries 
Mufflers 
Brakes 

Major & Minor 
Engine Repair 

Ignition Repair
FREE Pick-up and 

Delivery in Kewaskum Area 
450 E. MAIN. KEWASKUM

PHONE 626-2311

permann. 9& Left to right, 
standing, are great-grand­
mother, Mrs. Mal'nda Gar 
bisch; Amv’s father. Leroy 
Peterson III, and grandmoth 
er, Mrs. Leroy Peterson, Jr.

Pet Patrol
If you have lost or 

found a pet, please call 
PUPPYLAND, 334 4640

Pupa, dogs, cats 
for adoption

Give 
something 

special... 

BULOVA

Choose 
the gift 
that tells how 
much you care ..

Bier's Jewelry

KEWASKUM

The Right Choice 
For Dependable, 
Economical Cooling.

Z^OTCentral 
«■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■•

NEW at 
Kettle Moraine Electric 

KitchenAid

Air Conditioning
Quiet
Isolated compressor.
Air discharge is up 
and away. Optional 
two-speed fan for 
extra sound control.

Thrifty
Large, efficient 
condenser coil 
delivers maximum 
cooling.
Rugged
Heavy galvanized 
cabinet protects vital 
components. Features 
weatherproof 
baked-on enamel 
finish

Service Ease
On most models 
service ports and 
valves are outside for 
quick refrigerant 
charge testing.

Before you make a major in­
vestment like central air con­
ditioning, find out about the 
Lennox reputation for quality 
and full-value comfort. Then 
call us for a no obligation 
home survey We have an ef­
ficient Lennox central cool­
ing unit just right for your 
home.

JOHANN, INC.
• Plumbing • Heating

• Air Conditioning
Sales & Service

located in St Michaels 3 miles east of 
Kewaskum on Hwy 28

Daily 8 - 5 30 Fri til 9 So’ til 3

PHONE
 334-9481

=NEED HELP=----------=
In selecting a place to hold your next group party? We 
have several suggestions as to where we can cater your 
party for you. Just give us a call.
84 N. Main St. Fond du Lac, Wis.

I

DISHWASHERS
BUILT-INS • PORTABLES
ENERGY SAVERS

There's a lot more to KitchenAid dishwashers 
than their good looks: Real versatility, flexible 
loading convenience, and a miserly use of water 
and energy. Beauty, reliability and economy. A 
value-packed combination from KitchenAid.

WE HAVE A MODEL TO 
FIT HER IVEEDS...

ANO YOUR BUDGET!

Kettle Moraine I 

Electric I

OPEN EVERY NIGHT TIL 9
Saturday 'til 5 — Closed on Sundays

S 1261 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum 626 2093 g
FINANCING AVAILABLE

Remember ... at Kettle Moraine Electric
£. . W? wytpe whp(.wf sell I find we service all other b'ands »
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BLOOD BANK
REMINDER

Area residents are remind­
ed that the Blood Mobile Un 
it will be at the old Kewas­
kum High School gym on 
Wednesday, March 30, from 
1:00 to 7:00 p. m.

If you are in good physical 
condition and between the 
ages of 18 and 66 years, you 
can donate every 10 weeks 
but not more than 5 times in 
12 consecutive months. If 
you are 17 you are also eligi­
ble to donate but you have to 
have the consent of a parent 
|or guardian. These forms will 
be available at the gym that 
day.

If you have had major sur­
gery, are under 110 pounds, 
pregnant, or traveled out of 
the U.S. within the past 6 
months, you cannot donate 
blood at this time. If you ever 
had hepatitis, jaundice, heart 
disease or diabetes, you are 
unable to be a blood donor.

Recording your confidenti­
al medical history, taking 
your blood pressure and test­
ing a single drop of blood 
from your earlobe takes a 
bout 15 minutes. The actual
drawing of the blood from 
your arm takes only 4 to 10 
minuses If you think it 
hurts, you’re wrong. Over 
6,000 people each month give 
blood to the Milwaukee Blood 
Center. They measure that 
momentary prick in their arm 
against the restored health of 
the patients who need their 
blood.

If you are qualified, can 
you give us a little of your 
time and one pint of blood? 
You’d really be putting some 
life into your society’

New donors are asked to 
call Sandy Remmel at 626 
2210 or Gloria Rodenkirch at 
626 4021.

Fill your water bed with beer and 
get a foam mattress.

RICH’S

and RESTAURANT

NOW OPEN 

— Ever} Day — 
Including* Saturday!

Regular Hour* 

Monday thru Friday 

6:30 A.M. til 11:00 P.M.

Saturday and Sunday 

4:00 P.M. til ???

SERVING BREAKFAST 
6:30 a.m. to 1 1 a m. 
Monday thru Friday

Home Made Pizza 
Breasted Chicken

PHONE 533-4448 FOR FAST 
CARRY-OUT SERVICE.

250 N. Fond du Loc Avenue 
Compbellsport, Wi 53010

Course Offered
For Area Women

Wednesdays are for women’ 
A course, “A Survey of Wo­
men's Issues.” will be offered 
by Moraine Park Technical 
Institute at Kewaskum High 
School from 7:00 to 9 40 p. 
m beginning March 30 for 
six weeks.

This survey will focus on 
subjects which may be of vi­
tal importance to you. The 
class will be open to men as 
well.

There will be six topics in­
cluded in this class.

1. “Legal Rights for Wo­
men” will include a discus­
sion that will focus on prop­
erty rights and family rela­
tions.

2. “Job Finding Skills” will 
focus on what employers arc 
looking for concerning re­
sumes and application forms 
Searching out the job that 
suits you will also be includ­
ed.

3. “Coping with Stress” 
will provide an opportunity 
to understand various causes 
of stress on our lives and 
learn ways of dealing with 
that stress

The 
WIGWAM

Kewoskum, Wi*. 
Phon. 626-2901

Open Daily 11:30 a. m. 
Short Order Menu

Ixcollont Dinners

FISH FRY 
FRIDAY

COCKTAIL HOUR 
4:00 to 6:00 

Mon. - Tues. • Wed. • Thurs. 
Martinis, Manhattans 

& Old Fashioneds

75c
ENTERTAINMENT
Thursday, March 17 

ST. -PATRICK’S DAY
BLACKJACK 

$2.00 admission 
includes 

CORNED BEEF and 
CABBAGE LUNCH

Friday, March 18 
SCOTFREE and 
LOGAN CAINE

Saturday, March f9 
SYLS POLKA DOTS

Wednesday, March 23 
BLACKJACK

Friday, March 25 
GNEURF

Saturday, March 26 
SHILO 

GOLDEN ROCK REVUE

We Will Be Serving 
SMORGASBORD 

on EASTER SUNDAY 
11:30 to 4:30 

featuring 
ROAST GOOSE & DUCK 

BAKED HAM 
FRIED CHICKEN w/dressing 
deep fried WALLEYED PIKE 

COMPLETE SALAD BAR 
Price — $4.95 Adults 

$2.95 Children 
(8 & under) 

For Reservations 626-2901

4 “Releasing Your Child’s 
Potential” shows the chance 
to develop an awareness of 
the ways in which we Um't a 
child’s development through 
sex role stereotyping and 
what to do about it.

5 “Understanding Our Bo­
dies Ourselves” is an intro­
duction to body awareness 
including fears and myths a 
bout the female body

6 “Meeting the Challenge 
of Home Management” is an 
emphasis on budgeting time 
and balancing the needs of 
your family with your own 
needs.

Registration for this course 
must be made in advance by 
calling Roy Esser a* 626 2166 
The fee Is $5 00 nayable the 
first evening of class

The first touch of Spring is the In­
ternal Revenue Service.

Prize Winners at 
Sno-Chiefs Dance

Prize winners at the Ke­
waskum Sno-Chiefs Snowmo 
bile Club dance held at Ame- 
rahn recently were as fol­
lows:

$300 Cash — Todd Backus. 
Kewaskum: $100 Cash- Bob 
Fellenz. Kewaskum: $50 Cash 
— William Chesak, Newburg: 
$50 Cash - Elmer St meh 
ing. Allenton: $50 Cash- De 
lores Gahagan, Cascade: $50 
Cash — Laura Gehing, She­
boygan Falls

Other prize winners includ­
ed: bottle of whiskey—Steven 
Amerling, Allenton; 2 chick 
en dinners — Alien Puestow. 
West Bend; bottle of brandy 
—Dan Balhazar, Fond du 
Lac; 2 horseback rides—Art 
Luedtke, West Bend; $5 00
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gift certificate—Ken Franke, 
Horicon; ^ gallon of wine— 
Norman Kutz, West Bend; 
gas can carrier—John Klahn, 
R 1. Kewaskum: John Deere 
stocking cap, Linus Herriges, 
Kewaskum: banana sweat 
shirt — Ann Burg, Kewas­
kum; pair of gloves- Mary 
Marquardt. Kewaskum; 6 
pack of chain saw oil — 
Yvonne Amerling, R 3, 
Campbellsport; one pizza — 
Jeanne Yeadeke, West Bend: 
bottle of wine — Joan Strue 
bing, R 3. Camnbellsoort: 
bottle of rock & rye—Marie 
Reigle. Kewaskum: $5 00 — 
Boh a Lenes Tap. R, 2. Ke­
waskum: Polaris cooler stool 
— Keller’s Tap, Kewaskum
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Film Presented 
At Jr. Woman’s 
Club Meeting

Vai Szymanski and Lu 
Steinert, representatives from 
the Big Brothers and Big 
Sisters organizations of 
Washington County presented 
the Kewaskum Junior Wo­
man’s Club with their March 
11 program, “A Friend for 
Joey,” a film depicting the 
types of parents and children 
who are referred to the pro 
gram through friends, rela­
tives, social agencies, church­
es, schools, or courts. Follow­
ing the movie, they took time 
to answer questions from the 
audience of Juniors, guests 
and members of the senior 
class of Kewaskum High 
School, to further explain 
how the program works. 
“Thanks” to both ladies for 
the very informative pro­
gram.

Following dessert and cof­
fee, the general meeting was 
called to order.

Judy Nycz (corresponding 
Secretary) read a “thank 
you" note from Jackie Wick 
land of the West Bend Chap­
ter of the Red Cross, for the 
Juniors’ donation of $15 to­
ward the cost of a projector, 
which the Red Cross office 
sorely needs.

Karen Matthies was intro 
duced as the newest member 
of KJWC We welcome Karen 
into our ranks and hope to 
put her to work as soon as

possible?
It was motioned and (hear­

tily) seconded to have our 
club included in the Kewas­
kum Statesman’s congratula 
tory message to the chamnion 
Kewaskum High School Girls 
Basketball team, which went 
to the State Tournament Win 
or lose, girls, we’re really 
proud of you (and Mr Thei 
ler) for getting this far!

Izzy Straub (Arts) an 
nounced that Snring Story 
Hour will again be held on 
Thursday mornings at the 
Kewaskum Community Li­
brary, from April 14 • May 
19. The first session runs 
from 9:15 - 10:00 a m and 
the second session from 10 30 
• 11:15 a. m There will be a 
meeting at Izzy’s house on 
April 7 to formulate further 
plans. She also requested that 
anyone having children’s 
books no longer needed at 
home, could certainly be 
used by her Story Hour com­
mittee. (So dig through your 
attics, girls!)

Izzy also asked for volun­
teers to attend a St Patrick’s 
Day get-together at the 
Beechwood Rest Home. In­
terested persons will meet at 
Valley Bank on Mar 17 at 
6 30 p. m and proceed “with 
the green” from there.

Hope was also expressed 
by Izzy (Home Life) that 
her committee might hold 
another Babysitting Clin’c — 
probably the first week in 
May.

Ros Kiefer (Cookbook Pro

ject) set a meeting of her 
committee at her home on 
Mar. 15 at 7 30 p. m. to coor­
dinate plans for distribution 
of our “Kewaskum Kettles" 
cookbook, which should be 
arriving around April 1.

Pat Redig (Education) an­
nounced that about 40 people 
attended the Parent Effec­
tiveness Train’ng session, led 
by Ken Schermacher, Psy­
chologist with the West Bend 
School System, in February, 
which we consider a fine 
turnout She also mentioned 
that her committee will be 
working on the idea of pre­
senting a scholarship to a de­
serving young woman of the 
community to enable her to 
begin or return to the ranks 
of the “back • to • school” 
crowd.

Karen Schmidt explained 
a proposal now being consid­
ered on the state level that 
would require that all child­
ren in grades 4, 8. and 12 be 
tested and ranked according­
ly, and as a result, the State 
would dictate the curriculum 
taught in Wisconsin’s School 
Districts. It was motioned and 
seconded that the KJWC will 
urge vetoing this proposal, 
and will forward our stance 
to our State Representatives.

Rosemary Kempf (Conser­
vation) announced that the 
cycling center will again be 
open on Saturday, March 19, 
from 9 a. m. to 12 noon for 
business Also, a meeting of 
her committee members will 
be held at her home on April

5 at 7 30 p. m to judge the 
Woodsy Owl posters, which 
will be awarded at our April 
14 meeting

Sherry Miller (Social) an­
nounced a family afternoon 
of roller skating at the Artis­
tic Roller Rink in West Bend 
for members and their fami­
lies. Anyone interested will 
meet at the Roller Rink on 
Sunday, Mar 20. at 1:30 p. 
m. The cost is $1 50 for those 
age 10 and older. $1.25 for 
those age 6 to 10. and child­
ren under 6 are free.

Ellie Jalas (Public Affa’rs) 
presented information on the 
Voter’s Forum which is being 
sponsored by KJWC. in con­
junction with the League of 
Women Voters, on March 29 
at 7 p m. in the Kewaskum 
High School cafeteria All 
candidates for positions on 
both the Kewaskum School 
Board and Kewaskum Village 
Board have been invited to 
present themselves and thHr 
opinions to the electorate at 
this forum If you have ques­
tions you’d like answered, 
th’s will give you the onnor- 
tunity to voice them, so let’s 
be there’

It was moved and seconded 
to send Ros Kiefer and Corry

Wuebben. as well ns Presi­
dent Ann Enright, as voting 
delegates to the GFWC’s 8”1 
District Snring Convention 
which will be held at Brilli­
on. Wis on April 21. on be­
half of KJWC

Shirley Perkins (CT^Com- 
munitv Tmnmvcmont Pro­
ject) asked for volunteers tn 
work on her committee Mr 
this project, which is being 
sponsored by Sears Roebuck 
Her committee has chosen to 
work with the Kewaskum 
Community Library staff and 
board on ways to imnrove 
library services and facilities 
in this area. A monetary a 
ward will be made bv Sears 
to the club effecting the 
greatest achievement in the 
CIP contest.

BIRTH

BUTZKE -A daughter to 
David and Karen Butzke, Ke­
waskum, Thursday, March 10.

Why do some men look for home 
atmosphere in a hotel and hotel ser­
vice in a home ?

March Special
$25.00 off Regular Price

JAEGER CONSTRUCTION CO.

PERSONALIZED 
SERVICE & 

GUARANTEED 
SATISFACTION

• CARPETING#
• SHINYL-VINYL •

• DRAPERIES & RODS* 
• COMPLETE 

CLEANING SERVICE* 
• FREE ESTIMATES*

214 N. MAIN
*

KEWASKUM
*

626-2181
Houri: Mon.-Fri. 10-9 

Tues.-Wtd.-Thurs.
10to5

Sot. 10 to 3 
Other hours by 

appointment only

General contractor

A COMPLETE BUILDING SERVICE

Phone 533-4857
ACTION PLUS SATISFACTION

THE SUPER MARKET 
OF AUTO REPAIRS

Goeden Auto Body
Complete Auto Body Repairs 

and Painting Professionally Done

INSURANCE ESTIMATES AND REPAIRS 
OUR SPECIALTY

Automotive - Tune-Ups - Exhaust - Brakes 
Tires-Anti-Freeze-Texaco Products 
ALL DONE TO YOUR SATISFACTION

24 HOUR TOWING
Hy. 28 E. of Kewaskum in St. Michaels 

334-2759 
Try Our Personalized Service

Lions Club 
Paper Drive

SATURDAY, MAR. 19
All paper or cardboard must be on 
the curb by 9:00 a.m. tied in bundles, 
packed in boxes or bags. No waxed 
paper or boxes, please. This drive is 
conducted every third Saturday of 
the month. (No Magazines)

Money used for local projects.

YOU SUPPLY 
THE WATER

THE 
SOFT 
AND 
FRESH

Water Conditioners
If you have hard water problems or water problems 
of any kind, we can help you. We are fresh water 
specialists and carry a complete line of water 
conditioning units.

FREE WATER
ANALYSIS & ESTIMATE

PRICES 
START AT $238.50

Plus Installation
SALE ENDS MARCH 31, 1977

N

HOME IMPROVEMENT CENTER
AUTHORIZED DEALER

JOHANN, INC
• Plumbing • Heating • Air Conditioning

Kewaskum

Hwy 28

Sales & Service
located in St Michaels. 3 miles east of

Kewaskum on Hwy 28
Doily 8 - 5 30 Fri. 'til 9, Sat til 3

X
/MH

SMtAMFRlCAJII

welcome
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The recycling center at the 
village gagage is open every 
third Saturday of the month 
from 9 to 12 for cans, glass 
and aluminum.

Nylac removes tough soil 
from carpeting quickly and 
easily No machine needed. 
Miller’s Fine Furniture car­
ries Nylac.

Cook spaghetti in salted wa­
ter with a little vegetable oil. 
The oil glazes it and prevents 
sticking. It also prevents the 
water from boiling over.

LIVE MUSIC
FRIDAY, MARCH 18

BILL SACKETT TRiO
FRIDAY, MARCH 25

THE WINDRIFTS
Sponsored by The Kewaskum F.F.A. Alumni Ass'n

FRIDAY, APRIL 1

GORDY RECKLEBURG

J Large Hall Available for All Occasions 0
£ Brat Fry Every Tuesday Night — 50c
g Starting at 6:00 p. m.

SW-E-E-T

THE AMERAHN
% mil# north of Kewoskum on Hwy. 45

Maybe they can't harmonize . . hut RAYNOR 
and MARK sure know how to tune up an oil
burner 
RIGES 
burner

AD-O-LINE”

for top performance. Just call HER- 
OIL, INC. for reliable and prompt oil 
service.

■ HERRIGE5

626-2244
KEWASKUM

Van Stolen, Biker
Hit, Break-in Noted

Among incidents reported 
by the Washington County 
'Sheriff's Department the past 
week were the following in 
volving Kewaskum area re­
sidents

Ralph A. Fleischmann of 
'Kewaskum ’•eported his 1969 
Ford Econoline van stolen 
last week Monday afternoon 
from the area of the gravel 
pit at State 28 and Oak Road 
In the Town of Kewaskum. 
Fleischmann had reportedly 
left the keys in the ignition 
while he went for a walk 
The van was recovered in 
Calumet County.

A 16 year-old bicyclist, Ste­
ven R Tackes of R. 2, Kewas 
kum. was hit by a car driven 
by Steven H. Bath. 19. of 
3414 State 28 Kewaskum. 
Sunday afternoon on Kettle
Moraine Drive. Tackes had 
reportedly stopped his bike 
in the northbound lane, fac­
ing south, and Bath braked 
but was unable to avoid hit-

ting him. Tackes was taken 
to St. Joseph’s Community 
Hospital, West Bend, by pri 
vate ambulance service for 
treatment of a knee injury

A black and white televi­
sion set worth about $75 and 
several tools were taken in a 
break-in at a summer resi­
dence on Sunset Drive, R 
2. Kewaskum, according to a 
report received the weekend 
of March 5-6. The house be­
longs to William Wagner of 
Milwaukee. Entry was ap 
parently gained by throwing 
a rock through a window, 
reaching in and unlocking the 
door.

Hospital News
Mrs. Robert Ours, Kewas­

kum, is a patient at St. Jo­
seph’s Community Hospital, 
West Bend, since Saturday. 
March 12. where she submit­
ted to surgery on Monday, 
March 14.

I Bargain Prices (
I grass seed

50 lbs.— $39.50 
fertilizer

10-10-10
50 lbs.— $4.50 )

Kewaskum Mill/
I 626-2818 /

f***e*ee#*e«*eeeee*eee*eeee4 
"On the Spot Repair 
with Country Aire"

Mobile Repair 
Service

for autos, air and electric 
tools, lawn mowers, small 
engines, welding and snow­
plowing. ALSO WRECKER 
SERVICE.

REASONABLE

Country Aire 

Repair
KEWASKUM

NOTICE

NEW PHONE NUMBER

626-2763
DENNIS SCOTT 
TORY RUSSELL 

^*#^e^ee*Me#e#e^#M

Marriage Licenses
Robert John Staiduhar, 

Kewaskum, and Deborah Em 
ily Menke, Kewaskum; wed­
ding March 9.

Steve Vaughn Garbisch, 
Kewaskum, and Andrea Yo­
cum, Kewaskum; wedding 
March 19.

JORDANS 
in kewaskum

Open 11:00 - 7 Days - 626-4618 
Cocktail Hours 4 to 6 p.m. 

HALL AVAILABLE FOR ALL OCCASIONS

We also cater food for
• Weddings • Private Parties • Union Meetings 
• Birthday Parties • Bachelor Parties • Etc.

LIVE ENTERTAINMENT
FRIDAY, MARCH 18

SUDS
FRIDAY, MARCH 25 FRIDAY, APRIL 1

ROCKER Sergeant Pepper

ATTENTION
"Why Wait 
To Order”

SEE OUR LARGE 
SELECTION OF 

NEW CARS 
IN STOCK AT 

HONECK 
CHEVROLET INC. 

1242 Fond du Lac Ave.
Kewaskum, Wis. 53040 

Phone 626-2161
OPEN: 

Monday thru Friday til 9 p.m.

See Our Professionals: 
"KILLY " HONECK 

MARK RODENKIRCH 
ORVSCHULZ 
PAUL BLUMER 

MARV LAUBENSTEIN

THE SMALL TOWN DEALER 
"WHERE SERVICE STILL COUNTS"

Richard R Reindl, Ke 
waskum, and Rose Mary 
Ramthun, West Bend; wed­
ding March 19.
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FOR SALE — 1976 Lund 

15-ft. fiber glass tri-hul 
fishing boat with 1976 
Chrysler 15 h.p. electric 
start engine with battery 
and 1,000 lb. Sportsman 
trailer. Includes oars, an­
chors, running lights and 

boat cover. Used twice. Boat 
and motor still under war­
ranty. Call after 5:00 p. m 
533 4150 3182t

BIRD SEED SPEC IA 1^- 5 
lbs. bird seed, reg 98c now 
69c; 25 lbs bird seed, reg 
$4 19, now $2 99: 5 lb sun 
flower seeds, reg $1.89, 
now $1 19 FREE 79c suet 
cake with $3 00 purchase 
Bird feeders — 20% off 
Schultz’s Greenhouse, Hwy 
45 South. 626 2432 It

FOR SALE—Hay Call 626 
2928 after 5 p m. 3 18 2t

SEED CATALOG SHOP 
PUNG? Save shipping costs 
and anxious waiting We 
carry all these items and 
you see what you are buy­
ing Grow your own plants 
Stop in and we’ll get you 
started. Schultz’s Green­
house, Hwy. 45 So. 3-18-tf

FOR RENT — Two bedroom 
home, Lee Honeck. 626 
2961. 3-18-2

NOW IS THE TIME to ferti­
lize your lawn Good selec­
tion — low prices Schultz’s 
Greenhouse, Hwy. 45 South 

3-18-tf

FOR SALE — 1968 Bridge­
stone Scrambler II. 175 
CC’s. Very excellent condi­
tion. Very economical 
transportation. 626 2046 It

MEL’S BIKE REPAIR — All 
makes, parts, tires, acces­
sories, b’kes 706 Meadow­
brook Dr., West Bend 
338-8562 2 25 4p

WANTED — Newcomers to 
the village of Kewaskum. 
The “Kewaskum Wel­
comes You” committee 
would like you to cal! 
626 2430 or 626-4944 3 11

FOR RENT—2 bedroom fur­
nished mobile home on lake 
just north of Kewaskum 
Phone 1-466 2147 2 11-tf

TIRES — Get your tire deal 
at Roger’s Service, Hwy 45 
south, Kewaskum. Phone 
626-2888 2-20-tf

UPHOLSTERING
Free Estimates 

Pickup & Delivery 
Reasonable Rates 

KETTLE MORAINE 
UPHOLSTERY 

528 8967

LOTS

HOMES

ACREAGE

J-N REALTY
Jerry Nigh, Broker 

626-4043

BUILDING FOR RENT
Former Bank Building at 120 
Main St. for rent. Available 
immediately. Inquire at Ke­
waskum Savings Office, 114 
Main St. or phone Dan Filzen 
at 626-2186.10-8-tf
POTATOES — Call 629 5267 

or 629-5092 Paul Pamper- 
in. 10-29-tf

SERVICES OFFERED - Small 
engines, motorcycle, snow­
mobile, lawn and garden 
equipment and outboard 
repair. Ked-Web of Ke­
waskum. 1204 Fond du Lac 
Ave. Phone 626-4344, tf

SERVICES OFFERED--Pere 
tests - septic systems in­
stalled - swimming pools - 
field tiling Schwartz Tren­
ching. Phone Arnold Kutz 
334-5004 or Gary Schwartz 
994 4535.tf

SERVICES OFFERED—Ma­
sonry and cement. Len Lu- 
terbach Construction. Qua­
lity work at competitive 
prices. Estimates given 
free. Call evenings 338- 
8537 or 692-9233. 5-28-tf

HIGHEST PRICES paid for 
old newspapers, copper, 
brass, aluminum, lead and 
batteries Lynn’s Waste Pa­
per Co., 121 Island Ave., 
West Bend, Wis. tf

THANKS EXPRESSED

A sincere thank you to all 
my family, relatives and 
friends. Your visits, cards, 
flowers, gifts and well wishes 
have been very comforting to 
me.

I am very grateful to 
Schmidt Ambulance, Dr. 
James Froelich, his staff and 
the nurses at St. Joseph’s 
Community Hospital. Thank 
you to Dr. Flemma, his op­
erating crew and nurses at 
St. Luke’s Hospital in Mil­
waukee and all who in any 
way assisted me in my recov­
ery from my heart attack 
and surgery.

I thank God for my extend 
ed stay here in this world 
With Him willing I will soon 
be back to work selling mon­
uments again.

God bless you all, 
Roman J. Breit

SCHULZ 
REAL ESTATE CORP. 
Broker* — Builder* 

MONICA SCHULZ, Broker 
JAMES SCHULZ, Builder 

2395 W., Washington, West Bend 
_____ Phone 339-6109 _____

IN MEMORIAM

Tn loving memory of An­
drew "Gene” Gruber, who 
passed away five years ago, 
March 17, 1972:

They say that time heals 
all sorrow

And helps us to forget
But time so far has only 
proved

How much we miss you 
yet.

God gave us strength to 
take it

And courage to take the 
blow

But what it meant to lose 
you

No one will ever know
Sadly missed by his wife 

Alice, children and mother, 
Maryann.

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to thank all our 
relatives, friends and neigh­
bors for their kind expression 
of sympathy in our recent 
bereavement, the death of 
our dear mother, Lorinda E 
Schaefer. Special thanks to 
Pastor Darrell Joiner, organ­
ist, soloist, donors of memo­
rial tributes, floral pieces, 
pallbearers, sexton, ladies 
who served the luncheon, M;l- 
ler’s Funeral Home, traffic 
officers and all who showed 
respect and helped in any 
way.

Mr. and Mrs John L 
Schaefer

Mr. and Mrs William F 
Schaefer

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Kral

THANK YOU

I wish to extend my deep­
est appreciation to ail my 
relatives, friends and neigh­
bors who remembered .ne 
with gifts, visits, flowers, 
cards and phone calls while 
I was a patient at St. Jo­
seph’s Community Hospital 
and recuperating at home. 
These many acts of kindness 
are deeply appreciated

Homer Schaub

A NOTE OF THANKS

I wish to personally thank 
everyone for the cards, flow­
ers, phone calls, prayers and 
visits while I was in the hos­
pital. Special thanks to Mr. 
and Mrs Elmer Yoost for 
their care to me.

Mrs. Sally Joiner

If you want to buy or sell 
Home — Farm — Busines* 

Contact
Norb Rohlinger

Representing 
BOWE & WENTNGER 

REALTY, INC.
In the Kettle Moraine Area 

PHONE 626 2332
LISTINGS NEEDED

TOP CASH * GLOVES 
FOR DISABLED OR DEAD

CALVES OR PIGS
When Picked up in Area 

Hi^pe Collect Oshkah 233-1010

NELSON FARM 
SERVICE

Public Notice
Public notice is hereby gi 

ven that the next meeting of 
the Kewaskum, Wisconsin, 
Village Board is scheduled 
for Monday evening, March 
21, 1977, at 8 00 P. M. in the 
Council Room of the Munici­
pal Building, 204 First Street.

Copies of the agenda will 
be available at the office of 
the Commissioner at the Mu­
nicipal Building on the day 
of the meeting

William Martin, Clerk

USED MOBILE 
HOMES WANTED!

We pay cash 
for used homes ! -

Call

FLOOD MOBILE HOMES
414 922 2222 

or send description 
and asking price to 

R. 1, Fond du Lac, Wis. 54935

•KEYS

fitF4i 
£xrnj hey

Honeck Chevrolet
KIWASKUM

:; Bowe & Weninger Realty, Inc
948.

920

406

921.

Forty acres one mile 
from the Town of 
Kewaskum. Small 
creek ambles thru 
property. About 
one-half work land.
Some trees. Could
be a very private
hideaway.
$34,900.

Asking

Drugstore sundries 
business located in 
small village north­
west of West Bend 
Doing good, with 
11 v i n g quarters. 
$35,000.

Kewoskum oreo opportuni­
ty to go into business for 
yourself. Auto body shop 
on large one acre country 
lot Building 55 x 50 with 
three large Overhead 
doors. Also included is a 
hoist and oir compressor. 
Coll for more details

Two bedroom year round 
home on Long Lake with 
40 of loke frontoge New 
gas furnace, plumbing 
aluminum siding plus 
house boat $32,000 00, or 
$28,900 00 without house 
boat.

Many other residential, farms, business 
and vacant land listings. Call for details.

BOWE & WENINGER
REAL TY, INC.

West Bend 334-7841 
Mike Walsh, Sales — Phone 626 47 09 

Norbert Roblinger, Broker Sales — Phone 626-2332

ACTION + SATISFACTION

Is there any significance to the fact 
that when a woman says she’s all 
tired out, the doctor first looks at her 
tongue?

Veterinary Services 
LARGE & SMALL ANIMALS 

WOODVIEW 
VETERINARY CLINIC 

Drs. Bushard & Thornborrow 
North Point Shopping Center 

Hwy. 45 N. of West Bend 
Phone 338 1838

insurance needs!

AMERICAN FAMILY
INSURANCE

J AUTO FIRE HEALTH LIFE u 
AMERICAN FAMILY MUTUAL INSURANCE CO. 

MADISON, WISCONSIN S37OI

Richard C. Gust
156 N. MAIN ST. 
WEST BENJ) WIS.

, Office Phone 338-1313 
Residence Phone 626 2765

910. 3 lorge country lots. 117' x 
600' each. North of 
Kewoskum in Fond du loc 
County Priced to sell.

,. <4 500 00 par lot

*92 39 acre* of open land across 
from Comp Awano Spring

929 . 6 bedroom brick ond log 
home on 40 acres of larnr 
'6 mile rood frontoge. run­
ning creek, small born, 
many out buildings. Town 
of Woyne.

904. Two businesses and rental 
property consisting of a li­
quor store, office and 
tovqrn in small village. Op­
portunity to be your own 
doss. Excellent gross. Price 
$75,000 00.

905. Move to country, clean air, 
blue skies. Take your pick I 
2 almost 1 acre lots. Ke­
waskum School District. 10 
minutes to West Bend. One 
lot $5,600.00. other 
$6,500.00

•76. Sharp cottage on spring fad 
Ioka In the Kettle Moroina

Iras hctlltnt flaking, 
hunting, swimming, and 
snowrnobillng. Call for 
more dotoils
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Elect Officers at 
Citizens Concerned 
For Life Meeting

The Wisconsin Citizens Con­
cerned for Life. Kettle Mor­
aine Chapter, elected new 
co chairpersons at their meet­
ing held March 9 in Allenton. 
Mrs. Jeri Gundlach, West 
Bend, and Mrs. Maggie Kova 
cevich, Allenton, are the new 
leaders. They replace Dr. and 
Mrs. Parnell Donahue, Hart­
ford, who have held this posi 
tion for the past two years.

The members were educat­
ed on the subject of euthana 
sia via a slide presentation. 
It was emphasized that al­
though WCCL has of late 
been most concerned with the 
abortion issue, the organiza­
tion is pro-life, stressing the 
sanctity of life at all stages.

Tom Dlugopolski, the chap­
ter’s representative to the 
state board of governors of 
WCCL, reported that Rep. 
Joanne Duren has reintroduc­
ed her bill in this session of 
the Wisconsin State Legisla 
ture that would prohibit tax 
money being used to fund 
abortions

In other business the chap­
ter is hoping to send a repre­
sentative to the National 
Right to Life Convention to 
be held in Chicago June 16 - 
19

The organization will spon 
sor an information booth 
again this year at the Wash 
ington County Fair.

The next meeting will be 
held Wednesday. May 11, at 
8:00 p. m at the United 
Church of Christ, Slinger.

School Menus
KEWASKUM COMMUNITY 

SCHOOLS
Menus for week of March 

21 - 24
Monday — Hot beef on a 

bun, tater-tots, carrot sticks, 
peach crisp, peanut butter.

Tuesday — Spaghetti and 
meat sauce, French bread 
with garlic butter. spiced 
apple rings, apricots or pears

Wednesday — Chop suey 
over fluffy rice, cheese sticks, 
chow mein noodles, creamy 
fruit salad, orange juice.

Thursday — Bar-b-que on 
a bun, tossed salad with 
choice of dressings, vanilla 
pudding with cherry sauce.

Friday — NO SCHOOL 
(Teacher In-Service)

Each meal served with 
bread, butter and/or marga 
rine and milk.
Menus are subject to change.

• • • •
HOLY TRTNYTY SCHOOL
Menus for week of March 

21 • 25.
Monday — NO SCHOOL.
Tuesday — Macaroni and 

Cheese, crackers, bread and 
butter, peaches, cookie, milk.

Wednesday — Beef casse 
role, green beans, buttered 
beets, brownie, milk.

Thursday — Wiener on a 
bun, French fries, pork and 
beans, pear crisp, milk.

Friday — Fishwich, lettuce 
salad, fried potatoes, finger 
jello milk.
Menus are subject to change

Rescue Squad Calls
Thursday, March 10. 9:33 

p. m.—Edward E “Pat” Mil­
ler, Sr., 1318 Roseland Dr., 
Kewaskum, removed to St. 
Joseph’s Community Hospital, 
West Bend, from Dr. R. G. 
Edwards residence when he 
became ill

Friday, March 11, 10 36 p. 
m. — Roger Sinnen, R 1. 
Random Lake, and Philip 
Medingcr, R 1, Cedar Grove, 
removed to St. Joseph’s Com­
munity Hospital from Ke­
waskum with injuries suf­
fered in an auto accident.

Saturday, March 12, 9:43 
pm — Jean Milewski, 15. 
daughter of Mr and Mrs. 
John Milewski, 1133 Fond 
du Lac Ave., Kewaskum, re­
moved to St. Joseph’s Com 
munity Hospital from Hwy. 
45 at Friendly Dr. with inju­
ries suffered in an auto acci­
dent.

Monday, March 14. 2 p. 
m — William J. Kranski, 2, 
son of Mrs. Diane Kranski, 
812 Bel Ric Dr., Kewaskum, 
removed to St. Joseph’s Com-

GIANT 
TOOL AUCTION 

LOCATION; AMERAHN HALL
1 Mile North of Kewaskum on Hwv. 45

DATE: Marell 23 TIME: 7:00 P. M.
SALE ITEMS CAN BE INSPECTED ONE HOPI BEFORE SALE TIMEI

AUCTIONEER: dairy state auction service PHONE: ^VS?
FLOOR JACKS AIR COMPRESSORS TABLE SAWS ROLL AROUND TOOL' BOXES 

HIGHEST QUALITY, NATIONALLY ADVERTISED 
NAMEBRANDS!

ROCKWELL - RODAC - FULLER - CUMMINGS - MILLER FALLS - BROWN 
MARFLOW - SHOPMATE - WRIGHT - CHANNEL LOCK - REMINGTON 
McGRAW EDISON - DIAMOND LOY - WATERLOO - INGERSOLL RAND - 

WEN

WE HAVE THE LARGEST SELECTION OF ALL NEW TOOLS AND ACCESSORIES ON WHEELS

A complete selection of hand tools for the plumber, carpenter, mechanic, 
welder, electrician, trucker, farmer, painter, contractor, shop owner or 
serious tool user in any profession. We have it all — drill bits to air tools, 
hacksaw blades to table saws, paint brushes to compressors, sandpaper to 
grinders, extension cords to torch hoses.

ALL HAND TOOLS CARRY A LIFETIME GUARANTEE - POWER TOOLS A FULL FACTORY WARRANTY 

TERMS OF SALE
Cash or approved check with proper I.D., if tax exempt must show 
number. Not responsible for changes due to strikes or shipping schedules. 
Not responsible for accidents or property after sold.

(KEFKESHMENTS)

THIS IS THE LARGEST SALE OF THIS KIND EVER TO BE HELD 
IN THIS AREA!

munity Hospital from his 
home with convulsions.

FIREMEN ANSWER 
FALSE ALARM CALL

Kewaskum firemen an 
swered a call to the apart 
ment building at 222 Braatz 
Drive at 3:30 p. m. Tuesday 
There was no fire and it is 
believed one of the children 
pulled a fire switch.

WEDNESDAY 
MORNINGETTES 
Paula Kutz, Sec.

Won Lost
Everglades 51*4 29^
Serwe’s Tap 49 32
Herriges Tap 46^ 34^
Papa Joe’s 43^ 37^
Rich’s Pizza 35 46
Weis Tavern 34 47
King Pin Lanes 32^ 48’4
Silver Key 32 49

TR9 THIS 
MAN-MADE 
TWINE 
ONCE, 
AND yOU’LL 
NEVER USE 
ANYTHING 
ELSE

Indv. high game: Shirley n Tndv hi*h series Janet 
Nass 223, Janet Serwe 205 Serwe 553, Kathy Herriges 

515.

BRIDON
Man-Made-Fiber

BALING TWINE
PROVEN ON THE FARM - Bndon twine 
has already produced amazing results for 
farmers on hay, straw and corn stalks. It's 
guaranteed to work for you, too.
MAN MADE-FIBER STRENGTH You get 
stronger, more uniform twine in every bale 
because manufacturing is electronically con­
trolled And Bndon twine ha.- consistently 
higher knot strength than traditional pro­
ducts.
WORKS IN YOUR BALER Bndon twine is 
guaranteed to work in any properly adjusted 
baler — without modifying the bill hooks. 
You get free factory assistance if Bndon 
twine doesn’t work for you.

March Only — #11.00 Per Bale

KEWASKUM MILL
123 Second St. — 020 2811

The new water bed is great if 
you have a bad back you use hard 
water!
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Slinger Goes
To State Meet

Lakes Team Edges 
Hartford; To Play 
Slinger for Title

The close ‘,B” Division race 
in the Und o’ Lakes League 
was tightened last weekend 
as Kewaskum edged Hart 
ford by one point, 112 111. 
and Slinger lost to Thiens 
ville - Mequon by one.

As a result Slinger and Ke 
waskum now are tied for 
first place with 7 - 6 records 
and the two will play each 
other at Kewaskum at 7 30 
p. m this Sunday for the di 
vision title. The team would 
like to see a large crowd 
turn out for this big game

Kewaskum’s Ken Torsi 
made two free throws with a 
bout five seconds left to put 
his team up by three and sew 
up the victory Pete Hauser 
made a layup at the buzzer 
to pull Hartford within a 
point for the final score.

Loes! took scoring honors 
with 38 noints while Chuck 
Wallace hit 30 and Tom Zoch 
28. For Hartford, Hauser 
swished in 35, Jim Gaedtke 
27 and Ted Rulseh 17.

HAITFOK) KEWASKUM
Eg H f tqh I

Hawn 16 3 2 U**t 15 8 4
Goedtke 12 3 4 Zoch 12 4 4
Utah 7 3 S Wolloct 15 0 4
Moguire 5 2 I Bockhous 3 0 3
Houser 0 5 0 2 Kennedy I 0 2
Dillon 3 0 2 Pieper 2 0 3
Jentges 2 0 2 Marti .10 3
Totofa 50 II 11 Waddig 1 0 0

Wogner 0 0 1
Totals 50 12 24

Hartford X 21'2'31-111
Kewoskum 22 36 22 32 112

FTM- Hartford 4 Kewaskum 8

LAND O' LAKES
LEAGUE BASKETBALL

March 12 — West Bend 122 at Port 
Washington 121

March 13 — Cedarburg 119 ot M. 
Falls Stingers 150. Hartford HI at 
Kewaskum 112; Slinger 83 at Thiens 
ville Mequon 84 M. Falls Badgers 
111 at Sussex 107.

The standings: gov w I 
A DIV w I Slinger 7 6 
Falls Bodgen IIO Kewaskum 7 6 
Falls Stingers 10 2 Hartford 6 I

T Meqyo" ♦ ’ 
Cedarburg . 5 7 wetland 4 ♦ 
Oconomowoc 2 9 Port Wash <! • 3 W

The schedule
March 20 Slinger Ot Kewaskum. 

Thiensville-Mequon as West BencE 
Port Washington ot Hartford; 
Cedarburg at M. Falls' Badgers: 
Oconomowoc at M Falls Stingers, all 
af 7 30 p.m.

QUEEN HITS LEAGUE 
Ellen Breitzman, See.

Won Lost
Bauer Spraying 46% 28%
Everglades 43 32
Baumann’s Bus 43 32
Charles 43 32
Dundee Sand, Gr 42 33
Regal Ware 42 33
Gay Nineties 40 35
Fin n Feather 39 36
Strobel’s 38 37
Gipper’s Bar 38 37
Hensen’s 35% 29%
Johann Plumbing 34% 40%
Herman’s 34 41
Newsettes 33 42
Artie’s Mkt. 27 51
Laurie’s 24% 50%

Tndv. high game: Judy 
Geidel 218, Kathy Jungers 
209, Bernice Loehr 204.

Indv. high series Judy 
Geidel 559, Kathy Jungers

The Scenic Moraine Con 
Terence added much prestige, 
publicity and proof of its ca 
libre by sending not one but 
two teams to the Wisconsin 
Interscholastic Athlete Asso 
ciation (WIAA) Class B state 
tournament at Madison this 
year.

First to go was the Kewas 
kum girls team, which made 
a fine showing in the girls 
meet at Madison last week 
end. This weekend the Sl'ng 
er Owls, co-champions (with 
Hartland) of the conference, 
will be there to represent the 
Scenic Moraine in the boys 
meet.

After winning sub-regional 
and regional tournament 
games, Slinger ran into teams 
with lesser records in the 
Sectional in Sheboygan Falls 
(11 - 11) and East Troy (9 - 
14) The Owls took care of 
both of them for a state 
berth.

A reminder again that Slin­
ger and Kewaskum are both 
Class B schools competing a- 
gainst four Class A schools 
in the Scenic Conference

The ninth-ranked Owls 
(21-2) will face third-ranked 
Prairie du Chien (20 - 2) 
at 1:20 p m Friday at Madi­
son The other B schools in 
the meet are top rated Lady 
smith (22-1) and fourth rated 
Clintonville (20-3), who meet 
at 7 05 Friday. Finals are at 
2:50 p. m. Saturday.

Vetter Completes 
Telemark Ski Race

The fifth annual Birkbeiner 
Croas Country Ski Race held 
several weeks ago at Tele­
mark Lodge, Cable, Wis., at­
tracted nearly 2,000 skiers 
from the United States, Can­
ada and Norway. Among the 
finishers was Dennis Vetter 
of Phillips, Wis., who finish­
ed the hilly 34 2 mile course 
between Cable and Hayward 
in 5 hours and 8 minutes. 
Vetter placed 255th out of a- 
bout 750 skiers in the 19 • 34 
year old age division. Vetter 
also ran and finished the 
Boston Marathon last spring 
in 100 degree weather at 
Boston, Mass

Dennis, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Leland Vetter of rurail Ke 
waskum, is the high school 
principal of Phillins High 
School, Phillips. Dennis, his 
wife, Jeanette, and daughter, 
Lea Lynn, also raise horses 
and herefords and run a sum­
mer campground at rurail Ash 
land.

(Continued from Page 1)
CUBA CITY S3

528, Marge Wentz 501.

An old subscriber .wrote to 
the editor of a magazine and 
complained: “Your magazine 
iSn’t as good as it used to be.” 
Replied the editor: “It never 
was” j

fp fpp fl no pf rob pts
JoAnn Steinbach ................ 3 10 0 0 1 2 6
Lynn Timmerman ........... 1 4 5 10 1 19 7
Deb Tronel ....................... 6 11 4 5 5 8 16
Patti Runde ......................   0 0 3 4 2’ 1 3
Mary Kav Lelfker .............3 II 4 4 4 1 10
Linda Brown .................... 5 15 0 0 2 3 10
Jan Oallev ...........................0 2 1 2 5 5 1
Pea Bowden ....................... 0 0 0 1 0 1 0

Totals ....................... 18 S3 17 26 20 45 53
KEWASKUM 45 

no n no pt rM pts
Julie Stoffel ....................... 5 7 5 9 5 15 IS
Mary Schoofs .................... 1 3 0 0 4 6 2
Bonnie Schmidt ................ I 2 1 3 0 3 3
Ann Weddlfl .................... 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Kathy Mertz ....................... 3 10 0 1 3 1 6
Yvonne Schacht .............. 5 17 2 3 1 1 12
Jonlne Prost .....................  1 2 3 6 3 7 5
Marv Ryan ....................... 1 2 0 0 3 0 2
Karen Wagner .............. 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Joan Petri ....................... 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Tami Edgar ..................... 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Kove WeinreiCh ............ 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Totals ......................... 17 43 11 22 19 38 45
Rebounding totals Include team rebounds

Cuba Citv .............................................. 1 14 7 22-53
Kewaskum ......................................... U 15 10 9—45

Field goal percentages — Cuba City 340. Kewas 
kum .395 Free throw percentages — Cuba City 654. 
Kewaskum SOO. Officials — Carol Jacket!, George St
Catherine

INSULATE 
YOUR HOME 
NOW. SAVE!

0Illi*

Comfort From Heat in Summer - Save Dollars on Fuel in Winter

DO IT YOURSELF
No Costly Installation Charge \
* No Charge for Use of Blower When 

You Purchase Insulation From Us.

OR WE'LL DO ITFORYOy

NU-WOOL
(OUR BRAND)

R.VALUE COMPARISON PER 6’

GLASS MINERAL VERMICULITE 
FIBER WOOL

Insulation has one primary function 
- to reduce the transfer of heat - to 
store it in winter and keep it out in 
summer. Heat resistance for each 
type of insulation material is 
measured by the some laboratory 
test. This test rates the material 
and is coded with an R-Foctor 
(resistance to heat or cold). This 
should be noted on every bag, not 
just salesman's lingo - the higher 
the rating number the greater the 
resistance.

EXTREMELY BETTER THAN ALL FIBERGLASS INSULATION
NU-WOOL is pneumatically blown be­
tween and over ceiling joists, filling 
and staling every crack and crevice 
with a uniform density of insulation. 
Floor ond attic areas ore handled the 
same as side walls. Exterior side 
walls of existing buildings are blown 
full. Access holes are drilled between 
studs and insulation is forced in to 
completely fill the area. The some 
process is used around doors ond 
windows.

PER INCH!

Why NU-WOOL Is your final choice in insulation
MMORMAN a
NU-WOOl I mutation has been tested ond 
Mil by Factory Mutual Reseorcb 
UDoretorrts matting all Insulation rat mgs 
NUW001 meets or txcttds federal 
ipectficatiom Ho HH-1-515A, and is 
Approved for use in F H A structures

COOLS IN WMMCR
MMB001 insulated homes are 10-15 degrees

than etstvde temperatures during the long 
hot summers And a big bonus reduced 
elect* cost in your aw conditioning

MOUCXS HC AT COST
Correct attic insulation can save you 30% or

HIGH R-VALLM
NU-WOOl ceHulostx fiber exceeds most 
insulation (by laboratory test) in constants 
to heat or cold

HILFS CONTROL Id BUILDUP
Damaging ice and ricks on a roof is caused 
from heat loss through your attic when 
outside temperatures drop below freezing

MANUFACTURING INSULATION 
siwes IMP
NU WOQI has been supplying the building 
industry for over 26 years, proof of our 
reputation

FIM MUST ANT
Case history has proved that our insulation 
will definitely confine that which might hove 
become TOTAL LOSS Our fire retardant 
chemicals will lost indpfinptly.

PLUS SOUND PROOFING
Ono of the best insulations for Sound

Proofing - it naturally absorbs sound be­
tween walls and ceilings More quiet means 
more tranquility

VHMIN ANO RODINT PfSIST ANT 
Chemiclly treated to repel insects and 
r odent s fram work mg i n materials

MSI IT ANT TO MOISTUM
The fibers hove no capillary attraction for 
moisture, therefore guarding side walls and 
attic against condensation little movement 
of worm air through it. eliminates the cause 
for moisture condensation

WILL NOT DITHHORATt
It is 0 life-time insulation because it is 
treated with chemicals that are permanent

GUARANTH
Hu Wool Insulation is guaranteed for the Ifo 
of the structure (building).

LIGHT WIIOHT WILL NOT UTT LI 
Cellulosic Fiber Insulation is extremely light 
weight 13 oz per square foot. 4 inches thick 
Vibration keeps it fluffed up over the years 
and It does not lose its insulation value with 
age - the older it gets the better job it does 
One of notice's best insulators

CALL US OR STOP IN! 
OPEN EVERY NITE 'TIL 9

Kettle Moraine Electric
I26l Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum

Financing Available
Ro't'; ■to'.'fr at Kettle Moraine Electric

Phone 626 2093

va*"^


