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New Owner of Local Malting Co. 
Questions Board on Sewer Charges

By Karen Schmidt
The Kewaskum Village 

Board meeting was held on 
July 21 at 8 p. m. Motion 
passed to accept minutes of 
the July 7 meeting, the ad­
journed meetings of July 8 
and July 14.

John Kratz, new owner of 
Kewaskum Malting Compa­
ny appeared before the board 
with several questions re­
garding sewer service char­
ges. He stated there was a 
broken storm sewer between 
his building and the railroad 
tracks and contended that 
the broken sewer ran into the 
sanitary sewer and through 
the malt house meter. He 
said he has a Malting Com­
pany in West Bend and his 
water and sewage service bill 
for three months was lower 
than - the one month bill he 
has received since taking ov­
er the business. The board 
temporarily adjourned to do 
an on the spot check of the 
troubled area. When back in 
session, Pete Albers, Village 
Engineer, explained to Kratz 
that since the village has 
built a new sewage plant un­
der federal grant, the village 
is given the amount their ser­
vice charge must be and in­
cludes more than just water 
and sewage and when Kratz 
explained he has checked 
with other surrounding 
Malting Companies and their 
bills aren’t nearly as high, 
he was told when other com­
munities go to new type 
plants, their sewage charges 
will be the same.

Gregor Nigh, a village 
trustee, also ^owner of Ke­
waskum Frozen Foods, stat­
ed he also thought village 
charges were out of line af­
ter he did some checking of 
other locker plants. Village 
President Charles Miller then 
stated charges could be open 
for revision. At that point, 
Kratz said he hoped this is 
true, because he would like 
to continue doing business in 
Kewaskum. After discussion 
is was decided the Malting 
Company will repair the bro­
ken storm sewer and check 
output from the plant.

Roger Schmitt appeared 
to inquire what was happen­
ing with the hay field in the 
Ideal Subdivision which lies 
behind his home and other 
homes in his neighborhood. 
The hay needs cutting and is 
being infested with mice 
which are now digging holes 
in the existing ground piles 
in the subdivision. The Vil­
lage Clerk will check into 
the matter.

Augie Bilgo, on behalf of 
the Fire Department, re­
quested action on the requi­
sition of the new fire hose. 
He stated the department 
preferred 800 lb. test instead 
of 600 lb. test which would 
result in an increase of .03 
cents per foot or a total of 
$75.00 He stated the 800 lb. 
test has a tighter weave to 
the hose and would last long­
er. Motion by Dan Schmidt, 
seconded by Raynor Herri- 
ges to authorize the Equip­
ment Committee of the Fire

Department to purchase 800 
lb. test hose. Motion passed.

Discussion was held on two 
street lights on- North Fond 
du Lac Ave. that have been 
inoperable for some time. 
A short in the electrical ca­
ble is the problem and the 
question was raised as to 
whose obligation it is for 
repair, village or Electric 
Company? Type of cable 
and if a local electrician can 
do repairs will be checked 
into.

Motion by Schmidt, second­
ed by Gregor Nigh to accept 
a building permit applica­
tion from Building Associ­
ates of West Bend for a one 
family residence in Roseland 
Hills, Addition No. 2.

Plans and specification for 
curbing, in Ideal Subdivision 
have been received from Ar­
thur & Arthur Engineering 
Firm. Motion by Roger 
Strack, seconded by Herri- 
ges to authorize the village 
clerk to place ads advertising 
for bids for construction of 
curbing. Board will notify 
property owners in the area 
affected of curb charge.

Still no word from J. Rog­
er Miller Associates of She­
boygan on soil test borings 
from the new park. Clerk 
William Martin will call and 
inquire as to the delay in re­
ceiving results. Trustee El­
mer Yoost stated this should 
all be straightened out by the 
next meeting. As soon as re­
sults are in, digging for the 
pool could be started.

Village President Charles 
Miller requested the board to 
approve a resolution which 
will be sent to the Council 
General of Venezuela which 
in part would state that the 
Village of Kewaskum would 
request that John Andrade of 
Venezuela, who would be a 
student at Kewaskum High 
School this fall, also brother 
of Ivan Andrade, former AFS 
Student at Kewaskum, be al­
lowed to use the remaining 
one year of a five year visa 
issued to Ivan. John was to 
come to the United States 
and to Kewaskum this week 
but his country will no't issue 
a new visa. His brother Ivan 
has completed a four year 
college course at Carroll Col­
lege in less than the usual 
four years, thus having a 
year left on his visa. Ivan is 
returning to Venezuela. John 
would be staying with the 
Benzschawel family of Beech­
wood. Herriges made the mo­
tion to approve the resolu­
tion and Strack seconded. 
Motion passed and resolution 
will be sent.

Trustee Schmidt stated he 
has received complaint of 
tree branches on the green­
way next to the sidewalk be­
ing so low. People walking 
get hit with the branches He 
requested board members to 
make a check of different ar­
eas of the village and bring a 
list of areas to the next 
meeting so a letter can be 
sent to property owners ad­
vising them to trim trees

Schmidt also brought up 
for discussion reassessment of

Rev. R. Gadow 
Observes 50th 
Anniversary

Peace United Church of 
Christ honored the Rev Rich­
ard Gadow in the 9 o’clock 
morning service Sunday in 
celebration of his 50th anni- , 
versary in the ministry.

Pastor and Mrs. Gadow are 
in retirement and living at 
5473 Village Drive, West 
Bend. He served the Kewas­
kum parish for nine years 
from 1932 to 1941 The con 
gregation invited all their 
members and friends to 
share this service expressing 
appreciation for the dedica­
tion and talented service he 
gave to individuals and par­
ishes he served so faithfully

Pastor • Gadow graduated 
from Elmhurst College, Elm­
hurst, Ill., Eden Seminary, St. 
Louis, Mo and did graduate 
work at Washington Univer­
sity, St. Louis.

He served congregations in 
Fall Creek, Brodhead, Ke­
waskum. Germantown, Wau­
watosa, Beechwood, Random 
Lake, Wis.; Chicago, Ill.: 
Louisville. Mo.; Fairport Har­
bor, Ohio; Payson, Ill. and 
Antwerp, N. Y.

He was ordained by his 
father Aug 16, 1925 in the 
UCC Church in California, 
Mo.

He was married to Irene 
Loos of Menomonee Falls in 
1926 They have two daugh­
ters, Mrs Theodore (Elsbeth) 
Miller of Port Edwards, Wis. 
and Mrs. Stan (Gretchen) 
Whitmarsh of California; two 
grandsons and two grand- 

‘ daughters.
, A social hour followed the 

service providing an oppor­
tunity for the Gadows to vis­
it with their many friends 
and the visitors to share the 
fellowship of the hour. Cof­
fee and cake were served

To Hold Open House 
For Golden Wedding

There will be an open 
house reception in St. Mich­
ael’s Hall, St. Michaels, on 
Sunday, July 27, from 2:30 
to 4:30 p. m. for the Golden 
Wedding Anniversary of Mr. 
and Mrs. Anton Herriges of 
R. 2, Kewaskum. Anniversa­
ry Mass at 1:30 in the after­
noon at St. Michael’s (this 
Mass also fulfills your Sun­
day obligation).

FIREMEN CALLED 
TO BEYER HOME

Kewaskum firemen were 
called to the Norm Beyer 
home at 317 Braatz Drive at 
4 p. m Friday for a grease 
fire in an oven. There was 
no damage. About 20 firemen 
responded.

village property. Board mem­
bers agreed that reassessment 
is probably necessary at this 
time, but can the village af­
ford it? Village Clerk will 
check the year of last reas­
sessment and cost of that re­
assessment.

Motion to adjourn by 
Trustee Schmidt.

Lamont Albers Leaves for Scout
World Jamboree in Norway

Lament “Monty” Albers 
left Saturday as a delegate to 
represent Kewaskum at the 
Boy Scouts of America’s 
Fourteenth World Jamboree 
near Lillehammer, Norway. 
He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Peter Albers, 340 Clinton St 
Albers is among nine repre­
sentatives from the Bay 
Lakes Area Council who left 
from Chicago.

The Jamboree will be host­

Ebert Joins Regal 25 Year Club

Walter Ebert, R 3, Camp­
bellsport, is the 101st mem­
ber of Regal Ware, Inc.’s 25 
Year Club. Ebert’s Regal ca­
reer began on July 13, 1950, 
when he started as a grinder

Speaker, Writer
The Warren Schmidt fam­

ily and Mrs. E F Schmidt, 
R 2, Campbellsport, were vi­
sited recently by Mr. and 
Mrs. Roland McCully and 
their children, Alan and Ka­
ren.

McCully is currently serv­
ing as Supervisor of Math 
and Foreign Languages for 
the Phoenix Union High 
School System, Phoenix, Ari­
zona A prominent speaker, 
McCully has just completed 
work on his latest book Al-

ed by Denmark, Finland, Ice- 
Jand, Norway and Sweden 
The Wisconsin contingent 
will spend eight days at the 
Jamboree site in Norway be­
fore beginning a 13 day tour 
of other Nordic countries.

Monty will spend July 29 
to Aug 7 at the Jamboree 
before beginning the Nordic 
tour.

More than 2,500 scouts 
from the United States will 
participate along with 12,- 
500 from around the world

Selection was made by sub­
mitting an application to the 
Bay Lakes Area Council, the 
organization responsible for 
all area scout troops. Next, 
applications were processed 
and evaluated, based on the 
applicant’s qualifica­
tions These included the ap­
plicant's scouting record, 
school grades and extracur­
ricular activities.

For Monty, these included 
wrestling, church groups, 
earning the rank of star 
scout, serving as Senior Pa­
trol Leader of his troop and 
four years as a scout.

The Bay Lakes Council 
also sent 23 scouts and ex­
plorers to the Plilmont Scout 
Ranch in northern Now Mex­
ico on July 14 for 12 days of 
rugged mountain climbing.

in the Buffing Department. 
After two years, Ebert be­
came a Semi-Auto Buff Op­
erator and has worked in that 
capacity ever since.

Ebert and his wife, Doris, 
are members of Trinity Lu­
theran Church in Dundee 
He is also an active member 
of the Dundee Sportsman 
Club Ebert and his brother, 
Vilas, took over the family 
farm several years ago, 
where they milk 23 cows and 
farm 200 acres.

Working at Regal Ware, 
Inc is an Ebert family tra­
dition In addition to his bro­
ther, Vilas, Walter has anoth­
er brother and four cousins 
employed by the Kewaskum 
cookware manufacturer. He 
and his wife plan to travel 
when he retires.

Ebert received an engrav- ' 
ed watch from President 
James D Reigle to recognize 
25 years of service to the 
company.

Visits Schmidts
gebra One In addition, he is 
currently working on other 
publications. The Phoenix 
Union system consists of ele­
ven high schools

The McCully are now at 
the mid-way point of a ten 
state tour In addition to vis­
iting relatives and friends, 
McCully is meeting with 
math supervisors in other 
districts along their tour.

Mrs McCully is the former 
Nancy Fick of Racine, a 
niece of Mrs E. F Schmidt
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News of Our 
College Students

Recognition dinners honor­
ing the top scholars at Iowa 
State Universify were held 
recently in Memorial Union.

The 370 students honored 
included those in the top two 
percent of each class in each 
college, and the top student 
by curriculum or major se­
lected from those who have 
graduated or are graduating 
during the current academic 
year.

Top scholars honored in­
cluded Karen L. Secor, Ke­
waskum, Veterinary Medi­
cine.

Seven Kewaskum Commu­
nity High School students 
were enrolled in UW-Stout 
for the spring semester They 
were Myron V. Belger,, Anne 
L. Etta, Leo M Gundrum, 
Jennifer L Johann, Jean A. 
Koerble, Barbara J Lubahn 
and Francis J. Theusch.

KEWASKUM TUESDAY 
NITE LEAGUE

Second half standings:
Won Lost

Badger Pack........... 2 0
Hitching Post ........ 2 0
Marth Realty ........ 1 1
Thiemer’s ............... 1 1
Amerahn ................. 1 1
Serwe’s ..................... 1 '
Scott & Tom’s ....... 0 2
Three R’s ................. 0 2

Scores July 15: Thiemer’s 
5, Scott & Tom’s 4; Hitching 
Post 7. Amerahn 4; Serwe’s

16, Three R’s 5; Badger Pack­
aging 13, Marth Realty 5.

Home runs were hit by 
Perry Koth, Glen Eichstedt, 
Gene Ebert, Tom Rettler, 
Larry Brown and Mike Rein- 
dl.

HOSPITAL NEWS
Mrs. Vernon Fierke, Ke­

waskum, returned home from 
St. Agnes Hospital, Fond du 
Lac, after submitting to sur­
gery on Wednesday, July 16.

Birth
K R E I F — Airman First 

Class and Mrs Kenneth Kreif 
are the parents of a daughter, 
Theresa Marie, born July 14 
at St Agnes Hospital, Fond 
du Lac. Kenneth is stationed 
at Weisbaden, Germany and

Mrs. Kreif, the former Mary 
Abhold. is presently residing 
at R. 1, Mt. Calvary with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Abhold. The paternal grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. Je­
rome Kreif, Kewaskum.

Marriage Licenses
Robert Charles Krueger, 

Decatur, Ill., and Sandra Ann 
Bremser, Kewaskum; wed­
ding July 19.

Robert John Scholzen,, 
Pittsville, and Susan Marie 
Stoffel, Kewaskum; wedding 
July 19.

Gerald Mertz, Allenton, 
and Mary Falter, West Bend; 
wedding July 26.

START YOUR 
CHUD ON PIANO

Rent a New 
WURLITZER 

Just $10 A Month 
(Plus Cartoga) 

No Obligation To Buy But 
Full Rental Credit If You Do

DAVE'S
MUSIC CENTER

1 mile north of W**t Bend 
an Highway 45

Open 10 o m to 9 p.m 
Weekdays; Sot. till 5

Mtone 33*4040

NEED 
BRAKES?

SEE THE 
BR’AKE SPECIALIST 
Free Pickup 

and Delivery 

ROGER'S
SERVICE
KEWASKUM

Hwy. 45 South 
626-2888

MEAT VALUES TO STRETCH YOUR DOLLAR!

Dubuque - 12 oz. Skinless

WIENERS 
75c

/MS
Take 

a
Long

Look 

at

These 

Buys!

Keep 

your 
Head 

above 

Inflation!

Parts Missing

Young Hen 
TURKEYS 

55c lb.
Parts Missing

CORNISH HENS
17 oz. Size

89c each
Schweigert - Frozen

BEEF PATTIES
2 lb. Box

$1.73

LIBBY

KETCHUP
2® 01 8 P
Bottle > U

Wf ‘

You'll leap for |oy

CONSUMER REPORT
We hear much today about how business works 

os a rip oft against the consumer Obviously, this 

is not always true The very life blood of our business 

depends upon the honest and fair treatment of you, 

the consumer We have a personal stoke in the 

community just os you do.

That's why you con always expect honest values 

and fair treatment when you shop, here!

Come, join us on a Summer Savings Safari!

Roaring Big Buys! 

Gr r-eat Values!

L Rosenheimer's

UNTAMED SAVINGS!
MAMMOTH VALUES!

MIRACLE WHIP = 99'
FRUIT DRINKS
FANTA SODA 3 - 32 oz. bottles 89c

SWANS DOWN 
Layer Varieties 

CAKE MIXES
Kick the High Cost of Living!

Uh 01 
(and up) 

"9

for these Fresh Produce Specials!

Wis. HEAD LETTUCE 25c ea

Calif. TOMATOES 39c lb

Seedless GRAPES 59c lb

LEMONS 140 size 6 for 49c

10c OH Lobel

TIDE
20c OH Label 10c OH Lobel

CASCADE IVORY
"" *1.21 *1.19

STORE HOURS

MONDAY THRU SATURDAY

8 A. M. - 9 P. M.

SUNDAYS 9 A. M. - 1 P. M.

Valley Home, sliced

PINEAPPLE
Faithful brand

SWEET PEAS
a SUSVELVEETA

Penn Dutch 
MUSHROOMS

4 oz. can 
3/$1.00

good thru Tuesday 
July 29, 1975

Liquid ^W^O 
24 oi Btl ^^J^

save more 
than peanuts?

Shop Here?

STUFT OLIVES
' Prices

5 or 
Jar 

in this ad

free delivery

ON 

REASONABLE ORDER 

IN VILLAGE LIMITS
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the and paradeat picnic

VolunteerKewaskum

Fire Department

the 
the

the 
the 

incouple will be residing 
Sepulveda, California.

Dan Schowalter, father 
the bride.

A reception was held in
Fellowship Room of 
church following the 
mony.

Following a trip to 
New England States,

Schowalter - Lamm
Ken Roth and Mark Scho­
walter.

The ceremony was per­
formed by Rev. Clarence 
Hammen, Waubeka, and Rev.

of

the

SALE
Full SwingNow In

SAVINGSGREAT

Largest StockSelect From

Mary Schowalter and Ste­
ven Lamm were united in 
marriage at Zion United 
Church of Christ, Milwaukee, 
on Saturday, June 28

Mary is the daughter of 
Rev. and Mrs -Dan Schowal­
ter, Milwaukee, formerly of 
Kewaskum Steve is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Jack Lamm, 
Sepulveda, California.

Attending the couple were 
Debbie Schowalter, sister of 
the bride, and Gregory Ogi, 
a friend of the couple. Usher­
ing duties were performed by

Wife showing husband new expensive fur coat she 
just bought: "One can’t help but feel sorry for the 
poor thing that was skinned for this.’’ 
Husband: "I appreciate your sympathy."

FINE FURNITURE

HUGE MID-SUMMER

SAVE BUY NOW

B.C. Ziegler and Company
215 North Main Street / West Bend, Wisconsin 53095 

Phone: 414-334-5521

sik

NAME

Please send prospectus information on Cedar Lake Home Bonds.

ADDRESS PHONE

1 CITY STATE ZIP g

MtWASKUM'S HERITAGE

The top photo shows the It was entered by Winnebago ritage. 
first prize winning float in FS of Kewaskum. Parade

firemen’s picnic parade, theme was “Kewaskum’s He- (Paul Stoffel photo)

This advertisement is neither an offer to sell nor solicitation of offers to buy 
any of these Bonds The offering is made only by the Prospectus

CEDAR LAKE HOME
West Bend, Wisconsin

Sketch of Cedar Lake Home

$1,500,000 
First Mortgage Bonds

1975 Series

Issued by: The Benevolent 
Corporation of the Wisconsin Conference 

of the United Church of Christ, 
Madison, Wisconsin

2 to 316 year Bonds earn 8%
4 to 6 year Bonds earn 816%

616 to 916 year Bonds earn 9%
15 year Bonds* earn 916%

EARN 
UP 
TO

‘The holders of the Bonds due August 1, 1990 have the option to 
redeem at par on August 1, 1985.

PRICE: 100 and accrued interest 
Denominations: $1,000, $5,000, $10,000 

Semi-Annual Interest February 1 and August 1

CALL OR SEND COUPON TODAY
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The marriage vows of Rose 
Marie Zehren, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Aloysius Zeh­
ren, 1021 Milan Dr., Kewas­
kum, and Kenneth Nelson, 
son of Mr and Mrs. Edward 
Nelson, Lutsen, Minn, were 
exchanged during a 1 p. m. 
ceremony at Holy Trinity 
Catholic Church on Satur­
day, July 5. Father John Bud­
de officiated.

Mike Naumann was heard 
as vocal soloist and a cousin, 
Judith Wagner, was organist 
at the rite.

Joan Zehren was the maid 
of honor and Jane Zehren 
was the bridesmaid. Both are 
sisters of the bride.

The best man for the bride­
groom was Jerry Morland of 
Duluth. Alex Terlecky of

Crystal Lake, Ill. was the 
groomsman Ushering duties 
were shared by Robert Shar- 
ot and David Zehren. The 
ring bearer was Joel Larsen

A reception, dinner and 
dance was held at the Came­
lot Country Club following 
the ceremony.

After a wedding trip to 
Nassau the couple will reside 
in Milwaukee.

The bride graduated from 
.Kewaskum High School and 
UW-Stevens Point and prior 
to her marriage was a teach- 
br in Wausau Her husband 
graduated from Grand Mari­
as High School, Minn, and 
the University of Duluth, 
Minn, and is a manufacturers 
representative for S M. Os­
good Company.

Ambulance Calls
Monday, July 21, 2:27 p. 

m _ Clifford Clark, R 2, 
Kewaskum, removed to St. 
Joseph’s Community Hospi­
tal, West Bend, with inju­
ries suffered when his motor­
cycle and an auto driven by 
Louis Backhaus, Kewaskum, 
collided at Hwy. 45 and Pros­
pect Drive.

Monday, July 21, 3:45 p 
m.—Dawn E Buretta, 201 
First St., Kewaskum, and 
Michael Ziolkowski, 2664 S. 
9th Place, Milwaukee, re­
moved to St. Joseph’s Com­
munity Hospital with injuries 
suffered in an auto collision 
at the intersection of Main 
St. and Fond du Lac Ave.

Geri's
BEAUTY SALON

114 Main St. 
Featuring 

Helene Curtis UNIPERMS 
in Savings & Loan Bldg. 

(Rear Entrance) 
PHONE 626 4455 

If no answer 626-2956

IN FREE GIFTS
Buy a new Wickes building 
before August 10,1975, and 
get your choice of free gifts 
from our new 
president^ VENTILATOR

GUTTERS, 
DOWNSPOUTS

WALK-

John V. Drum is the new 
President ot The Wickes 
Corporation, succeeding 
E. I. McNeely, elevated to 
Chairman of the Board.

FREE WALK-IN DOOR 
or other building accessories of 
your choice up to $175 in value. ^T

FREE $175 GIFT CERTIFICATE 
redeemable in merchandise at any Wickes Lum­
ber Center, Wickes Furniture Store or Wickes 
Big Acre Store.

In the Service
Kreif Enlists in Army

Calvin Kreif, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerome Kreif, Ke­
waskum, enlisted in the U.S. 
Army June 27. His address is 
Pvt. Calvin Kreif, 389 66- 
3104, Co. D 3-2-, Snd. Pit., 
Ft Leonard Wood, Mo. 65473.

Opening Soon
J&J AUTO SERVICE

Complete Automotive Service
In Former Herriges Oil Co. Building 

450 E. Main St.
Kewaskum

JIM THORN
JACK ZALEWSKI

Phone 626-2311

REMINDER

Contest entries for the de­
sign of an official Village of 
Kewaskum flag must be sub­
mitted by 4:30 p. m. Aug 1, 
1975 at the Municipal Build­
ing.

7-18-3

EVERY FRIDAY
Beer Batter Fish, Barbecued Ribs, Fried Chicken 

Plus Salad Bar

$2.95 - All You Can Eat
PERCH PLATE — $1.95

SATURDAY & SUNDAY
King Crab, Lobster, Sirloin, Chicken

Plus Salad Bar

$6.95 - All You Can Eat
Plus Our Regular Menu 

m**mmm«/m*«< *”

LIVE MUSIC
Fri., July 25 - Two Hits & a Miss
Sat., July 26-Two Hits & a Miss

i t THE WIGWAM 
A Kewcekum, Wis.

Phone 626-2901
OPEN 7 DAYS A WEEK

LIMITED TIME OFFER ACT NOW. Offer good on any Wickes building bought 
before August 10. 1975 including this new Town & Country utility building 
with rugged Gambrel roof truss construction.

I Call collect or mail coupon today^ Wickes Buildings
A Division of The Wickes Corporation

Ripon, Wisconsin, Box 421 . (414) 748-3021

Elkhorn, Wisconsin, Box 127 • (414) 723-5261

Professionally Engineered Pole Buildings for F*rm and Industry

I Name____________________________
ks

I Address

। Town County

| State—_   Zip. _ Phone
■■^■WWW^l
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WEST BEND SAVINGS...

Is A Good, Safe Place to Save; 
and A Mighty Good Place to 
Get Your Family's Home Loan Financing!

SAVINGS SET NEW RECORDS
Month after month families and savers 
have deposited new record amounts 
in their Insured Savings Accounts and 
Insured Savings Certificates.

There is no real substitute for the safety 
and security of money deposited and 
saved in Insured Accounts. No one has 
ever lost 1’ in an account insured by 
The Federal Savings & Loan Insurance 
Corporation.

West Bend Savings has 5 convenient 
offices throughout Washington County 
for the benefit of our customers. (Our 
6th office will open in Jackson later 
in 1975).

We offer a wide variety of Savings 
Plans paying the highest interest rates 
authorized by the government for those 
types of accounts.

You're invited to open your account 
today.

SPECIAL CUSTOMER SERVICES
You get special service as a West Bend 
Savings customer:

free Tranter's Checks: You can buy all 
the Traveler's Checks you need with 
no fee or charge.

Free Momy Orders: Customers can pur­
chase Free Money Orders at all 5 
offices.

TRANSMATIC’ Money Transfers: An 
Automatic Funds Transfer program lets 
our customers make automatic mort­
gage and savings transfers- You save . 
time and this service is completely 
free.

Cbock-Sev Acceoets: New accounts that 
let you earn interest on your extra 
money that's idle in your checking ac­
count. With just a phone call you can 
transfer funds from your bank checking 
account to your West Bend Savings 
Account or the reverse.

A Home Loan Plan Designed for You
BOARD OF DIRECTORS

West Bend Savings & Loan Association
WEST BEND, WISCONSIN

Statement of Condition at of June 30,1975

ASSETS
Mortgage Loans................................................
Installment Note Loans....................................
Savings Account Loans.................................... 
Accrued Interest on Loans............................... 
Service Corporation Stock ............................  
Federal Home Loan Bonk Stock....................  
Urban Redevelopment Equity Investment . 
U. S. Government Securities.........................  
Notes Receivable............................................ 
Cash on Hand and in Bonks.........................  
Office Buildings and Equipment 
Accrued Interest on Investments 
Real Estate in Judgment................................. 
Accounts Receivable — Participations Sold 
Prepayment to Secondary Reserve of FSLIC 
Deferred Charges and Other Assets

$37,215,807 95 
106,71922 
112,947 71

11,306 00 
229,886 40 
316,900 00

10,000.00
3,378,667 14 

57,000 00
986,333 41
370,771 87 
77,553 73 
43,404 16
44,894 52

108,198 74 
45,212 82

$43,1)5,603 67

LIABILITIES
Savings and Investments..........
Loans in Process............................
Prepaid Taxes and Insurance
Escrow Accounts............................
Loon Fees Undisbursed.............
Deferred Discount Interest ... .
Notes Payable ...............................
Other Liabilities............................  
Reserve for Uncollected Interest 
GENERAL RESERVES.................... 
UNALLOCATED RESERVES

$37,956,829 64 
1,061,938 83

326,629 92
57,662 77
12,212 66
19,343 82

1,320,000 00
124,058 36

2,990 12
1,400,987 40

832,950 1 5
$43,115,603 67

Lower interest rates, longer terms, 
smaller downpayment requirements 
and efficient, expert service are just 
some of the reasons West Bend Savings 
is the most active home loan lender in 
Washington County.

West Bend Savings is one of the few 
lenders in the whole county that pays 
you interest on your Tax Escrows on 
regular loans.

You have a choice of a variety of loan 
plans and you don't pay penalties or 
extra pay-off interest.

Whether you are buying or building 
a home visit one of our offices to dis­
cuss your personalized home loan. We 
think you'll save time and money.

CONTACT THESE OFFICERS FOR 
PERSONALIZED HOMI LOAN SERVICE

RICHARD A LARSON
Chairman of the Board 
and President

H C KAEMPFER
Sr Vice Prevdent

C. J SCHLOEMER

E. J. ALTENDORF
Director, Wes Bend
Morine Bank

A. V. WEAKER 
Prevdent, Header 
engineering 4 Mfg Co.

JOSEPH J ZADRA
Prevdent. Gehl Co

RONALD J LARSON
Partner, A. C Larson 4 Co.

E W KANNENBERG
E. W Kannenberg I Co.

WAYNE • HULTQUIST
Executive Vice Preudent. 
The We# Bend Co

GERMANTOWN — Knight Valind, Vice President -- 255-2900 
SLINGER—Richard King, Slinger Office Manager - 644-5277 
KEWASKUM—Dan Filzen, Loan Officer - 626-2186
WEST BEND—Charles Mann, Vice President -- 334-5563

John Trunk, Senior Loan Officer 
or Marilyn Terrill, Loan Officer

^5^ WEST KNt>

INSURED Ravings & loan
ASSOCIATION

ur T0 k$X*40,0°° > 
'^^fco^

DOWNTOWN WEST IBID 
at 5th & Walnut

WESTFAIR MALL 
on South Main St.

GERMANTOWN 
at Corner 

Mequon & Division Rds

KEWASKUM
at 114 Main St.

SLINGER 
at Village Square 
Shopping Center

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY
LENDER
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VOUU BE SURE OF THE 5HUHIG5 
...UIHER VOU SHOP HI SEHTRV

You save money on your food bills and get full value for every dollar ★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★★

Round SteakFomonvsavings every week on scores of items plus real values chosen by 
Sentry s experienced buyers You re always sure of savings AND 

quality when you shop Sentry s Kitchen Cupboard'

you spend when you visit Sentry s Kitchen Cupboard with special

QUARTERED

<•

RHODES FROZEN WHITE

Lb.

SAVE AT SENTRY

Kree-Mee Ice Cream

59*
A FAVORITE

Grafs Boot Beer

3 Lb $p5
Con I

PLAIN, WITH MEAT OR WITH MUSHROOMS

20Oi CAc 
Bottle JV

r
'uce.CHOCOLATE

Mint Cake Lemonade Rolls
CREAMETTE

c
^ Lb.c

”0°’59*

LAKE TO LAKE MELLOW AGED

Cheddar Cheese
MRS SMITH FROZEN

Cherry Pie ...

ASSORTED COLORS OR DECORATED

Jumbo SeotTowels

JUICY _____

SOUTHERN GROWN

’^99*

1607 Ale
Con “ I

16 Oi A A{ 
Carton X w

35JO?265‘

SENTRY'S U.S. CHOICE

'^ 85*
2^ 89*

Sentry s produce department is brimming with top quality 
resh fruits and vegetables and Super Sale values. Stop in 

today, you'll like what you see!

’p? 79*

^TS*

COLORS OR PRINTED

GRADE A FROZEN
Round
Gallon
Carton

2-Lb.
Pkg.

Blue Bonnet Margarine
U.S.

CHOICE

^ Bump Roust

Bread Dough
$129

£ 79

Raju Spaghetti Sauce

thin Spaghetti

US. 
CHOICE

SENTRY'S U.S. CHOICEKLEMENT’S

Pre-Cooked <190Bratwurst ^’1^ i? Rrd $i 59
Steak.... Lt. ±

KLEMENT’S

Smoked CT
Grillwurst r^l «.... H™
OSCAR MAYER

Sliced o^
Bologna?."

Young Hen 7.IOLb
T 1 Av’’Turkeys.. Lb.

Jumbo Vw 31 <•

CUT-RITE

Wax Paper
2H’k

Kleenex Boutique Tissue

FROZEN CHOPPED OR LEAF

Birds Eye Spinach .. .2 49*
FROZEN CHOPPED

Birds Eye Broccoli . . .3 *£ 89*
FROZEN NON DAIRY

Sentry Creamer
SENTRY

Applesauce . . .

fwoo<l faaberij!

DELICIOUS

CHIPS AHOY OR PECAN SHORTBREAD

Nabisco Cookies .
SENTRY

Cucumber Chips .
PLAIN QUEEN

Holsum Olives .. .
golden

Fluffo Shortening .
CHOCOLATE

Hershey Syrup . .
HEINZ

Tomato Ketchup .

*1™ 6 85* Jl|ity QQ
Peaches. OtF
Sweet /■ A 
Nectarines ^iJF

c
Lb.
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SENTRY
VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON! VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-43

S-44
VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON

On One Large

SAVE

8c
Head 

Lettuce 
25c With Coupon

Valid al Sentry through July 27 1975 
limn One Per AduH CMh Value I 20c

SAVE

8c

On One Bunch S-45

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
Pkg of 6 by BORDEN

SAVE

13c
Eskimo Ice 
Cream Pies 

56c With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975 
Limit One Per Adult-Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-49

SAVE
4H Oz Pkg

9c Frito-Lay 
Potato Chips 

47c With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975 

Limit One Per Adult-Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-52 10 Pound Bag

SAVE

20c
Pillsbury 

Flour
$1.55 With Coupon

Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975
Limit One Per Adult-Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE
S-55

SENTRY COUPON

SAVE
48 Ounce Bottle

22c
Crisco 

Oil 
$1.73 With Coupon

Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975
Limit One Per Adult-Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S 58 6 3 Oz . 25c Off Label Tube

SAVE

10c
Peak 

Toothpaste 
64c With Coupon

Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975 
Limit One Per Adult-Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-61 9 Oz Aerosol Can Cooking Spray

SAVE

34c
Mazola 

No Stick 
85c With Coupon

Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975 
Limit One Por Adult Cash Value 1 20c

Green 
Onions 

11c With Coupon
Valid al Sentry through July 27 1975
Limit One Per Adult-Cam Value ’ 20c

SAVE

22c

32 Oz Bottle Dishwashing Liquid

Pink 
Velvet 

53c With Coupon
Valid al Sentry through July 27 1975
Limit Ono Por Adult-Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-47

SAVE

14c

Jumbo 100 Foot Roll

Saran 
Wrap 

75c With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975
Limit One Per Adult-Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-50

SAVE

15c

16 Ounce Can. Frozen

Snow Crop 
Orange Juice 

64c With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975
Limit One Per Adult-Cash Value ’ 20c

it

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-53

SAVE

26c

16 Oz Bottle KRAFT

Catalina 
Dressing 

83c With Coupon
Vahd at Sentry through July 27. 1975 
Limit One Por Adult-Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S 56

SAVE

18c

S-48

SAVE

30c

38 Oz.. 25c Off Label Box

Axion Enzyme 
Pre-Soak
$1.10 With Coupon

Valid at Sentry through July 27, 1975
Limit One Per Adult-Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-59

SAVE

10c

8 Oz Jar HOLSUM

Horseradish 
Sauce 

47c With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975 
Limit One Per Adutt-Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S 62

SAVE

49c

20 Quart Package

Mix ’n Drink 
Instant Milk 

$3.45 With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975 
Limit One Per Adult Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-51

SAVE

17c

3 Lb Can Regular Drip or Electric Perk

Butter-Nut 
Coffee 

$3.03 With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975
Limit One Per Adult-Gash Value 1 20c

16 Oz Pkg PILLSBURY HUNGRY JACK

Instant Mashed 
Potatoes 

80c With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975 
Limit One Por Adult Cash Value 1 20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON

SAVE

27c

23 Oz Pkg Frozen CHEESE & SAUSAGE

Saluto 
Pizza 

$1.72 With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975
Limit One Per Adult Cash Value 1/20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-57

SAVE

12c
99c Pre-Priced 49 Oz Box

Punch 
Detergent 

87c With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27. 197* 
Limit One Per Adult Cash Value 1/20

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S60

SAVE
Pkg. of 70

22c Wet-Ones 
Towelettes 

97c With Coupon
Valid at Sentry through July 27 1975 
Limit One Per Adult Caah Value 1/20c

VALUABLE SENTRY COUPON
S-63

SAVE

25c

1 5 Oz Size Regular or Unscented Deodorant

Ban 
Roll-On 
80c With Coupon

Valid •’ Sentry through July 27 
Limit One Per Adult cash Value
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Ray Klug
Ray Klug, age 67 years, a 

resident of the Town of Scott, 
Sheboygan County, died at 
9:30 p. m. FYiday, July 18, at 
Sheboygan Memorial Hospi­
tal , where he had been a pa­
tient for four days.

He was born Dec. 2, 1907 
in the Town of Scott to the 
late John and Louisa Staege 
Klug. He was married to Le- 
ta Wilke on June 17, 1931 in 
Immanuel Lutheran Church 
in the Town of Scott with 
Pastor Gustave Kaniess per­
forming the ceremony.

Mr. Klug was a retired 
prominent dairy farmer in 
Town Scott for many years. 
He was also a lifetime mem­
ber of Immanuel Lutheran 
Church and served as deacon 
for several years. He was a 
member of the Lutheran 
Laymens League, Town of 
Scott dartball team, served 
on the Beechwood School 
Board for many years and 
was an honorary member of 
the Beechwood Fire Depart­
ment.

His survivors include his 
wife Leta; two sons, Floyd 
(Laura) and Glen (Marge), 
both of R. 1. Kewaskum; one

WATKINS
Quality Products 
MASON SHOES

WM. J. COULTER 
179 Mill Street 

Cempfcellaport Ph. 53X1554
■hhmhbbbmmmmmmbbbbm

For Low Cost
High Quality

ROOFING
* Call

Erickson Roofing
COLLECT

For FREE ESTIMATES
531-8793

KEEP YOUR BATHROOM

INSTALL A SHOWER 
STALL IN YOUR 

BASEMENT
REGULAR 1114.75 

SALE PRICE 

*103“ 
32” x 32” WITH CURTAIN 

SAFETY GLASS DOORS
. AVAILABLE

DO-IT-YOURSELF OR 
LET US DO IT_

(^ HOME IMPROVEMENT CENTER

JOHANN PLUMBING 
& HEATING, INC.

2450 Hwy 28 Eost 
Kewaskum Wis

334 4 441

daughter, Rogene (Mrs. Ed­
ward) Engelman of R. 2, 
Campbellsport; four grand­
children; two sisters, Mrs. 
Anetta Hintz and Mrs. Elmer 
Stange, both of R 1, Kewas­
kum; two brothers, Victor 
ot R 1, Adell, and Marlin of 
West Allis; many other rela­
tives and friends.

Services were held at 2 p.

BRAT FRY EVERY TUESDAY NIGHT — 50c 
Starting at 6:00 p. m.

THE AMERAHN
'/a mile north of Kewaskum 

on Highway 45 *

Can you help? Will you help? Use the form 
below to send your gift or pledge today.

This message sponsored by

CHECKS SHOULD BE ADDRESSED TO;
CEDAR LAKE HOME PROJECT MIRACLE

Please print your Name and Address below:

NAME...............................................................................

ADDRESS ..........................................................................

CITY................................................ STATE..........ZIP....

TELEPHONE (optional).....................................................

Your Signature................................................

—Enclosed is $_ _ _ _ _ for the
Special Care Center "Project 
Miracle" Crusade.

_ l/We pledge $_ _ _ _ _ to 
the Special Care Center 
"Project Miracle" Crusade.

_ Payments on Date (s) _ _ _

_ Partial amount enclosed

When I am 75...

... will there be anyone who cares about me, 
will there be anyone to offer the friendship 
and concern I am sure to need?

When you are older and need a comfortable 
place to live among friends, where life can still 
be an interesting adventure, with every day a 
new opportunity to enjoy the human ex­
perience - The Cedar Lake Home, with its 
congenial people and spacious surroundings 
will be available.

Many individuals and organizations have 
already contributed cash and made pledges on 
behalf of this project for the confused aging. 
Others are endowing a special memorialized 
place in the new building on behalf of a loved 
one. Are you willing to help now with 
whatever you can find it in your heart to give? 
Your gift will help not only those so sorely in 
need today, but many others for years and 
years into the future.

But what about the elderly confused, the 
aged sclerotic who can no longer care for his 
own simple wants? Who takes care of the con­
fused older individual who needs so much love 
and care?

Cedar Lake Home is now building a new, 
separate facility to provide 128 beds for the ar- 
terio-sclerotic confused most in need of help. It 
is designed for small family sized living units 
where residents can associate as members of a 
group — and at their own level of awareness 
enjoy a satisfying life with dignity.

It will cost a total of $2,300,000 to build and 
equip this badly needed refuge for those so 
much in need. Bonding will finance part of it, 
but to make bonding practical, the remainder 
of pledges, cash contributions, and en­
dowments are needed by August 15th.

Providing for our retirement years calls for 
more than building up a cash reserve. If you 
can also help to provide a home and loving 

, care for those aged so much in need of concern 
', and understanding, you will surely be doing 

God's work, the most worthy of man's en­
deavors.

Kewaskum Office, West Bend Savings & Loan Association

m Monday at Immanuel Lu­
theran Church with Pastor 
Robert Wilcken officiating. 
Burial was in the church ce­
metery.

Visitation was at the 
church only from 11 a m. 
until the time of services at 
2 p. m. Monday. Miller’s Fu­
neral Home, 215 Forest Ave., 
Kewaskum, was in charge.

Try a classified ad for 
quick results.

LIVE MUSIC
ERL, JULY 25 - NORMIE DOGS

Benefit for 
Sally Tyda Gartzke

FRIDAY, AUGUST I

PRIVATE WEDDING
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Locals
Mr. and Mrs. Roland Back- 

us of Lakeworth, Fla. spent 
Thursday and Friday of last 
week in Kewaskum on busin­
ess and visited Ed Backus 
and family. Mrs. Shirlee 
Gaffke and family, Gerald 
Backus, Ralph and Eileen 
Hein and Mrs. V. C. Backus

Tired of scrubbing carpet­
ing? Clean it with Nylar 
quickly and easily. No mach­
ine needed Miller’s Fine Fur­
niture carries Nylac.

KEWASKUM 
Roseland Hills

Large improved lots now available 
in prime area of town.

They are adjoining proposed new 
village park and swimming pool. 
— Act Now & Build Later —

SCHULZ REALTY CORP.
2395 W. Washington St. 338-6106

FARM TIRE SERVICE

It doesn’t take an economist 
to tell you that inflation is 
when a fixed income is des­
perately in need of repair.

MR FARMER
We will pay good 

also FREE pickup
prices for 
service tor

Mondays and Thursdays.
(When Economically

Fresh Fallen Cattle, 
Hogs and Calves on

Feasible)

DARLING & CO.
FOND DU LAC 

Toil Free 1-800-242-9700

WAGON SALE

LETTERS 
TO THE 

EDITOR

COMPLETE TRACTOR TIRE 
SERVICE

We Will Change Your Tractor 
Tire on Your Farm

— New and Used Tires —
PASSENGER — TRUCK — TRACTOR

’75
*15

’75
’75

Kewaskum Statesman:
We believe that the article 

about Kewaskum Cares on 
page 15 should have been 
placed on page 1 instead of 
telling us about the resur­
facing of Hy. 45 South which 
everyone knew about the 
past week.

Sally (Tyda) Gartzke sure 
deserves front page coverage 
on her problem.

Ralph & Eileen Hein
EDITOR’S NOTE Besides 

the article last week we also 
ran one in a previous issue 
(July 4) about the benefit 
dance for Sally (Tyda) Gart­
zke, which is a most worthy 
cause. In all it was given al­
most 15 inches of space. We 
feel this is a fair amount of 
free publicity for a benefit. 
Furthermore it was given 
mention for the past four 
consecutive weeks in the A- 
merahn ad in the paper. As 
far as the Hwy. 45 resurfac­
ing is concerned we think a 
$208,959.36 project merits 
front page coverage in inter­
est to the taxpayer.

HERRIGES OIL, INC
1245 Fond du Lac Ave. phone 626-2244

DIAMOND F. CORPORATION
SEPTIC TANK CLEANING,

Holding Tank, Septic and Holding 
Tanks Installed, Industrial Waste 

CALL COLLECT 
677-3565 or 677-3623 

or 488-3051 or 246-6129

3281 Sunset Graze 
Richfield, Wi 53076
Operated by Theo. Fleisner

Licensed by Wisconsin State Board of Health

NOTICE
OF ANNUAL

• I complete service dealt
J N 120 MAIN 

OFFICE’
PRODUCTS 

D
KEWASKUM I

c
Office Supplies, Copiers, Fur­
niture, Typewriters, Adders, 
Calculators.
— SALES - SERVICE —

SCHOOL DISTRICT MEETING
Notice is hereby given to the qualified electors of the Kewaskum 

Community Schools, Joint School District No. 2, of the Village of 
Kewaskum, Towns of Kewaskum. Barton, Farmington and Wayne, 
County of Washington, State of Wisconsin, Towns of Ashford 
and Auburn, County of Fond du Lac, State of Wisconsin, Towns of 
Mitchell and Scott, County of Sheboygan. State of Wisconsin, 

that the
Annual Meeting 
of said District 

will be held on the 
28th day of July, 1975 

immediately following the 
Budget Hearing which commences 

at 8.00 P. M. in the 
Kewaskum High School 

Multi-Purpose Room
Notice is further given that the business to be transacted at 

said Annual Meeting will be as follows:
(1) to consider and adopt a budget for the fiscal year of said 

district ending June 30, 1976.
(2) to transact such other and further business as may be 

properly transacted at said meeting according to law. _

Honeck Chevrolet
KEWASKUM

Dated July 1, 1975. James D Oelhafen, District Clerk 
Kewaskum Community Schools 
Jt. School District No. 2

’74 
’73 
’73 
'73 
’72 
’72 
’71 
’70 
’70 
’70 
’68
’67

NEW
Chev. Impala 6-pass. 
Chevelle Malibu 6-pass.

DEMO
Chev. Inipala 9-pass.
Vega 4 cyl. - automatic

USED
Chev. Impala 6-pass. - Air
Pontiac Safari 6-pass. - Air 
Chev. Impala 9-pass. - Air 
Ford LTD 6-pass.
Chev. Caprice 9-pass.
Vega - 4 cyl. - 1 sp. - Rebuilt Engine
Vega - 4 cyl. 3 sp. - Economy
Chev. Bel Air 6-pass. - V8 - AT
Chev. Bel 'Air 6-pass. - V8 - AT 
Volkswagen - 4 cyl. - AT
Chev. Caprice 9 pass. - V8 - AT 
Chevelle 6-pass. - V8 - AT

HONECK
CHEVROLET

Hwy. 45 - Kewaskum, Wis, 53040
Phone 414-626-2161

Daily 8 a.m. to 9 p.m. - Sat. 8 a.m. to 5 p.m.

A Flag For Your Hone

w

BEAilT/Full x'7g 
BiceNTe^NiAL 

FLAG5

AIs9,
A vd H ^ b IC •

5b STAR FLAGV^Ilh^l^ 
PC A G ^ £775
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Lduun sei^
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PotT 384
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HoHeK sgHA^-8 
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^AV terMer 
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AHcCiCArf UEGioN’
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RUMMAGE SALE — Friday 

and Saturday, July 25 and 
26, 8 a m. to 8 p. m., one 
mile west of Kewaskum on 
Hwy. 28 Mrs Ruben Op­
permann. Ip

FOR SALE -Washer, 3 quar­
ter size bed, clarinet, and 
clothes. Ph. 626-2877. It

WANT TO RENT—Responsi­
ble couple wishes to rent 
small home or first floor 
flat in Kewaskum or West 
Bend. Willing to do yard 
work. Call after 5 p. m. 
533 8675.7-25-2p

FOR SALE—’76 McCormick 
combine power takeoff 
pick-up attachment only.

Good condition. $500. Pat 
Haacker, 1 mile south of 
Brownsville - HH. Phone 
583 3571.Ip

FOR RENT—Upper two bed­
room apartment, partially 
furnished. Phone 626-2998

7-18-tf
BABYSITTING—Will do ba­

bysitting in my home, day­
time or evenings. Phone 
533-8685.7-18-2

HELP WANTED — Babysit­
ter in my home, day shift,
your own transportation. 
Start after Sept. 1. Phone 
626-4604.7-18-2

FOR SALE Red raspberries. 
Clarence Schmitt, ¥4 mile 
west of Elmore. Phone 533- 
8419.01- pick your own.lt.

FOR RENT—New beautiful 
country view two bedroom 
apartment. Stove and re­
frigerator furnished Fully 
carpeted. $160 per month. 
Hwy. H & Bel-Ric Dr., Ke­
waskum Call 626 2820 or 
626 4473.7-18-tf

FOR SALE — Cornet, good 
condition, $125. Ph. 626- 
4663.7-11-tf

FOR RENT — Heated upper 
4-room apartment, avail­
able Aug. 1. Bauer’s 139 
W. Main, Campbellsport.

7-11-tf

FOR SALE — 1971 14x70 
Schult 3 bedroom mobile 
home. Mediterranean de­
cor, spacious kitchen and 
living room. Many extras, 
including metal storage 
shed. Excellent condition. 
Ph. 626 4620.7-4-4t

FOR RENT—Two bedroom 
apartment available Aug. 
1. Carpeting and applian­
ces included. Near schools, 
shopping and churches in 
Kewaskum Five Corner 
Apartments Phone 626- 
2836 or 533 4430 6 20 tf

LANDSCAPING and LAWN 
MAINTENANCE - Call for 
free estimates anytime, 
626-2432 Schultz’s Green- 
hous. Lawn & Garden Cen­
ter, Kewaskum. 6-20-tf

REALTOR*
If you want to buy or sell 
Home — Farm — Business

Contact

Norb Rohlin <<er
Representing 

BOW!. & WTMNGER 
REAI/TY. INC.

in the Kettle Moraine Area 
PHONE 626 23:<2 

LISTINGS NEEDED

PART TIME HELP WANT 
ED—Between 7 and 9 a m. 
and 2:45 to 4:45 p. m. to 
drive school bus for John­
son School Bus in the Ke­
waskum district Prefer 
housewives and young re­
tirees Will train. Please 
call for appointment, 626- 
4414.   6-27-2

LAWN & GARDEN NEEDS 
See Schultz’s Greenhouse, 
Lawn & Garden Center for 
excellent quality and rea­
sonable prices. Call any- 
time, 626-2432. 6-20-tf

CHAIN SAW sharpening and 
repair. Laubenstein Lawn 
& Garden Mart, Kewas* 
kum. Ph. 626-2553. 12 6-tf

Where else but at 
LAUBENSTEIN’S 

can you get such a variety 
of parts for the following: 

Briggs & Stratton Engines 
Tecumseh Engines (also
Craftsman) /

Peerless Transaxles
Kohler Engines
Gates Green Line V Belts 
Complete Selection of Small
V-Belts

Toro Lawn Mowers
Jacobson Mowers 
I^wn Boy Mowers 
John Deere Complete Line 
Ariens Complete Line 
Pioneer Chain Saws 
Disston Cordless Grass
Shears or Hedge Trimmers 

Engine or Transmission Oils 
Grease Guns & Grease 
Lawn Mower Blades and
Adapters 

Throttle & Choke Cables 
Batteries

We Will Service Your 
Lawn Equipment 

As you can see SERVICE 
is Building Our Business 
LAUBENSTEIN 

LAWN & GARDEN MART 
R 2 - (2 drs. South of 

Bonne Belle Motel) 
Kewaskum - PhMJ2fl-2553

Hours 8 to 5:30 Daily 
Mon & Fri. Till 9 p. m. 

Saturday 8 a. m. to 3 p. m.
Closed Sundays

Bowe 6> Woninger Realty, Inc.
656. Opportunity of a lifotimo! 

Sport and boit shop, posotino 
sales, boat rentals ana sales, 
plus many other items, located 
in heart of Kettle Moraine area 
with no competition. Owner 
soys "SELL", land contract 
available, plus inventory. Ask­
ing $70,000.00.

575. Reduced to $7,500.00. 11 most­
ly wooded acres, rood front­
age on 2 roads; seller will fur­
nish survey ond percolation 
test.

600. Beautiful 7 acre wooded parcel 
with creek ambling through. 
Ct a ,new 74 x 36 metal 

Iding. Park-like setting.
Nice site for building. 
$12 500.00

612. laundromat in small village. 10 
brand new washers. 4 dryers, 
complete with 3 bedroom liv­
ing quarters, located in center 
of town.

650. Secluded mini form. 49 acres. 4 
bedroom home carpeted liv­
ing room ond family room, oil 
furnace, large horse barn, 
north of Wayne $55,000.00

604. 5 bedroom country home, 
olumfcumjgsiding. ^excellent 
conxLon^orje qMg« aod 
shedA Are <PionP;Mlan»on 
area $30 000 00

661 Country living carpeted 3 
bedroom ranch with large liv­
ing room ond kitchen with 
lovely cathedral ceilings, full 
bath and '4 bath off master 
bedroom, full basement, on 1 
acre of land juste. Mi of Kewas 
kom $34 900 00

OFFICE: 131 Main St,
Paul Albinger, Broker-Sales — Phone 334-9163 

Mike Walsh, Sales — Phone 626-4757 
Norbert Rohlinger, Broker-Sales — Phone 626-2332

Full Time Realtors and Appraisers

BULK GRASS SEED—69c 
and 89c lb. Laubenstein 
Lawn & Garden Mart. Ph 
626-2553 4-11-tf

SERVICES OFFERED—Pere 
tests - septic systems in­
stalled - swimm’ng pools - 
field tiling. Schwartz Tren 
ching. Phone Arnold Kutz 
334 5004 or Gary Schwartz 
994-4535. 5 23-tf

SERVICES OFFERED-Small 
engines, motorcycle, snow­
mobile, lawn and garden 
equipment and outboard 
repair. Ked-Web of Ke­
waskum, 1204 Fond du Lac 
Ave. Phone 626-4344. 18-tf

SERVICES OFFERED—Ma­
sonry and cement. Len Lu- 
terbach Construction. Qua­
lity work at competitive 
prices. Estimates given 
free. Call evenings 334- 
9335 or 692-9233. 9-6-tf

MACHINIST WANTED—To 
help set up production tur­
ret lathes Must have ap­
proximately 25 years ex­
perience. Could use retired 
men, nart time. Apply Hy­
draulic Gear, Kewaskum, 
or cal1 626 2191 1-17-tf

SERVICES OFFERED
FLITTER’S CARPET 

CLEANING
Steam Cleaning
Roger Flitter, 
(Campbellsport

533 4954
5-16-tf

HIGHEST PRICES paid for 
old newspapers, copper, 
brass, aluminum, lead and 
batteries. Lynn’s Waste Pa- 

. per Co., 12T Island [Ave., 
West Bend, Wis.

WMSM INKS MALE! 

KEWASKUM 
REALTY 

KEWASKUM, WB. 

338-8500 
626-4392

616. REDUCED
3 bedroom mobile home, living 
room, kitchen, dining area 
with bar, utility room plus 
small room, full both, front ond 
back porch and shed. 
$4.950 00. Kewaskum,

625 . 3 miles from Kewaskum. 
Spotless 2 story form home 
with 5 bedrooms. 2 full baths. 2 
kitchens, new aluminum siding 
ond combinations. 2 new steel 
buildings, barn other out 
buildings, along the banks of 
Milwaukee River. 53 acres of 
scenic beauty. Priced to sell at 
$85,000.00. More land avail­
able. up to 120 acres.

637 . 40 acre parcel • Kewaskum 
area. Would split into smaller 
parcels. $30 900 00

270-2 10 plus acres, T. of Wayne. 
Mostly low land with creek run­
ning thru; one building site. 
800" of rood frontage. $7,500

499. 20 acres or more in Town of 
Farmington, Washington 
County. Some trees. Geek 
running through land. Ideal 
building site with pond pos- 
sbililies. Price $750 acre.

632. Extro sharp mini-farm 5 acres, 
large barn, completely re­
modeled 4 bedroom home 1 'A 
baths natural fireplace, car­
peted throughout $47,500.00. 
More lond available

64 8 4 bedroom home in country on 
2 ocres. large living room 
large kitchen full bath full 
basement $27 500 00 
More land available.

KEWASKUM Phone 626-4757

SALES POSITIONS
Local company needs 3 

representatives in immediate 
area to sell and service es­
tablished business accounts. 
21 or over, bondable, col­
lege education preferred. 
Looking for individuals with 
athletic background. Excep­
tionally good fringe benefits. 
Send resume to Box (No 9H, 
Kewaskum An Equal Oppor- 
tunity Employer. M/F. 11-3
LAND WANTED — Cash or

Terms - prefer wooded 
with or without water 
frontage. 40 to 160 acres. 
Write R Susnar, 500 N. 
Vine, Appleton, Wis 54911 
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CARD OF THANKS
We desire to express our 

sincere thanks to all our re­
latives and friends for their 
kindness during our recent 
bereavement, the death of 
our dear mother, mother- 
in-law and grandmother, 
ELEANOR F1RKS Special 
thanks to Pastor Hoenecke, 
organist, pallbearers, Senior 
Citizens, donors of floral and 
memorial tributes, ladies who 
served, food donors, ambu­
lance squad. Miller’s Funeral 
Home, traffic officer, custo­
dian, sexton, all who helped 
us in any way and all who 
showed their respect.

The Surviving F’amily

NOTICEII 
WASHINGTON COUNTY 
postponed Real Estate Taxes are 

DUE JULY 31, 1975
Payment may be made at the Courthouse 

or Mailed to:

Robert J. Klein, County Treasurer 
P.O. Box 518, West Bend, Wis. 53095

USED[DRS
*74 Dodge Coronet, 4 Dr. V8, 

Automatic, Very Clean
’74 Vega Hatchback Coupe, 

Like New
’74 Ford Torino 4-Dr., 

Like New
’73 Ford LTD Sta. Wagon 
’73 Vega Hatchback,

4 Cyl., 4 Speed 
'73 Maverick “Grabber” 

Small V8 Automatic 
’73 Pontiac Station Wagon

6 Pass., Low Mileage
*72 Chevelle Malibu Coupe, 

V8. Automatic
'72 Ford Torino Coupe, 

Low mileage
’72 VW Beetle, 

Low Mileage

USED TRUCKS
’74 Chev. ’A Ton Pickup, 

Automatic Trans., Fully 
Equipped, 4,500 Miles

’74 Chev. Suburban Carryall 
V8, Automatic, Equipped 
for towing, Low mileage

’74 Chev. 4-Wheel Drive 
Pickup, Fully Equipped 
W/Snow Plow

’74 Dodge “Kary Van”, 
V8 Automatic

PLUS MANY OTHER PICKUPS AND LARGER TRUCKS

HONECK 
Chevrolet, Inc. 

KEWASKUM Phono 624-2161

FOR SALE BY OWNER -3 
bedroom Cape Cod hoMe. 
2 car garage. Kewaskum 
Phone 626-2566.

6 6 tf

FOR SALE — Residential 
building lot in new subdi­
vision in Village of Ke­
waskum. Phone 284-2641 
or 284-4588 after 5 p. m. 
and weekends.___ 9-27-tf 

HELP WANTED - FEMALE 
—Attention Demonstrators -

Toys & Gifts. Work now 
thru December. Free sam­
ple kit. No experience 
needed. Call or write San­
ta’s Parties, Avon, Conn. 
06001. Phone 1 (203) 673- 
3455. Also booking par­
ties.

CARD OF THANKS
We desire to express our 

most sincere thanks to all our 
relatives and friends fortheir 
kindness during the time of 
illness and after the death of 
our dear husband, father, 
father-in-law and grandfath­
er, RAY KLUG Special 
thanks to Pastor Wilcken, or­
ganist, singers, pallbearers, 
donors of floral and memori­
al tributes, ladies who serv­
ed, Miller’s Funeral Home, 
custodian, sexton, all who 
showed their respect and all 
who helped us in any way.

The Surviving Family

’72 Impala 4-Dr. Sedan, 
Low Mileage

’72 Vega Station Wagon
4 Cyl., 3 Speed,

’72 Chev. Impala Custom Cp< 
V8 Automatic (i2j

’71 Monte Carlo, 
2 to Chose From

’71 Buick Skylark Coupe, V8 
Automatic - Very clean

’71 Ford Sport Coupe, 
V-8 Automatic

’70 Chev. Tmnala Custom 
Coupe, V8, [Automatic

*70 Impala 4-Dr. Sedan
’69 Ford LTD 4Df.

V8 Automatic

’73 Chev. % Ton Pickup, 
V8, 4 Speed

’73 Chev. % T. V8 Automatic
’72 Ford % Ton V8,

3 Speed
’71 Chev. ¥2 Ton Pickup,

6 Cvl., 3 Speed
’71 Ford ¥2 T. Pickup, 6 Cyl.

3 Speed, Very Nice
’66 Chev. ¥2 Ton

6 Cyl., 3 Speed



Kewaskum Statesman
Friday, July 25, I!»*.">

State of Wisconsin 
Washington County Court 
PROBATE BRANCH
ORDER SETTING TIME TO 
PROVE WILL AND HEIR­
SHIP AND NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS.

IN THE MATTER OF THE 
ESTATE OF JAMES E. 
RYAN, Deceased.

A petition for the probate- 
of the Will, and determina­
tion of heirship, of James E. 
Ryan a/k/a James Edward 
Ryan and James Ryan, Wash­
ington County, Wisconsin, 
post officb address % Cedar 
Lake Home, 5595 Hy. Z, 
West Bend, Wis. 53095, hav­
ing been filed;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
1. The petition be heard at 

the Washington County 
Courthouse, in West Bend, 
Wisconsin, on August 5, 1975, 
at the opening of Court or 
thereafter;

2. All creditors* ’ claims 
must be filed on or before 
October 8, 1975, or be 
barred.

Dated July 8, 1975
By the Court,

/s/ J. Tom Merriam 
County Judge.

NOTE PLEASE CHECK 
WITH THE ATTORNEY AS 
TO THE EXACT TIME OF 
HEARING.
McKENNA LAW OFFICE 
Attorney
114 Main Street
Kewaskum, Wisconsin 53040
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NOTICE OF MEETING 
OF BOARD OF REVIEW
State of Wisconsin,) 
Washington County,) ss. 
Town of Kewaskum)

Public Notice is Hereby 
Given That the Board of 
Review for the said Town of 
Kewaskum will meet at the 
Labor Center Hall in the 
Village of Kewaskum, on the 
30th day of July, 1975 at 9 
o’clock in the forenoon, for 
the purpose of reviewing and 
examining the assessment 
roll of real and personal 
property therein, and of cor­
recting all errors in said roll, 
whether in description of 
property or otherwise, and to 
perform such other duties im­
posed by law.

HOURS: 9 a. m. to 12 p. 
m (noon).

Evening appointments can 
be arranged in advance by 
calling the Town Clerk, 626- 
2550.
Dated July 21, 1975

Barbara Hinz, 
Town Clerk

Kewaskum Ed^ed 
By Slinger, 6-5, 
Tips Belgium, 9-4

In a Tri-County Nite Lea­
gue game at Slinger Satur­
day, Kewaskum was nosed 
out, 6-5. The winners rallied 
from a 5 3 deficit with a 3 
run rally in the 8th to win. 
The winners outhit Kewas 
kum, 9-7. Tom Theusch went 
the distance and was the los­
er, striking out 5. Tom Beinc 
and Lee Wagner worked for 
Slinger with Wagner the 
winner. He fanned 7 John 
Keller, Brian Williams and
Dan Karius paced Slinger 
with 2 hits. Keller’s included 

,a home run.
On Sunday in a Land o’ 

Lakes contest here, Kewas­
kum defeated Belgium (2-9) 
by a 9-4 score. The victory 
moved Kewaskum (3-8) into

Each team got the same num­
ber of hits as they had runs. 
Kewaskum had 2 3-run inn­
ings. Tom Bartelt, the win­
ner, and Jeff Klos, the loser, 
both went the route. Klos 
struck out 10 and Bartelt 3 
There were 13 errors in the 
game. Tom Theusch led Ke­
waskum with 3 hits and Dan 
Marx got 2. Gonwa got 2 for 
Slinger.

On Sunday, July 27, Ke­
waskum hosts Barton in a 
Lakes tilt at 2:30 following 
the Old Timers game at 1:00 
and Wednesday, July 30, the 
team plays a return game at 
Barton in the Tri-County 
loop at 8:00.

NORTH POINT 
SHOPPING CENTER 

FOR RENT
1,200 to 2,400 sq. ft.

(Next to Dove's Music Center) 
Rent bused on 1972 rotes 

Immediate occupancy 
33M444

Bartoli's Produce
SWEET CORN

New Homegrown Potatoes 
Fresh Fruits & Vegetables 
9:00 to 9:00 — Monday thru Friday 
9:00 to 6:00 — Saturday & Sunday

4 miles North of Kewaskum on Hwy. V 

Phono 533-4092

Pu ppy 1 and Press 
Pet Patrol

If you have lost a pet 
or found one, please call

PUPPYLAND, 334-4640 
Also dogs, pups and cats 

for adoption

TOP CASH
for disabled or 

DEAD 
COWS & HORSES 

Humane-
Phone Collect 

Oshkosh 233 1010 

nelson farm
SERVICE

Village of Kewaskum 
Advertisement for Bids

Curb and Gutter
KNIGHTS AVE. - EDGEWOOD ROAD - FOREST AVE.

Notice is hereby given that sealed proposals for the following 
work will be received by the Village Clerk of the Village of 
Kewaskum. Wisconsin until 8:00 P. M. August 18, 1975 at 
the Municipal Building at which time and place such pro­
posals will be publicly opened and read.
Principal items of construction include:

3,850 lineal feet of curb and gutter
The contract documents, including plans and specifications 
may be obtained at the office of Arthur and Associates, Inc., 
548 Prairie Road, P O. Box 1222, Fond du Lac, Wisconsin 
upon the depositof ten dollars ($10.00) for each set. The de­
posit will be refunded to those parties returning the set of 
contract documents, including plans and specifications in 
good condition not later than ten days after the opening of 
bids. Each proposal shall be submitted on the standard pro­
posal form included in the contract documents. The entire 
contract documents shall be enclosed in a sealed envelope 
endorsed on the outside, VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM, CURB 
AND GUTTER.
Each proposal will be accompanied by a certified check or 
bank draft payable to the Village Treasurer, or a satisfac-. 
tory bid bond in an amount of not less than five-percent 
(5%) of the bid as a guarantee that if the proposal is accept­
ed, a contract will be entered into and the performance of 
the contract is properly secured.
The letting of the above described work is subject to the 
provisions of Section 66.293 of the Wisconsin Statutes.
The successful bidder will be required to furnish a satisfac­
tory Performance Bond and a Labor and Material Bond in 
the sum of the full amount of the contract.
No bid shall be withdrawn after the opening of bids without 
the consent of the Village Board for a period of thirty (30) 
days after the scheduled time of closing bids.
The Village Board reserves the right to reject any or all bids, 
to waive any informalities in bidding and select the bids 
that will best serve the interest of the Vllla«e- 
Published by authority of the Village Board of the Village o 
Kewaskum the 25th day of July and the 1st day of August.
1975. William Martin

Village Clerk

call “OLE CROW’’animal service
When Bowe the Cow is deed. down, or dr Mb led
DIAL TOLL TREE I 800242 0389 or 1 BOO242 0343 

OFFERING IHE FARMER'
• FREE PICKUP SERVICE ON Al L COWS AND HEIFERS

TOLL IRtE DIRECT DIAL PHONE SERVICE
CASH AND BUCKSKIN GIOVES WHEN THE MKT Al I OWS 
PROMPI 3 HR SERVICE

Official
ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS

FOR

Basement Lounge & Storage Rooms
FOR

SAMARITAN HOME
FOR

The Board of Supervisors 
of Washington County 

County Court House
432 East Washington Street 

West Bend, Wisconsin
BIDS CLOSE; 12.00 Noon Central Daylight Saving Time 
DATE: 8/5/75
BIDS OPENED: 2:00 P. M. Central Daylight Saving Time 
DATE: 8/5/75 
DELIVER TO- Office of the County Clerk 
LOCATION: Washington County Court House
DRAWINGS AND PROJECT MANUAL:

Prepared by: WENZEL ZOLLER-GUNN & ASSOCI­
ATES, LTD , ARCHITECTS 
15255 Watertown Plank Road 
Elm Grove, Wisconsin 53122 
(Phone 414/782-1855 
Dated: 7/22/75

Sealed proposals, endorsed with the name and address of the 
Bidder and Title of the work, will be received for the 
County Board of Washington County, by Mr. George Nehr- 
bass, County Clerk, at this office, at place, time, and date 
indicated above. Bids will be opened at place, time and date 
also indicated above, at which time they will be opened 
publicly and read aloud, for the above titled project.
Project Manual and bidding documents may be obtained 
from the office of the Architects, 15255 Watertown Plank 
Road, Elm Grove, Wisconsin, and may be seen at the Build­
ers Exchange in Milwaukee, at F. W. Dodge Corporation 
in Milwaukee, and at the Washington County Court House. 
A fifty dollar ($50.00) deposit is required for each set of 
plans and project manual. The full amount of the deposit 
will be refunded if the plans and project manual are re­
turned undamaged within thirty (30) days after the date 
of bid opening.
Bidder’s Proof of Responsibility in the form provided shall 
have been filed with the Washington County Clerk, West 
Bend, Wisconsin, at least ten (10) days prior to the opening 
of bids. Forms for such Bidder’s Proof of Responsibility 
must be secured at the office of the County Clerk, County 
Court House, West Bend, Wisconsin.
The Board of Supervisors of Washington County, the Owner, 
reserves the right to reject any or all bids, or any bid 
which in the opinion of the Owner will be insufficient to 
carry out the work under the terms of the Contract and 
Specifications; or to waive any ir regularities in any bid; 
or to accept any bid which wild be to the best interest of 
the County.
Lump sum bid will be received as follows:

a) General Construction (including Plumbing, Heating, 
Ventilating and Electrical Work) including but not 
limited to the following-
Demolition work, masonry including concrete work, 
carpentry including painting and finishing, sealants, 
metal door frames, wood doors including varnishing, 
finish hardware, glazing, ceramic tile work, plumbing, 
heating, ventilating and electrical.

No bid may be withdrawn for a period of thirty (30) days 
after the date set for the opening thereof.
A certified check or a bid bond payable to the Owner in an 
amount not less than five (5%) per cent of the maximum 
bid shall accompany each bid as a guarantee that if the 
bid is accepted the bidder will execute and file the proper 
contract and bond within ten (10) days after being notified 
of the acceptance of his bid.
Published by the authority of

THE INSTITUTIONS COMMITTEE 
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
WASHINGTON COUNTY, WISCONSIN 
George Nehrbass, County Clerk 
Washington County

Dated at:
West Bend, Wisconsin



Koth Pitche* No-Hitter Against
Lomira in Tournament; Fans 14

Senior Scott Koth reached 
the height of his high school 
career when he pitched a no­
hit, no-run game and struck 
out 14 batters in a 2-0 victo­
ry over Lomira here Monday 
night in the WIAA Regional 
Tournament opener. And to­

40 or over and out of base­
ball for 5 years are eligible 
to play. The old timers are 
invited to practice on Satur-
day afternoon, July 26, 
1:30.

at

mira 
ence 

As
the

is the Flyway Confer- 
champion.
a result of Koth’s gem, 
Indians advanced to

Thursday night’s 8 p. m. Re­
gional championship game a- 
gainst Campbellsport, which 
drew a first-round bye. It 
is hoped Koth will again be 
on the mound for the Indians. 
This game will also be played 
here. The winner will ad­
vance to next week’s Section­
als.

Kewaskum shortstop Ran­
dy Koepke made a dazzling 
play behind second base on 
Jeff Neitzel’s ground ball in 
the first inning and threw out 
Lomira’s leadoff man. After 
that Koth, who has a 6-6 re­
cord, was the complete mas­
ter. He allowed his only two 
walks in the second inning 
with two out but got the next 
batter and nothing closely re­
sembled a hit the remainder 
of the way.

Koth also had a bunt sin­
gle in Kewaskum’s two-run 
fifth inning off Lomira’s

Indians Lose 
Two of Last 
Three Games

In playing 3 games 3 days 
in a row last week, the Ke­
waskum Indians lost 2 of
them and won 1 
of the title race 
the season with
cord.
shared

Hartland

to drop out 
and wind up 
an 8-6 re- 
and Slinger

the Scenic Moraine

starting 
Myles 
turned 
mance.

and losing pitcher 
Geschke, who also 
in a strong perfor- 
striking out seven

and giving up six hits. Mike 
Koepke’s single sent in John 
Kleinman, who had walked, 
and Koth with the only runs 
of the game. Both runners 
had moved up on a throwing 
error.

Koth’s 6-6 record this sea­
son is deceptive Four of his 
six losses have come by one 
run, including three 1-0 set­
backs. He has 102 strikeouts 
in 12 games. His earned run 
average is probably around 
10 or below.

Koth’s no-hitter came as no 
real big surprise as he has 
been flirting with this for se­
veral years. He has pitched a 
number of one-hitters and 
two-hitters and also had a no- 
hitter going for six and one- 
third innings last week a- 
gainst Pewaukee He faced 
just 24 batters in the Lomira 
contest, two of the base run­
ners getting on on walks and 
the other on a drooped third 
strike by the . catcher. He 
struck out the side in two 
innings.

Praise should also go out 
to the Koepke cousins. Mike 
and Randy Mike came thru 
with a big single that scored 
both Indian runs and Randy’s 
fine defensive play in the 
first inning saved the no-hit­
ter Mike’s hit came in the 
fifth with John Kle’nman on 
third and Koth on second 
Kleinman had walked and 
Koth reached on a perfect 
bunt single. Both runners ad­
vanced on a bad throw trying 
to nail Koth.

championship, both with 10- 
4 marks.

Slinger iced a share of the 
crown here Wednesday night 
in beating the Indians, 3-1. 
The next night the Owls lost 
to Hartland, however, which 
cost them the undisputed ti­
tle. Slinger got on board with 
2 runs in the top of the 3rd 
when Tom Luken singled 
with runners on 2nd and 3rd 
Kewaskum scored its only 
run in the 4th to make it 2 1 
John Kleinman reached 2nd 
on an error, advanced to 3rd 
on a ground out and scored 
on Randy Koepke’s long fly 
ball. The Owls added their 
3rd run in the 5th on Jack 
Held’s triole and Luken’s 2nd 
single. Slinger had just 4 
hits off Scott Koth and the 
Indians had only 2 off win­
ner Rod Reed. The Indians 
were hurt by 6 errors.

KEWASKUM

Kleinmann 
Strigenz 
R. Koepke 
M. Koepke 
Rohlinger 
Koth 
Rinzel 
Laatsch 
Gruber

Slinger 
Kewaskum

SLINGER

0

0

0

Scherr 
Reed 
Bayer 
Held 
Luken 
Karius 
Vaughan 
Neuberg 
Rahil

002 
000

oio 
100

0

0

27

Winner - Rod Reed, Loser — Scott Koth

KEWASKUM 
H r h

Kleinman 2 I 1
Kam 3 1 2 
R Koepke 3 0 0
M Koepke 2 0 1
Rohlinger 3 0 0
Rinzel 3 0 1
Strigenz 3 0 0
Laatsch 2 0 0
Gruber 2 0 1
Timblin 10 0

24 2 4
Lomira
Kewaskum

Winner — Scott .
Geschke

LOMIRA 
ab r h

Neitzel 3 0 0
Voight 3 0 0
Hartwig 3 0 0
Faber 3 0 0
Kuhl 3 0 0
Sterr 2 0 0
Beck T 0 0
Adeimeyer 2 0 0
Geschke 2 0 0

22 0 0

000 000 0-0 
000 020 X-2 

oth. Loser — Myles

KEWASKUM BARTON OLD 
TIMER'S GAME JULY 27

It will be the Old Timers 
vs the Barton Old Timers in 
a game here at 1 p. m Sun­
day. July 27 Any old timers

Hosting Kettle Moraine 
Thursday night, the Indians 
lost another game by 1 run 
for the 4th time in a 5-4 
giveaway. The Indians jump­
ed ahead 3-0 with a rally in 
the 4th, climaxed by Randy 
Koepke’s 2-run triple. Leon 
Laatsch lashed an apparent 
home run to right field in the 
5th but he was called out for 
failing to touch 3rd base. 
This would have made it 4-0 
Then the bottom fell out as
Kettle scored 5 
runs in the 6th

unearned 
as runners

flew around the bases on 4 
errors followed by the Las­
ers’ only 3 hits of the game.
Kewaskum added a run
the 
the 
and 
on

7th to make it 5-4
in 

but
call on Laatsch’s homer 
another controversial call 
Mike Koepke’s long hit.

which was ruled a foul, cost 
the Indians a tie and possible 
win. Kewaskum had 7 hits 
off Brad Boettcher and pit­
cher Laatsch, besides his 3-
hitter, got 2 
Koth.

of them as did

KEWASKUM KETTLE MOR.

Kleinmann 
Strigenz 
Koth
M. Koepke 
R. Koepke 
Rohlinger 
Rinzel 
Gruber 
Laatsch

30

Kettle Moraine 
Kewaskum

0

K. Houk 4
Klemmons 4
Toschner 4
McQuire 4
Boettcher 3
Whitney 3
Zac how 2
C. Houk 2
Grisaffi 2

000 005
000 300

28 5
R H E

Ending the regular season
at Mayville Friday evening. 
Kewaskum downed the Car­
dinals, 5-1. 
3rd night in
Indians had 
who has not

Playing for the 
succession the 
Randy Koepke, 

had much pitch -
ing action, on the mound. He 
responded with a good per­
formance, scattering 6 hits 
and striking out 5 The In­
dians got 7 hits, 2 each by R 
Koepke and Tom Rohlinger.
Giese got 2 for 
Kewaskum scored
the 2nd, 
added 1 
Mayville’s 
the 4th.

3 in the 
more in 
lone run

Mayville.
1 run in 

4th, and 
the 6th. 
came in

THE SUPER MARKET 
OF AUTO REPAIRS 

Goeden Auto Body
Complete Auto Body Repairs 

and Painting Professionally Done 

INSURANCE ESTIMATES AND REPAIRS 
OUR SPECIALTY

Automotive - Tune-Ups - Exhaust - Brakes 
Tires-Anti-Freeze-Texaco Products 
ALL DONE TO YOUR SATISFACTION

24 HOUR TOWING
Hy. 28 E. of Kewaskum in St. Michaels 

334-2759
Try Our Personalized Service

FREE
CAR WASH

With $5.00 Worth of Gas
Less than $5.00 — 50c

No Gas — $1.00

Herri^es Oil, Inc.
1245 Fond du Lac Ave. phone 626-2244

KEWASKUM MAYVILLE
>b.r h ab r h

Kleinmann 3 0 0 Scheberl 4 0 1
Koth 4 0 0 Vollmer 3 0 0
R. Koepke 4 1 2 Wurtz 3 1 1
M. Koepke 4 0 1 Weyer 3 0 0
Jeeger 0 0 0 Giese 3 0 2
Rohlinger 3 2 2 Spars 3 0 1
Hansen 1 0 0 Hausse 3 0 0
Rinzel 2 1 0 Koepsell 2 0 1
Strigenz 3 0 1 Schwartz
Gruber 3 1 1 miller 2 0 0
Bilgo 0 0 0 24 1 4
Laatsch 2 0 0
Panzer 0 0 0

29 5 7
Kewaskum 010 310 0-5
Mayville 000 100 0 — 1

JAYCEE LITTLE LEAGUE
Valley Bank 1, Ked-Web 

0: Honeck 6, Miller’s 5 Den­
nis Butz of Honeck’s hit a 
3-run home run.

STANDINGS
Won Lost

Valley Bank ............ 4 2
Honeck ..................... 3 2
Miller’s ..................... 2 3
Ked-Web ................. 2 4

Next games are Monday, 
July 28, and Wednesday, Ju­
ly 30.

WULFF’S LANDSCAPING
KEWASKUM 

Highland Kentucky Sod 
45c SQUARE YARD DELIVERED 

200 Yards or More 

Kentucky or Merion Muck Sod 
55c SQUARE YlARD DELIVERED 

100 Yards or More 

FREE Estimates on 
Complete Landscaping 

PHONE 626-4820

Why you 
should buy 
LENNOX central 

^um^mnmmo^^^^mmae 

cooling now:

1. Lennox quality central air conditioning is a 
good buy any time.

2. Pre-season savings during our “Nifty Weather 
Days" sale make it even better.

3. Prompt installation before hot weather.
4. Dependable, cool, clean quiet comfort for many 

summers to come.

OUTDOOR COOLING UNIT: Compact. Isolated 
compressor and upward discharge fan make it 
quiet. Weatherproof paint keeps it looking great.

Call now for our low price on 
a Lennox comfort system for 
your home.

Come in and tee JOHANN
N

KEWASKUM *

I Hwy 28

PLUMBING & HEATING, INC.
Home Improvement Center

PHONE 334-9481
Located in St. Michael*, 3 mile* 
East of Kewaskum on Hwy. 28.

Houri: Mon.-Thur*.- 8 a m. to 5:30 p m
Fri. 8 a.m.-9 p.m.; Sat. 8 a m.-5 o m.

Nifty
Weather Machine 

Headquarters



SHOP
STORES

free Packer Pictures!
k GET ONE EXCITING GREEN BAY PACKER PLAYER PICTURE FREE WITH 

EACH $5.00 PURCHASE. HURRY. . .SUPPLIES ARE LIMITED!Ilm

BAKE WITH THE BEST
Bakers Chocolate Chips ....*?' 690

ROUNOYS WHOLE OR JELLIED
Cranberry Sauce............. 3 Cans $1

Orange Drink >

BETTY CROCKER ASSORTED

Hamburger Helpers
5-8 Oz. Pkgs. 590

^$1.49

S„39C
ROUNOYS FRESH
Half & Half.....
KRAFT FLAVORFUL
Miget Longhorn

COUNTRY STYLE OR BUTTERMILK _
Pillsbury Biscuits............ 2 U 290 ROUNOYS FANCY LIGHT

Chunk Tuna..
PERFECT EVERY TIME
Minute Rice.

SPECIAL 30C OFF LABEL
•&°'44C Dial Deodorant....... c“' 890

STOCK UP & SAVE!
2^$] 19 VO $ Hair Spray • •. Can 890

GARDNER
Honey & Egg Bread ^390



SHOP 
RITE

FOOD STORES
1 WENTZS SHOP

STORES '
105 N. FOND DU LAC AVE. CAMPBELLSPORT. WIS.

Supplement to Campbellsport News and Kewaskum Statesman

THANKS TO A LI FOR MAKING 
OUR GRAND OPENING A BIG 
OVERWHELMING SUCCESS'.

POTATO CHIPS
■ VALUABLE COUPON

RO UNDY $OZ. BOX

FREE POTATO CHIPS
■ I With Purchat* of SI 0.00 or Mor*—Limit On*
■ Minimum Markup and Fair Trad* Items Exampt

J WITH THIS COUPON
$ ■ WENTZ'S TH’U OCT. If 1975 ■ } 
V ■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■ { 
BUaa^a2gaa^

WHOLE PLUMP

Fresh Fryers KNEIPS ROUND 0

Corned Beef
18 990

FRESH, LEAN

Ground Chuck 
ib 880

WITH THIGHS QUARTERED
Fryer Legs.......
PLUMP MEATY
3-Legged Fryers

INDIAN RIVER

Grapefruit 6 Red or CQA
White 3uV

HILLSHIRE
Ring Bologna ....
QUARTER LOIN

PORK LOINS

LB $1.09

J119

CRISP FRESH ICEBURG

Lettuce
EACH

PRICES GOOD THRU OCTOBER 11, 1975 ■ QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED


