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Golf Course Open 
For Play, Tee Off 
Dinner Saturday

OFFICERS, COMMITTEES, 
SOCIAL, SPECIAL EVENTS 
FOR SEASON ANNOUNCED

The Hon-E-Kor Country club 
golf course officially opened for 
play for the season on Thursday 
of this week, it was announced by 
“Moe” Mariucci, club greenskeep- 
er. Mr. and Mrs. Gilbert (Bud) 
Korth, owners, cordially invite all 
club members and their guests and 
area residents to visit the course, 
clubhouse and bar facilities dur­
ing the season.

The annual tee off dinner held 
at the opening of the season will 
take place this Saturday night, 
Apr. 24. A smorgasbord of spare 
ribs and roast chicken will be 
served from 6 to 8 p. m. and will 
be followed by dancing with a 
dance band furnishing music 
starting at 9 p. m. Prizes will be 
given. Chairmen and hosts for 
this opening event are Mr. and 
Mrs. Harry Koch, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayland Tessar, Mr. and Mrs. 
George Fassbinder and Mr. and 
Mrs. John Hetzel. A very large 
crowd of club members have made 
reservations for the dinner.

Membership cards, guest tickets 
and program booklets for the 1965 
season listing the men’s and wo­
men’s golf committees and activi­
ties, special events, social events, 
regulations and rules of play, gen­
eral rules and fees have been dis­
tributed to all members.

On the men’s golf committee 
this year the officers are Erv. 
Werner, president; Harry Koch, 
vice president, and Howard Rum­
sey, secretary and treasurer- The 
board of directors and golf com­
mittee consists of the above offi­
cers and Bruce Koth, John Petri, 
Ronald Reigle and Bud Korth. The 
tournament chairman is Tom Lar­
sen, club pro, and the league 
committee includes Allen Tessar. 
chairman, and captains of all 
teams.

The women’s general committee 
has these officers: Jane Reigle, 
president; LaVerne Hetzel, vice 
president; Joyce Gruber, secreta­
ry, and Adeline Tessar, treasurer. 
Corliss Fassbinder heads the board 
of directors. The golf committee 
consists of Ruth Ramthun, chair­
man; Bev O’Connor, Audrey Stier 
and Arlette Edwards. Marge Berge 
is chairman of the card committee 
which also includes Marge Zehren, 
Dorothy Schaefer and Eleanor Fel- 
knz. The publicity committee is 
Ginny Backhaus and Dorothy Mar­
tin.

Play in the Tuesday Night Men’s 
league will open on May 4 and 
continue through Aug. 24 with tee 
time at 5:20 p. m. and dinner ser­
ved at 8 p m. Award night will be 
Oct. 2. Ladies’ day activities will 
open on Wednesday, May 12 with 
dinner, meeting, chatter and cards 
at 6:30 p. m. Golf, luncheon and 
cards will be held every Wednes­
day until Sept. 22, when the clos­
ing dinner will be held and awards 
given. The ladies’ tournament will 
be held Aug. 18 and 25.

Special men’s tournament events 
will be the Regal Cup May 22 and 
23, best ball two-some tournament 
June 5 and 6, A. G. Hron Cup July 
10 through 18, Father-Son tourna­
ment July 31 and Aug. 1, Club

Elect Romaine 
Chairman of Co. 
Board 21st Year

Elwyn M. Romaine of Kewas­
kum, veteran chairman of the 
Washington county board of su­
pervisors, was elected to his 21st 
term as head of the board at the 
annual organization meeting Tues­
day. He also began his 26th year 
as a member of the board. Chair­
man Romaine represents the vil­
lage of Kewaskum as supervisor 
on the board.

Joseph Schmitz, supervisor from 
the village of Germantown, and al­
so a veteran county board mem­
ber, was reelected vice-chairman. 
In the only other elections Tues­
day all three members of the 
board highway committee were all 
reelected. They are Reuben 
Schmahl, town of Jackson; Adolph 
Lofy, town of Richfield, and John 
Kratz, West Bend first ward. 
Schmahl is chairman of this com­
mittee.

Prior to the board elections, 
Chairman Romaine introduced the 
three new members of the county 
board who were elected at the 
April 6 spring election. They are 
Edwin Roecker, town of Barton; 
Roland Bast, town of Germantown, 
and Harold Boyd, town of Hart­
ford.

Romaine also announced the ap­
pointment of the following board 
members as members of the com­
mittee to study and set up the 
reorganization of the county board 
to conform with state statutes on 
reapportionment as recently re­
vised: E. M. Romaine, Kewaskum 
chairman; Joseph Schmitz, Ger­
mantown; Adolph Lofy, town of 
Richfield; Guido Schroeder, town 
of West Bend; Math Lechner, 
Hartford; Fred Black, Jr., Hart­
ford; Fred Sager, West Bend; Leo 
Geib, West Bend and Cornelius 
Gundrum, town of Addison.

DAYLIGHT SAVING TIME 
TO BEGIN THIS SUNDAY

Readers are reminded that Day­
light Saving Time will begin at 1 
a. m. Sunday, April 25, and con­
tinue until 2 a. m. on Sunday, 
Oct. 31, a month longer than here­
tofore.

Residents are informed to set 
their clocks ahead at 1 a. m. Sun­
day or before retiring Saturday 
night or they will arrive at church 
Sunday morning when the services 
are over.

You’ll regain your lost hour on 
the last Sunday in October when 
clocks are set back an hour again

Championship Aug. 21 and 22 and 
28 and 29, and Senior Champion­
ship Sept. 7 through 12.

Social events include the tee off 
dinner and dance Saturday, Apr. 
24; mixed two-ball foursome and 
dinner Sunday, May 30; better- 
half get together and dinner Sat­
urday, June 12; flag tournament 
and potluck family Sunday, July 
4: mixed two-ball foursome and 
dinner Saturday, July 24; better­
half get together and dinner Sun­
day, Aug. 15; flag tournament and 
potluck family Labor Day, Sept. 
6; men’s and ladies’ award night, 
dinner and dance Saturday, Oct. 2. 
and Christmas party, dinner and 
dance Saturday, Dec 11.

Kewaskum to Host 
County Homemakers 
Achievement Night

MERCEDES CHALMERS OF 
PATRICIA STEVENS SCHOOL 
TO GIVE LECTURE ON CHARM

“MAYTIME MELODY” is the 
theme of the annual Achievement 
Night of the Washington county 
homemakers. This event will be 
held on Tuesday, May 4, at 7:30 
p m. at the Kewaskum High 
school gym, on 3rd st., two blocks 
north of Main.

There will be many displays of 
the projects which were covered 
by the homemakers clubs during 
the 1964-1965 season.

“Charm in a Capsule” will be 
the lecture presented by Mrs. Mer­
cedes Chalmers of the Patricia 
Stevens Career College and Finish 
ing School of Milwaukee. Mrs. 
Chalmers will discuss how every 
woman can improve her appear­
ance with proper posture, groom­
ing, wardrobe and makeup. She 
will explain how a woman can 
gain poise and confidence and 
broaden her personality and in­
terests. Well qualified to speak of 
charm and beauty, Mrs. Chalmers 
represents the largest career and 
finishing school system in the 
world.

There will be musical entertain­
ment and installation of the home­
maker executive board.

Tickets are available front! home­
maker club members.

4-232

Tom Larsen Selected 
For Award to Attend 
Summer Institute

Thomas Larsen, who teaches 
mathematics in the junior, high 
program of the Kewaskum Ele­
mentary school, has been selected 
as a recipient of an award to at­
tend a summer institute in math­
ematics at Wisconsin State Uni- 
versity-Eau Claire.

This institute, supported by the 
National Science Foundation, is 
for key elementary school person­
nel.

The purposes of the institute 
are: 1. To provide an understand­
ing of the mathematical concepts 
necessary to teach a good modern 
mathematics program. 2. To pro­
vide information concerning re­
cent developments and trends in 
the elementary school mathema­
tics curriculum. 3. To prepare 
participants to help conduct in­
service programs in modern math­
ematics in their own school sys­
tem

The seminar will provide parti­
cipants the opportunity: 1. To ex­
amine the relevance of the con­
tent of the institute courses to cur. 
rent elementary school mathema­
tics programs. 2. To develop and 
accumulate materials to be used 
in the arithmetic classroom. 3. To 
help secure and develop materials 
and procedures that will enable 
participants to help conduct in­
service mathematics programs in 
their school systems.

Businessmen 
Elect, Change 
Dairy Day Date

A meeting of the Kewaskum 
Business association was held at 
the municipal building on Monday 
evening, at which time the follow­
ing officers were elected for the 
ensuing year:

President — Myron Perschbach- 
er, succeeding Bob Ours; vice 
president — Charles Miller, suc­
ceeding Myron Perschbacher; sec­
retary—Harold Marx, succeeding 
Charles Miller; treasurer — Glen 
Remmel, succeeding Harold Marx-

The date of the annual Kewas­
kum Dairy Day program, original­
ly scheduled to be held on Satur­
day, June 12, was moved ahead a 
week to Saturday, June 5, at the 
meeting. This event annually at­
tracts a large crowd from through­
out the area.

The Dairy Day celebration this 
year will be held on the streets 
and in the business places and not 
at the high school as heretofore. 
Merchants will give prizes and of­
fer merchandise at sale prices and 
entertainment will be provided. 
Dairy products will be served 
throughout the day. The event will 
continue on into the evening and 
it was decided at Monday’s meet­
ing to hold the evening program 
in the village park, where a queen 
will be crowned, entertainment 
provided, refreshments served, 
and possibly an outdoor dance 
held.

Additional information and 
complete details will be published 
at later dates.

Peace Church Hosts
District Workshop

Peace United Church of Christ, 
Kewaskum, shall be the host 
church for an Alert Workshop on 
Wednesday, April 28. This work­
shop sponsored by the Lay Life 
and Work Commission of the 
Southeast Association of the Wis­
consin Conference of the United 
Church of Christ will be for all 
churches of the West Bend dis­
trict Approximately 125 regis­
trants are expected to participate 
in the event. Nursery care will be 
provided.

The program will begin at 9:30 
a. m and conclude at 3 p. m. 
Seven laboratory sessions will as­
sist registrants in program plan­
ning for their local churches.

Hostess for the day is Mrs Carl 
Freehauf. Serving as a laboratory 
session leader from the local 
church is Mrs. John Tessar, Sr.

MARRIAGE LICENSE
April 19—Leander Albert Op­

permann, R 2, Campbellsport, and 
Janis Ann Kohn, Kewaskum;
wedding May 1. ,

LOCAL FIREMEN GUESTS 
OF CAMPBELLSPORT DEPT.

Two representatives of the Mil- 
v/aukee fire department presented 
a showing of films and spoke to 
the Campbellsport fire depart­
ment at their regular meeting last 
Tuesday evening, Apr. 15. Some 
of the Kewaskum fire department 
members were guests. Lunch and 
refreshments followed.

Edward Canavan, First Battali 
on chief, spoke to the firemen a- 
bout fire prevention, while Lt. 
Florian Sobczak of Rescue Squad 
No. 1 spoke on rescue work and 
first aid.

Cancer Crusade 
Envelopes Now 
In Circulation

MRS. NORMAN HELD AND*
MRS. JACK TESSAR ARE 
CHAIRMEN IN KEWASKUM

American Cancer society “neigh- 
bor-to-neighbor” envelopes are 
now circulating in all residential 
areas of West Bend and in the 
villages of Kewaskum, Slinger, 
Jackson and Germantown, report­
ed Washington county campaign 
co-chairmen Rid ard C. Klein and 
Waren E. Coultas.

Envelopes contain educational 
and instructional leaflets urging 
recognition of cancer danger sig­
nals and prompt medical treat­
ment — the best known remedy to 
curable cancers. Voluntary contri­
bution envelopes to continue the 
“fight against cancer” are also en­
closed.

Residents are requested to 
promptly move the red and white 
packets along the route specified

West Bend ward chairmen co­
ordinating the 1965 “neighbor-to- 
neighbor" crusade are as follows:

Ward 1—Mrs. Joe Weiss and 
Mrs. E. A. Neese; Ward 2 -Mrs 
Charles Walter, Jr.; Ward 3 Mirs 
Derry Wagner; Ward 4—Mrs. Aug­
ust Oelhafen and Mrs. Robert T- 
Kauth; Ward 5 — Mrs. Merv. 
Thompson and Mrs. Grant Wilcox; 
Ward 6—Mrs. Carl Vogt; Ward 7— 
Mrs. Arthur Schmid.

Volunteer chairmen coordinat­
ing the "neighbor” crusade in 
county villages are the following:

Kewaskum—Mrs. Norman Held, 
chairman; Mrs. Jack Tessar, vice- 
chairman. Slinger—Mrs. Bernard 
Sukawaty. Jackson — Mrs. Lyle 
Butzke and Mrs. John Gremming- 
er. Germantown — Mrs. Harold 
Schaetzel.

County unit chairman Guido 
Schroeder stated the rural and spe­
cial gift phase of the crusade, 
conducted by direct mail, would 
get underway next week, April 28.

Prom Next Friday
The junior class will present 

their prom, “The Old Lamplight 
er,” at the Kewaskum Community 
High school on Friday, Apr. 30, 
from 9 p. m. to 12 midnight. You 
will be entertained by Harry Roth 
man’s orchestra. King Larry Coul­
ter and Queen Jeanne Reindl will 
reign at the dance with the grand 
march beginning at 10 p. m.

May is anti-litter month in Wis­
consin.

SUFFERS BROKEN LEG 
IN LOGGING MISHAP

Mac Schumacher, Kewaskum, 
who is employed at the Emil Shul 
ka sawmill on Hwy 28 east of the 
village, suffered a compound 
fracture of his left leg while at 
work Monday morning when it be­
came caught in a log somehow 
while rolling logs at the mill. He 
is a patient at St. Joseph’s hoop* 
tai, West Bend.

FIRST GRASS FIRE CALL 
ANSWERED BY FIREMEN

Kewaskum firemen received 
their first grass fire calf of the 
spring at 11 a. m. Tuesday when 
they snuffed out a blaze along the 
North Western railroad tracks ad­
jacent to the Holy Trinity school 
playground. There was no damage.
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Area AFS Students Visit Assembly

The AFS students and their 
visor are shown above with

variety this next season. ( bellsport, occurred the marriage
i Mrs. Fred Zimmerman returned of Miss Mary Mueller of Ashford 

and Math. Volm of the town of 
Kewaskum.

Earlier in the year various re­

home after having been with her 
mother, Mrs. Barbara Lilia, 87, at 
Theresa, who has been very ill- 
Mrs. Lilia narrowly escaped burn­
ing to death several weeks ago
when alcohol ignited.
guished the flames herself.

| Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Miller left 
for Kearny, N. J., where the for-

' respondent.
Julius Reysen of Milwaukee pur- 

' chased the Ed. Uelmen farm in 
I the town of Auburn, formerly 
known as the Peter Schiltz farm.

ports were to the effect that the | 
, German Kaiser was slated for the 

She extin-1 ^obel peace prize this year. Later.
BODDEN BABY BAPTIZED 
AT HOLY TRINITY CHURCH

Washington County Assembly­
man Frederick C. Schroeder (K- 
West Bend) last week was host at 
the state capitol in Madison to 
three foreign exchange students 
who are attending high school in 
West Bend and Kewaskum

The students, in the U. S. under 
American Field Service (AFS) 
sponsorship, were introduced as 
special guests to the state assem­
bly during last Wednesday’s ses- ( 
sion and each said a few words a- 
bout their home country. |

ad­

semblyman Schroeder following 
their introduction to the assembly: 
left to right: Mrs. Norman Justl, 
West Bend, AFS advisor; Miguel 
Leon, from Spain, attending West 
Bend High school; Marion Evans, 
from New Zealand, attending Ke­
waskum High school; Assembly-

mer is taking a two week course 
in linoleum laying and decorating 
at the Congoleum-Nairn Factory 

। Training Institute.
j Capping exercises cf St Ag­
nes School of Nursing, Fond du 
Lac, were held Sunday when 40 
nurses received their caps. Among 
them was Miss Evelyn Kraut- 
kramer, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ed. Krautkramer of Kewaskum.

Misses Edna Schmidt and Helen 
Remmel were to Fond du Lac to 
call on Mrs. Catherine Harter at 
St. Agnes hospital in observance 
of her 91st birthday. Mrs. Harter 
was a resident of Kewaskum until 
going to Fond du Lac a couple of 
years ago to make her home at the 
Henry Boyle Heme for the Aged 
Soon after arriving there she fell

man Schroeder; and Elvira T. Es- and fractured her hip and has
quieres, from the Phillipines, at­
tending West Bend High school.

been confined to the hospital 
since.

it seemed that President Wilson or The infant son born to Mr. and 
William Jennings Bryan might xirs. paui Bodden on Mar. 31 was 
capture the prize. But now there baptized Sunday, Apr. 11, at Holy 
can be no doubt as to who is en- Trinity church, Kewaskum, by the 
titled to it and has it cinched,; Rev john Budde. He received the 
since “Pat” Guenther Sunday in-1 name Randall Paul. Sponsors were 
terfered with and successfully pre- Le0 Nigh and Evelyn Martin. Mrs. 
vented seven fights at Lomira Bodden is the former Bernadine 
which the local marshal was un-' straub.
able to stop.—Campbellsport cor-|

SALE on famous
GLIDDEN

SPRED SATIN
HOMOGENIZED WALL 

GUARANTEED
PAINT PERFORMANCE 
IN WRITING!

NOW $5.45 GAL
REG. $6.89 GAL.

25 Years Ago
April 20, 1940

Recent deaths included the Rev. 
C. J. Gutekunst, 65, pastor of St. 
John’s Lutheran church, New 
Fane, for the past 32 years; Mrs 
Gerhard Peters, 56, Milwaukee, 
native of Kewaskum and sister of 
Mrs. John Stellpflug; Rev. Frank 
Gadow, 77, California, Mo., father 
of Rev. Richard Gadow of Kewas­
kum; Albert J. Edwards, 90, R. 2. 
Kewaskum; Mrs. Charles Kocher, 
74, West Bend, formerly of Ke­
waskum; John Duley, 63, Byron, 
father of Albert Duley of R. 3,

-------------------------------------------------- OVER 50 YEARS AGO
native of Kewaskum and brother Sept. 19, 1914
of Wm. Opgenorth; Herman Fick, At St.’ Matthew’s church, Camp-
67, town of Auburn; Mrs. Hugo ———----- - - -------- -----
Bratz, 56, Fillmore, mother of |
Miss LaVerne Bratz, Kewaskum
public school teacher;
Geidel, 77, Kewaskum;
Wilke, 83, Clintonville
dealer and undertaker, 
the town of Auburn.

Coaches and athletic

Herman 
Henry H 
furniture 
native of

officials
from schools in the Tri-County 
conference met at the Republican 
Hotel here to discuss plans for 
the 1940 six man football season. 
The conference played touch foot-: 
ball last season and all of the 
schools are in favor of the tackle

Kewaskum; Ruth Knoebcl, 13,
daughter of the Andrew Knoebels, 
Milwaukee, formerly of Wayne; 
Louis Nigh, 68, North Lake, for
merly 
James 
sport, 
public

of the town of Auburn; 
P. Gilboy, 70. Campbell- 
retired businessman and 
official; Andrew L. O’-

Schlaeter Optometrists
MATH. ANTHONY 

PHONE 533 2924
Office Hours: 912 1-5
Wod. & Fri. evenings 7-9

Closed Thursday Afternoons 
CAMPBELLSPORT, WIS.

New Work Shoes

MASON

AK-CUMfON# 
woo won
SO Styles to Choose from!
Let ms give you • FREt demonstration of 
Masons naw work shoes—sspsclslly da 
signed to give day long comfort oo your Job 
row or ’HIM WtCiAi HAtuagg.
• Aw Cvaktaa I w«e< •**•-. le^hwdlael av»*e«O
• Mwe*ww O«l *•»!••*>» WW. o«d HwM
• Sl^ lewHoM Wat sad HeeM

• legged HaoaAlda e»d t* Teamed Ue*e<>>
• Mylo* aataahUgl Saa-w wehal *
Amasing ranga of ana# !»-»•> and wtdtka 
.AA EEEEi means 1 can easily St almost 
anybody: Contact me at ones far FREE 
demonstration.

Robert L. Schultz
R. 2, KEWASKUM 

Phone 626-2518

$1.75 QT.
REG. $2.20 QT.

Bunkelman’s Floor Covering
Kewaskum, Wis.

Don’t Miss Our
ANNUAL

HOME FURNISHING

SALE
Tremendous Savings on

Towels Blankets - Rugs

Connell, 76. Plymouth, resident of 
Beechwood most of his life; A- 
dolph J. Claus, 87. Kewaskum; 
Frank Ehnert, 61, New Fane; Al­
bert Opgenorth. 60. Milwaukee,

Weekend Only
Special

1 lb. 8 oi. Loef 
County Fair Family Siie 5 for 

BREAD $1.00
3 lb. bafl

ONIONS 15c
Large Size 88 a dux.

ORANGES 59c
9 Flavors Morton Frozen 4 for 

CREAM PIES $1.00 
7Variarl« Fir»,ld« ~ 4 tor

COOKIES $1.00

"George, I don't think you should try to fix 
that bad wire 'til we’ve looked into a home

improvement loan from the

Pillows - Kitchen Needs - Bedding - 
Baby Needs & Many More.

Thermo-Serv Offer!
Redeem your coupons this week!

WE DELIVER

"KOCH’S
Phone 626-2414 j

IBank ©if Kewaskum

MEMBER FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORP.

FREE
with coupon and purchase of $5.00 or more

ALSO THIS WEEK:

SAVE 25c on any $5.00 purchase from our 

w* coupon MEAT DEPARTMENT

(Rag. 59c aa.) 
2 THERMO-SERV EACH ^ ft_ 

just yc 
(with coupon)

THERMO-SERV TUMBLER
(Rag. 59a value)

CUPS

SAVE 15c
WITH COUPON

ony any purchase of $2.00 or mora from our

PRODUCE DEPARTMENT
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Hubert P Klein ILADIES SOCIETY TO have rumen r. mein, | communionbreakfast

Retired Farmer, 
Official Dies

April 25 is Ladies’ society Com-
munion Sunday at Holy Trinity rp ii •». ~,
parish. There will be a breakfast- 1 ellS KlWHIlianS

Must Cut State i w ._ ■ Henmck 521(1 taxpayer organiza-
□pcndm? Speaker ^ons have dem°nstrated how state 
— — ; spending can be reduced to pre-

is the added hazard that the po­
tential manager may say to his 
boss ‘I don’t want to work in Wis-

Hubert P. Klein, 82, of R. 2. Ke­
waskum, passed away at 7:05 p. m. 
Thursday, Apr. 15, at St. Agnes 
hospital, Fond du Lac, where he 
was confined for nine weeks.

He was born Nov. 14, 1882, in 
the town of Auburn, a son of the 
late Peter and Margaret Fellenz 
Klein, and was married to Susan

meeting after the 8 a. m. Mass. 
The ladies are asked to invite

I vent tax increases. He said they 
| are asking for a ceiling on the a- 

(Special)—Wisconsin’s tax prob-, mount of aid the state will pay
their daughters from sixth grade lem Is a spending problem created | Per school pupil, a streamlining of 

' up to the mother-daughter break- by government growing at a faster j state government agencies, and a1by government growing at a faster j state government agencies, and a
tast. Hostesses will be Mmes. A.!rate than the economy, John Hen- single board to control all tax-sup- 
Hron, L. Hron, N. Jaeger, H. Jan- ■ nick, Milwaukee, a representative ported post-high school education.

Mertes on Apr. 11, 1907, at Holy; 
Trinity church, Kewaskum.

Mr. Klein farmed in the town of
Wayne for 40 years before his re-

dre, E. Jaycox and R. Kern. Be­
cause of the breakfast-meeting the 
last Mass will be a half hour later, 
at 10:30 a. m.

The Catholic Knights will re­
ceive Holy Communion at St. Kil­
ian’s parish, St. Kilian, Sunday at

of the Public Expenditure Survey i “Taxpayer groups feel state 
of Wisconsin, told the Kewaskum ' spending can be cut. They are cer- 
Kiwanis club here Monday at the tain that every state administra- 
Hon-E-Kor Country club. tor knows where he could cut in

The Public Expenditure Survey his department if he had to. He [ 
of Wisconsin is a private nonpro-1 knows which phases of his opera-1

consin because the state income 
taxes are too high’,” Hennick said.

Hennick said that Wisconsin is 
not going backward economically 
but that if the rest of the United 
States were standing still, Wiscon­
sin would be losing ground.

“We cannot permit our govern­
ment costs to continue to expand 
at a faster rate than the economy 
that is supplying the taxes,” Hen­
nick said.

tirement. During 
served as trustee 
congregation for 
assessor for eight

this time he 
of St. Bridget’s 

20 years, town 
years, and also

as school clerk of the Campbell
school district for 10 years.

fit nonpolitical government re- ] tions are most expendable and 
the 8 a. m. Mass. The dinner will J search and service agency for least essential,' 

state-wide and community taxpay-
Hennick said.

KEWASKUM KC MEMBERS 
RECEIVE DEGREE HONORS

be at 1 p. m. Members do not 
have to attend the dinner to join 
the group at the Communion 
Mass.

Forty Hours Adoration will be

er organizations.
“Are we going to take another 

income tax increase when our in-

Hennick said the public general- 
; ly is not aware that Wisconsin tax 
j payers pay more per person than

Our Lady of the Rosary council 
of Sheboygan was the scene, on 
Sunday, April 11, in which 31

Survivors include three daugh- observed at Holy Trinity parish
ters, Mrs. Lawrence Gaffney, Fond next week, opening on Friday,
du Lac;
Bend;

Mrs. Joe Cartus, West APril 30 and closing Sunday, May
Mrs. Ralph Ruplinger, Ke

waskum, and one son, Lawrence, 
of West Bend; 12 grandchildren, 
five great-grandchildren, one sis­
ter, Mrs. Kathryn Kennedy, of 
Niles, Mich.; one daughter-in-law, 
three sons-in-law, nieces, nephews 
and other relatives. Mr. Klein was 
preceded in death by his wife, 
eight brothers and three sisters. 
During the past ten years he had 
made his home with his sons-in- 
law and daughters, Mr. and Mrs 
Gaffney and Mr. and Mrs. Rup­
linger.

Funeral services were held at 
9 a. m. Monday, Apr. 19, from 
Miller’s Funeral home, Kewas­
kum, and at 9:30 a. m. at St. Brid­
get’s church with the Rev. John 
Budde officiating. Burial took 
place in Holy Trinity parish ceme­
tery. Friends called at the funeral 
home from 2 p. m. Sunday.

One fifth-grade science class
has proved sex doesn’t exist. They 
put a bird and a bee in a cage. 
Nothing happened.

Bulova
The gift-quality* watch

Ads bring sales. Why not try 
one?

LEN & ROG 
SERVICE 

Hwy. 45 South 
KEWASKUM 

PHONE 626 2888

Shell Oil 
Pennzoil 

Pennsylvania Passenger, 
Farm and Truck Tires 

Engine Tune-ups 
Valve Grinding 
Wheel Balancing 

Expert Lubrication 
Brake - Generator - Muffler 
Transmission ■ AAA Service 

24 Hour Towing

I government would cost in the i members of the West Bend coun- 
come tax places us at a disadvan-{states which are our principal ®H °^ the Knights of Columbus re- 
tage in competition with other . competitors for job-producing bus-1 chived honors of second and third 
states? Are we going to sacrifice iness and industry. J degrees of the order.
the property tax relief we bar- j “Our economic climate is such' Kewaskum area members of the“Our economic climate is such ' Kewaskum area members of the 
gained for at the price of a selec-1 that to management and finan-j Wcst Bend council who received 
tive sales tax, higher income taxes cjal men ft makes Wisconsin unat-1 honors with the group included
and income tax withholding? Or tractive,” Hennick said. Gafy Gerhartz, Ray Sipple, Robert
are we going to lower the boom | “When a new industry is think-, Staehler, Lester Strobel, Norbert 

Hennick ask- jng of coming into the state there 'Weiland and Gregory Rohlinger.on state spending?

More People Than Ever Are Enjoying

75YOUR CHOICE *

MISS AMERICA — Youth and beauty cap­
tured In a fine 17 jewel shock-resistant 
watch. In yellow or white. Matching 
expansion bracelet.

SENATOR-A handsome watch he’ll wear 
with pride. 17 jewel precision movement, 
shock-resistant Expansion band, in yel­
low or white.

See Our Extensive Collection oj Bulova Watches From $24.75

LEROY C. H
JEWELER

PHONE 626-2777 KEWASKUM

FURNITURE — KEWASKUM

ENTIRE STOCK

ON SALE

CLOSED

IGA Savings and Quality
Table Rite
ICE CREAM
Lovit
GRADE A BUTTER 1 lb. pkg
Country Cupboard
WHITE BREAD P/2 lb. loaf 2 for
Nabisco
GRAHAM
Reynolds
FOIL
Scott
TISSUE

CRACKERS 1 lb. pkg

75 ft. economy roll

1,000 sheet rolls 4 for

Marx FOODLINER

55th Anniversary Sale
APRIL 26 - 27 - 28 - 29 - 30

MAY 1-3 — 9 a. m. to 9 p. m.

Furniture Lamps Bedding

Carpets Juvenile Wall Decor

Friday & Saturday, Apr. 23 - 24 

To Prepare For This Big Event Free GIFT TO 1ST 
150 ADULTS
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FRIDAY, APRIL 23, 1965 ! Weddig, son of Mr. and Mrs. Ed-

Local News Items
Marriage banns were announced 

in the Holy Trinity church bulle­
tin for the first time Sunday for 
James Klahn and Kay Broecker, 
who will be wed May 8

Miss Judy Cudnohoske of Beech­
wood was guest of honor at a mis­
cellaneous bridal shower Sunday 
afternoon, Apr. 11, at the Harold 
Laux home. Young ladies present 
were from Random Lake, Fredon­
ia, Beechwood, Batavia, Sheboy- 
gan Falls, Silver Creek and Town 
Scott Games were played and a I 
buffet supper served Miss Cudno- 
boske will become the bride of 
Russell Breit, R. 1, West Bend, 
on May 15 at Immaculate Concep 
tion Catholic church, West Bend.

Funeral services were held re­
cently at Plymouth for Father A. 
J. July, 90, former pastor at Camp 
bellsport, who died at St. Camillus
hospital in 
in 1957

Funeral
April 9 at

Milwaukee. He retired

services were held 
West Bend for Harold

A. Ohrmund, 50. who died April 6 
at his home in that city. He was a 
brother of Mrs Andrew Staehler 
(Father) and Mrs. Elmer Kittel 
(Gertrude), both of R 2. Kewas
hum

Save! 
Miller’s 
lection, 
con able

Select your furniture at 
in Kewaskum. Largest se- 
high quality at most rea- 
prices. Open daily until

PIZZA
WIGWAM

PHONE 626 2001

SHELL
Shell Products

Minor Tune-ups

Car Washing A Polishing

Tire Repair

Oil A Grease Jobs

Wheel Balancing

Mufflers Installed

PHONE 626-2311

per
Paints

AllSOTHEYSAY

8 Assorted 
Colors 

No Paint 
Purchase 
Required

ONE 
to a 

customer, 
please

1095 Sani- 
GW *,"S 
*M^’ 
* per ga’- 

save rwcE

wn 55 Cert'M, |

* per gab

U10 6 1412

* per g»l-

(1.00 Off*
nallon on

°er 9 inclut"n9:

JUSTY & JUSTY

HERRIGES OIL CO
PHONE 626 2244

when she walked into JANZ 
TV and saw their display of 
Stereo and Hi Ft units. And 
she learned they mean it 
when they say, "We service 
What We Sell".

94^

No- 3
Beauty iw t

per g»’- 
sale price

Shell Oil 
and Lubrication

GREASING 
WASHING 
MUFFLERS 

MINOR REPAIRS 
GOODYEAR AND 
DAYTON TIRES 

AUTOLITE BATTERIES 

Bulk Delivery of 
Gas and Fuel Oils

5:30, Monday and Friday to 9 p. m. ry Ann, 533A S. Main st., West । Campbellsport, 
fron ^opond^u dniivnry Bend, to Leon Kober, son of Mr. । | Free dependable delivery.

4 Young Ladies

Spring engagements of four 
young couples were announced

J the past week.
At an Easter dinner at their , *0ness 

home, Mr. and Mrs- Joseph Mar- e 
tin, 230 S. 7th ave„ West Bend,lmen'
announced the engagement of! Mrs. 

! their daughter, Joanne, to Thomas turned

v/ard Weddig, 1404 Parkview 
drive, Kewaskum.

Mr. Weddig is enrolled at the 
University of Wisconsin-Milwau­
kee, where he is a student in com­
merce, and Miss Martin is employ­
ed by the county superintendent 
of schools.

A winter wedding is being plan­
ned.

Mr. and Mrs John Fell, R. 1, 
Campbellsport, announce the en­
gagement of their daughter, Chris­
tine, to James Ruplinger, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Ruplinger, R. 
2, Kewaskum. Both are employed 

I at Regal Ware, Inc. No date has 
been set for the wedding.

Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Nielsen, 
Pewaukee, announced the engage­
ment of their daughter, Sue, to
Dennis Bingen, Kewaskum, 
Easter Sunday No date has 
set for the wedding.

Mr and Mrs. Henry Lohse, 
Sheboygan Falls, announce
engagement of their daughter, Ma-

SPECIAL 
Wool 

TOPCOATS

$1.59
REGULAR $2.10

Apr. 26 — May 1 
FREE 

Pick-up & Delivery 
OURS DRY 
CLEANERS 

KEWASKUM
Ph. 626-2727

JANZ 
TV

b26’
2610! SO <y KEWASKUM
^-*^ ON Ml WAY 45

and Mrs. George Kober, 1026 
Chestnut st-, West Bend. A Sep­
tember wedding is being planned.

Hospital News
Donald Koerble, Kewaskum, re-

turned home Monday from Dea- ! 
hospital, Milwaukee, where 
a patient for medical treat-I

Math. Kohn, Kewaskum, re 
home Sunday after being a

patient at St. Agnes hospital, Fond 
du Lac, for nine days and later • 
convalescing at the home of her i 
daughter, Mrs. Roderic Reese, in

of

Thank You
Voters

on 
been

R. 2, 
the

for
office of
election.

ROGER SCHLEIF

electing me to the 

supervisor in the VACUUM CLEANER DISPOSABLE BAGS 
AND REPAIRS 

Phone 626-2808

the Town of Auburn

IT'S SAVINGS TIME AGAIN AT

ml®^

Th

BACK"

Specif 0|h
io Out IVmj j 
t| Saying- J 

"WELCOME J

1100 Super 
W«W.L’ratriorl?tfS

p»»ct $6-59 
per g»l

SKYBIRD
Painting - Decorating Glass

LESS 10% ON ALL GLASS FROM APR. 24 TO MAY 15 
Call daily after 4 p. m. or Saturday all day

PHONE 626-4081

JANDRE—A daughter io
and Mrs. Dennis Jandrt, Kewas-1 kum-

PUERLING—A son to Mr. and 
Mrs. Richard Puerling, 601 Third 
ave., West Bend, Thursday, Apr 

■ 15. Mr. Puerling is a son of Mr. 
Mr and Mrs. Nic. Puerling, Kewas-

kum, at St. Nicholas hospital, She-1
boygan, Tuesday, Apr. 20. The 
Jandres also have a son.

CLEAN-UP • PAINT-UP • FIX-UP

Births

A broadminded man is a citizen
| who takes your side

Jack’s Appliance
"The Complete Appliance Center"

General Electric - Zenith - Maytag

Residential - Farm - Commercial 
ELECTRICAL WIRING

Appliance - T.V. - Radio - Phonograph 
REPAIR

Phonograph Records - All The Latest Hits

26" x 44" Rubber Backed
ALL PURPOSE

THROW RUG

0°^

W

Only

,99?

PARTNER 
PAINT BRUSH

$6.49

$3.98

A Big 4* Quality 
Brush at an 

unusually low 
promotion price 

• 
Ideal for Water 

thinned and latex 
finishes (also 
’ oil paint)

• .
Suggested Retail 

each

254 OFF PER QUWT Me Met f^ 49

KEWASKUM
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County Agent 
News Notes

By MAURICE J. HOVLAND 
Washington County Agent

FARMERS IMPATIENT
Farmers normally are a very 

patient group of men. They till 
the soil, plant the crop, and har­
vest it. There is a long period of 
waiting between each phase. But 
I think that farmers right now are 
showing more impatience as a 
group than I have ever seen in 18 
years as a county agent. Rightly 
so, because there are years when 
we see all the grain planted and 
a good share of the plowing done 
by the middle of April. And here 
we are, just about to get started. 
Have a little more patience, 
Friend Farmer — you will still 
get your oats planted in plenty of 
time. But I’ll bet we burn a lot of 
midnight oil this year, and we’ll 
cut the planting time required to 
plant all the oats in Washington 
county to an all-time minimum.

nition for motorists coming from ing a name — if there is a single 
behind that it is moving slowly, pine tree standing by itself some-
This is very important at night.

These signs are available from
where, it could be the Lonesome 
Pine farm; or Gnarled Oak farm,

। vin Schulz at the Immanuel Luth­
eran church, Campbellsport.

your dealers. They are also avail- or Sleepy Creek farm. This is a 
able from 4-H tractor members- > good idea, and remember that if

The wedding fifty years ago 
took place at Trinity Lutheran 
church at Dundee. The attendants

. - । were: Mrs. William Schaub of Ke­
lt would be a good idea to have you ever want to register cattle, waskum, Mrs. Myrtle Wiesner of 
Ano f^ ' tWs name can ^ ^ prefix Qn g^b^^ ^^ j^ ^ of Camp

your cattle that were bred in your | bellsport and Irvin Hintz of Bata- 
Herd. 1 via. They attended the celebration

one for each slow-moving vehicle'
you have that might be on the I 
road at night.

The 4-H leaders in this tractor 
project deserve a pat on the back 
for the fine work they are doing 
with the young boys in their clubs.

Last week a farmer asked a- ]
bout the procedure for naming'

Couple Observes 
Golden Wedding

Mr- and Mrs. Oscar Hintz of
his farm. It was his sons who I Campbellsport, who were married

Sunday.
Mr. Hintz was born near Ran­

dom Lake, the son of Mr. and Mrs. , 
Herman Hintz, and Mrs. Hintz was 1

a Dundee gin, ihe daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ed. Falk. They farmed 
near Random Lake and Dundee 
and then moved to Campbell­
sport in 1948 when both took em­
ployment at Regal Ware, Inc. in 
Kewaskum until retirement-

There are two children, Mrs. La­
verne Treichel, Milwaukee, and 
Allen Hintz, R. 1, Campbellsport, 
also a Regal Ware employee. An­
other son, “Jigger,” was killed in 
an industrial accident in 1949. The 
couple has seven grandchildren 
and two great-grandchildren.

SIGNS ON SLOW VEHICLES
Kenneth Kohlwey, who is one of 

the tractor leaders in the Wash­
ington county 4-H club program, 
has asked that we give you a re­
port on the slow-moving vehicle

wanted to do this, and he was e- 
qually enthusiastic, but didn’t 
know how to go about it.

We checked with the register of 
deeds, and this is the procedure- 
First of all, choose the name that 
you would like to have for your 
farm. Report to the register of 
deeds in the Washington county 
court house, and give them this 
information. They will then check 
the names of farms registered and 
see if it is already taken. If not, it 
will then be recorded, it will cost 
you $1.00, and this will be the 
name of your farm. You might use 
your imagination a little in choos-

on Apr. 15, 1915, celebrated their ( 
golden wedding anniversary on: 
Easter Sunday that included a fa- ■ 
mily dinner at Hon-E-Kor Country | 
club, Kewaskum, and a private re-) 
ception at their home for relatives. I 
A special prayer was said forthem 
at the 10:15 service by Rev. Al-

STAEHLER’S

Watkins Quality Products

RADIO-TV-SOUND
SALES AND SERVICE

GAMBLES
Authorized 
FRANK J.

Phone 626-2841

Dealer
FELIX

Kewaskum |

sign now being popularized, in 
Wisconsin. Kenneth says that a 
slow-moving vehicle is one travel­
ing under 25 mph. If this sign is 
properly placed on the vehicle, it 
is an immediate means of recog-

and Mary King Cosmetics 
Home Remedies All Approved 

by Good Housekeeping 
WM- J- COULTER

R. 3, Camp. Ph. Kew. 626-2503

KEEP STIRRING...
pUT A ,>f| WHERE YOU ARE

When the phone rings, there’s no need to stir out of the 
kitchen if you have a handy wall extension phone only a 
reach away. And it makes wonderful sense to have a 
phone where you work. A wallphone in the color of your 
choice fits almost anywhere, costs little to have. Visit or 
phone our Business Office for details.

OENEHAL TELEPHONE ®
America's Largest Independent Telephone System

DRY CLEANING
“Make Washday a Pleasure”
NEAT — CLEAN — CHEERFUL

FRIENDLY HOSTESS AT YOUR SERVICE

512 N. Main West Bend FE 4-9883

Take the word of this expert . . . and add satisfaction to your 

meals — with real BUTTER. Nothing butters like butter. Use it aplenty 

in baking . . . frying . . . seasoning . . . and on the table for good 

eating at its best.

BUTTER has no equal — no counterpart. Rich in natural food values, 

BUTTER is really nature's masterpiece. That's why all America has 

come to say — Naturally, it tastes better with BUTTER.

Wisconsin dairy farmers 
know you'll be happier 
when using only BUTTER.

American Dairy Association 
Of Wisconsin
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WANTED—Good baled hay. Will 
weigh and pay at time of load­
ing. Art. Schultz. Box 301, She­
boygan. Phone 458-1287. 23-3p

FOR RENT—Apartment at 1421 
N. Fond du Lac ave. 3 rooms 
and bath, heat and hot water 
furnished, $65.00 per month. 
Call 626-2875 or 2280. 4 2-tf

FOR SALE—Surge stainless steel 
milker, seamless bucket; com­
pressor and line. Bill Becker, R.

2, Kewaskum. Phone 626-4045.
4-16-2p

HELP WANTED—Feed mill work 
and truck driver. Apply Rosen - 
Wimer mill office or store of 
lire It

HELP WANTED—Weekly clean­
ing woman. Write Kewaskum 
Kai 237. K

VO* SALE — Full length white 
ribiffon formal with green and 
pink embroidered waist, can be 
warn with or without hoop, 
fair 12. Phone 626-2682 Ip

FOK SALE—New 1965 Sony Mo 
del 200-A tape recorder, 4-track 
nierco/mono system; 2 full 
range speakers built into sides 
cf carrying case; acoustically 
balanced The Statesman, phone 
808-2626 tf

FOB SALE — Keumore electric 
range, apartment size. Walnut 
dining room table and chairs.
Call 626 2536. It

HEARING AID BATTERIES to fit 
all brands and types at Jack’s 
Appliance, Kewaskum 4 23-tf

WANTED—Auto mechanic; ex­
perienced man to work in mo­
dern Chevrolet and Buick deal 
eTahip. Many company benefits. 
Apply in person to C. P Schill 

Schill Motor, Inc.
113 E Main St. 
Campbellsport, Wis.

4234

LISTINGS NEEDED

KEWASKUM tavern-dance hall­
delicatessen with four brdm. liv­
ing quarters; on busy roads lead­
ing to lakes and Kettle Moraine 
state park; a money maker; in­
cluded in the price are all the 
wedding and public dance book­
ings. For further details, consult 
broker.

THERESA 80 acre farm: Grade 
A setup, 50 acres tillable, balance 
pasture and woods; new well and 
pump; spring fed fish pond; semi­
modern home which has four bed­
rooms; 314 miles south of Theresa. 
Get this—owner asking only $15,- 
50000.

KEWASKUM cozy 2-bdrm. ranch 
home So. of village with 114 car 
garage, cabinet lined kitchen, nice 
living rm. Just the right place for 
retired folks. Priced to sell, own-

LAKE AND COUNTRY OR 
RECREATIONAL PROPERTY 

WO FEET OF LAKE FRONTAGE 
with 8 ACRES OF LAND, north 
went of Park Falls in a wilder 
ww area Price $1,600 QO, $25 00 
dwwn, $25.00 a month. Will send 
map Art Schmidt, Broker, Park 
Fail*. Wis. tP

Farm AUCTION Sale
DAIRY EQUIPMENT — CATTLE AND FEED

SAT., MAY 1 -12:30 p. m.
Located: 7 miles North of Kewaskum, Wis., on Hwy. S (thru 
New Fane) then take Hwy. GGG, Mauthe Lake Rd., to sale of 
Al. Schladweiler and Mrs. Julius Reysen farm. Watch for di­
rectional signs and arrows.

DAIRY EQUIPMENT—A Monjonnier bulk milk cooler, Model No. 
250 J, 250 gal capacity, like new, complete with controls and com­
pressor; 2 Surge milking units, a 40-lb. unit and a 30 lb unit, com­
plete; also a McC-D., milk pump; large stainless steel milk strain­
er, two 40-lb. stainless milk buckets, plus miscellaneous cleaning 
items.
37 HIGH GRADE HOLSTEIN CATTLE—Only maintained and 
improved by owner. March average test of 3 76%. 10 heifers, 9 
springing, 1 open; 27 milk cows, 11 open, 16 springing. Detailed re­

cords day of sale.
FEED—8 ft. corn silage in 10-ft. by 30-ft. silo; 14 ft corn silage 
in 12-ft. by 50-ft. silo, first and second cuttings of baled and chop­
ped hay.

TERMS:: Usual; financing can be arranged
MR. and MRS. AL. SCHLADWEILER 

and MRS. JULIUS REYSEN, Owners
CLERKING by BANK OF KEWASKUM
OTTEN BROS., LICENSED AUCTIONEERS,

West Bend, Wis — FE 4-3630

TYPIST
Full time position in general 
cd I mt Experience desirable but 
not necessary. Pleasant working 
conditions Liberal employee 
krarfits.
Apply in person and ask for 
Mr Sengpiel.

REGAL WARE, INC.
Kewaskum, Wis.

Orders for Pioneer brand seed 
mm this year arc highest in his­
tory and indicate that more Wis- 
ronton farmers will plant more 
teahrls of Pioneer than ever lie 
fore* See your local Pioneer 
dealer and plant all Pioneer this 
R*ing

AL TISCHENDORF 
Campbellsport 
RAY GARBISCH

Random Lake, Wis.

AUCTION
On the Frank Caswin farm. Located 4 miles east of Kewas­
kum on 28 to St. Michaels, then north 2 miles and \% mile 
east, the former Geier farm.

SAT., APR. 24 - 12:30 p. m. sharp
Lunch wagon on farm

23 HEAD OF HIGH GRADE HOLSTEIN AND GUERNSEY CATTLE 
8 Holstein milk cows, 1 due in May. bal. Aug. and Sept.; 2 Guern­
sey cows. 1 bred Holstein heifer, 6 heifers 6 to 18 mos., 3 heifers 
3 mos, 3 steers 8 to 19 mos. 100% T B and Bang’s free-
MACHINERY—Ford Ferguson tractor. Case VAC tractor, M. C. 

T50 hay baler, rubber tired wagon and flat rack, Case 7 ft. hay 
mower, Case 2 bottom plow. Case cul. tractor chains, Ford 2 bottom 
plow. David Bradley 4 bar side rake, Oliver manure spreader, 
springtooth, 2 corn planters, 3 point hookup, 2 wheel trailer, chain 
saw, skill saw. bench saw, John Deere hay crimper, 4 years old; W. 
C. Allis Chalmers tractor, now 3 section drag, air compressor, hog 
trough, hog oiler, electric motors, pump jack, electric fencers, 
battery charger, cow clipper. 2 water tanks, underground gas tank, 
fence posts, pig feeder, mink cages, rabbit pens, tool chest, tools 
5 electric drills, lots of small items, 2 S. S. Surge milker buckets, 
6 unit Surge vacuum pump and motor, 8 mos. old; 1% inch pipe­
line 6 can cooler, hot water heater, Banty roosters, iron pile-
HOUSEHOLD sale starts at 3 p. m. sharp—Metal cabinets, wash­

ing machine,, 3 beds and dressers, 2 davenports, lamps, automatic 
washer, bicycle, trunks, dishes, oak dining room table and 6 chairs, 
living room chairs, lawn mower, kitchen chairs, screens and storm 
windows.
ANTIQUES: Marble top dresser, wall clock, coffee grinder, pic­

ture frames, others, .22 rifle.
Come early, sellinsg out complete '

FRANK CASWIN. OWNER
John Reilly and Ernest Freund, Auctioneers 
Kewaskum Bank, Cashier

er leaving area. j USED AUTO PARTS
Financing arrangements on any Honeck Salvage Yard

of the above properties. | On CTH “V,” north of Kewaskum.
Call anytime 1 Open 8:00 a. m to 5:00 p m.

RUSS KRUEGER REALTY ^SES-^Broke 7nd trained at
Write or ph. Kewaskum 626-2767 j my home. Phone 626-2973. 16-3p

MODERN DRIVE-IN
LONG LAKE — DUNDEE — HWY. 67 — CENTER OF MA­
NY CAMPING AREAS — WELL MAINTAINED — FULLY 
EQUIPPED — READY TO OPEN — LOT 150 x 140 — 
PRICED FOR QUICK SALE — MAY BE SEEN EVENINGS 
AFTER 7 — SAT. OR SUN.

Majesky Realtor — Broker
R. 3, Campbellsport Dundee, Wis.

FARM SALES — LIQUIDATIONS — HOUSEHOLD

Col. Robert J. Knoebel 
AUCTIONEER

MISSOURI Auction School GRADUATE
FORMERLY 5215 N. 62nd ST.

OF MILWAUKEE, WIS.
WAYNE, WIS. 462-1054

Wc USED[DRS
DEMOS

1965 CHEVY II 4 DR., 6 CYL., PG.
1965 CORVAIR MONZA SPT. CPE., 4 SP. TRANS.
1965 IMPALA SPT. SED., V8-PG., POWER STEER., BRAKES

LATE MODEL CHEVROLETS
1964 BEL AIR 6 PASS. STATION WAGON V8 
2—1964 BEL AIR 4-DR„ V8 P.G., RADIO 
5—1963 CHEV. BEL AIR 4-DR. 6 CYL.
1963 IMPALA SPT. SEDAN - V8 - PG, RADIO
1963 CHEV. 4 DR., IMPALA V8 
2—1963 MONZA SPT. SEDAN, 4 SP., RADIO, 110 H. P.
1962 CHEV. IMPALA SPT. CPE. V8 STD. TRANS.
1962 BEL AIR 4-DR. STA. WGN., V8-PG., RADIO 
1962 BEL AIR 4-DR. 6 CYL. P. G.
1962 MONZA SPT. CPE., 4 SP, 110 H. P., RADIO
1961 CORVAIR STATION WAGON, PG.
1960 BEL AIR 2 DR. V8
1960 CHEV. BEL AIR 4-DR.
1959 STATION WAGON 9 PASS - 6 CYL. STD. TRANS.
1957 BEL AIR 2-DR., 6 CYL., PG., 32,000 MILES
1957 BEL AIR 2-DR., 6 CYL., STD. TRANS.

OTHER MAKES
1960 FORD FAIRLANE 500, 4-DR., V8 AT
1959 FORD 4-DR. STATION WAGON, V8-AT

Plus Many Older Models in Good Running Condition 
At Reasonable Prices.

USED TRUCKS
1962 FORD VAN PANEL
1961 GMC 4000 SERIES CAB FORWARD - 2 SPEED
1959 CHEV. PICKUP
1957 CHEV. 2-TON LONG WHEELBASE
1957 WILLYS 4 WHEEL DRIVE WITH SNOW PLOW
1957 CHEV. PANEL - 6 CYL. - STD TRANS - CHEAP
1956 DODGE 2-TON, HOIST & 12 FT. PLATFORM
1954 CHEV. 4 TON STAKE
1953 CHEV. 2 TON 2 SPEED WITH 12 FT. PLATFORM
1951 CHEV. 2-TON 2-SPEED WITH HOIST & PLATFORM

See our large stock of used 14 ton and 2-ton trucks. 
We also have several older model pickup trucks in 
good running condition in stock.

Honeck Chevrolet
OPEN 7 A. M. TO 9 P. M. DAILY 

KEWASKUM PHONE 626-2161
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HAVING
REAL ESTATE 

PROBLEMS
Help Is As Close As 

Your Phone

Call BILL RUTH 
626-2513

Homes, Businesses, rarms 
Needed

LONG LAKE, 2 cottages each 
with frontage, one for $5,500, the 
other $5,0000.

COZY 2 bedroom home neat as 
a pin, 1% baths, large corner lot, | 
beautiful shrubbery and trees, 1% | 
car garage, in Kewaskum, only 
$11,000.

IDEAL FAMILY HOME, 5 miles 
west of Kewaskum, 4 bedrooms, 
family size kitchen, full bath, 
drilled well, 4 car garage, barn, 
1 acre with plenty of room for a 
garden, $8,500.

WHITE COLONIAL, like new 
condition, large kitchen, % bath, 
formal dining room carpeted, spa­
cious living room carpeted; 2nd 
floor full bath, 2 cheery bedrooms, 
airing porch. Basement floor com­
pletely covered with inlaid tile, 
painted walls just ideal for recrea­
tion, 1 car attached garage with 
electric eye door opener. $19,000.

BILL RUTH, BROKER
Kewaskum 626-2513 anytime

WANTED TO BUY—Newspapers 
and baler twine. Lynn’s Waste 
Paper, 121 Island ave., West 
Bend, formerly Canning Co. 
building. 12-11-tf

FARM WELDERS—Large new 180 
amp. Lincoln welders now $93.
225 amp. $110. Ready to weld— 
We don’t believe it! But they 
are yours for this price, while 
thye’re available. Easy terms. 
Sales and service on all welding 
needs and machines. Mayville 
Welding Ind’s., Corner Dayton 
& Grove sts. Pho. 28W, Mayville 
Wis- 1-22-tf

CARD OF THANKS
We are sincerely grateful to re­

latives and friends for their many 
kind acts shown us during the 
time of illness and after the death 
of our dear wife, mother and 
grandmother, Mrs. John Schlad- 
weiler. We especially wish to 
thank Fathers Staskunas, Schnei­
der, Fellenz and the Benedictine 
fathers, pallbearers, drivers, mem­
bers of the Ladies’ Altar society, 
organist, choir, donors of floral 
and spiritual offerings, ladies who 
served, Miller’s, traffic officer, 
sexton, donors of food, and all 
who showed respect.

John Schladweiler and Family

CARD OF THANKS
We desire to express to our kind 

relatives and thoughful friends 
our heartfelt thanks for their 
kindness shown us during the 
time of sickness and after the 
death of our dear father, Hubert 
P. Klein. Special thanks to Rev. 
Budde, organist, choir, pallbear­
ers, drivers, donors of floral and 
spiritual bouquets, for the deli­
cious food, to Miller’s, ladies who 
served, traffic officer, sexton, ush­
er, and all who showed respect.

(THANK YOU
Words cannot express my deep 

appreciation for the many cards,! 
gifts, visits and flowers which I 
received while I was a patient at 
the hospital and convalescing at 
home. I shall always remember 
these acts of kindness.

Mrs. Dolores (Jim) Hammes

THANK YOU
I would like to express my sin­

cerest thanks to all my friends and 
neighbors who remembered me 
with cards, visits, flowers and gifts 
while I was at the hospital and re­
cuperating at the home of my 
daughter. Your kind thoughts are 
deeply appreciated.

Mrs. Math. Kohn

Groh Plays With 
UW Band in Palm
Sunday Concert

Richard N. Groh, 1254 Roseland 
Dr., Kewaskum, was among 82 stu­
dents who are members of the Un­
iversity of Wisconsin Concert band 
conducted by Prof. Raymond F. 
Dvorak which played its annual 
Palm Sunday concert in the Wis­
consin Union Theater on the uni­
versity’s Madison campus April 
11 at 3 p. m.

Pamela Hornig, mezzo soprano 
from Wisconsin Rapids; duo-pian­
ists Cheryl Knobeloch, Beloit, and 
Pierre La Plante, Sturgeon Bay; 
and the University Percussion En­
semble conducted by Jay Collins 
assisted the band in its 79th an­
niversary appearance.

The program included such 
stirring works for band as the 
“Overture” written by Andrea 
Rolland in 1946; the “Symphony 
No. 3 for Symphonic Band,” Gian­
nini; and the Suite from Mous- 
sorgsky’s “Pictures at an Exhibi­
tion.”

A “Polonaise” by Prof. Hilmar 
Luckhardt. composer-musicologist 
on the university faculty, and 
“Concerto for Percussion” by Wil­
lis Charkovsky, played by the UW 
Percussion Ensemble conducted by 
Jay Collins, were other features of 
the varied program.

The current concert band is 
one of the most “home grown” 
bands in university history: of the 
82 members, all but 12 hail from 
Wisconsin communities.

Looking Thru the 
Field Glasses...

By Bob Lake, Conservation 
Warden, Washington County

ICE STILL ON LAKES; WILL 
DREDGE END OF CEDAR LAKE

As this is written most of the 
lakes in Washington county are 
partially covered with ice. How­
ever, this coming weekend should 
find all waters ice free.

The Wisconsin Public Service 
Commission has issued a permit 
to the town of West Bend to 
dredge out part of the north end

BOLTONVILLE
TEEN-AGE

DANCE

of Big Cedar lake. The Duehning month is Karen and Billy Ludwig, 
boys of Slinger have been employ- Bonnie and Dennis Smith
ed by the town to do the work. Carol Seefeldt was one out of 
The dredge is at Gonring s re- four chosen for the citizens short 
sort, ready to start work when । course in Washington, D. C.

The meeting was adjourned.the lake is ice free.
Those individuals who enjoy

crappie fishing in that area
should start their sport early. The 
racket of the dredging operation I 
and the discoloration of the water 
no doubt will slow fishing later i 
on.

In The Service
SP/4 MAURER DISCHARGED

Sp 4 Jim Maurer, his wife and 
son Scott returned to Kewaskum 
to make their home on Monday, 
Apr. 12, after he received his hon­
orable discharge from the U. S. 
Army at Petersburg, Va, where he 
was stationed. Sp/4 Maurer was in 
the service for three years, two of 
which were spent in Germany. He 
is employed at Gehl Mfg. Co. in 
West Bend. Mrs. Maurer is the 
former “Suzie” Galabinske, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence 
“Babe” Galabinske, Kewaskum.

4-H Club News
KEWASKUM 4-H'ERS

The Kewaskum 4-H’ers will be 
holding a 4-H bake sale on May 
15 at 2 p. m. at the Labor Center 
Every member should bring two 
items.

The 4-H pledge was led by 
George Martin. The pledge of al­
legiance was led by Chuck Bunkel- 
man.

The flower box committee this 
year is Debra, Mike and Colleen 
Frank and Bonnie Smith.

The food committee for next

Kewaskum '
DON'T FORGET—Every Friday 

Night is Family Night.—Children 
admitted FREE if with parents

NEW ADMISSION PRICES 
NOW IN EFFECT

Grade School Students ..............25<
High School Students............. S0< 
4dults.......................................... 70c

The games we played after the 
meeting were enjoyed by every­
one.

Colleen Frank

Our Police Chief Says
Village ordinance prohibits ■■ 

guns, bow and arrows or rifles be 
j ing discharged in the village.
i Complaints are being received 
I that children are not respecting 
; private property, they are Ire*
, passing and damaging lawns and 
1 gardens.

DANCE
BATAVIA HALL

Wednesday, April 28
MUSIC BY

The CHIEFTONES
Canada’s All-Indian Band

8:30 TO 12:30

Admission $100

FOOD GOLF COCKTAILS

Surviving Daughters and Son

THANK YOU
Sincere thanks to all my friends 

for the many cards, gifts, visits,» 
flowers and to all who helped in , 
any way while I was a patient at; 
St. Joseph’s hospitals in West Bend 
and Milwaukee and while conval-l 
escing at home. These wonderful; 
acts of kindness will never be for-! 
gotten.

Mrs Walter Christ ' 

~ Calf 626-2626 with your news. a

Every Sunday 
Afternoon
2:00 TO 6:00

APRIL 25 
The

VAN TELS
Wisconsin's Top Bond

Sat. & Sun. Eve 
Apr. 24-25 

What a Castl
What a Pastl

What a Show!

“WHAT A WAY
TO GO”

SHIRLEY MacLAINE 
ROBERT MITCHUM 

PAUL NEWMAN 
DEAN MARTIN 
GENE KELLY 

BOB CUMMINGS 
DICK VAN DYKE

Cinemascope Color by Deluxe

Fri. Eve. & Sun. Mat. 
Apr. 30 — May 2 
Double Feature
M.G M.'s Big Fun Film 
50 FABULOUS STARS 

“M.G.M/S
BIG PARADE 

OF COMEDY”
CLARK GABLE 
LUCILLE BALL 
GRETA GARBO 

WILLIAM POWELL
ALSO 

“NIGHT TRAIN 
TO PARIS” 

LESLIE NIELSEN 
ALIZIA GUR

HON-E-KOR
GOLF AND COUNTRY CLUB

WE CATER TO WEDDINGS 
BANQUETS OR ANY KIND OF PARTY 
FAMILY STYLE — BY RESERVATION 

HON-E-KOR SPECIALS: 
Seafoods — Fish 
FRIDAY 11:00 TO 11:00

Steaks — Chicken — Lobster 
SATURDAY 5:00 TO 11:00 

Our Own Roasted Chicken 
FAMILY STYLE — SUNDAY 11 A. M. TO 2 P. M. 

PHONE 626-2520 KEWASKUM, W»1

Closed Thursdays
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Indians Shut Out
Lomira, 6-0, in 
Baseball Opener

Marian college board of advisors, and Wilbert Kelly, district com-
Alumnae association representa- missioner, for the Marsh Moraine 626-2534,

Gnacinski, 626-2886, or Bob Sparks,! West Bend. The meeting will start 
‘ 1 with Benediction and Rosary atand they will see to it

tives and Fond du Lac committee district are working together with that you get tickets, 
members met at Marian college several other council and district | ---------------
Regina Hall to outline ambitious 
goals for one of the outstanding

The Kewaskum Indians, who summer sports events held in Wis-
shared the Scenic Moraine con- 
lerence championship with Ger-

consin.
Scheduled for the weekend of

mantown last season, started off July 9, 10 and 11 and expected to 
their baseball season on a win-, draw more than 350 top horses

over from a four state radius, the Ma-ning note with a 6-0 victory
Lomira in a non-conference game rian show will be held to benefit
here Monday afternoon. | the Badger Council and the Mari-

The Indians scored three times, an college development fund. Hun- 
in the second inning on a hit, an I ters, jumpers, fine harness and 
error and three walks, then added saddle horses, Arabians, regis- 
two more runs in the third frame ‘ tered ponies, Tennessee walkers 
and one in the fourth inning. ; and quarter horses will be among

Paul Kohler and Bob Miller the favorites to be exhibited in 
combined for Coach Hal Moscher’s i the Marian show which received a 
team as they compiled eight strike I top honor rating from the Ameri- 
outs, surrendered six walks and i can Horse Shows association at the 
checked the Lions on only one hit national organization’s annual Jan- 
Kohler pitched the first five inn- uary meeting.
ings and Miller the final two. [ Roger Miller, district chairman,

Scouters to insure the success of । 
the show in the Washington and [ 
Dodge county area. Badger Coun­
cil serves boys in Washington, 
Dodge and Fond du Lac counties 
and also Markesan in Green Lake 
county. Marian show participation 
of the last two years has kept the 
Badger Council operating in the 
black. The council hopes to use a 
share of the 1965 returns to estab- 

i lish a capital fund for a long 
[ needed wilderness camp.

The Boy Scouts of Kewaskum 
I will be parading to homes in the 
1 next few weeks to sell tickets for 
the horse show. However, if any­
one is interested in purchasing 
tickets and has not been contacted 
by June 1, they should call Mike

CATHOLIC WOMEN TO MEET 
AT WEST BEND THURSDAY

7:30 p. m., followed by a program 
on Judaism. Election of new offi­
cers for the district will also be 
held.

All Catholic women of District 
13 of the Milwaukee Archdiocesan 
Council of Catholic Women are in­
vited to attend the annual spring 
meeting of District 13 on Thurs­
day, Apr. 29, to be held at Im-
maculate Conception parish hall at । social work.

Professions that are predicted 
to grow fastest in opportunities 
and income during the 1960’s are 
medicine, dentistry, engineering, 
nursing, chemistry, physics, teach­
ing, mathematics, accounting and

MUFFLER
SPECIAL

Steve Sterr and C. Schmidt 
toiled for Lomira as this duo | 
whiffed 13 Indians and walked 1 
nine. Gary Schwartz got the only | 
hit for Lomira Kewaskum tallied 
its six runs on only four hits, 
made by Justman, Erickson, B. 
Miller and Kohler. The visitors 
were guilty of three errors.

MEYS
REMMEL’S

MARKET
214 MAIN ST. PHONE 626-2828

Starts MONDAY

$8.95
1954 to 1965 Chevrolets

FREE MUFFLER INSTALLATION 
DURING APRIL AND MAY

Now is the time to replace that noisy worn-out muffler!

Local Boy Scouts 
To Sell Tickets 
For Horse Show

BUYA\/
O EXIRA REV

CHUCK ROAST Take advantage of F R 
in April or May during

E E MUFFLER INSTALLATION 
our 6th annual muffler sale-

Planning for the sixth annual 
Marian College Horse Show to be 
held in July at the Fond du Lac

Honeck Chevrolet
KEWASKUM

Blade Cut - lb. 33c
Boneless lb. 57c Honeck Chevrolet

1242 FOND DU LAC AVE. KEWASKUM, WIS.

county fairgrounds got a warm 
start at a Fond du Lac session of 
Boy Scout leaders and Marian col­
lege boasters.

Executive board members and 
members at large of the Badger 
Council, Boy Scouts of America,

Zing into spring! 
Chevrolet Impala

OLLIE’S
TEXACO SERVICE

Call Kewaskum 626-2560

TEXACO 
Products & Services

GAS — OIL 
MAR FAX LUBRICATION 
WASHING — POLISHING 1 

ACCESSORIES 
MOTOR TUNEUP 
MINOR REPAIRS 

MUFFLERS — TAILPIPES 
FIRESTONE A DUNLOP TIRES 

DELCO BATTERIES

1965

Chevrolet Impala Super Sport Coupe—one of two bucket-seated beauties for 65.

Farmers
Don’t Give Your 

Dead or Disabled
Cows or Horses Away

WE PAY
Straub’s Mink ■

Ranch
R. 1, CAMPBELLSPORT I 

PNONI 533-3841

People who buy other big expensive-looking cars 
get one thing you won’t (big expensive-looking payments)

It looks like a big car. And is—by almost any 
standard you want to apply.

H'kWi? Nobody builds a car as much as one 
inch wider. Length? It grew three inches this 
year. Roominess? Every closed model’s got 
three inches more shoulder room, front and 
rear, and more leg and foot room up front too. 
Luxury? Nice little touches like the look of 
mellow walnut across the Impala’s instru­
ment panel. And big touches. Like the fine­
ness of the same Body by Fisher workman­
ship that makes some of America’s most

expensive cars look so expensive. How about 
the ride? Chevrolet engineers took the Jet­
smooth one and smoothed it out even more 
this year. Also made it more stable by widen­
ing the wheel stance. Price? That’s where 
Chevrolets fall way short of the other big 
expensive-looking cars. But we wouldn’t have 
it any other way. Would you?

One last question: How soon can you make 
a good spring buy on a Chevrolet? One last 
answer: Just as soon as you can get down to 
your Chevrolet dealer’s.

HIGH TIME TO TRADE arrow Chevrolet or Acer's

Zing into spring in a new Chevrolet, Chevelle, Corvair, Chevy H or Corvette
48 4320 ^

HONECK CHEVROLET, INC.
1242 Fond du Lac Ave. Kewaskum Phone 626-2161


