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Begin Swimming 
Instructions at

Mary Kroncke 
Will Sail for
Spain June 27Beach on June 22

REGISTER JUNE 20 FOR 2 
CLASSES; ALLEN BECKER i 
RETURNS AS INSTRUCTOR

Approved Red Cross swimming 
instructions will again be provid­
ed for the children of the village 
of Kewaskum at the beach area in 
the village park beginning on 
June 22.

The village is fortunate in a- 
gain having Allen Becker as in­
structor. Allen will be assisted by 
Ralph Albrecht, who is now also a 
qualified instructor- Under this 
arrangement the village will be 
able to provide an expanded and 
improved program.

The swimming instruction pro­
gram will be divided into two 
sessions. The first session will be­
gin on June 22 and end July 17. 
The second session will begin on 
July 20 and end Aug. 14. Instruc­
tions will be given each morning, 
Monday through Friday. No other 
swimmers except those in the 
swimming classes will be allowed 
at the beach area while classes 
are in session.

The schedule of classes is as 
follows: 9:00-9:30, Beginner I; 
9:30-10:00, Beginner II; 10:00- 
10:30, Beginner I; 10:30-11:00, Be­
ginner II; 11:00-11:30, Intermed­
iate. Registration will be held 
from 9:00 to 11:30 a. m. Saturday, 
June 20, in the council room of 
the municipal building. Children 
must be six years or older be­
fore they can be accepted into a 
class.

In the interest of safety, child­
ren under six years of age will 
not be allowed in any of the 
swimming area unless accompan­
ied by and supervised by a par­
ent. Children under six left in the 
care of a babysitter or older 
brother or sister will not be toler­
ated. Our instructors and life­
guards have a great responsibility 
and should not be expected to 
assume the roll of a babysitter.

Supervised open swimming will 
be provided every afternoon and 
Saturdays and Sundays, according 
to William Martin, village com­
missioner.

Graduating Class 
Of ’39 Has Reunion

Members of the 1939 graduating 
class of Kewaskum High school 
enjoyed their 25th graduation re­
union with a family style dinner 
at the Glacier Inn in Kewaskum 
on Saturday evening, June 6 Fol­
lowing the dinner the evening was 
spent in renewing acquaintances 
and reminiscing.

Members of the class attending 
included Mr. and Mrs. Byron Bun- 
kelman, Mr and Mrs. Bernard 
Hom, Mr. and Mrs. Bernard Ha- 
femann, Wesley Kuehl, Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Mayer, Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Menger, Mr. and Mrs. M. 
Teschendorf, Marlin Schneider, 
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Schlosser, 
Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Fellenz, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Petri, Mr and Mrs. 
Allen Tesar, Mr. and Mrs. Ho­
ward Kruepke, Mr. and Mrs. Eu­
gene Weinand. Mr. and Mrs Ken­
neth Koepke. Mr. and Mrs. Willi­
am Maurer, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Schaefer, Jr. Mr and Mrs. Byron 
Richie, Mr. and Mrs John Bodden.

Legion Post 384 
Elects Officers

KEWASKUM'S 1ST STUDENT 
ACCEPTED IN AMERICANS 
ABROAD SUMMER PROGRAM

Mary Kroncke, daughter of Mr 
and Mrs. Robert Kroncke, Kewas­
kum’s first student to participate 
in the Americans Abroad Summer 
program, will fly to New York on 
Friday, June 26, and board the 
USS. Seven Seas to sail for Rot­
terdam on the 27th. From there 
she will go to Barcelona, Spain, 
where she will live with the Juan 
Pros Peris family.

Barcelona, a thriving commer­
cial and industrial center of two 
million people, is located on the 
northeastern coast of Spain on the 
Mediterranean Sea.

Mary, who will be a senior at 
Kewaskum Community High 
school this fall, will have a sister, 
Eulalia, and a brother, Juan, in 
her Spanish family. Juan spent a 
year in Phoenix, Ariz. in the AFS 
exchange program.

The family has written Mary 
that they are eagerly awaiting 
her arrival and that they have 
made many plans for a busy sum­
mertime at their summer home 
on the island of Mallorca and a 
local fiesta on Aug. 15, the Fiesta 
of Portal Nous.

The Kewaskum AFS chapter 
wishes Mary bon voyage and will 
share news of Spain from her with 
you periodically

ATTEND GRADUATION OF 
SON IN-LAW AT MADISON

Mr. and Mrs. Joseph M. Miller, 
Kewaskum, attended the gradua­
tion of their son-in-law, Kenneth 
H. Kenyon, who was among 3,100 
graduates to receive degrees at 
the University of Wisconsin, Ma­
dison, on Monday, June 8 He re­
ceived a Bachelor of Science de­
gree in chemical engineering.

Mr. Kenyon has accepted a po­
sition in the product development 
department with the Firestone 
Tire and Rubber Co. at Akron, 
Ohio. Mr. and Mrs. Kenyon will 
reside in Akron after June 17. 
Mrs. Kenyon is the former Jolene 
Miller.

Officers for the ensuing year 
were elected by Robert G. Ro­
maine Post 384 of the American 
Legion, Kewaskum, on Monday, 
June 8. The new officers are as 
follows:

Commander, Vernon Butz; 1st 
vice-commander, John Tessar, Jr.; 
2nd vice-commander, Roger Rein- 
dl; chaplain, Cornelius Beisbier; 
historian, Harold Degner; ser­
geant-at-arms, Robert Staehler; 
executive committee for three 
years, James Andre, Al Zehren 
and Roger Jacobs.

The Legion post wishes to thank 
everyone who participated in and 
attended their Memorial Day par­
ade and exercises.

Lady Struck by Car, 
Two Other Mishaps 
Occur in Village

Three traffic mishaps in the vil­
lage the past week were reported 
by Chief of Police Roland Pledl.

Ardath Clements, 41, of R. 2, 
Kewaskum, suffered a bruised 
left leg at 5:45 p. m. Monday 
when she was truck by a car driv­
en by Harold Meisenheimer, 58. 
of 113 Prospect st , Kewaskum, at 
the intersection of Main st- and 
Fond du Lac ave. Meisenheimer 
was westbound on Main st. and 
stopped for the Fond du Lac ave. 
arterial. The pedestrian began 
crossing the street on the cross­
walk in front of the car just as 
Meisenheimer started to pull out 
onto the highway. He said he 
failed to see her in time and the 
auto struck her left leg.

Oars driven by Jerome R. 
Gentz, 19, of 3034 N. 44th st., Mil­
waukee, and Clyde T. Smith, 57, 
of 303 Spring st., Campbellsport, 
collided at 8:50 p. m. Sunday on 
Fond du Lac ave about 100 feet 
south of Elm st. Gentz stated that 
he thought Smith was going to 
make a left turn so he started to 
pass on the right side when Smith 
suddenly turned right in front of 
him. Smith said he was turning 
into a driveway at 1121 Fond du 
Lac ave. when Gentz tried to pass 
on the inside lane. Approximately 
16 feet of skid marks were left by 
the Gentz car as he tried to stop 
before the collision. The left front 
and radiator of the Gentz vehicle 
and the right front end of the 
Smith auto were damaged.

Vehicles driven by Michael A 
Chesak, 17, of R. 6, West Bend, 
and Barry L. Rammer, 18, of R. 
1, Kewaskum, collided at 12:35 a. 
m. Friday on Kewaskum st. at the 
intersection with Main st. Travel­
ing west on Main st., Rammer 
made a right turn onto Kewaskum 
st. when Chesak, who was hacking 
away from the curb, backed into 
his auto as Rammer was turning 
the corner. The left rear fender of 
Chesak’s vehicle and the right 
side of the Rammer car were dam­
aged.

MARRIAGE LICENSE
June 4—William Clarence Volm 

Jr., R. 2, Kewaskum, and Peggy 
Lee Larson, R. 6, West Bend; wed­
ding June 20.

Four other class members were 
unable to attend the reunion and 
two others are no longer living.

4-H CLUB TO SPONSOR 
BIKEORAMA SATURDAY

A Bike-O-Rama, sponsored by 
the Kewaskum 4-H’ers, will be 
held Saturday, June 13, at the 
high school parking lot at 10:30 
a. m. There will be prizes.

Brother Isadore
Herriges Will 
Go to Nicaragua

Brother Isadore, O.F.M. Cap., 
son of Mr. and Mrs- Anton Herri­
ges of St. Michaels, R. 2, Kewas­
kum, will leave for the Catholic 
mission at Bluefields, Nicaragua, 
C. A. on Sunday, June 21. Present­
ly stationed at St. Joseph’s Friary, 
Appleton, Brother Isadore was not 
assigned but volunteered for mis­
sion work in Nicaragua.

A departure ceremony will be 
held at 7:45 p. m- on Sunday, 
June 14, at St. Michael’s church in 
St. Michaels. This will be followed 
by an open house for relatives 
and friends of Brother Isadore in 
the parish hall.

Brother Isadore is a graduate of 
St. Michael’s grade school and at­
tended high school at St. Felix 
Friary,

Driver Course 
Completed by
41 Students

Announcement was made this 
week by Principal Ernest Mitch­
ell that 41 students at Kewaskum 

I Community High school have 
just completed a classroom course 
in driver education. Student cer­
tificates indicating satisfactory 
completion of the program have 
been issued by the motor vehicle 
department. They are accepted in 
lieu of the knowledge test if ap­
plication is made within one year 
for a permit to learn to drive.

“The most important objective ] 
of a driver education course is to 
help young people become better 
citizens through the acquisition of 
knowledge and improved attitudes 
in relation to the proper use of 
motor vehicles under all condi­
tions. Accident statistics reveal 
that the majority of traffic acci­
dents are brought about by hu­
man errors,” the principal said.

The instructors, Mr. Buswell 
and Mr. Zemlicka have devoted 
many hours to acquaint the stu­
dents with the rules of the road 
and good driving practices. Much 
time was spent on evaluating the 
physical, mental and emotional 
qualifications of drivers and un- 
derstanding the application of 
these factors in safer driving.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

A meeting of the Kewaskum 
Business asociation will be held 
Monday, June 15, at 8 p. m at the 
municipal building in regard to a 
“Crazy Days” promotion in July.

Overeating will make you thick 
to your stomach.

New Record Set 
By Kewaskum in 
Cancer Crusade

OVER $400 CONTRIBUTED; 
MRS. JACK TESSAR, MRS.' 
NORMAN HELD CO CHAIRMEN

Mrs. Jack Tessar and Mrs. Nor­
man Held, co-chairmen of the 
1964 Cancer Fund Crusade in Ke­
waskum have reported contribu­
tions of over $400 in the commu­
nity, setting a new record for the 
effort in the area.

The total contributed in this 
year s Crusade exceeded by 12 H 
per cent any previous year, it was 
reported

Assisting the Kewaskum co- 
chairmen in conducting the Cru­
sade were the following: Mrs. 
Bruce Petri, Mrs. Ed. Weddig, Mrs. 
Armin Oppermann, Mrs. Ralph 
Hein, Mrs. Carl Freehauf, Mrs. 
Roger Strack, Mrs. Frank Krueg­
er Sr., Mrs. Paul Blumer, Mrs. 
Ralph Remmel, Mrs. John Tessar, 
Jr., Mrs. Erwin Bullette, Mrs. Olga 
Koch and Mrs. Mildred Kirchner.

Direct mail solicitation for the 
Crusade in the rural areas is now 
underway and it is hoped a final 
report for the Washington county 
fund campaign will be available 
soon. Those who have not yet 
contributed are urged to do so 
now so the county quota for 1964 
can be attained.

Winds Cause Power
Failure, Break Trees

Extremely high winds with 
gusts up to 50 miles per hour on 
Tuesday felled trees, downed 
wires and caused power failures 
in many areas. Rain and hail 
raked some communities but not 
locally. It was also the hottest day 
so far this year as temperatures 
reached 92 degrees.

In Kewaskum, almost the entire 
village was without electric power 
from approximately 7:15 until 
close to 8:15 p m. when two elec­
tric lines whipped together due 
to high winds and knocked out 
the power when the wires burned 
out. The power failure occurred 
just east of the Milwaukee river 
south of Main st. The entire vil­
lage except a small portion in the 
southwest corner of it was with 
out light and power. Gas sta­
tions could not pump gasoline, el­
ectric clocks, including the Catho­
lic church clock and the one in 
front of the bank stopped, and 
other electric equipment was in­
operative as a result of the storm 
Scattered reports of felled signs, 
broken tree branches and other 
damage were reported.

MISS BROWNE IS AWARDED 
SCHOLARSHIP TO SEMINAR

Margaret E. Browne, a member 
of the Kewaskum Community 
High school faculty, has been a- 
warded a full scholarship to at­
tend the sixth annual Seminar 
on Financial Institutions at Mar­
quette university in Milwaukee, 
June 22 to July 3

The seminar deals with the role 
of all financial institutions in col­
lecting the savings of individuals, 
and in the investing or lending 
of these funds to business and 
government in the United States 
and in the world
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25 Years Ago
June 9, 1939

Ralph, 11-year-old son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Lawrence Ketter, sub- 
mitted to an appendectomy at the 
We. i Bend hospital.

Ray M. Sheehy, chairman of the 
state athletic commission of Wis­
consin, Frank J. Jazdzewski, real­
tor and loans and general insur­
ance man, and Wally Schmidt, 
well known north side tavernkeep­
er, and their wives, all of Milwau­
kee, were Sunday evening guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Eberle.

Ellsworth E. Medberry, youth­
ful Fond du Lac slayer, was 
brought to Kewaskum Monday at 
11 a. m. in a Fond du Lac squad 
car. He was in the custody of two 
sheriffs from Colorado. The youth 
is accused of slaying John F. Gray, 
32, of Crystal Springs, Colo., soap 
salesman, when he gave him a lift 
while hitchhiking. Much publicity 
has been given the case in the dai­
ly papers. The sheriffs and their 
prisoner stopped at Joe Eberle's 
Beer Garden for lunch, allowing 
the prisoner to take off his hand­
cuffs only long enough to eat. 
during which time he was covered 
with a gun. At noon they moved 
to the depot, causing no small a- 
mount of excitement in the vil­
lage, being followed by many 
townspeople, especially school 
pupils. They boarded the 12:45 
train to return the prisoner to 
Denver. Medberry did not confess 
to the murder, claiming he struck 
him over the head with his pistol 
butt and threw the body in sage­
brush along the road. Gray’s body 
with a bullet in his head, was 
found in a rural school garage 
and his car was found in Denver 
Medberry hitchhiked back to Fond 
du Lac and was arrested at the 
borne of his father-in-law.

Aunt Jemima, famous enter­
taining, robust Negro mammy, 
known for her famous Aunt Jemi­
ma pancakes, will be the attrac­
tion in person at the L Hosen 
heimer store Friday and Saturday 
She will make and serve her fam­
ous pancakes free and entertain 
with her southern hospitality, 
charm and songs. Famous on the 
radio, stage and screen, she was 
recently a feature attraction at 
the Milwaukee Home Show.

Loran Backhaus of the town of 
Kewaskum has purchased the 
George Schleif farm on Hwy. 55, 
a mile north of the village. Earl 
r cher purchased the Fred Bar- 
telt estate home just outside of 
the south village limits on Fond 
du Lac ave and will move there

Large Heads Crispy 2 for

LETTUCE 29c
U. S. No. 1 Red Salad 10 lbs.

POTATOES 49c
24 ox. jar Shurfine 3 for

GRAPE JUICE 95c
15 ox. tin 
Wyman's, in syrup 4 for

BLUEBERRIES $1.00
Shurfine Elbow 2 lb. box

SPAGHETTI 35c
WE DELIVER :

KOCH’S
Phone 626-2414 !

with his family from the F. E. 
Colvin home on West Water st. 
Frank Krueger bought the Mrs- 
Fred Belger estate home on Clin- 

j ton st. and will move there with 
; his family from the Wm C.
Backhaus home on Prospect ave- 
Mr. and Mrs Vai. Peters pur­
chased a lot from Helen and Mary 
Remmel on First st. and will : 
build a home there. Mr. and Mrs. I 
Andrew Roden of St. Michaels i 
moved onto the Wallace Geidel 
farm northwest of Kewaskum.

50 YEARS AGO
June 7, 1914

Born to Mr. and Mrs. Earl Don- । 
ahue of Reedsburg, a daughter । 
Mrs. Donahue formerly was Miss 
Frances Ockenfels. ;

Ernst Becker is able to tell a ’ 
good story. Last Friday he was | 
surprised to notice a fox running 
about 40 yards ahead of him and 
all of a sudden drop. Hastening to 
the spot Mr. Becker was astound­
ed to see that the animal was 
dead, perhaps of heart failure, 
due to the excitement of Mr. 
Becker being after him.

The junior class of Kewaskum 
High school held their annual 
prom recently in the South Side 
Park hall. The popular Kewaskum 
Quintette furnished music.

SAFETY PATROL BOYS
ATTEND BRAVES GAME

Twenty-three safety patrol boys 
of Kewaskum attended the Mil-1 
waukee Braves-Chicago Cubs base­
ball game at Milwaukee County 
stadium last Saturday afternoon, 
sponsored by the Kiwanis Club of 
Kewaskum. Four chaperones ac­
companied the boys, who made 
the trip by bus

The Institute for Safer Living j 
states that many motorists fail to : 
do their homework—which means I 
that before starting out for the 
day’s driving, they should take a 
few moments to check vital oper­
ating parts of the car, including • 
brakes, windshield wipers, horn, I 
lights, and directionals.

Weigh the many advantages of gett­
ing that personal Ioan you need at this 
friendly bank. Honest advice, prompt 
and thorough service, low bank rates, 
convenient budget repayment plan,— 
add up to complete satisfaction. See 
us this week.

IBank ©if Kewaswm

ARROW SHIRTS $4.50
MASSAGIC SHOES $15.95
SPORT SHIRTS $1.98 up
COOL PAJAMAS $2.98 up
SWIM & BEACH SUMMER 

CLOTHING SLACKS 
CAMPING AND OUTDOOR

COOKING EQUIPMENT 
and MANY MORE

ROSENHEIMER’S 
Department StoreMEMBER FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORP.

WE PAY 4% ON ONE YEAR SAVINGS CERTIFICATES

Herb Backhaus 
Honored as Top 
Auto Salesman

In recognition of superior sales 
accomplishments in 1963, 196 
Chevrolet salesmen from Milwau­
kee zone including Herb Back­
haus of Honeck Chevrolet, Inc , 
Kewaskum, were honored during 
a banquet and installed as mem­
bers of Chevrolet’s exclusive 
“Legion of Leaders Honor Club.” 
Scene of the occasion was the 
Lac la Belle Golf club, Oconomo­
woc, Wis., on May 26.

E. E. Fross, zone manager, wel­
comed the new members and paid 
special tribute to their outstand­
ing sales performance in provid­
ing intelligent, professional coun­
sel to all customers. The sales­
men were also complimented for 
the extra effort put forth in help­
ing customers fill their specific 
automotive needs and require­
ments.

New members were awarded a 
special parchment certificate and 
an attractive lapel pin as acknow­
ledgment of their distinguished 
salesmanship.

Recognition of exceptional sales­
manship has been a Chevrolet tra­
dition since 1926 when the first 
honor society was established. 
Through the years this organiza­
tion evolved into the present 
“Legion of Leaders Honor Club ”

Eligibility and membership in 
the “Legion of Leaders” is open to 
all qualified salesmen actively en­
gaged as full-time sales represen-

tatives for an authorized Chevro- 
i let dealer.

i4-H Club News
i AUBURN 4 H CLUB
I Our May meeting was at the Al- 
I ban Nigh home with Linda Nigh. 
. president, taking charge. After the 
flag pledge we had our business 
meeting. All reports were accept­
ed as read.

Lorina Petermann, our general 
leader, gave out additional helps 
for our projects. We invited our 
parents and friends to this meet­
ing to hear an interesting talk by 
our special guest, Miss Laura La- 
ghi, AFS student from Italy at Ke­
waskum High school, and her Am­
erican family, the Gregor Nighs.

After a question and answer pe­
riod we all had a good descrip­
tion of life in Italy. She and her 
American sister, Mary Nigh, were 
presented with a gift from the 
club. After the 4-H pledge, a deli­
cious lunch was served by the 
Nighs.

The next meeting June 2 was 
set for Sandy Hoepner’s home. 
(Sorry I didn’t get this in the pap­
er last month).

Our June 2 meeting at the home 
of Sandra Hoepner was attended ; 
by all members. The roll call to-

I pic was on safety practices, which 
! is the 4-H theme this year on 

highway safety. After the min­
utes were read and the treasurer’s 
report given, we had our business 
meeting.

Jeffrey Schleif is going to Camp 
I Talaki in Waupaca county June 8- 
| 11. Linda Nigh couldn’t go.

Alice Weddig was the winner 
of a $1.00 prize in our bluebird 
ccntest by reporting the first 
bluebird family in her house-

On safety practices we want to 
refleotorize all neighboring ma­
chinery and bicycles.

For community builders pro­
ject we intend to make two ceme­
tery signs, one each for Gage and 
Van Vechten cemeteries so people 
know which one it is when they 
drive by.

The June Dairy Month posters 
were judged. All did a good job.

Orville Petermann, our electric 
project leader, together with his 

i members, attended the all-electric 
project meetings at Fond du Lac.

We will divide our club into 
three groups to go out and paint 
mail boxes in the next few weeks.

Our next meeting will be held 
July 6 at the Roger Schleif home.

.After the 4-H pledge we were 
treated to a delicious lunch by 
Mrs. H. Hoepner and Sandy.

Reporter, Alice Weddig

IANZ TV-RADIO
Sales & Service

ADMIRAL
THE VOICE OF MUSIC

PHONE 626-2610

R. 2 KEWASKUM

IS YOUR LAWN MOWER IN 
TIP-TOP SHAPE FOR THIS 
SUMMER’S WORK? IF NOT, 
BRING IT IN FOR EXPERT 

SERVICE.
We are now open for all types 
of repair service.

REMMEL MFG. CO.
Louis L. Bath, Prop.

REMEMBER DAD (Grandad, too) 
ON

Father’s Day
SUNDAY, JUNE 21st

With Gifts Like These:
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Assemblyman of 
County, Elmer J. 
Schowalter Dies

SECOND STROKE PROVES 
FATAL TO HUSBAND OF 
FORMER KEWASKUM GIRL

Elmer J. Schowalter, 69, of the 
town of Jackson, a Republican, 
who was serving his fifth term as 
Washington county assemblyman, 
passed away Tuesday night, June 
9, at St- Joseph’s Community hos-

Mr. Schowalter was widely 
known for the animals he raised 
which included deer, buffalo, 
longhorn cattle, African moun­
tain sheep and elk, on his farm at 

i Jackon and another farm near 
। Iron Mountain, Mich. He supplied 
। many game farms, both private 
I and public, with deer and other 
animals. Whitetail deer raised on 
his Jackson farm were used in the 
1947 motion picture, "The Year­
ling.” He has also provided deer 
for federal and state re-stocking 
programs since 1948. At Iron 
Mountain he raised buffalo, Afri­
can mountain sheep, longhorn cat­
tle and elk.

Mr. Schowalter was born on Oct. 
12, 1894, and he resided in the 
town of Jackson all his life- He 
was married to Hulda Quandt of 
Kewaskum in November of 1922 
in this village. The couple had two 
sons, one of whom died in infan­
cy. The other, Donald, survives 
and operates the farm. Mrs- Scho­
walter died in 1932.

In addition to his activities as 
assemblyman, animal raiser and 
farm operator, Mr. Schowalter 
had previously served on the 
school board and was a former 
town assessor. He was a member 
of the church brotherhood of St- 
Peter’s United Church of Christ 
of the town of Jackson and the 
Loyal Order of Moose.

Surviving, in addition to his 
son, are a daughter-in-law, five 
grandchildren and five brothers, 
Alwin of Jackson, Herbert and 
Norman of West Bend, Clarence

will officiate and burial will be in I 
the church cemetery.

CHARLES PLAUTZ
Funeral services were held at 

the Techtman-Myrhum Funeral 
home. West Bend, at 1 p. m. Sat­
urday, June 6. for Charles Plautz, 
85, of R. 1. Kewaskum. The Rev 
C- H. Meyer officiated and burial 
was in Graceland cemetery, Mil­
waukee. Friends called at the fun­
eral home from 5 p. m. Friday.

Mr. Plautz died at St Joseph’s 
Community hospital. West Bend, 
at 9:15 a. m. Wednesday, June 3. 
after a brief illness.

He w’as born at Milwaukee on 
March 7, 1879. and after his mar­
riage to the former Emily Dippel 
in the Lutheran church at Dundee, 
farmed in Fond du Lac county for 
a number of years. Later he did 
carpenter and masonry work in 
the Milwaukee area. He had been 
a R. 1, Kewaskum, resident for 
the past seven years, living there 
with a son, Walter. His wife pre­
ceded him in death Jan. 7, 1953.

Surviving are the son mentioned 
above, three daughters, Mrs. Lo­
retta Stanton of Chicago, Viola. 
(Mrs. Homer Harrison/ of Mil­
waukee and Esther (Mrs- Jim 
Harrison) of Brookfield; seven 
grandchildren, nine great-grand­
children, a daughter-in-law, two 
sons-in-law, a brother-in-law and 
other relatives.

Sitting still and wishing 
Made no person great 
The good Lord sends the fishing

29th Red Cross 
Dinner Meeting 
Here June 25

BERNARD ZIEGLER GUEST 
SPEAKER AT ANNUAL MEET 
AT HOLY TRINITY CHURCH

Bernard Ziegler, secretary and 
director of public relations of the 
West Bend Company will be the 
guest speaker at the 29th annual 
Red Cross dinner meeting of the 
West Bend chapter on Thursday 
evening, June 25. at the Holy Tri­
nity church hall, Kewaskum at 
7:15 o’clock.

“Water—On It and in It” is the 
title of the talk Mr. Ziegelr has 
chosen as the local chapter this 
year joins in the nationwide cele­
bration of the golden anniversary 
of a program responsible for sav­
ing lives, with a promise to make 
it bigger and better.

General meeting arrangements 
are in charge of the town of Ke­
waskum headed by Arnold Amer- 
ling, a member of the chapter 
board of directors. Roy Esser, ag­
ricultural instructor at the Ke­
waskum High school, will serve 
as master of ceremonies.

A family style beef dinner will 
be served by the ladies of the par­
ish at $2.00 per person prior to

J the program under the direction 
I of Mrs. Al Muckerheide.

The annual meeting is open to 
(everyone. Reservations should be 
] made by June 19 with Mr. Amer- 
ling, R. 2, Kewaskum, telephone 
626-2320 or the local headquar­
ters, library building. West Bend, 
telephone FE 4-4587.

HONOR GERALD MILLER 
I AT GRADUATION PARTY

The guest of honor at a gradua­
tion party following commence­
ment exercises at Kewaskum Com­
munity High school on June 4 was 

• Gerald Miller, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
De ward Miller, R. 1, Kewaskum.

] Those who attended came from 
i Beechwood, Batavia. Silver Creek 
| and Sheboygan.
j Gerald was awarded the Cliff­
ord M Rose Memorial scholar­
ship, the academic athletic award 
and a medal for four years of par­
ticipation in the high school band.

He will attend Platteville State 
university.

When you’re in an argument at 
home and something has to give 
it’s usually father.

I Some people keep you from be- 
' ing lonely, others make you wish 
| you were.

pital, West Bend, where he was 
confined since suffering a second 
stroke last week.

Mr. Schowalter was first elected 
to the state assembly in 1954 and 
wras re-elected in 1956, 1958, 1960 
and 1962- He suffered his first 
stroke in October of 1962, shortly

of Beloit and Henry of West Bend
The body is in state at the 

Woldt Funeral home at Jackson 
since 11 a. m. Friday and friends 
may call at St. Peter's United 
Church of Christ from noon until 
the time of services at 2 p. m 
Saturday. The Rev. Ralph Schultz

But you must dig the bait

before his last election, and had
been recuperating since that time 
prior to his most recent stroke 
last Friday. Active in GOP county 
and state political circles, he did 
not intend to run again this fall.

A native of the town of Jack- 
son, Mr. Schowalter was born on 
the family farm in that township 
which he continued to operate un-

OLLIE’S 
TEXACO SERVICE

Call Kewaskum 62 6-2 5 60

MADE
KEYS

> EX7/M MEY

Honeck Chevrolet
KEWASKUM

til it was taken over by his son 
Donald. He had been active in 
farm affairs up to the time he 
was originally stricken, continuing 
to operate the family dairy farm 
which the Schowaletr family set­
tled in 1843.

Watkins Quality Products 
and Mary King Cosmetics 

Home Remedies Al) Approved 
by Good Housekeeping 

WM. J- COULTER
R. 3, Camp. Ph. Kew. 626-2503

TEXACO 
Products & Services 

gas — OIL 
marfax lubrication 
WASHING — POLISHING 

ACCESSORIES 
MOTOR TUNEUP 
MINOR REPAIRS 

MUFFLERS — TAILPIPES 
FIRESTONE & DUNLOP TIRES 

DELCO BATTERIES

Every Bride’s
Hearts Desire

MUFFLER 
SPECIAL

a
$8.85 -1954 to 1964 Chevrolets

FREE MUFFLER INSTALLATION 
DURING MONTH OF JUNE

Now is the time to replace that noisy worn out muffler! 
Take advantage of FREE MUFFLER INSTALLATION in 

June during our 5th annual muffler sale.

Honeck Chevrolet
1242 FOND DU LAC AVE. KEWASKUM, WIS.

Ever since 1850 — finest name 
in American wedding rings! 
Now see our exciting collec­
tion for Spring ’64. For dar­
ingly fresh designs, exauisite 
detailing — nothing can com­
pare. And they start at $8!

LEROY C. BIER
JEWELER

PHONE 626 2777 KEWASKUM

Geiger Ford
Sells

CARS FOR LESS

Uncomfortable ... thia is the way you are sitting now!

The PEARL-WICK
LEG-LOUNGER*

Select One For Him

From Our Large Stock

$9.95 to $16.95

Q^^s-v
ALWAYS DEPENDABLE & REASONABLE

Open Daily To 5:30 Mon. & Frl. To 9 P. M. 
mm_m__mmmm^.
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Local News Items
Sylvester “Tiny” Terlinden left 

Sunday by car on a vacation trip 
through the eastern states, in­
cluding Niagara Falls. He expects 
to be gone two weeks. After this 
swing through the East, Tiny re­
ports that he will have visited ev­
ery state in the United States ex-
cept Alaska. He has been 
waii.

Mrs. Minnie Mertes and 
ter Mona left Tuesday for

to Ha-

daugh- 
a five-

Dolores Ketter, 
James Hammes 
Wed on Saturday I

Vows were exchanged during an j

mes, R. 2, Campbellsport, Miss 
Sheri Harbeck, Milwaukee, and 
Miss Rosalie Ewert, Kewaskum,! 
served as bridal aides. All of the j 
attendants were attired alike in, 
floor length fluid sheath gowns |

Engagement of Miss Births
Heisdorf Announced

11 a. m. nuptial mass in Holy Tri­
nity church, Kewaskum, on Satur­
day, June 6, by Miss Dolores E 
Ketter of 215 Clinton st., Kewas­
kum, daughter of the late Mr. and 
Mrs. Lawrence Ketter, and James 
J. Hammes of R. 2, Campbell­
sport, son of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Hammes. The Rev John T. Budde, 
pastor, officiated.

Dinner for the wedding party 
and immediate families at the
Glacier Inn, Kewaskum, 
the ceremony and Mass, 
tion and dance were 
Nonn’s resort, Kettle 
lake, near Dundee.

followed 
A recep- 
held at 
Moraine

Following their wedding trip to 
an undisclosed destination, Mr 
and Mrs. Hammes will be at home 
at 1306 Fond du Lac ave. in Ke­
waskum. Both the bride and 
bridegroom are graduates of Ke­
waskum Community High school. 
He is a truck driver for Fairmontweek stay at Boulder, Colo., where .

Mona will attend school at Boul-1 F°°ds ^°» Kewaskum and his
der university-

Mr.
gave a 
nesday 
of the

and Mrs. Robert Scannell 
party at their home Wed- 
evening, June 10, for all 
graduating classmates of

bride is an 
advertising 
Ware, Inc., 

Given in

office employee in the
department at Regal 

Kewaskum.
marriage by her broth-

of blue 
a fitted 
wristlet 
flowed

chiffon over taffeta with 
scoop necked bodice and 
sleeves. A watteau back 

gracefully from a back
’ neckline bow. They wore emboss­
ed floral hats ornamented with 
pearl tips and irridescents with a 
pouf tiered veil. All carried bas­
kets of pastel spring flowers and 
ivy.

Donald Hammes, R. 2, Camp­
bellsport, was his brother’s best 
man, while Alfred Schmitt, West 
Bend, Harold Pesch, R. 2, Camp­
bellsport, and Daniel Coulter, 
Kohlsville, attended as grooms­
men. Guests were placed by Gil­
bert Gloede, Kewaskum, and An­
drew Pesch, R. 2, Campbellsport

BALOG INFANT IS 
BAPTIZED SUNDAY

their daughter Susan, who grad­
uated from the eighth grade at 
Holy Trinity school on Friday, 
June 5.

Mrs. A. Reindl and family were 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Leo Hall 
and Mrs. Lena Beck at Campbell­
sport Sunday in honor of Andy 
Hall’s eighth grade graduation.

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold Schmidt 
accompanied Mr. and Mrs. Arthur 
Schmidt and daughter of Milwau­
kee to Iron Mountain, Mich, to vi­
sa: over the weekend with Mrs. 
Mary Jane Fillon, the mother of 
Mrs Arthur Schmidt. They also
visited William Meinecke, 
mer Kewaskum resident.

a for-

Carol Reindl of Fond du Lac vi­
sited over the weekend with her
mother, 
ily

Save! 
Miller’s 
lection, 
son able

Mrs. A Reindl and fam-

Select your furniture at 
in Kewaskum. Largest se 
high quality at most rea 

prices. Open daily until

er, Ralph Ketter, the bride was 
gowned in veiled silk organza with 
Pcau D’ Ange lace. A narrow self 
fabric band outlined the empire 
bodice of the controlled silhou­
ette. A pearl and sequin embroid­
ered motiff highlighted the bo­
dice. Bracelet length sleeves, 
scoop neckline and a detachable 
watteau train was banded with 
lace and flowed from the back 
neckline. The semi-sheath skirt 
featured a wide band of lace at 
the hemline which was high­
lighted with jeweled clusters. Her 
bouffant veil of silk illusion was 
held in place by a Juliet hat of 
silk petals ornamented with pearl 
beading. Her bouquet was a white 
calla lily surrounded by a cascade 
of ivy.

Mrs. Charles Halfmann, Camp­
bellsport, was her sister’s honor 
attendant, while Miss Diane Ham-

The little daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Balog, R. 2, Kewas­
kum, was baptized Sunday morn­
ing, May 31, at Holy Trinity 
church by the Rev. John T. Bud­
de. She received the name Bar­
bara Jean. Sponsors were Mr. and 
Mrs. Leonard Nelson of Wiscon­
sin Rapids. Guests for the occa­
sion included the paternal grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. A H. Balog, 
of Manitowoc, the sponsors and 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed. Theusch and son 
Ralph.

Black walnut is getting scarce in 
the United States, and right now 
it commonly sells for 10 to 20 
times the price of other hard­
woods.

A puss purrs for an obvious 
purr-puss-

Schlaeter Optometrists
MATH. ANTHONY

PHONE 533-2924
Office Hours: 9-12 1-5
Wed. & Fri. evenings 7-9

Closed Thursday Afternoons 
CAMPBELLSPORT, WIS.

5:30. Monday and Friday to 9 p 
m. Free dependable delivery.

NOTICE HERRIGES OIL CO
Hospital News

Kenneth and Sharon, son and 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Bernard 
Kaehne, Kewaskum, submitted to
tonsil 1 ectomies Friday at 
soph’s Community hospital, 
Bend. They returned home 
day.

St- Jo- 
West 

Satur-

HOMER’S 
BARBER SHOP 
Will Be Closed 
For Vacation

PHONE 626-2244

Shell Oil 
and Lubrication

From June 22
To June 30

GREASING 
WASHING 
MUFFLERS 

MINOR REPAIRS 
GOODYEAR AND 
DAYTON TIRES

farmers
PLEASE MAKE YOUR APPOINT 

MENTS ACCORDINGLY

HOMER SCHAUB

AUTOLITE BATTERIES

Bulk Delivery of 
Gas and Fuel Oils

Don't Give Your 
Dead or Disabled 

Cows or Horses Away

WE PAY
Straub’s Mink

Ranch
«. 1. CAMPBELLSPORT

PHONE 533-3841

Jack’s Appliance 
"The Complete Appliance Center" 

General Electric - Zenith - Maytag

Residential - Farm - Commercial 
ELECTRICAL WIRING

Appliance - T.V. - Radio - Phonograph * 
REPAIR

Phonograph Records - All The Latest Hits
VACUUM CLEANER DISPOSABLE BAGS 

AND REPAIRS
Phote 626 2808

Mr. and Mrs. John H. Heisdorf, 
R. 2, Kewaskum, announce the 
engagement of their daughter, Ju­
dy, to Carl Steiner, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Chester Steiner, 1456 Bilgo
Lane, Kewaskum. An Oct. 
wedding is being planned-

10

There’s a laugh in it when a 
husband gives his wife a tip-back 
chair for her birthday for him to 
fall asleep in.

HEBERER—A second son to Mr. 
< and Mrs- Norman Heberer, 1339 
Kewaskum st., Kewaskum, Wed­
nesday, June 10, at St. Joseph’s 
Community hospital, West Bend.

BEISBIER—A daughter, Colleen 
Mary, to Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Beisbier, 1306 Fond du Lac ave-, 
Kewaskum, Monday, May 25, at 

। Si. Agnes hospital, Fond du Lac.
BEISBIER—A daughter to Mr.

and Mrs. 
Forest ave., 
June 5-

Robert Beisbier, 130
Kewaskum, Friday,

REINDL—A daughter 
and Mrs. Alvin Reindl,

to Mr.
R. 1, Al-

lenton, Tuesday, June 9, at St. 
Agnes hospital, Fond du Lac.

WOOLMAN—A son to Mr. and 
Mrs. Stanley Woolman, 1203 Park 
View Drive, Kewaskum, Sunday, 
June 7.

KULTGEN—A son to Mr. and 
Mrs. Elmer Kultgen, R. 1. Kewas­
kum, Tuesday, June 9.

HAACK—A son to Mr. and Mrs- 
Carl Haack, R. 1, Random Lake, 
Saturday, June 6

ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Abel of 
West Bend, formerly of Kewas­
kum, announce the engagement 
of their daughter, Judith, to Rich­
ard Kohn, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Franklin Kohn, Campbellsport.

Call 626-2626 with your news-

JACOBS BARBER SHOP
Now Has 2 Barbers

For the best in hair styling 
and grooming call on Rog or Don

WALK INS OR BY APPOINTMENT

PHONE 626-2331

We Also Call on Shut-ins

For today, tomorrow, and their future protection

Equitable’s Uving Insurance 
pays off for the living

Living Insurance means benefits for the living. 
Benefits for you while you live; if you die, benefits 
for those who live on after you. It means funds 
toward your children’s college education, a com­
fortable retirement for you someday, money for 
retirement or emergencies, an income for your 
family if you’re not there. Your specialist in Living 
Insurance can help you select the right protection 
plan for your living needs. Just ask your Man 
from Equitable. Call or write:

ORVAL E. BEHNKE, District Mgr.
230 CLINTON ST., KEWASKUM PHONE 626-2441

Living Insurance by Equitable
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Looking Thru the 
Field Glasses...

By Bob Lake, Conservation 
Warden, Washington County

FISHING SLOWS, BIG 
ROCK BASS HITTING

Fishing in the county slowed 
some what in the past week. Bass 
continue to bite at Big Cedar. 
Crappies and a few northern at * 
Little Cedar. Excellent fishing for 
large size rock bass from the piers 
at Pike lake. Waters cloudy and 
dropping rapidly.

Complaints are coming in from 
property owners on some of the 
lakes in Washington county that 
individuals are crossing their land 
or fishing from their pier without 
permission.

Public rights in navigable wa­
ters as quoted by the Wisconsin 
Public Service Commission are as 
follows: (The public has the right i 
to use water up to the water. | 
When the water recedes to low I 
water mark, the rights of the pub­
lic recede with the water, and 
when the water rises and extends 
to the ordinary high water mark, 
the public rights to use the water 
are extended accordingly. The 
public does not have the right to 
use a strip of land along the 
shore. A pder is private property, 
and permission should be ob­
tained to use. In the event the 
pier is a menace to navigation the 
Public Service Commission may 
order it removed.

Park and Forest Regulations
This is the time of the year 

when our state parks and forests 
are used most frequently by both 
Wisconsin residents and our visi­
tors from other states. With the 
increased use of these facilities, 
it has been necessary to tighten 
regulations governing conduct and 
use of these areas. Here briefly 
are some of the regulations.

1. It is unlawful to destroy, mo­
lest or deface any natural growth 
or natural or archeoligic features 
or any state property; to enter in 
any way, any building, installation 
or area that may be locked or 
closed to public use, or contrary 
to posted notice.

2. It is unlawful to destroy, mo­
lest, or remove the property of 
others-

3. It is unlawful for any person 
other than a permittee or licensee 
to scavenge golf balls on any golf 
course.

4. It is unlawful to discard or 
leave any refuse, sewage or other 
waste material on the ground, or

PIZZA
WIGWAM

PHONE 626 2901

Why wait for 
. - Trouble?

Buy Your X 
Set of

Now...Today!

LEN &

KNNSYLVANIA 
i TIRES j

ROG
Shell Service

PHONE 626-2888

in any building or installation, or 
in the water or on the ice of any 
lake or stream or to dispose of 
any such waste material in any 
manner except by burning or by: 
placing in receptacles or other au- ■ 
thorized location provided for 
such purposes.

5. It is unlawful to wash vehi­
cles or pets except at authorized 
locations in any public use area 
under the management, supervi­
sion and control of the Conserva­
tion Commission-

6. It is unlawful to wash any 
clothing except at authorized lo­
cations in any public use area.

7. From May 15 to Sept. 15 it 
is unlawful to allow a dog or cat 
to enter any public building, or 
installation, or be upon any bath­
ing beach or in any improved 
campsite or picnic area in any 
state park, state forest, fish hatch­
ery, state recreation area or simi­
lar public use area. I

County Agent 
News Notes

By MAURICE J. HOVLAND 
Washington County Agent

DUTCH ELM DISEASE
We expect to have a great deal 

of Dutch elm disease in Washing­
ton county this year. If you live in 
one of the villages or cities, and 
are suspicious of a tree , please 
call one of the following Wash­
ington county Dutch elm disease 
wardens: Village of Germantown, 
Clarence Strack or F. W. Mehre; 
village of Jackson, Frederick Free- 
hauf; village of Kewaskum, Roland 
Fledl; village of Slinger, Gerald 
Kienbaum; city of Hartford, Gor­
don Finck; city of West Bend. 
Walter Puestow.

If you live in a rural area, take 
a sample of the tree yourself and 
bring it in to our office. We will 
send it on to Madison for you-

Last week my son Jim came 
home from school and told us 
that the rumor was going around 
school that one man had used so 
many toothpicks that he had 
come down with Dutch elm dis­
ease. For a while we thought we 
ought to begin an investigation, 
but didn’t know just where to 
start-

Seriously, though, the point is

AUTO-TOUR I STS I
TAKE LAKE MICHIGAN

SHORT CUT
Milwaukee. Wis.-Muskegon, Mich.
Save 275 Miles of Driving 

Around The Lake
Morning, Afternoon, Night 

Sailings
Combine a Lake Trip With 
Your Motor Tour Enjoy 
CLIPPER hospitality — spaci­
ous decks, beautiful lounges- 
Outside staterooms with toi­
lets, berths, children’s play­
room, free movies, TV, danc­
ing, fine food and refresh­
ments at reasonable prices. 
Send for brochure showing 
rates, schedules. AUTO—One 
way $8.95. PASSENGER-—One 
way $575. CHILDREN—5 to
11 Half Fare, Under 5 Free. ।

WISCONSIN I MICHIMN JTHWHIF CO. 
Municipol Fow»n«« 7t»r 

Z 500 N Harber Drive
Milwaukee X wl* tel 8* 1-7005 _

Season Opens June 19th Marx FOODLINER

that Dutch elm disease affects on­
ly elm trees—nothing else.

BIRDS IN STRAWBERRIES
How can you keep the robins, 

blackbirds and other birds away 
from your strawberry plantations? 
This oan be quite a problem. The 
best thing for the small plantation 
would be to cover the area with 
cheesecloth. The berries will get 
enough sunlight to ripen properly 
even though they are covered.

If you have a large plantation 
you might like to set a carbide 
gun in the middle of the field. 
This gun is automatic and timed 
so that it explodes about every 
minute or so. This does a very ef­
fective job- Naturally it is an ex­
pense, but if you have a large 
plantation it may well worth the 
investment.

INGENUITY OF FARMERS
I have always been intrigued by 

the ingenuity of farmers. It seems 
that if they need an item and 
can’t buy it, they simply make or 
build it- Last week Roger Liese- 
ner showed me two items he has 
devised. One was a truck which 
he remodeled into a chopper wa­
gon. He mounted his present 
chopper wagon on the truck in 
such a w»ay that it is comp1 ?tely 
versatile—it eliminates an extra 
tractor, saves a lot of time and 
certainly investment. For the 
other unit, he used the hydraulic 
system of his plow, mounting it 
on the necesary frame so that he 
could split fence posts with his 
tractor, saving many hours of hard 
labor. Once more this is proof to 
me that our farmers are inven­
tive and ingenious.

BRED HEIFERS WANTED
Last week we attended a dairy

RADIO-TV-SOUND
SALES AND SERVICE

GAMBLES
Authorized Dealer 
FRANK J. FELIX

Phone 626-2841 Kewaskum

Grocery Specials
IGA
CATSUP 14 oz. bottle 2 for

Zest
BATH SOAP 7c off deal 2’s

IGA
CUT GREEN BEANS 15V2 tin 6 for

Silver Buckle 
Pieces-Stems MUSHROOMS 4 oz. tins 2 for

Purity
WHITE PAPER PLATES 80 count

Midwest
SANDWICH COOKIES 2 lb pkg.

cattle sale at Fullpail Sales Arena 
in Hartford. Ernie Kueffner, oper­
ator of Fullpail, said it is a well- 
accepted fact that cattle with 
good records bring good money. 
Cattle without good records don’t 
bring quite so much, and cattle 
with no records bring even less.

This indicates to us that farm­
ers who are not on test ought to 
be to get good records on their 
cattle.

Ernie also said that he has an­
other order for bred heifers to go 
to Puerto Rico. He just shipped 
out about 60 head; his son Vince 
went along with these cattle on 
th boat. Now these people want 
another 40 to 60 head of bred 
heifers- If you have any, we sug­
gest you get in touch with Ernie.

Holstein Breeders
Annual Twilight 
Meeting June 25

PLAN FINE PROGRAM, ICE 
CREAM EATING, JUDGING 
CONTESTS; NELSON SPEAKER

The Washington County Hol­
stein Breeders association will 
hold their 1964 twilight meeting 
at the Schroeder Dairy Farm on 
Thursday, June 25, beginning at 
7:00 p. m. This farm is located 
near West Bend, on the corner of 
Hwy. G and Hwy. 143- It is sug­
gested you use Hwy. 143, since G 
is under repair.

John Horlamus, chairman of the 
association this year, has announc­
ed an excellent program. A pure­
bred Holtein heifer calf from a

Geiger Ford;
Sells 

CARS FOR LESS

cow that made 558 lbs. of butter­
fat will be sold at public auction. 
This calf was born in February 
The money from this sale will be 
given to the Holstein association 
to use in promoting youth activi­
ties throughout Washington coun­
ty.

The usual judging contest will 
be held this year with Eugene Nel­
son making the final placings. 
Nelson will also be the featured 
speaker during the meeting.

An ice cream-eating contest 
will be conducted by Bcb Stodola, 
Jake Wiesner and John Engel­
hardt. These three men are sett­
ing up the program for the boys 
and girls who come to the meet­
ing. Bill Schroeder will furnish 
the ice cream for this contest.

In addition, Gehl Bros. Mfg. 
Co. of West Bend will have a 
farm machinery show at the event; 
and winners of the county 4-H 
judging team contest will be an­
nounced.

This will be a fine program and 
everyone is invited to attend. It 
is not necessary to be a member 
of the association to attend this 
meeting. You will be very wel­
come.

The driver who steps thought 
fully on the gas pedal puts his 
best foot forward. The Institute 
for Safer Living of the American 
Mutual Liability Insurance Com 
pany states that a skilled driver 
never bounces a passenger around 
in his seat. Smooth accelerations 
and stops, unnoticed by a passen­
ger, are the hallmark of a good 
safe driver.

33c 
32c

$1
49c 
49c
49c
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WANTED SECRETARY—Life in­
surance district office, Ke 
wtaskum. Good salary with ex­
cellent fringe benefits. Contact 
Orv Behnke for interview Must 
take dictation. 6-12-tf

WO«K WANTED—By two high 
school girls Experienced baby 
sitters. Phone 626-2439. Ip

WORK WANTED — Country boy 
would like work. Phone 626- 
2653. 6-12-2

FOR SALE — Boy’s 26’’ bicycle
Paul Kohler. Phone 626-2746. 2p

FOR SALE—Fresh eggs. Delivery 
in Kewaskum. Ph. 626-2439 Ip

FOR SALE—White male poodle 
dog, small miniature, 3 months 
old. AKC registered. Ph one FE- 
dera) 4-7047. 6-12-21

WANTED TO BUY — Antiques. 
Furniture, glassware, top bug­
gies, wheels, seats. Write H 
Horn, 1720 N. 13th st., Sheboy­
gan, Wis. 6 12 4p

FOR SALE—Set of World Book 
encyclopedias. Ph. West Bend 
FE 4-2734. 6-5-4p

FARM WELDERS — Large new 
180 amp. Lincoln Welders now 
$95, 225 amp. $110. Ready to 
weld—we don't believe it! But 
they are yours for this price, 
while they’re available. Easy 
terms. Saks and service on all 
welding needs and machines. 
Mayville Welding Ind’s., corner 
Day ton & Grove sts. Ph. 28W,

Mayville. 4-3-tf

USED AUTO PARTS
Honeck Salvage Yard

Open 8:00 a. m. to 5:00 p. m.
On CTH “V,” north of Kewaskum.

FOR SALE—Used TV sets, recon­
ditioned. Janz TV, corner of 
Hwys. 45 and H.

New 7 room, ranch. 1H baths, 
built-in oven and range, wood 
paneled family room. 2 car attach­
ed garage.

3 large bedrooms, family size 
kitchen, plenty of cabinets and 
closets, spacious living room, oak 
floors, garage. $12,200.

2 bedrooms, step saver kitchen, 
dining area, carpeted living room, 
breeze-way, 1% car garage. $13,- 
000.

Two family home, large, spa­
cious and bright. 2 car garage. 
Priced to sell.

Modern, 4 large rooms, plus 
dining area, recreation room, at­
tached garage. $10,500.

Four bedroom ranch, formal 
dining room, carpeted living room, 
2-car basement garage. $16,000.

Kewaskum—South on 45 *- mi. 
4 bedrooms, dining area, 2-car ga 
rage, double lot.

Homes and farms needed.
BILL RUTH 
Real Estate 

.Ph. Kewaskum 626 2513 anytime.

SEED CORN FOR SALE—There’s 
no crop like corn and no seed 
like Pioneer. Plant all Pioneer

I STATE OF WISCONSIN 
j WASHINGTON COUNTY COURT

IN PROBATE
Order Appointing Time To Hear 
Petition For Administration And 
Heirship And Notice To Creditors-

I In The Matter Of The Estate Of 
LOUISA GUTH, Deceased.

A petition having been filed, re­
presenting that Louisa Guth, late 
of the Village of Kewakum, Wash­
ington County, Wisconsin, died in- 

1 testate, and praying that Letters 
of Administration be granted, 
and for determination and adjudi-1 
cation of heirship;

IT IS ORDERED:
That said petition be heard, at 

a term of Court at the Court 
House in the City of West Bend, 
County of Washington, State of 
Wisconsin, commencing on the 7th 
day of July, 1964, at the opening 
of Court on that day or as soon 
thereafter as said petition can be 
heard;

That the time within which cre­
ditors of the deceased shall pre­
sent claims against such estate for 
examination and allowance is 
hereby fixed and limited up to 
and including the 22nd day of 
September, 1964;

That all claims against the de­
ceased be examined and adjusted 
by the Court on the 24th day of

for dependable pleasing perfor­
mance. Ray Garbisch, phone 
Kewaskum 626-2059. th 6-16?

FOR SALE
Double flat south of Kewaskum, 

close to town. Kitchen, living room, 
3 bedrooms, and both up and 
down. Can be made into a single 
family dwelling. Reduced to 
$10,700 00.

Have prospects but need more 
homes and farms. List your real 

(estate with
RUSS KRUEGER REALTY 

Russ Krueger, Broker
Write or phone 626-2767 

Kewaskum, Wis.
6-5-tf

FOR SALE 
REAL ESTATE 

BUY, SELL OR TRADE
3-bedroom ranch with large 2 Ms 

car garage. A-l condition, in Ke­
waskum. Priced to sell $16,900.

Your choice—2 lots, 1 on corner 
of River rd. and Keller st. and 
other on E. Main st. $1750 each.

Contact
BOWE & WENINGER 

REALTY
Phone: Allenton, MArket 9-3333 or

(November, 1964, at the opening 
I of Court on that day, or as soon 
thereafter as the matter can be 
heard;

Dated June 9, 1964.
By the Court,

L. A. Buckley, 
County Judge. 

SCHLOEMER & MERRIAM. 
Attorneys

Corner of Sixth and Hickory 
West Bend, Wisconsin

6-12-3

DR. RUMSEY SPEAKS TO 
WORLD WAR I VETERANS

Dr. Chester R. Rumsey, a mem­
ber of Barracks 2617, Veterans of 
World War I and a candidate for 
assemblyman of Washington coun­
ty, addressed members of the bar­
racks on conservation at the reg­
ular meeting of the group on Sat­
urday, June 6- Dr. Rumsey foc­
used his remarks on water pollu­
tion in our lakes and streams, a 
subject in which he has long 
been interested and has made a 
life-time study.

Monotony is the opiate of the 
expressways. Best antidote is a 
short rest stop every 100 miles, or 
for each two hours of driving 
time.

■ J
Look what you can put
where this I I■
8 cubic-foot ' ;
refrigerator stands...

M USED EHRS
1963 Chev. Spt. Cpe.
2—1963 Chev. 6-pass. Wagons 
1962 Ford 4-Dr.
1961 Chev. 4dr.
1960 Chev. 6-pass- Wagon 
195* Chev. 4 dr.
2—1958 Chev. 2 Drs.
2—1957 Ford 4 drs.
1956 Chev. 4-dr.

1961 Falcon 4-dr.
1960 Chev. Coupe 
2—1959 Chev. 4 drs 
1958 Chev. Wagon 
1957 Buick Sedan
1957 Ford Wagon 
2—1957 Chev. 4 Drs. 
2—1957 Chev. 2 Drs.
2—1955 Chev. Sp. Coupes

Plus Many Older Models in Good Running Condition 
At Reasonable Prices.

USED TRUCKS

1961 Chev. 2-ton New Engine
1961 GMC LCF
1958 Chev. 1 H-Hn
1957 Chev. Panel
1956 Chev. 4-ton
1955 Chev. Panel
1954 IHC w/plow
1953 Chev. Cab & Chassis
2 Chev. dump trucks
See our large stock of used lH-ton and 

have several older model pickup

1959 Chev. 2-ton
1959 Ford Ranchero
1959 Ford 1 ton •
1958 Chev. 2-ton W/Hoist
1957 Willys Jeep & Plow
1957 Chev. 2 ton
1957 IHC 4-wheel drive
1956 Dodge 2-ton w/platform

2-ton trucks. We also
trucks in rood running con-

dition in etock.

Honeck Chevrolet
OPEN 7 A. M. TO 9 P. M. DAILY

KEWASKUM PHONE 626-2161

A modern electric refrigerator- 
freezer is no bigger on the ouside — 
yet holds over half again as much 
inside. A new 14 cubic-foot refriger­
ator-freezer could fit right into the 
same space where your older 8 
cubic-foot refrigerator now stands.

And there’s NO DEFROSTING

a new 14 cubic-foot 
refrigerator-freezer 
that you'll never 
have to defrost

1A ER in a modern refrigerator­
freezer — plus many other features 
such as easy-to-reach shelves and 
plenty of ice cubes.

See the handsome, big capacity, 
NO DEFROST electric refrigerator- 
freezers on display at your dealer 
or at the Electric Company.

Wisconsin electric power company
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In The Service CAMPERS ENJOY WEEKEND 
OUTING AT CROOKED LAKE

MEDICAL AUXILIARY 
AWARDS SCHOLARSHIP

COMPLETES FIRST PHASE 
OF AIR FORCE TRAINING

The West Bend chapter of the 
' Wisconsin Campers association 
• enjoyed a weekend campout at 
Hoeft's resort at Crooked lake. 
Twenty-three families were regis­
tered.

It pays to keep your car in good 
ignition. According to the Insti- 

of the lute 101 Safer Laving of the Am- 
Washington County Medical socie-|^can Mutual Liability Insurance 
ty has awarded its annual nursing Company, owners often neglect 
scholarship of $100.00 to Miss the car s electrical system as long

A 5:30 p. m. potluck supper [ 
was served on Saturday evening.

The Women’s Auxiliary

Phyllis Krueger, a 1964 graduate
of West Bend High school. Miss

as it is functioning smoothly.
Such neglect may sooner or later

। Krueger is the daughter of Mr. lesu^ hi sudden failure. Ignition, 
• lights, horn, and other electrical-

after which there was a short 
meeting. Later singing was en- 

I joyed around a huge bon fire, a- 
| long with treats and prizes for 
I games. On Sunday all enjoyed a 
i wiener roast for lunch. The food 
’ and pleasant weather made it a 

most enjoyable weekend for all.
The next campout for the group 

is slated for Sept- 11, 12 and 13 
with the place to be decided at

and Mrs. Waldemar Krueger of 
R. 1, West Bend. She will attend 
the Miwaukee Hospital School of 
Nursing in the fall.

During 1963, 34 beef producers 
cooperated in the Wisconsin Beef 
Improvement association. Over 
1.000 beef cows now have perfor­
mance records, reports Vern 
Felts, University of Wisconsin 
livestock production specialist.

ly-operated accessories should be

A, the next meeting which will be Airman William L. Gruhle, son 4 on held at the Kewaskum park at 8of Mr. and Mrs. Willard F. Gruhle
of R. 1, Kewaskum, has completed 1 ‘ m 
the first phase of his Air Force
basic military training at Lack- Don’1 plant ^wer seeds any' 

deeper than two to three times
Airman Gruhle has been select- the diameter of the seed 80016 of‘ 

ed for technical training as a miss- the very sma11 seeds should be I 
ile electronics specialist at the s<*ttered 011 the soil surface and I 
Air Training Command (ATC) watred gentIy into the SO1L

, WEST BEND
>^ Ŝ^_THE ATRI

land AFB, Tex.

school at Lowry AFB, Colo. His 
new unit is part of the vast ATC
system 
officers 
quired 
force.

which trains airmen and 
in the diverse skills re- 

by the nation's aerospace
Kewaskum*

The airman is a 1963 graduate 
of Kewaskum High school.

SPECIAL WEDNESDAY

DATE NIGHT
$1.00 PER COUPLE

Now Thru Sat
AT 7 & 9:10

OMID NIVEN • PETER SELLERS 
ROBERT WAGNER • CAPUCINE.

; THE PINK PANTMERy ,:
^.CLAUDU CARDINALE

TCCMBIIM* TTCHMRMM* UNITEO ARTISTS

Sun. - Mon. - Tues,
* DOUBLE FEATURE *

HOME FROM JAPAN
Darryl Wesenberg, son of 

and Mrs. Walter Wesenberg,

DON'T FORGET—Every Friday
TRW STORY Of AFRICA'S MOST DARING HUNTERS!

waskum,

Mr. Night is Family Night.—Children 
Ke- admitted FREE if with parents

1 a t ®pendinf a 3O’day NEW ADMISSION PRICES 
leave at his home. He was sta­
tioned in Japan and will return to NOW IN EFFECT
Sacramento, Calif., where he will ^rade School Students...........

High School Students ..............
Adults........................................

be stationed.
25c
50c
70c

RUMSEY ATTENDS NATURAL 
RESOURCE COUNCIL MEET

The Wisconsin Resource Devel- 
opement Council, to which Dr. C. 
R Rumsey, R. 5, West Bend, is a 
delegate, met with Ralph Hovind, 
secretary of the Natural Resource 
Committee of State Agencies, in 
the Capitol building at Madison, 
Wednesday, June 3, to discuss 
and evaluate proposals for legisla­
tion to be presented to the 1965- 
’66 legislature.

Dr. Rumsey reports that this 
meeting will result in new propo­
sals for the control of: garbage 
and refuse disposal, industrial pol-

Sat. - Sun., June 13-14 
Wowie! The million-buck 
schemes they dared! The 

luscious dolls they shared!
Terrific together 

JACKIE GLEASON 
steve McQueen 

“SOLDIER IN
THE RAIN” 

Co-Starring Tuesday Weld 
Tony Bill 

Tom Poston 
Ed Nelson

Music — Henry Mancini

Sun. 1:15 - 4:25 - 7:30 - 10:40 
Mon. 6:30 Only 
Tues. 7 & 10:10 
— ALSO

. Swi* 
I MMJNH ‘ 
1 sons of 
I SP**U' ill
igSM®^

Sun. 2:55 - 6:00 - 9:10
Mon. 8:05 Only
Tues. 8:40 Only

lution, flood plain zoning, sewer- W^/iH Timo IT IQ 
age districts, sanitary districts, June U-IJ 
water waste, highway billboards,
wild life safety on highways and 
overall water pollution.

Many other subjects were dis-

A shattering entertainment 
experience! From the man 

who fired "The Guns of 
Navarone."

cussed. but the problem of water ^TI-Ip VICTORS' 
pollution control was considered 1 1 v 1Vz 1
the most important because pure 
water is the basis for prosperous

VINCENT EDWARDS 
ALBERT FINNEY

farming, manufacturing.
and recreational activities 
state of Wisconsin.

business
in the

GEORGE 
MELINA 

JEAN

HAMILTON 
MERCOURI 
MOREAU

Lots of untruths travel 
fast although they haven’t 
to stand on

mighty 
a leg

DANCE
HITCHING POST! 

INC.
Kohlsville

MUSIC BY 

Bernie and His 
Jolly Lads

SAT., JUNE 20 
9:00 to 1:00 

75c Admission

MON.
2 BIG 
SHOWS

ON 
STAGE

2 P. M.
10 P. M.

Admission This Show
Children 
Under 12 
Adults

50c 
$1.00

professionally checked at least 
twice per year to forestall failures 
due to loose or worn wiring and 
wearing parts.

A recession is a period in which
you tighten up your belt. A 
pression is a time in which 
have no belt to tighten. When 

( have no trousers to hold up, 
I a panic-

de- 
you 
you 
it’s

M/^MM’Q Kettle Moraine Lake 
llViul □ Ballroom & Resort

SERVING CHICKEN
Every Sunday —12 Noon to 8 p. m

$1.00 - EAT ALL YOU LIKE
FRESH PERCH FISH FRY FRIDAYS

HALL FREE for Weddings or Parties
PHONE 533-3162

The EVERGLADES
at NEW PROSPECT

SERVING BROASTED FOODS
THAT ARE DELICIOUSLY

Food Served

Sundays 11

CLOSED

DIFFERENT

Daily 5

a. m. to

to 11

11 p. m.

TUESDAYS
Dinner Size Fish Fry Fridays 75c

PHONE 533 3299

HON -E-KOR
GOLF AND COUNTRY CLUB

Golf

Fridays

Cocktails Food
WE CATER TO WEDDINGS 

BANQUETS OR ANY KIND OF PARTY 
FAMILY STYLE — BY RESERVATION 

Also Serving

11 a. m. to 11 p. m
FISH — SHRIMP — LOBSTER — FROG LUGS

Saturdays 5 p. m. to 11 p. m
STEAKS — LOBSTER

GEORGE PEPPARD 
ROMY SCHNEIDER 

ROSANNA SCHIAFFINO 
ELKE SOMMER 
ELI WALLACH

MICHAEL CALLAN 
PETER FONDA 

JAMES MITCHUM 
SENTA BERGER 

Evening Shows 6:30 and 9:00

See Dracula & 
Frankenstein 

Monster 
In Asylum Of 

Horrors.
FREE ID Bracelet 

For 1st 100 Girls
On Screen * 

IN TECHNICOLOR 

“HOUSE OF 
INTRIGUE”

LAKE 7 RESORT
Music Every Friday

JUNE 19—THE KOOL GENTS

Swim — Fish — Cottages — Picnic Grounds 
Office and Company, Picnics Welcome 

On County Trunk SS, 1'4 Miles East of 
New P rospect

PHONE 626-2827

Sundays
PHONE 626-2520

11 a. m. to 2 p. m.
CHICKEN FAMILY STYLE 

KEWASKUM, WIS.

The Glacier Inn
KEWASKUM

Featuring
STEAKS CHICKEN

SEAFOODS FROG LEGS
SERVING FAMILY STYLE DINNERS 

For Groups and Parties 
By Reservation

FISH FRY FRIDAYS 
FOOD SERVED DAILY 5 TO 11 P. M. 

SUNDAYS 12 NOON UNTIL 11 P. M.

Sandwiches
Phone 626-2711 Closed Tuesday

Willard and Marga Lynn
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■■SPORTSW®

Lakes Team 
Blanked by 
Lithias, 7-0

FRAN HOFMAIER FANS 20

Kewaskum lost its fourth Land 
o' Lakes league game in succes­
sion without a victory and was 
shut out for the third time in 
four starts in a comedy of errors 
Tuesday night at West Bend, 
where the Lithias blanked them, 
7-0.

The Lithias collected only six 
hits off of Dave Oppermann and 
Manager Fred Bruhn but were 
aided by eight Kewaskum errors, 
two of them in the four-run second 
inning. Al Koepke has been the 
regular Kewaskum pitcher in all 
of the other games this season 
but was not started Tuesday 
night. Six of West Bend’s seven 
runs were unearned and with bet 
ter fielding support it could have 
been a tight, 1-0 mound duel. 
Bruhn worked the last three 
frames

Ix'fty Fran Hofmaier was in 
complete command as the Lithias 
chalked up their fourth win in a 
row to remain tied for the league 
lead with Saukville. Hofmaier 
struck out 20 batters and "Fran 
the Man,” as he was called in the 
Rock River league before being 
grabbed by West Bend this year, 
brought his season’s total to 58 in 
four games. He issued his first 
walk of the season in the second 
inning. Fran gave up only two hits,' 
both singles, to D. Theusch in the 
second and Thelen in the eighth, 
in his fine performance. Opper­
mann did not whiff a single bat 
ter and walked four, which also 
contributed to the Lithia scoring 
Bruhn fanned three and walked

AVE ON AUTO 
I INSURANCE

CALL 626 2401 OR SEE

Willard H. Bartelt
1450 PARKVIEW DR.

AGCNT KM 
HIRIYAOK MUTUAL 
INSURAMCa COMPANY
•♦«< •♦••«• Me«>««« *'•«••«.•

three in the three innings he 
toiled.

Mark Gonring, who played ball 
at Notre Dame university this 
spring, smashed an inside-the- 
park home run with one aboard 
in the second inning with the Ke­
waskum outfielder having trouble 
finding the ball under the West 
Bend lights. As Gonring slid hard 
into home plate, catcher Jack 
Theusch suffered a foot injury 
and was removed from the game 
to receive treatment. Dan Coulter 
replaced him back of the plate. 
Theusch was not seriously in­
jured.

After facing four of the best 
teams in the league so far, Kewas­
kum should find the going a bit 
easier this Sunday, playing at 
Port Washington. Like Kewaskum 
Port is looking for its first win 
and shares last place with an i- 
dentical 0-4 record.

LAND O’ LAKES STANDINGS
Won Lost

West Bend ....................4 0
Saukville ................... 4 0
Sheboygan .................. 3
Grafton ....................... 3 1
Cedarburg .................  2 2
Kewaskum .................  0
Port Washington .... 0
Barton ......................... 0

In driving rain or heavy fog, 
it is better to stay at home 
or to stop driving if you are 
caught on the road. Unless you 
have clear vision ahead, you 
may drive off the road, crash 
into a car ahead of you, or 
collide head-on with an on­
coming car. Reduce speed so 
that you can stop within the 
distance you can see. 5

Wltcvntln Cornell ®r Solely

Results Sunday — Saukville 5, 
Cedarburg 1; Sheboygan 8, Barton 
0; Grafton 7, Port Washington 6.

Result Tuesday night — West 
Bend 7, Kewaskum 0.

Games this Sunday—Kewaskum 
at Port Washington, West Bend at 
Barton, Saukville at Grafton, Ce­
darburg at Sheboygan.

HON-E-KOR HOOKS

PRO ON THE AIR
Tom Larsen, pro at Hon-E-Kor 

Country club, now has a five- 
minute radio program on station 
WBKV, West Bend, twice weekly. 
The program, titled “Hon-E-Kor 
Preview,” is aired at 4:30 p m. 
Wednesdays and 1:05 p. m. Satur­
days.
CHILDREN'S LEAGUE

Play in the children’s league, 
for boys and girls from 8 to 18 
years, will begin next week. Girls 
will tee off on Mondays from 9 a. 
m to 12 noon and boys on Tues­
days from 9 a m. to 12 noon.
HON E KORNER

On Wednesday, June 3, ladies’ 
day, the class event was low 
gross. Winners and their classes 
are as follows: Class B—Betty 
Meunier; Class C—Dorothy Buttz; 
Class D—Joyce Coughlin.

The event of the day was won 
by Ginny Backhaus with her 
longest putt on number 9-

Lucky ladies at cards were: 
Bridge—Marion Mitchell, Hattie
Romaine, Lou Kerry, Sheepshead- 
Joyce Gruber; Samba—Edna Witt-

man.
On Wednesday, June 10, the 

class event was low on number 
3. The winner of the event of the 
day was closest to the pin in two 
on number 7.

Virginia Backhaus

New Prospect
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Jandre vi­

sited Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Narges 
at Waucousta Sunday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Barrett and 
family of West Bend visited the 
latter’s parents, Mr and Mrs. Wal­
ter Jandre Thursday evening.

Mrs. Kenneth Jandre, Mrs. Wal­
ter Jandre and Mrs. Vilas Ludwig 
visited patients at Memorial hospi­
tal in Sheboygan Friday after­
noon.

Mr and Mrs. Lenard Branchi of 
Burlington, Ohio, and Mrs. Ma­
mie Trapp of Milwaukee visited 
with Mr. and Mrs. Richard Trapp 
Saturday-

Mr and Mrs. Geo. H. Meyer 
spent Tuesday of last week visit­
ing their daughter and son-in-law 
and family in Germantown, Mr. 
and Mrs- Laurence Fuller and 
daughters.

Miss Virginia Trapp closed a 
successful term of school in Bur­
lington Friday and is spending her 
vacation with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Richard Trapp

Mr. and Mrs. Matt Baird spent 
several days in Milwaukee.

Mr. and Mrs- Henry Lemke of 
Sheboygan Falls visited Mr and 
Mrs. Paul Giese Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Hensler of 
West Bend visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Klosterman Sunday p. m. 
On Tuesday evening they called 
on Mr and Mrs. Del Kehres and
Mr. and Mrs. L. West at Forest । That we’re apt to leave behind us 
lake. Letters that we ought to burn..

Monday evening Mr. and Mrs- 
Frank Klosterman attended the 
wake of the former’s cousin in 
Milwaukee.

Mr. and Mrs. Del Kehres visited 
Mr. and Mrs- Frank Klosterman 
Thursday afternoon of last week.

Mr. and Mrs Jerome Bowen of 
Dundee called on Mr. and Mrs- 
Jos. P- Uelmen Monday after­
noon.

Dundee
The following children will be 

confirmed Sunday, June 21, at the 
Trinity Lutheran church: Charles 
Benson, Edward Ebert, Norman 
Ebert, Allen Haegler, Jonothan 
Mielke, Susan Mielke, Steven 
Roehl, Roger Tuttle, Marie 
Schmidt, Marjorie Schmidt.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Bohn 
were entertained at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Gutjahr Sat­
urday evening at Hartford

Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Heider, 
Mrs. Emma Heider were enter­
tained at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Herbert Ramel at Kewaskum, 
honoring their niece, Marie Ann 
Lohse, for her graduation.

Mr. and Mrs. Rudy Grandlic and 
son of Sheboygan, Mr. and Mrs. 
Delmar Roitt and children and H. 
W Krueger of Plymouth visited 
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. C. W- 
Baetz Sunday.

Charles, Jr and Lynn Roethke of 
West Bend spent from Friday until 
Monday with their grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. C. W. Baetz, while 
their parents were on a vacation 
at Harper’s Resort at Westboro, 
Wis.

Lives of all great men remind us, 
As their pages o’er we turn.

Geiger Ford
Sells

CARS FOR LESS


